CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD'S SHMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Parks and Recreation
AGENDA DATE: February 6, 2018

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Tracy Nevak, Parks and Recreatior Director, (915) 212-1768
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, (915) 212-1181

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: Al

STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 4: Enhzance El Paso’s Quality of Life through Recreational, Cultural and
Educationzl Esvironments

SUBJECT:

Discussion and action (o award Solicitation 2017-1409 Sports Officials Part If to vendors Texas ASA District — 4
and Magdalena V, Heredia for an initial three (3) year term estimated award of $854,670.00, The award is to
include 2 two {2) year option to extend for an amount of $569,780.00 for a total five (5) year award of
$1,424,450.00. This contract is to provide sport official services.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The City’s sports program serves thousands of adult and youth in organized, competitive league and tournament
play in a variety of sports venues throughout the City. Each scheduled game requires at least one sports official
and often, as in the case of youth football, up to three officials. Sports officials fees are part of the overall program
fees paid by participants.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on July 25, 2017 and August 1, 2017. The solicitation was posted on City website on
July 25, 2017. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on July 27, 2017. Total of five (5) bidders were
solicited; four (4) being local vendors. Total number of views were forty (40). Two (2) bids were received both
from local vendors.

PROTEST

No protest received for this requirement.

D Protest received.

COST VARIANCE PREVIOUS CONTRACT:

The difference in cost, based on the comparison to the annual usage from previous contract is as follows:

Group [ increased by $141,600.00 for the 3-year total as the estimated number of annual games increased by 37%.
Group II increased by $65,250.00 for the 3-year total as the estimated number of annual games increased by 4%,
as well as an averaged price increase for officials of 10%. Group I decreased by $6,600.00 for the 3-year total as
the estimated number of annual games were reduced by 83% and the price of Indoor Soccer Official decreased by
65%. Group IV increased by $8,370.00, as additional tournament officials were added. Resulting in an overall an
increase of $203,850.00 for the 3 years.

FFPS FORM 001, Rev. 3, 8/8/2018
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COUNCIL REPRESENTATIVE BRIEFING:

Was a briefing provided? [_] Yes or [X] No
If yes, select the applicable districts.

D District 1
[] District 2
D District 3
D District 4
[ District 5
D Diistrict 6
D District 7
[] District 8
All Districts

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Council awarded Solicitation #2014-315 for Sports Officials on August 5, 2014

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department: Parks & Recreation

initial Estimated Amount: $854,670 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $1,424,450.00 (5 years)

Funds Available: 451-31270-522110-1000-P5113

Funding Source: General Fund - Recreation and Cultural Contracts P5113

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

NiA
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BEPARTMENT HEAD:
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COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(BEST VALUE)

********************************POSTING LANG UAGE BELOW*******************1\-*******************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR AGENDA for the Council Meeting of FEBRUARY
6, 2018.

STRATEGIC GOAL 4: Enhance El Paso’s Quality of Life through Recreational, Cultural and
Educational Environmenis

Discussion and action to award Solicitation 2017-1409 Sports Officials Part [l to vendors Texas ASA
District — 4 and Magdalena V. Heredia for an initial three (3) year term estimated award of
$854,670.00. The award is to include a two (2) year option to extend for an amount of $569,780.00
for a total five (5) year award of $1,424,450.00. This contract is to provide sport official services.

Contract Variance:

The difference in cost, based on the comparison to the annual usage from previous contract is as
follows:

Group | increased by $141,600.00 for the 3-year total as the estimated number of annual games
increased by 37%. Group Il increased by $65,250.00 for the 3-year total as the estimated number of
annual games increased by 4%, as well as an averaged price increase for officials of 10%. Group il
decreased by $6,600.00 for the 3-year total as the estimated number of annual games was reduced
by 83% and the price of Indoor Soccer Official decreased by 65%. Group |V increased by $8,370.00
as additional tournament officials were added. Resulting in an overall increase of $208,620.00 for
the 3 years.

Department: Parks and Recreation

Award to: (Vendor #1) Texas ASA District 4
El Paso, TX

ltem(s): Group | and Il

Initial Term: 3 years

Option to Extend: 2 years

Annual Estimated Award: $270,100.00

Initial Term Estimated Award: $810,300.00 (3 years)

Option Total: $540,200.00 (2 years)

Total Estimated Award:

Award to: (Vendor #2}

$1,350,500.00 (5 years)

Magdalena V. Heredia

El Paso, TX
ftem(s): Group llf and IV
Initial Term: 3 years
Option to Extend: 2 years
Annual Estimated Award: $14,790.00
Initial Term Estimated Award: $44,370.00 (3 years)
Option Total: $29,580.00 (2 years)

Total Estimated Award:

$73,950.00 (5 years)



Total Annual Estimated Award:  $284,890.00
Initial Term Estimated Award: $854,670.00 (3 years)

Option Total: $569,780.00 (2 years)

Total Estimated Award: $1,424,450.00 (5 years)

Account No.: 451-100-51270-522110-P5113

Funding Source: General Fund — Recreation and Cultural Contracts
District{s). All

This is a Best Value, service contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and Parks and Recreation Departments recommend award
as indicated to Texas ASA District 4 and Magdalena V. Heredia, the bidders offering the best
value bids.

In accordance with this award, the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future
options if needed.



EVALUATION CRITERIA

COST
Group 1-Girls Fast Pitch Softball

Group 2-Slow Pifch Softball
Group 3-Indoor Soccer

Group 4-Hockey

SUBTOTAL EVALUATION FACTOR A:

CAPACITY TO UNDERTAKE CONTRACT

Offar must provide name, ghong number and address of alk officials to be used in
the fullfilment of the contract for each sport.

include your organtzation's procedure for evaluating the officials you employ.
Provide availability of officials and any restricls on Ipvation of work sites,

Pravide information on program or computer software used for assignments.

SUBTOTAL EVALUATION FACTOR B:

EXPERIENCE AND QUAELIFICATIONS

List cerlification ane qualifications of all offictals assigned. Include a separate page
for each sperl. Include all officaials’ names, addresses and phone number.
Certilications shall be {rom onr of the organizations listed on Paga 21, Part 3.2 (#4}.
Provide coples of certifications of each official.

SUBTOTAL EVALUATION FACTOR C:

REPUTATION & QUALITY OF THE BIDDER™S SERVICE

Bidder shall identlify ils fult client histary for the fast lwo {2} years, including any localj
Governmenl Services excluding the Gity of El Paso departments and employees. §
The bidder shall provide al leasl three (3) reference for which they have provided}

confinuous similar services for at least the past lwo (2) years. The agency shall
provide the names and telephone numbers of the contract asmnistrales for whos

the work was performed. ¥ you do nat have three loval Government coniracts, thenp

list Federal, Stale, or commercial contract lo complele this information. Note: Score
for each reference will be delermined by dividing 1he tolal scere by 3 references (i.e.
15 tolal poinl'3=5 peints per feference)

SUBTOTAL EVALUATION FACTOR D:

Group 1
Group 2
Group 3
Group 4

PPS FORM 04, REV 1, 721/2017 (All previous versions obsolete)

Magdalena V. Heraedia

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET
Request for Qualifications
SOLICITATION TITLE: Sports Officials Part li

SOLICITATION NO: 2017-1409
Texas ASA District 4

El Paso TX El Paso, TX
$289,100.00 $317,100.00
50.00 47.16
$448,800.00 $493,200.00
50.00 45,50
$19,800.00 No bid
50.00
$24,570.00 Nao bid
50.00
5.00 12.00
5.00 12.00
a.17 12.33
B.17 12,33
15 14,00 14.67
15 14.00 14.67
100 7147 86.16
100 77.17 84.50
100 77.47 Neo Bid
100 7747 No Bid




CITY OF EL PASO 7
BID TABULATION FORM &

Ackiireerert of

Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS PART ! Solicitation #: 2017-1409

Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 30, 2017 Departiment: PARKS AND RECREATION
MAGDALENA V HEREDIA TEXAS ASA DISTRICT 4
: S : : ELPASO, TX EL PASQ, TX
“GIRLS FAST PITCH SOFTBALL .~ -
EsTiMATED | | UNIT OF TOTAL ARNUAL | 4 vEaR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL | 4 v aRr TOTAL
NOT TO MEASURE COST cosT
M Exceep | ANNUAL | ooonts COST (FORMULA: A x | (FORMULA: D X COST (FORMULA: A X | (FORMULA: D X
DESCRIPTION (GAMES PER (PER OFFICIAL) N 3YEARS =3 | (PER OFFICIAL) i 3 YEARS =3
NO. COST (PER | ™ v AR REQUIRED BXC=TOTAL | (AR TOTAL BXC=TOTAL 1 e AR TOTAL
GAME) PER GAME) COST) ) COST) }
(A (B} (C} (D) (c) (B}
1. 8 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $29.00 400 1 £29.00 $11,600.00 $34,800.00 $29.00 $11,600.00 $34,800.00
2. 8 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 400 1 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $3.00 $1,200,00 $3,600.00
$27.00 -
3. 10 & UNDER OFFICIAL $29.00 400 2 $27.00 $21,600.00 $64,800.00 $29.00 $23,200.00 $69,600.60
4, 10 & UNDER ABSSIGNER 53.00 400 1 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00
$27.00 -
5 12 & UNDER OFFICIAL $29.00 400 2 $27.00 $21,600.00 $64,800.00 $29.00 $23,200.00 $69,600.00
6. 12 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 400 1 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00
$28.00-
7. 14 & UNDER OFFICIAL $30.00 400 2 $28.00 $22,400.00 $67,200.00 $30.00 $24,000.00 $72,000.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardiexecution of Coniract,
This is a Best Value Procurement, Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:% \fa{

2017-1409 SPORTS OFFICIALS PART




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS PART Ii-

Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 30, 2017

 Acbicyrmeslal

Gisslliaer
2017 Asaed Winne? s
Solicitation #: 2017-1409
Departmeni: PARKS AND RECREATION
| MAGDALENA V HEREDIA TEXAS ASA DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
7/'GROUP 1: GIRLS FAST PITCH SOFTBALL =~ &7 o
ESTIMATED UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL [ 3 YEAR TOTAL | _ TOTAL ANNUAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL
NOT TO ANNUAL ME#’:SURLE COST COST (FORMULA: D X cosT COST (FORMULA: D X
ITEM EXCEED {QFFICIALS (FORMULA: AX | 3YEARS =3 {FORMULA:AX | 3YEARS=3
NO. DESCRIPTION GOST (PER (GA\TE?R';ER REQUIRED | (PER OFFICIAL) BXC=TOTAL | YEAR TOTAL) (PER OFFICIAL) BX C=TOTAL | YEAR TOTAL)
GAME) PER GAME) COST) COST)
(A (8) {C) o {©) (D)

8. 14 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 4400 1 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $3.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00

$28.00 -
9, 16 & UNDER OFFICIAL $30.00 200 2 $28.00 $11,200.00 $33,600.00 $30.00 $12,006.00 $36,600.00

10. 16 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 209 1 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
$28.00 -
11. 18 & UNDER OFFICIAL $30.00 100 2 $28.00 £5,600.00 $16,800.00 $30.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00
12, 18 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00
GROUP 1 (ITEMS 1 THRU 12) - GRAND TOTAL: $99,700.00 $299,1G0.00 [+ $105,700.00 | $317,100.00
NOTE: The information contained in this hid tabulation is for information only and does n.ot ébnslitute actual award/execution of cohtract.
This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED EI: i %

DATE: ‘?/8 }q-

20171400 SPORTS OFFICIALS PART Il



Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS PART 1
Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 30, 2017

CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

AT arkrsmeer af
&

Solicitation #; 2017-1409

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
MAGDALENA V HEREDIA TEXAS ASADISTRICT 4
EL PASG, TX EL PASO, TX
‘GROUP-2:SLOW-PITCH:SOFTBALL TR
' ' = UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANRUAL
NoTTO | ESTIMATED | oo o os COST 3 YEAR TOTAL COsT 3 YEAR TOTAL
ITEM EXCEED ANNUAL (OFFICIALS COST (FORMULA: A X | (FORMULA: D X COST {FORMULA: A X [(FORMULA: D X
NG DESCRIPTION COST (PER (GAMES PER| Lroeep | (PEROFFICIAL) | BXC=TOTAL | 3YEARS =3 | (PER OFFIGIAL) | B XC=TOTAL | 3 YEARS =3
GAME) YEAR) PER GAME) COST) YEAR TOTAL} COST) YEAR TOTAL)
{A) {B} €} {2} (C} 1))
1. | LEAGUE & PLAYOFFS - OFFICIAL $$2;'5'0000' 5500 1 $23.00 $126,500.00 | $379,500.00 $25.00 $137,500.00 | $412,500.00
2. |LEAGUE & PLAYOQFFS - ASSIGNER | $3.00 5500 1 $3.00 $16,500.00 $48,500.00 $3.00 $16,500.00 $49,500.00
$23.00 -
3. TOURNAMENT (1) « OFFICIAL. $25.00 100 1 $23.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00
4, TOURNAMENT (1) - ASSIGNER $3.00 100 (| 53.00 $300.00 $900.00 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00
5. TOURNAMERNT (2) - OFFICIAL $20.00 100 2 $20.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $20.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00
BIDBER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$2,0600.00 $6.,000.60
6. TOURNAMENT {2) - ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00
7. ONE PIT%‘;;‘;&T-NAMENT $20.00 100 1 $20.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
5400009 $12.00000..
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecution of CONact,

This is a Best Value Procurement, Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:

paTES] ﬁt&_ } 13;

2017-1408 SPORTS OFFICIALS PART I



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS PART I

Solicitation #: 2017-1409
Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 30, 2017

Departmen{: PARKS AND RECREATION

MAGDALENA V HEREDIA TEXAS ASADISTRICT 4
L e T El PASQ, TX EL PASO, TX
. {GROUP 2:USLOW PITCH SOFTBALL: BEE
ESTIMATED UnIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL | 2 YEAR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL
NOTTOQ ANNUAL MEASURE COST COST {FORMULA: D X COST COsT (FORMULA: B X
ITEM EXCEED (OFFICIALS (FORMULA: AX ] 3YEARS=3 (FORMULA: AX | 3YEARS =3
NO. DESCRIPTION COST (PER ‘GA\':"EE;SR';ER requirep || (FER OFFIGIALY | o CoTaL | vear ToTALy | FER OFFIGIALY L L rotaL | veAs TOTAL)
GAME]) PER GAME) COST) CcosT)
{A) (8) {C} (D} (C) {0}
ONE PITCH TOURNAMENT
8. SCOREKEEPER $10.00 100 1 $10.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $10.0¢ $1,000.00 $3,000.00
ONE PITCH TOURNAMENT
9. ASSIGNER 53.00 100 1 $3.00 $300.00 $800.00 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00
GROUP H - (ITEMS 1 THRU 9) - GRAND TOTAL: $153,200.00 | $459,600.00 $164,400.00 | $493,200.00
: BIDDER'S PRICE RERR
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardfexecution of contract,

This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APF‘RD\TD BY:

DATE:GI 128] ["l‘ 2017-1409 SPORTS OFFICIALS PART It



CITY OF EL PASO

Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS PART 1l Solicitation #: 2017-1409
Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 30, 2017 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
MAGDALENA V HEREDIA TEXAS ASA DISTRICT 4
_ : . EL PASQ, TX EL PASQO, TX
GROUP 3: INDOOR'SOGCER .+ . o
esTmaTep | UMT OF TOTAL AANUAL] 3 veAR TOTAL TDTAé‘OASberUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
NOTTO +  aAnNUAL OFFICIALS COST (FORMULA: A X | (FORMULA: D X COST (FORMULA: A X |(FORMULA: D X
’L%M DESCRIPTION c‘é’éﬁﬁgR (GAMES PER (RE quiRep || PEROFFICIAL) | 5y crorar | 3YEARS=3 | (PEROFFICIAL) | 5 Y o mrorar | 3 YEARS =3
. A YEAR) PER GAME) COST) YEAR TOTAL) cosT) YEAR TOTAL)
(A) (B} {C} (D) ] {D)
1. INDOOR SOCCER - OFFICIAL $20.00 200 1 $20.00 %$4,000.00 $12,000.00 NG BID $0.00 $0.00
2. {INDOOR SOCCER - SCOREKEEPER| $10.00 200 1 $10.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $06.00 $0.00
3. INDOOR SOCCER - ASSIGNER $3.00 200 1 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 3 - {ITEMS 1 - 3) - GRAND TOTAL: $6,600.00 | $19,800.00 | . . - _f i | nomiD NO BID
it GROUP-AEHOCKEY. i s
1. HOCKEY - OFFICIAL $20.00 200 4 $20.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
2. HOCKEY - SCOREKEEPER $10.00 200 1 $10.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for Information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shal] be evaluated to determine an awardee,

APPROVED BY:
o8l a

2017-1409 SPORTS OFFICIALS PART |l 5



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Aehitreeenl of

Crgellonce

1617 Avirsl Winnc?

Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS PART II

Solicitation #: 2017-1409
Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 30, 2017

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

MAGDALENA V HEREDIA TEXAS ASA DISTRICT 4
EL PASQ, TX EL PASO, TX
{GROUP4:HOCKEY : S T
EsTiMATED |  UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL | 4 veaR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL | 5 vEAR TOTAL
NOT TO MEASURE cosT . COST
ANNUAL oo als cosT (FORMULA: A X | (FORMULA: D X cosT (FORMULA: A X |(FORMULA: D X
ITEM DESCRIPTION EXCEED liGaAMES PER (PER OFFICIAL) —ToTaL | 3YEARS =3 | (PER OFFICIAL) gy 3 YEARS =3
NO. COST(PER| " ygar) | REQUIRED BXC=TOTAL | yeaR TOTAL) BXC=TOTAL | yEARTOTAL)
GAME) PER GAME) COST) COsT)
{A) (B} (C) o) (C) (D)
3. HOCKEY - ASSIGNER $3.00 200 1 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
4, |HOCKEY OFFICIAL - TOURNAMENT| $20.00 30 2 $26.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
HOCKEY SCOREKEEPER -
5. TOURNAMENT $10.00 30 1 $10.00 $300.00 $900.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
HOCKEY TOURNAMENT -
6. ASSIGNER $3.00 30 1 $3.00 $90.00 $270.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 4 - (ITEMS 1 THRU 6) - GRAND TOTAL: $8,190.00 $24,570.00 |- ! .. NoBID NO BID
NOTE: The Information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and'ddes'not' cﬁénsiitute actual awardlexecution of doniract. :

This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:

DATEﬂ T ) 2017-1409 SPORTS OFFICIALS PART Il



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Achrovrment et

207 Avank Winner

Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS PART li Solicitation #: 2017-1409
Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 30, 2017 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

MAGDALENA V HEREDIA TEXAS ASA DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX 7 EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRAGTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF
SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION 7O EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CiTY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRAGT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRIGE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDS SOLICITED: 5§ LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 4 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 2 NO BID:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for infermation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:OI [zgl ‘t:t 2017-1409 SPORTS OFFIGIALS PART Il 7



El Paso Umpires Association {TASO)
Atin: Perry A. Huddleston, President
433 Grace Place

El Paso, TX 79915

Texas ASA - District 4
Attn: Jorge Mijares
8446 Whitewater Lane
El Paso, TX 79907-4939

Julie Rodriguez {Julie.Rodriguez @ usssa.com)
PO Box 5424

Hobbs, NV 88241

575-602-1717

George Heredia georgeheredia34®vyahogo.com
4509 Parrot Way

El Paso, TX 79922
915-474-1846

Claudia Zamora
28 Buttlerfield trail
El Paso, TX 79906



