
CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS 
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM 

 

DEPARTMENT:   General Services – Land Management Division   
 
AGENDA DATE:   March 11, 2014  
 

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Stuart C. Ed, General Services Director, (915) 621-6822 
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, (915) 212-1181 

 

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED:  ALL 
 

SUBJECT: 
 
General Services would like to recommend award of Solicitation No. 2014-103 (Grounds Maintenance for El 
Paso City Parks - Mowing) to Abescape Landscaping & Irrigation, LLC and Three C’s Contractors, Inc., for 
an initial term estimated amount of $1,447,794.72 and the option to extend amount of $965,196.48 for a total 
5 year award of $2,412,991.20. 
 
BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION: 
 
The General Services Department is recommending the award of the above bid to Abescape Landscsping & 
Irrigation, LLC and Three C’s Contractors which offered the Best Value to the City.  If approved, this 
award will allow for the mowing of grass in 127 City Parks and will maintain parks clean and neat.  This 
service will also enhance the appearance and overall of image of both the parks and the City overall.  
Local business is being supported. 

 
PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: 
 
Yes.  Council previously approved contract on September 28, 2010, Item 12.  

 
SELECTION SUMMARY: 
 
Solicitation was advertised on 12/10/2013 and 12/17/2013.  The solicitation was posted on City website on 
12/10/2013. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on 12/10/2013. Total of thirty-five (35) bidders 
were solicited; thirty-three (33) were local vendors.  Ten bids were received with eight (8) being local 
vendors.  

 
AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING: 
 

 Department:  General Services – Land Management Division  
 Annual Amount:  $482,598.24 
 Total Initial Estimated Award:    $1,447,794.72 (3 years) 
 Total Estimated Award: $2,412,991.20 (5 years) 
 Funds Available:  Dept: 231 Acct: 522210 Fund: 1000 Div: 31120 Program Code: P3110 

Funds Source:  General Services – General Fund – Ground Keeping Horti Contracts   
 
BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION: 

N/A 
 
 

____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

********************AUTHORIZATION******************** 
 

DEPARTMENT HEAD: 
 
 
              ________________________________________________________________________ 

     Stuart C. Ed, General Services Director 



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM 
(BEST VALUE BID) 

 
*****************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW******************************************* 

 
Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of MARCH 11, 2014. 
  
Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2014-103 (Grounds Maintenance for El Paso City 
Parks - Mowing) to Abescape Landscaping & Irrigation, LLC and Three C’s Contractors, Inc., for an initial 
term estimated amount of $1,447,794.72 and the option to extend amount of $965,196.48 for a total 5 
year award of $2,412,991.20. 
 
Department:  General Services – Land Management Division   
Award to:             Vendor 1: Abescape Landscaping & Irrigation, LLC 
 El Paso, TX 
Item(s): Central Group VI 
 Eastside Group I, II, III, V, VI, VII, VIII 
 Mission Valley Group I, II, III, IV, V, VI 
 Northeast Group II, III, IV, V 
 Natural Linear Park Group - Rio Grande River Trail  
Initial Term: 3 Years 
Option to Extend: 2 Years 
Payment Terms: 2% -10 Days 
Annual Estimated Award: $268,380.00 
Initial Term Estimated Award: $805,140.00 (3 years) 
Total Estimated Award: $1,341,900.00 (5 years) 
 
Award to:             Vendor 2: Three C’s Contractors, Inc.   
 El Paso, TX 
Item(s): Central Group I, II, III, IV, V 
 Eastside Group IV 
 Northeast Group I, VI, VII, VIII 
 Westside Group I, II, III, IV   
Initial Term: 3 Years 
Option to Extend: 2 Years 
Payment Terms: 2% -10 Days 
Annual Estimated Award: $214,218.24 
Initial Term Estimated Award: $642,654.72 (3 years) 
Total Estimated Award: $1,071,091.20 (5 years) 
 
Total Annual Estimated Award: $482,598.24 (Vendor 1 and Vendor 2) 
Total Initial Estimated Award: $1,447,794.72 (3 years) (Vendor 1 and Vendor 2) 
Total Estimated Award:    $2,412,991.20 (5 years) (Vendor 1 and Vendor 2) 
Account No.: 231–522210-1000-31120-P3110 
Funding Source: General Services Dept – General Fund – Ground Keeping Horti Contracts 
District(s): All 



This is a Best Value, service contract. 
 
The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and General Services – Land Management Division 
recommends award as indicated to Abescape Landscaping & Irrigation, LLC and Three C’s Contractors, Inc.,  
the bidders offering the best value bids. 

 
 

***************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW*************************** 



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$35,184.00 $43,464.00 $58,033.92 $48,960.00 $40,656.00 $76,800.00

# points 65 64.82 52.47 39.30 46.58 56.10 29.70

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.66 71.47 71.14 59.58 76.10 55.20

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX SCOTTSDALE, AZ

$64,320.00 $80,640.00 $35,088.00 $40,704.00
# points 65 35.46 28.28 65.00 56.03

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 6.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

35.46 28.28 91.27 69.03

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP I
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - CENTRAL GROUP I

CENTRAL GROUP I

GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Cost

CENTRAL GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

Past Performance

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

CENTRAL GROUP I TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$97,440.00 $108,000.00 $133,136.56 $113,760.00 $96,480.00 $158,976.00
# points 65 53.70 48.45 39.30 45.99 54.23 32.91

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

71.54 67.45 71.14 58.99 74.23 58.41

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$137,472.00 $141,024.00 $80,496.00 $104,064.00
# points 65 38.06 37.10 65.00 50.28

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

38.06 37.10 91.27 57.28

CENTRAL GROUP II TOTAL POINTS

CENTRAL GROUP II
Cost

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP II
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - CENTRAL GROUP II
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

CENTRAL GROUP II TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$45,984.00 $66,912.00 $75,478.08 $65,376.00 $59,760.00 $102,240.00
# points 65 64.51 44.33 39.30 45.37 49.64 29.01

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.35 63.33 71.14 58.37 69.64 54.51

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$62,880.00 $135,360.00 $45,635.52 $48,000.00
# points 65 47.17 21.91 65.00 61.80

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

47.17 21.91 91.27 68.80

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP III TOTAL POINTS

CENTRAL GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

CENTRAL GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - CENTRAL GROUP III
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP III TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$99,264.00 $121,440.00 $116,067.84 $97,920.00 $94,080.00 $127,776.00
# points 65 45.95 37.56 39.30 46.58 48.48 35.70

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

63.79 56.56 71.14 59.58 68.48 61.20

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$88,992.00 $129,120.00 $70,176.00 $102,240.00
# points 65 51.26 35.33 65.00 44.62

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

51.26 35.33 91.27 51.62

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS

CENTRAL GROUP IV

CENTRAL GROUP IV
Cost

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - CENTRAL GROUP IV
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$39,168.00 $51,746.88 $58,033.92 $48,960.00 $44,640.00 $83,520.00
# points 65 58.23 44.07 39.30 46.58 51.09 27.31

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

76.07 63.07 71.14 59.58 71.09 52.81

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$57,120.00 $73,920.00 $35,088.00 $47,040.00
# points 65 39.93 30.85 65.00 48.48

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

39.93 30.85 91.27 55.48

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP V TOTAL POINTS

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - CENTRAL GROUP V
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

CENTRAL GROUP V TOTAL POINTS

CENTRAL GROUP V
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

CENTRAL GROUP V
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$60,000.00 $96,503.04 $139,452.48 $117,648.00 $103,200.00 $164,736.00
# points 65 65.00 40.41 27.97 33.15 37.79 23.67

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 59.41 59.81 46.15 57.79 49.17

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$102,720.00 $135,360.00 $84,314.88 $63,360.00
# points 65 37.97 28.81 46.26 61.55

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

37.97 28.81 72.53 68.55

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS

CENTRAL GROUP VI
Cost

CENTRAL GROUP VI
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - CENTRAL GROUP VI
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

CENTRAL GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$54,048.00 $84,362.88 $123,919.68 NO BID $89,760.00 $137,184.00
# points 65 65.00 41.64 28.35 NO BID 39.14 25.61

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 60.64 60.19 13.00 59.14 51.11

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX SCOTTSDALE, AZ

$107,520.00 $113,760.00 $74,923.20 $76,800.00
# points 65 32.67 30.88 46.89 45.74

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

32.67 30.88 73.16 52.74

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP I
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

EASTSIDE GROUP I
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP I
Cost



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$47,712.00 $78,026.88 $103,777.92 NO BID $79,200.00 $124,992.00
# points 65 65.00 39.75 29.88 NO BID 39.16 24.81

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 58.75 61.72 13.00 59.16 50.31

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$102,240.00 $113,760.00 $62,745.60 $72,000.00
# points 65 30.33 27.26 49.43 43.07

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

30.33 27.26 75.70 50.07

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP II

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP II TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP II
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

EASTSIDE GROUP II
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP II TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$57,216.00 $101,317.44 $137,403.84 NO BID $96,480.00 $178,944.00
# points 65 65.00 36.71 27.07 NO BID 38.55 20.78

# points 20 12.50 6.00 18.84 0.00 6.50 6.00

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 49.71 58.91 13.00 52.05 39.78

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$185,856.00 $201,600.00 $83,076.48 $93,888.00
# points 65 20.01 18.45 44.77 39.61

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

20.01 18.45 71.04 46.61

EASTSIDE GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP III
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP III TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP III TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$43,680.00 $60,186.24 $69,983.04 NO BID $56,256.00 $107,232.00
# points 65 65.00 47.17 40.57 NO BID 50.47 26.48

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 66.17 72.41 13.00 70.47 51.98

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$105,312.00 $110,640.00 $46,411.20 $54,336.00
# points 65 26.96 25.66 61.17 52.25

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

26.96 25.66 87.44 59.25

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP IV
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

EASTSIDE GROUP IV

EASTSIDE GROUP IV
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$31,104.00 $62,496.00 $71,006.40 NO BID $54,720.00 $98,304.00
# points 65 65.00 32.35 28.47 #VALUE! 36.95 20.57

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 51.35 60.31 13.00 56.95 46.07

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$119,520.00 $104,160.00 $42,931.20 $52,128.00
# points 65 16.92 19.41 47.09 38.78

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

16.92 19.41 73.36 45.78

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP V TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP V

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP V
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

EASTSIDE GROUP V
Cost

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP V TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$34,368.00 $61,844.16 $92,000.64 NO BID $60,240.00 $108,480.00
# points 65 65.00 36.12 24.28 #VALUE! 37.08 20.59

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 55.12 56.12 13.00 57.08 46.09

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$105,120.00 $108,000.00 $55,625.28 $57,120.00
# points 65 21.25 20.68 40.16 39.11

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

21.25 20.68 66.43 46.11

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP VI
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

EASTSIDE GROUP VI
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP VI
Cost



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$23,520.00 $47,662.08 $52,230.72 NO BID $38,448.00 $78,912.00
# points 65 65.00 32.08 29.27 #VALUE! 39.76 19.37

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 51.08 61.11 13.00 59.76 44.87

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$81,600.00 $81,120.00 $33,220.80 $36,960.00
# points 65 18.74 18.85 46.02 41.36

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

18.74 18.85 72.29 48.36

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP VII

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP VII TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP VII
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

EASTSIDE GROUP VII
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP VII TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$54,336.00 $84,369.60 $115,042.56 NO BID $80,160.00 $172,512.00
# points 65 65.00 41.86 30.70 #VALUE! 44.06 20.47

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 60.86 62.54 13.00 64.06 45.97

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$90,912.00 $145,920.00 $72,302.40 $63,168.00
# points 65 38.85 24.20 48.85 55.91

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

38.85 24.20 75.12 62.91

EASTSIDE GROUP VIII
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - EASTSIDE GROUP VIII
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Past Performance

EASTSIDE GROUP VIII TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP VIII TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP VIII
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$30,720.00 $84,843.84 $68,275.20 NO BID $81,600.00 $84,787.20
# points 65 65.00 23.54 29.25 #VALUE! 24.47 23.55

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 42.54 61.09 13.00 44.47 49.05

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX SCOTTSDALE, AZ

$83,040.00 $91,200.00 $41,280.00 $84,864.00
# points 65 24.05 21.89 48.37 23.53

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

24.05 21.89 74.64 30.53

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - MISSION VALLEY GROUP I
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

MISSION VALLEY GROUP I

MISSION VALLEY GROUP I
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

MISSION VALLEY GROUP I TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$44,448.00 $76,364.16 $103,777.92 NO BID $79,680.00 $132,288.00
# points 65 65.00 37.83 27.84 #VALUE! 36.26 21.84

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 56.83 59.68 13.00 56.26 47.34

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$93,600.00 $93,120.00 $63,840.00 $54,048.00
# points 65 30.87 31.03 45.26 53.45

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

30.87 31.03 71.53 60.45

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP II TOTAL POINTS

MISSION VALLEY GROUP II

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET -MISSION VALLEY GROUP II
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

MISSION VALLEY GROUP II
Cost

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY  GROUP II TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$50,592.00 $75,617.28 $110,605.44 NO BID $80,640.00 $151,968.00
# points 65 65.00 43.49 29.73 0.00 40.78 21.64

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 62.49 61.57 13.00 60.78 47.14

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$114,240.00 $120,480.00 $67,200.00 $56,736.00
# points 65 28.79 27.29 48.94 57.96

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

28.79 27.29 75.21 64.96

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - MISSION VALLEY GROUP III
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

MISSION VALLEY GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP III TOTAL POINTS

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP III TOTAL POINTS

MISSION VALLEY GROUP III
Cost



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$45,888.00 $68,672.64 $102,412.80 NO BID $59,520.00 $120,960.00
# points 65 65.00 43.43 29.12 #VALUE! 50.11 24.66

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 62.43 60.96 13.00 70.11 50.16

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$93,120.00 $100,800.00 $62,112.00 $49,920.00
# points 65 32.03 29.59 48.02 59.75

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

32.03 29.59 74.29 66.75

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - MISSION VALLEY GROUP IV

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS

MISSION VALLEY GROUP IV
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

MISSION VALLEY GROUP IV
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$32,976.00 $48,799.68 $61,174.08 NO BID $47,520.00 $86,112.00
# points 65 65.00 43.92 35.04 #VALUE! 45.11 24.89

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 62.92 66.88 13.00 65.11 50.39

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$56,640.00 $65,520.00 $39,840.00 $44,736.00
# points 65 37.84 32.71 53.80 47.91

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

37.84 32.71 80.07 54.91

MISSION VALLEY GROUP V
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - MISSION VALLEY GROUP V
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP V TOTAL POINTS

MISSION VALLEY GROUP V TOTAL POINTS

MISSION VALLEY GROUP V
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$46,080.00 $57,424.32 $109,240.32 NO BID $49,920.00 $117,888.00
# points 65 65.00 52.16 27.42 #VALUE! 60.00 25.41

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 71.16 59.26 13.00 80.00 50.91

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$49,440.00 $57,600.00 $66,048.00 $53,760.00
# points 65 60.58 52.00 45.35 55.71

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

60.58 52.00 71.62 62.71

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - MISSION VALLEY GROUP VI
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

MISSION VALLEY GROUP VI

MISSION VALLEY GROUP VI
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

MISSION VALLEY GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS

MISSION VALLEY GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$39,072.00 $46,353.60 $44,890.56 $37,872.00 $32,928.00 $72,576.00
# points 65 48.23 40.65 41.98 49.76 57.23 25.97

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

66.07 59.65 73.82 62.76 77.23 51.47

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX SCOTTSDALE, AZ

$45,504.00 $72,288.00 $28,992.00 $40,320.00
# points 65 41.41 26.07 65.00 46.74

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

41.41 26.07 91.27 53.74

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP I

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP I
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NORTHEAST GROUP I
Cost

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP I TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$49,056.00 $108,896.64 $109,274.88 $92,188.80 $101,760.00 $138,528.00
# points 65 65.00 29.28 29.18 34.59 31.33 23.02

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 48.28 61.02 47.59 51.33 48.52

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$97,248.00 $132,192.00 $66,240.00 $160,320.00
# points 65 32.79 24.12 48.14 19.89

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

32.79 24.12 74.41 26.89

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP II
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NORTHEAST GROUP II
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP II TOTAL POINTS

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP II TOTAL POINTS

EASTSIDE GROUP II
Cost



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$59,424.00 $78,256.32 $128,016.00 $108,000.00 $84,000.00 $138,144.00
# points 65 65.00 49.36 30.17 35.76 45.98 27.96

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 68.36 62.01 48.76 65.98 53.46

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$82,560.00 $81,792.00 $77,472.00 $70,080.00
# points 65 46.78 47.22 49.86 55.12

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

46.78 47.22 76.13 62.12

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP III

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP III TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NORTHEAST GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP III TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$25,728.00 $67,053.12 $52,571.52 $44,352.00 $57,120.00 $62,112.00
# points 65 65.00 24.94 31.81 37.71 29.28 26.92

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 43.94 63.65 50.71 49.28 52.42

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$81,600.00 $54,528.00 $31,872.00 $55,680.00
# points 65 20.49 30.67 52.47 30.03

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

20.49 30.67 78.74 37.03

NORTHEAST GROUP IV
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP IV
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP IV
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$48,960.00 $78,256.32 $102,412.80 $86,400.00 $75,360.00 $110,496.00
# points 65 65.00 40.67 31.07 36.83 42.23 28.80

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 59.67 62.91 49.83 62.23 54.30

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$82,560.00 $72,000.00 $61,920.00 $72,288.00
# points 65 38.55 44.20 51.40 44.02

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

38.55 44.20 77.67 51.02

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP V
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NORTHEAST GROUP V

NORTHEAST GROUP V
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP V TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP V TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$62,016.00 $73,648.32 $77,151.36 $65,088.00 $61,920.00 $113,856.00
# points 65 49.00 41.26 39.39 46.69 49.08 26.69

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

66.84 60.26 71.23 59.69 69.08 52.19

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$57,792.00 $103,680.00 $46,752.00 $72,000.00
# points 65 52.58 29.31 65.00 42.21

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

52.58 29.31 91.27 49.21

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP VI

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP VI
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NORTHEAST GROUP VI
Cost

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP VI TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$28,992.00 $40,240.32 $39,940.80 $33,696.00 $33,600.00 $54,048.00
# points 65 56.61 40.78 41.09 48.70 48.84 30.36

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

74.45 59.78 72.93 61.70 68.84 55.86

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$37,440.00 $64,320.00 $25,248.00 $35,712.00
# points 65 43.83 25.51 65.00 45.95

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

43.83 25.51 91.27 52.95

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP VII
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NORTHEAST GROUP VII
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP VII TOTAL POINTS

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP VII TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP VII
Cost



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$47,040.00 $85,472.64 $70,493.76 $59,424.00 $75,360.00 $89,760.00
# points 65 59.16 32.56 39.48 46.83 36.93 31.01

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

77.00 51.56 71.32 59.83 56.93 56.51

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$77,760.00 $68,352.00 $42,816.00 $79,200.00
# points 65 35.79 40.72 65.00 35.14

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

35.79 40.72 91.27 42.14

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NORTHEAST GROUP VIII

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP VIII TOTAL POINTS

Past Performance

NORTHEAST GROUP VIII TOTAL POINTS

NORTHEAST GROUP VIII
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NORTHEAST GROUP VIII
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$56,448.00 $86,418.24 $82,272.00 NO BID $58,560.00 $128,352.00
# points 65 65.00 42.46 44.60 #VALUE! 62.66 28.59

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 61.46 76.44 13.00 82.66 54.09

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX SCOTTSDALE, AZ

$92,832.00 $128,160.00 $57,504.00 $64,128.00
# points 65 39.52 28.63 63.81 57.22

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

39.52 28.63 90.08 64.22

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

WESTSIDE GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - WESTSIDE GROUP I
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

WESTSIDE GROUP I
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

WESTSIDE GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

WESTSIDE GROUP I



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$55,104.00 $66,113.28 $78,174.72 NO BID $59,520.00 $116,352.00
# points 65 58.66 48.89 41.35 #VALUE! 54.31 27.78

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

76.50 67.89 73.19 13.00 74.31 53.28

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$84,192.00 $88,080.00 $49,728.00 $84,000.00
# points 65 38.39 36.70 65.00 38.48

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

38.39 36.70 91.27 45.48WESTSIDE GROUP II TOTAL POINTS

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

WESTSIDE GROUP II TOTAL POINTS

WESTSIDE GROUP II
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - WESTSIDE GROUP II
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

WESTSIDE GROUP II
Cost



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$30,240.00 $42,144.96 $50,011.20 NO BID $36,480.00 $70,080.00
# points 65 65.00 46.64 39.30 #VALUE! 53.88 28.05

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 65.64 71.14 13.00 73.88 53.55

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$41,664.00 $45,360.00 $31,584.00 $36,096.00
# points 65 47.18 43.33 62.23 54.45

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

47.18 43.33 88.50 61.45

WESTSIDE GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

WESTSIDE GROUP III TOTAL POINTS

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - WESTSIDE GROUP III
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

WESTSIDE GROUP III
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

WESTSIDE GROUP III TOTAL POINTS



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$46,752.00 $74,064.96 $76,297.92 NO BID $64,800.00 $101,760.00
# points 65 65.00 41.03 39.83 #VALUE! 46.90 29.86

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 60.03 71.67 13.00 66.90 55.36

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$74,112.00 $85,920.00 $47,136.00 $66,240.00
# points 65 41.00 35.37 64.47 45.88

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

41.00 35.37 90.74 52.88

Past Performance

WESTSIDE GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS

Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

WESTSIDE GROUP IV TOTAL POINTS

WESTSIDE GROUP IV
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - WESTSIDE GROUP IV
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

WESTSIDE GROUP IV



SOLICITATION NO: 2014-103
SOLICITATION TITLE:

ABESCAPE LANDSCAPING & 
IRRIGATION, LLC

ARE LANDSCAPE 
MANAGEMENT 

BORDER TM 
INDUSTRIES INC. 

DBA XCEED 
RESOURCES

EPDS EVERGREEN 
LAWN SERVICE

GREATER TEXAS 
LANDSCAPE 

SERVICES, INC. A 
SUBSIDIARY OF 

ENVIRONMENTAL 
EARTHSCAPES, INC. 

DBA THE 
GROUNDSKEEPER

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX EL PASO, TX ALBUQUERQUE, NM

$8,964.00 $36,000.00 $22,402.80 NO BID $53,730.00 $37,800.00
# points 65 65.00 16.19 26.01 #VALUE! 10.84 15.41

# points 20 12.50 12.00 18.84 0.00 13.00 12.50

# points 10 2.00 2.00 8.00 8.00 2.00 8.00

# points 5 3.34 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

82.84 35.19 57.85 13.00 30.84 40.91

MARTINEZ IRRIGATION & 
LANDSCAPES INC.

PRIME 
IRRIGATION & 

LANDSCAPE, INC.

THREE C'S 
CONTRACTORS, 

INC.

WCD 
ENTERPRISES, 

LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO,  TX

$47,340.00 $46,800.00 $13,590.00 $18,000.00
# points 65 12.31 12.45 42.87 32.37

# points 20 0.00 0.00 19.27 0.00

# points 10 0.00 0.00 2.00 2.00

# points 5 0.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

12.31 12.45 69.14 39.37

NATURAL LINEAR PARK - GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

WESTSIDE GROUP IV
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance

NATURAL LINEAR PARK - GROUP I TOTAL POINTS

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET - NATURAL LINEAR PARK
GROUNDS MAINTENANCE FOR EL PASO CITY PARKS - MOWING

NATURAL LINEAR PART - GROUP I
Cost

Reputation and Quality of Bidder's Service

Employee Medical Benefits and Incentives

Past Performance
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