CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Facilities and Fleet Management

AGENDA DATE: March 24, 2015

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE:  Larry F. Nichols, Facilities and Fleet Management Interim Director,
(915) 212-8000
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, (915) 212-1181

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL
STRATEGIC GOAL: No. 6: Set The Standard For Sound Governance And Fiscal
Management
SUBJECT:

The Facilities and Fleet Management Department would like to recommend the award of Solicitation No.
2015-444 (Trucks, Small SUV’s and Vans) to Dick Poe Dodge LP and Rudolph Chevrolet LLC for a one
(1) year term. The estimated award is for $1,132,736.20.

ck Poe Dodge, 294,0
Rudolph Chevrolet, LLC 8 thru 18 $837,228.00
Total $1,131,276.35

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The City is currently in the process of replacing the old fleet through a Fleet Replacement Program that
targets vehicles that have met their life expectancy. Once identified, they are replaced with new, more
cost effective vehicles that operate more efficiently and are environmentally-friendly. Local business is
being supported

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:
Yes. Council previously awarded contract 2012-293 on October 9, 2012, item 10A.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on 11/25/2014 and 12/02/2014. The solicitation was posted on City website on
11/25/2014. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on 11/25/2014. Total of twenty-three (23)
bidders were solicited; seventeen (17) local vendors. Received six (6) bids and five (5) were local
vendors.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
Departments and Funding Source:

Facilities and Fleet Management Department - General Fund-Vehicle Replacement Fund
Dept: 231 Div: 37010 Acct: 580540 Fund: 4932 Project: PIF14GS010

Environmental Services Department - Enterprise Fund — Cars_Pickups Vans & Vehicular Equipment
Dept: 334 Div: 34050 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3150 Program: P3450 Project: PESD00150

Dept: 334 Div: 34050 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3120 Program: P3450

Dept: 334 Div: 34050 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3120 Program: P3454

Dept: 334 Div: 34100 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3150 Program: P3412 Project: PESD00150

Dept: 334 Div: 34030 Acct: 580060 Fund: 3150 Program: P3432 Project: PESD00150

Dept: 334 Div: 34030 Acct: 580060 Fund: 3110 Program: P3436 Project: G341519

Dept: 334 Div: 34030 Acct: 580060 Fund: 3150 Program: P3438 Project: PESD00150

Dept: 334 Div: 34030 Acct: 580060 Fund: 3150 Program: P3440 Project: PESD00150




Dept: 334 Div: 34080 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3150 Program: P3480 Project: PESD00150
Dept: 334 Div: 34080 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3150 Program: P3486 Project: PESD00150
Dept: 334 Div: 34130 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3150 Program: P3470 Project: PESD00150
Dept: 334 Div: 34130 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3150 Program: P3472 Project: PESD00150

El Paso International Airport — Enterprise Fund — Cars_Pickups Vans, Vehicular Equipment &
Maintenance Equipment

Dept: 562 Div: 62220 Acct: 580590 Fund: 3080 Project: P5000040

Dept: 562 Div: 62220 Acct: 580060 Fund: 3080 Project: P5000040

Dept: 562 Div: 62220 Acct: 580540 Fund: 3080 Project: P5000040

Convention and Performing Arts — Capital Fund/Internally Funded - Cars_Pickups Vans
Dept: 457 Div: 57040 Acct: 580540 Fund: 4920 Project: P_501591

Total Estimated Amount: $1,131,276.35

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
N/A

******'k*************AUTHORIZATION********************

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Larry F. Nichols, Interim Director
Facilities and Fleet Management Department



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(BEST VALUE BID)

**POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW* * kR

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of MARCH 24,
2015.

STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 6: Set The Standard For Sound Governance And Fiscal
Management

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2015-444 (Trucks, Small SUVs, and Vans)
to Dick Poe Dodge LP and Rudolph Chevrolet, LLC for a total estimated award of $1,131,276.35.

Department: Facilities and Fleet Management
Award to: Vendor 1: Dick Poe Dodge LP
El Paso, TX
Item(s): 1,2,3,4,5,6,and 7
Term: 1 year
Option to Extend: None
Total Estimated Award: $294,048.35 (1 year)
Award to: Vendor 2: Rudolph Chevrolet, LLC
El Paso, TX
Item(s): 8,9, 10, 11,12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, and 18
Term: 1 year
Option to Extend: None
Total Estimated Award: $837,228.00 (1 year)
Total Estimated Award: $1,131,276.35 (Vendors 1 and 2)
Account Nos.: 231-37010-580540-4932-PIF14GS010

334-34050-580540-3150-P3450-PESD00150
334-34050-580540-3120-P3450
334-34050-580540-3120-P3454
334-34100-580540-3150-P3412-PESD00150
334-34030-580060-3150-P3432-PESD00150
334-34030-580060-3110-P3436-G341519
334-34030-580060-3150-P3438-PESD00150
334-34030-580060-3150-P3440-PESD00150
334-34080-580540-3150-P3480-PESD00150
334-34080-580540-3150-P3486-PESD00150
334-34130-580540-3150-P3470-PESD00150
334-34130-580540-3150-P3472-PESD00150

562-62220-580590-3080-P5000040
562 62220 580060 3080 P5000040
562 62220 580540 3080 P5000040
457-57040-580540-4920-P_501591

Funding Source: Facilites and Fleet Management - General Fund-Vehicle
Replacement Fund



District(s):

Environmental Services Department -Enterprise Fund —
Cars_Pickups_Vans & Vehicular Equipment

El Paso International Airport Enterprise Fund -
Cars_Pickups_Vans-Vehicular Equipment & Maintenance
Equipment

Convention and Performing Arts — Capital Fund/Internally
Funded - Cars_Pickups_Vans

All

This is a Best Value, vehicle purchase contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and Facilities and Fleet Management
Department recommend award as indicated to Dick Poe Dodge, LP and Rudolph Chevrolet,
LLC the bidders offering the best value bids.

****ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

SOLICITATION TITLE:

Cost $26,551.59 $27,064.00 $25,607.03 $0.00 $28,524.00 $27,407.80
(# points/percent max) 62.69 61.50 65.00 0.00 58.35 '60.73
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 83.69 83.00 16.00 94.69 96.23

(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 1: 3/4 Ton Pickup, Exténded Cab, REGULAR box size, 4x4, gas, V8, Automatic Transmission, White Exterior, Standard
Interior, Ac, Auto door locks, power windows, seats, vinyl floor covering, SPOTLIGHT ON BOTH SIDES, towing Package, hitch




COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $52,593.24 $50,901.54 $0.00 $0.00 $51,558.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 62.91 65.00 0.00 0.00 64.17 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 8.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information .
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
Vehicle Fuel Economy
(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 . 0.00 0.00
Past Performance
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
GRAND TOTAL 115 83.91 18.00 16.00 100.51 35.50
(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 2: 1/2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, LONG 8’ BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL WINDOWS, SEATS,
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH, LIGHTBAR-AMBER



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $69,596.82 $67,257.81 $74,652.09 $0.00 $67,536.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 62.82 65.00 0.00 0.00 64.73 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

@ points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 83.82 18.00 16.00 101.07 35.50

100 points/percent max)

ITEM 3: 1/2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, SPOTLIGHTS BOTH FRONT PILLARS, TOWING
PACKAGE



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $22,594.25 $21,802.00 $21,421.75 $0.00 $21,611.00 $0.00
(@ points/percent max) 65 62.17 64.43 0.00 0.00 65.00 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

@# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 83.17 18.00 16.00 101.34 35.50

(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 4: 1/2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $24,652.85 $24,145.00 $23,498.75 $0.00 $24,473.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 63.66 63.26 65.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
@# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

@ points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 84.66 83.00 16.00 36.34 35.50

(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 5: 1/2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL WINDOWS, SEATS,
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $55,621.70 $54,244.00 $52,455.50 $0.00 $53,314.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 61.30 62.86 65.00 0.00 63.95 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
Vehicle Fuel Economy
(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 82.30

83.00 16.00 100.29 35.50
(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 6: 1/2 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $49,605.76 $48,634.00 $0.00 $0.00 $48,482.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 63.53 64.80 0.00 0.00 65.00 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
Vehicle Fuel Economy
(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
GRAND TOTAL 115 84.53 18.00 16.00 101.34 35.50
100 points/percent max)

ITEM 7: 1/2 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, LONG 8’ BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $57,181.70 $55,030.00 $53,551.50 $0.00 $53,570.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 60.87 63.25 65.00 0.00 64.98 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 81.87 100.75 83.00 16.00 35.50

100 points/percent max)

ITEM 8: 1/2 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, LONG BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $84,980.55 $82,545.00 $79,481.25 $0.00 $80,355.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 61.46 63.28 65.71 0.00 65.00 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

Staff Experience
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy
(# points/ max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 82.46 100.78 83.71 16.00

35.50
100 points/percent max)

ITEM 9: 1/2 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH SYNC OR EQUIVALENT



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $119,005.68 $129,264.00 $134,206.50 $112,089.66 $116,028.00 $0.00

(# points/percent max) 65 61.22 56.36 54.29 65.00 62.79 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

@ points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy
(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 82.22 93.86 72.29 81.00
100 Eolnts/gercent max]

35.50

ITEM 10: 1/2 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $40,212.50 $44,564.00 $44,899.50 $38,050.72 $39,262.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 61.51 55.50 55.09 65.00 62.99 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

Staff Experience

@# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
Vehicle Fuel Economy
(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 82.51 93.00 73.09 81.00

35.50
(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 11: 1/2 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

(100 points/percent max)

Cost $119,005.68 $131,064.00 $134,206.50 $112,089.66 $116,028.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 61.22 55.59 54.29 65.00 62.79 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 S.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.00
Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 15 82.22 93.09 72.29 81.00 35.50

ITEM 12: 1/2 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER

WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING




COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $39,668.56 $43,688.00 $44,735.50 $37,363.22 $38,676.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 61.22 55.59 5429 65.00 62.79 0.00

Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50

Guaranteed Delivery Date
(@# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

Staff Experience
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

@ points/oercent ma) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 82.22 93.09 72.29 81.00
100 points/percent max)

35.50

ITEM 13: 1/2 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $43,283.70 $43,088.00 $40,677.50 $0.00 $41,902.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 61.09 61.36 65.00 0.00 63.10 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 82.09 98.86 83.00 16.00 35.50

(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 14: 1/2 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL
FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $34,963.90 $38,206.00 $40,405.75 $36,212.45 $35,767.00 $36,031.03
(# points/percent max) 65 65.00 59.48 56.25 62.76 63.54 63.07

Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50

Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 86.00 96.98 74.25 78.76 98.57

(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 15: 1 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2, DIESEL, V8 6.6L, AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, A/C, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PKG, HITCH, DUEL WHEELS



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $251,819.04 $286,539.00 $286,437.25 $0.00 $248,732.00 $0.00
(# points/percent max) 65 64.20 56.42 56.44 0.00 65.00 0.00
Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50
Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00
Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00
Staff Experience

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 85.20 93.92 74.44 16.00 35.50

(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 16: 5 PASSENGER SUV, 4 DOOR, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, A/C, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, ALL WEATHER FLOOR
MATS



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $43,814.66 $52,276.00 $0.00 $0.00 $44,642.00 $46,230.80
(# points/percent max) 65 65.00 54.48 0.00 0.00 63.80 61.60

Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50

Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

Staff Experience
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy

(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 86.00 91.98 18.00 16.00
(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 17: %2 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR,
50/50, SPLIT WITH WINDOWS, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
STANDARD INTERIOR, POWER DOOR LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, A/C, REAR A/C, BUCKET 2
SEAT, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, BULKHEAD WITHOUT DOOR



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-444
SOLICITATION TITLE: Trucks, Small SUVs and Vans
GENERAL SERVICES -FLEET DIVISION

Cost $24,990.94 $26,768.00 $0.00 $20,555.96 $22,266.00 $25,432.04
(# points/percent max) 65 53.46 49.92 0.00 65.00 60.01 52.54

Reputation & Quality of the Bidder’s Service
(# points/percent max) 20 0.00 11.50 0.00 0.00 13.34 12.50

Guaranteed Delivery Date
(# points/percent max) 10 6.00 6.00 8.00 6.00 8.00 8.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00

Staff Experience
(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

Vehicle Fuel Economy
(# points/percent max) 5 0.00 5.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 5.00 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

GRAND TOTAL 115 74.46 87.42 18.00 81.00
(100 points/percent max)

ITEM 18: % TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR 50/50
SPLIT WITH WINDOWS, 4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

EL Pasﬁ

A-Raerica Liy.

11K

2000

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

16. TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD

WEATHER FLOOR MATS

5 PASSENGER SUB, 4 DOOR, 4X2 GAS, V6 AUTOMATIC

INTERIOR, A/C, SEATS VINYL FLOOR COVERING, ALL

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation #: 2015-444

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC
SELMA, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

1

Estimated Quantity X

UNIT PRICE Unit Price

NO BID

EL PASO, TX
UNITpRICE | Estimated Quantity X
Unit Price

$22,612.00

VINYL FLOOR
N/A

$248,732.00

Estimated Quantity X

UNIT PRICE Unit Price

NO BID

YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL

17.

15 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR, 50/50, SPLIT WITH
WINDOWS, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION,
WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, POWER DOOR 2
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, A/C, REAR A/C, BUCKET 2
SEAT, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, BULKHEAD WITHOUT
DOOR

NO BID

2015 CHEV EQUINOX ILH26

$22,321.00 $44,642.00

$23,115.40 $46,230.80

BIDDER'S PRICE
$46,230.88

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

18.

3% TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR 50/50 SPLIT WITH WINDOWS,
4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE 1
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, TOWING

PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT

$20,555.96 $20,555.96

2015 CHEV 2500 EXPRESS
CG23405

$22,266.00 $22,266.00

2015 FORD TRANSIT 150 LR

$25,432.04 $25,432.04

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

PAYMENT TERMS:

2015 CHEVROLET EXPRESS VAN

2500 CG23405

2015 CHEV 2500 EXPRESS CG23405

" NET - 30 DAYS

2015 FORD TRANSIT 250 LR

" NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES [ | No [X]

ves [ | No [x |

YES [ | NO [ X ]

LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:

BIDS SOLICITED: 23

17

BIDS RECEIVED: 6

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5

NO BID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES

12



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
Bl-faneieatity
M

2010

ITEM

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

\1;(

DESCRIPTION

KUP

%+ TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, SPOTLIGHT ON BOTH SIDES, TOWING

PACKAGE, HITCH

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
UNIT PRICE EStimate_d QL_la“ﬁty X UNIT PRICE Estimate.d Qt_:antity X UNIT PRICE Estimate‘d Ql:lantity X
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

$26,551.59

$26,551.59

$27,064.00 $27,064.00

$25,607.03 $25,607.03

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL WINDOWS, SEATS,
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
LIGHTBAR-AMBER

$26,296.62

$52,593.24

RAM 2500 2015 CREW CAB DJ7L91

$25,450.77

$50,901.54

2015 2500 REG CAB 4x4

NO BID

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2015 FORD F-150

2015 RAM 1500 4x4 QUAD CAB D56L41

Y2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, SPOTLIGHTS BOTH FRONT PILLARS,
TOWING PACKAGE

$23,198.94

$69,596.82

$22,419.27 $67,257.81

$24,884.03 $74,652.09

YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL

2015 FORD F-150

2015 RAM, 1500 4x2 QUAD CAB DS1L98

2015 QUAD CAB 1500

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

v

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015
Y s ™

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE e Quar UNIT PRICE o o UNIT PRICE pied Juar
15 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
4. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 1 $22,594.25 $22,594.25 | $21,802.00 $21,802.00 $21,421.75 $21,421.75
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 15)°s°1‘|‘ﬁ QUAD CAB 2015 QUAD CAB 1500 4x2
15 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
5, EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL 1 $24,652.85 $24,652.85 | $24,145.00 $24,145.00 $23,498.75 $23,498.75
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE
] 2015 RAM 1500 4X4 QUAD CAB 2015 QUAD CAB 4x4
YEAR | MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 v uAD G
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
6. | STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 $27,810.85 $55,621.70 | $27,122.00 $54,244.00 $26,227.75 $52,455.50
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH
RAM 1500 2015 4x4 CREW CAB 2015 1500 CREW CAB 4x4
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 Doss o CREW

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
5 TON PICKUP, CREW, CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
7. STANDARD INTERIOR, AC AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 $24,302.88 $49,605.76 $24,317.00 $48,634.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING
YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1500 4x2 DS1L91
¥ TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, LONG BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS,
V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
8. || STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 $28,590.85 $57,181.70 $27,515.00 $55,030.00 $26,775.75 $53,551.50
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT BIDDER'S PRICE
$80,327.50
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1500 4.4 CREW DSL91 2015 CREW CAB 1500 4x4
5 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
9. || STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 3 $28,326.85 $84,980.55 $27,515.00 $82,545.00 $26,493.75 $79,481.25
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH SYNC OR EQUIVALENT
YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1500 4x4 DS6L.91 2015 CREW CAB 4x4

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is/

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
[ 5o e 4 |

i

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO

ACQUISITIONS

dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO. TX
G
ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
. DESCRIPTION SUANTITY | UNIT PRICE pied Quan UNIT PRICE pied Suan UNIT PRICE pied Quan
15 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
10.| EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AD, AUTO DOOR 6 $19,834.28 $119,005.68 | $21,544.00 | $129,264.00 $22,367.75 $134,206.50
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING BIDDER'S PRICE
$129,624.00
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1;’2:’:6"22 REG CAB 2015 REG CAB 1500
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
11.| EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $20,106.25 $40,212.50 | $22,282.00 $44,564.00 $22,449.75 $44,899.50
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM :353010&22 REG CAB 2015 REG CAB 4x2
15 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
12.| EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 6 $19,834.28 $119,005.68 | $21,844.00 | $131,064.00 $22,367.75 $134,206.50
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING BIDDER'S PRICE
$133,106.00
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1135301"!_‘;’1‘2 REG CAB 2015 REG CAB 1500

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is]

DATE: 2/17/115

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
A-Bmesicaiity
1'“[?

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE

STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS,
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
. DESCRIPTION e | uNiT PRICE ared Quar UNIT PRICE ed Suan UNIT PRICE aied Quan
15 TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,

4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
13.| EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $19,834.28 $39,668.56 | $21,844.00 |  $43,688.00 $22,367.75 $44,735.50

LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR

COVERING
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM E‘g?l_‘:s’;z REG CAB 2015 REG CAB 1500
15, TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2,

14, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, 2 $21,641.85 $43,283.70 | $21,544.00 |  $43,088.00 $20,338.75 $40,677.50

15.

1 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2,
DIESEL, V8 6.6L, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, A/C, AUTO DOOR
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PKG, HITCH, DUEL WHEELS

2015 FORD F-150

2015 RAM 1500 4x2

2015 REG CAB 4x2

$34,963.90

$34,963.90

REG CAB V-8 DS1L61

$38,206.00

$38,206.00

$40,405.75

$40,405.75

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2015 FORD F-150

RAM 3500 4x2 CREW CAB DIESEL

2015 RAM 3500

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exrbad
BID TABULATION "0y

2010
BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS Solicitation #: 2015-444
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015 Department: GENERAL SERVICES

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS

CASA FORD INC. DICK POE DODGE LP
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE Estimated Quantity X UNIT PRICE Estimated Quantity X UNIT PRICE Estimated Quantity X

NO. QUANTITY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

5 PASSENGER SUB, 4 DOOR, 4X2 GAS, V6 AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD

16. 22,892.64 1,819. 26,049.00 ,539. 26,039.7 ,437.
INTERIOR, A/C, SEATS VINYL FLOOR COVERING, ALL 1 $ $251,819.04 | $286,539.00 S 9.75 $286,437.25
WEATHER FLOOR MATS
2075 DURANGO SPECTAL SERVICE

YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD ESCAPE

2015 JEEP GRAND CHEROKEE
)N CARGOVAN T T T T

2 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO

DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR, 50/50, SPLIT WITH
WINDOWS, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION,
17. || WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, POWER DOOR 2 $21,907.33 $43,814.66 $26,138.00 $52,276.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, A/C, REAR A/C, BUCKET 2
SEAT, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, BULKHEAD WITHOUT
DOOR

2015 RAM 1500 PROMASTER 1500
CARGO VAN 136 WB VF1L12

YEAR | MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD TRANSIT 150

34 TONCARG \
% TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR 50/50 SPLIT WITH WINDOWS,
18. 4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE 1 $24,990.94 $24,990.94 $26,768.00 $26,768.00 NO BID

EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT

2075 RAM 1500 PROMASTER CARGO
VAN 136 WB VF2L13

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES [ ] NO ves [ ] NO[x | YES NO[ |

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information onlv and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD TRANSIT 250

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15 2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES 6




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO o
BID TABULATION RN

7BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES

SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price

QUANTITY

/4 TON

%4 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE

1. | EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 1 NO BID $28,524.00 |  $28,524.00 $27,407.80 $27,407.80
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, SPOTLIGHT ON BOTH SIDES, TOWING ADD $272.00
REMOTE
PACKAGE, HITCH REMOTE
2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 2015 CHEV CK25753 2015 FORD F250 LWB 158"WB

YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL

CK 25753 SUPERCAB

Y2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
2. | STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL WINDOWS, SEATS, 2
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
LIGHTBAR-AMBER

$51,558.00 NO BID

NO BID $25,779.00

2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500

CK 15753 2015 CHEV CK15753

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

Y2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE

EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, SPOTLIGHTS BOTH FRONT PILLARS,

TOWING PACKAGE

NO BID

$22,512.00

ADD $272.00
REMOTE

KEYI FSS

$67,536.00

NO

BID

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500

CK 15753

2015 CHEV CC15753

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee,

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION 0y

2030

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

e i
GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
\ SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
o o (
ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
2 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
4. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 1 NO BID $21,611.00 $21,611.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR ADD $§272.00
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR | MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVR0|;§;5§ILVERADO cc 2015 CHEV CC15753
5 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
5. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL 1 NO BID $24,473.00 $24,473.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15753
CK 15753
5 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
6. | STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 NO BID $26,657.00 $53,314.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH ADD #272.00
REMOTE
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVR°L1E5T,f;LVERAD° CK 2015 CHEV CK15743
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 2/17/15 2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES 8




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO ey
BID TABULATION *Il}i!f

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

. ,

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

C

K15743

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
6.5' BOX
15 TON PICKUP, CREW, CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2,
7. | GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, 2 NO BID $24,241.00 $48,482.00 NO BID
STANDARD INTERIOR, AC AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING Ai‘g;f;ﬁg’f’
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15743
CK 15743
6.5' BOX
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, LONG BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS,
V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
8. | STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 NO BID $26,785.00 $53,570.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING ADD $272.00
PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CK15743
CK15743
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
9. || STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 3 NO BID $26,785.00 $80,355.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING ADD $272.00
PACKAGE, HITCH SYNC OR EQUIVALENT REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CK15743

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
Al-fmstioa ity
I "r

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING

-
i

DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES

SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
. DESCRIPTION SUANTITY | UNIT PRICE pied Suan UNIT PRICE pied S UNIT PRICE piod Quan
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
10. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AD, AUTO DOOR 6 $18,681.61 $112,089.66 $19,338.00 $116,028.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15703
cc15703
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
11.| EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $19,025.36 $38,050.72 | $19,631.00 $39,262.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15703
CC15703
15 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
12. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 6 $18,681.61 $112,089.66 $19,338.00 $116,028.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING
YEAR | MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500

CC 15703

2015 CHEV CC15703

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES

10



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
Al-Banericabity
L ‘ " 7

2010

[BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

L e

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES

CC35943

SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE aiod Suan UNIT PRICE pied ua UNIT PRICE et Juar
15 TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
13.| EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $18,681.61 $37,363.22 | $19,338.00 |  $38,676.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 2015 CHEV CC15703
CK15703
15 TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
14-1 STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, 2 NO BID $20,951.00 | $41,902.00 NO BID
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 2015 CHEV CC15903
1 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2,
DIESEL, V8 6.6L, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
15. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, A/C, AUTO DOOR 1 $36,212.45 $36,212.45 $35,767.00 $35,767.00 $36,031.03 $36,031.03
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR ADD $510.00
COVERING, TOWING PKG, HITCH, DUEL WHEELS REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 3500 2015 CHEV CC35943 2015 FORD F350 DRW DIESEL 6.7 LUG

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES

1



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

¥1 Paso

{114

2030

-
[BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

.

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

\SSENGER

5 PASSENGER SUB, 4 DOOR, 4X2 GAS, V6 AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD
INTERIOR, A/C, SEATS VINYL FLOOR COVERING, ALL
WEATHER FLOOR MATS

16.

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

11

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC
SELMA, TX

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
EL PASO, TX

UNIT PRICE Unit Price

NO BID

Estimated Quantity X

Estimated Quantity X

UNIT PRICE Unit Price

$22,612.00

VINYL FLOOR
N/A

$248,732.00

UNIT PRICE

NO BID

Estimated Quantity X
Unit Price

YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL
_ 12TONCARGOVAN
Y2 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR, 50/50, SPLIT WITH

WINDOWS, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION,

WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, POWER DOOR
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, A/C, REAR A/C, BUCKET 2
SEAT, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, BULKHEAD WITHOUT

DOOR

17.

NO BID

2015 CHEV EQUINOX ILH26

$22,321.00

$44,642.00

$23,115.40

$46,230.80

BIDDER'S PRICE
$46,230.88

YEAR | MAKE AND MODEL
_3/4 TON Ci ;

%4 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR 50/50 SPLIT WITH WINDOWS,
4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT

18.

$20,555.96 $20,555.96

2015 CHEV 2500 EXPRESS
CG23405

$22,266.00 $22,266.00

$25,432.04

2015 FORD TRANSIT 150 LR

$25,432.04

YEAR /| MAKE AND MODEL

PAYMENT TERMS:

2500 CG23405

2015 CHEVROLET EXPRESS VAN

2015 CHEV 2500 EXPRESS CG23405

NET - 30 DAYS

2015 FORD TRANSIT 250 LR

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES [ | No [X]

YEs [ | No

YES [ ]

vo [x]

BIDS SOLICITED: 23 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 17

BIDS RECEIVED: 6

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5

NO BID:

0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES

12



DICK POE CHRYSLER
6501 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SUNLAND PARK
PONTIAC BUICK GMC
955 CROCKETT WAY
EL PASO, TX 79922

HOY FOX AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
7230 VISCOUNT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MACK MASSEY MOTORS
950 CROCKETT STREET
EL PASO, TX 79922

DRIVEWAY DODGE
8434 GATEWAY BLVD. E
EL PASO, TX 79907

ASMAR TRUCK EQUIPMENT
7713 ALAMEDA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

JACK KEY MOTORS
1840 N. MAIN
LAS CRUCES, NM 88001

BORMAN MOTOR COMPANY
470 W. BOUTZ
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005

DICK POE DEALERSHIPS
1363 AIRWAY BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79925

MISSION CHEVROLET
1316 GEORGE DIETER
EL PASO, TX 79936

RUDOLPH AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
ATTN: MIKE RUFFIN

5625 S. DESERT

EL PASO, TX 79932

BRAVO CHEVROLET
CADILLAC HUMMER
6555 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EL PASO HONDA
1490 LEE TREVINO
EL PASO, TX 79936

ENTERPRISE RENT-A-CAR
ATTN: JENNIFER JENNINGS
4115 N. MESA

EL PASO, TX 79902

BRAVO CHEVROLET
1601 S. MAIN ST.
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005

VISION FORD LINCOLN-MERCURY

1500 S. WHITE SANDS BLVD.
ALAMOGORDO, NM 88310

MIDWAY CHEVROLET
5915 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

SHAMLALEY FORD
11301 GATEWAY BLVD. W
EL PASO, TX 79936

CASA FORD

ATTN: RICK KENLEY
5815 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

TRAVIS CRAWFORD BUICK
6800 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

EXPRESSWAY FORD
5550 N. DESERT BLVD.
EL PASO, TX 79912

FABCO INDUSTRIES INC.
8406 SPRAGUE ROAD
ODESSA, TX 79764

SISBARRO BUICK, PONTIAC
425 W. BOUTZ ROAD
LAS CRUCES, NM 88005



