CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
AGENDA DATE: March 31, 2015

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: TED MARQUEZ, DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DIRECTOR, 212-7000
BRUCE D. COLLINS, PURCHASING DIRECTOR, 212-1181

DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL

STRATEGIC GOAL: Strategic Goal #7 — Enhance and Sustain El Paso’s Infrastructure Network

SUBJECT:

Department of Transportation recommends award to General Traffic Equipment Corp, for solicitation 2015-586
Traffic Signal Components. Items 1 through 23 consist of, but not limited to, push buttons, pedestals, visors, and
various traffic signal hardware. The annual quantities range from 50 to 800 depending per item. General Traffic
Equipment Corp. had the overall lowest price for all items as requested in solicitation.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

Department of Transportation has reviewed solicitation 2015-586 and recommends the contract be awarded to General
Traffic Equipment Corp., for an annual estimated amount of $145,820, as the lowest and most responsible bidder.
Contract term is for 36 months (3 years) with an estimated three year total of $437,460. An option for additional 24
months (2 years) with an estimated two year total of $291,640 is available. Total contract term would be for 60 months
(5 years) with an estimated amount five year total of $729,100.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on 1/13/2015 and 1/20/2015. The postcards were mailed out on 1/14/2015. The
solicitation was posted on City website on 1/13/2015. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on 1/15/2015. A
total of six (6) bidders, none local, were solicited. A total of five (5) bids were received, none being a local vendor.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Council previously awarded Contact 2011-320 Traffic Signal Components on October 25, 2011.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

P3252-32020-532030-1000-532 General Fund, Traffic Signals, Public Access Maint & Repair

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

s REQUIRED AUTHORIZA TIQN stttk

DEPARTMENT HEAD: Ted Marquez, P.E.

Name Signature Date




DEPARTMENT HEAD: _ Ted Marquez, P.E.

Name Signature Date



Attachment 1.

Estimated

Items Vendor Description Annual Unit Price Estimated | Estimated 3 | Option
. Annual Year Offered
Quantity
1 General Traffic |~ Push Button Signs 200 $56.00 $11,200 $33,600 2 Vr.
Equipment Corp 57 x7
General Traffic Push Button
2 Equipment Corp Assembly 9% x 12 200 $56.00 $11,200 $33,600 2 Yr.
3 Get}eral Traffic Push B’l’lttor}’&gns 200 $6.00 $1.200 $3,600 2VT.
Equipment Corp 57x7
A Ger}eral Traffic Push Bylylttons;,Slgns 200 $8.50 $1,700 $5.100 2Vt
Equipment Corp 97 x 12
5 General Traffic Adjustable Mast 150 $88.00 | $13,200 $39,600 2Yr.
Equipment Corp Arm Hanger
6 General Traffic Mast Arm Mount 200 $88.00 $17,600 $52,800 2Yr.
Equipment Corp Signal Bracket
7 Ger}eral Traffic Hardware — Serrated 150 $15.00 $2.250 $6.750 2Vr.
Equipment Corp Cross
General Traffic Hardware
8 Equipment Corp Horizontal Slip Tee 150 $10.00 $1.500 $4,500 2 Y.
General Traffic HUB 8” for Mast
9 Equipment Corp Arm Pole 200 $9.00 $1,800 $5,400 2 Yr.
10 General Traffic | pym 4o for 4 Pole 220 $8.00 $1,760 $5,280 2Yr.
Equipment Corp
General Traffic ADA Round Push
11 . ' Button Assembly W 210 $26.00 $5,460 $16,380 2 Yr.
Equipment Corp "
2” Plunger
12 General Traffic Slipfitter for two 150 $90.00 | $13,500 $40,500 | 2Vr.
Equipment Corp Way Signal
General Traffic Aluminum Pedestal
13 Equipment Corp Pole 4 x 16° 100 $180.00 $18,000 $54,000 2 Yr.
General Traffic 90 Degree
14 Equipment Corp Aluminum Elbow 200 $9.00 $1.800 $5,400 2 Yr.
General Traffic Nipple, All
15 Equipment Corp Thread(Alum) 150 $6.00 $900 $2,700 2Yr.
General Traffic .
16 Equipment Corp Hex, Nipple 200 $3.00 $600 $1,800 2 Yr.
General Traffic Screw, Setc Soc HD
17 Equipment Corp (Stainless) 200 $.25 $50 $150 2 Yr.
General Traffic .
18 Equipment Corp Hex, Nipple 200 $3.00 $600 $1,800 2Yr.
19 Ger}eral Traffic Gasket, 70 Duro 200 $.50 $100 $300 2Yr.
Equipment Corp Neoprene
20 Ger.leral Traffic CAP, Octagonal 200 $3.00 $600 $1,800 2 Yr.
Equipment Corp Closure




Attachment 1.

21

General Traffic
Equipment Corp

Base. Aluminum
Square Signal

250

$118.00

$29,500

$88,500

2Yr.

22

General Traffic
Equipment Corp

12” Vehicle Tunnel
Visor Yellow
w/Universal Clip.
Aluminum Black
Flat Paint Inside
Hood

800

$12.50

$10,000

$30,000

2 Yr.

23

General Traffic
Equipment Corp

18” Vehicle Tunnel
Visor Yellow
w/Universal Clip.
Aluminum Black
Flat Paint Inside
Hood

50

$26.00

$1,300

$3,900

2 Yr.

TOTALS

$145,820

$437,460




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(REQUIREMENTS OR BEST VALUE BID)

*****************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*******************************************
Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of MARCH 31, 2015.

STRATEGIC GOAL: Strategic Goal #7 — Enhance and Sustain El Paso’s Infrastructure Network

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2015-586 (Traffic Signal Components) to General Traffic
Equipment Corp. for an initial three (3) year term in the estimated amount of $437,460. The award is to include
a two (2) year optional amount of $291,640 for a total five (5) year award of $729,100.

Department: Transportation

Award to: General Traffic Equipment Corp.
Newburgh, NY

ltem(s): All

Initial Term: 3 years

Option to Extend: 2 years

Annual Estimated Award: $145,820.00

Initial Term Estimated Award:  $437,460.00 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $729,100.00 (5 years)

Account No.: 532-532030-32020-1000-P3252

Funding Source: General Fund, Traffic Signals—Public Access Maint & Repair

District(s): All

This is a low bid, unit price contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and Department of Transportation recommend award as
indicated to General Traffic Equipment Corp., the lowest responsive, responsible bidder. In accordance
with this award the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future options if needed.

Recommend that the following bidders be deemed non-responsive:

Incomplete Bid

Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc.
Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.
Traffic Parts, Inc.

*******************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW**********************************************



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

2010 "',
Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC
ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

APPROVED

N

DATE: : 2 \15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

o DESCRIPTION EST.ANNUAL| 17 price {22%'@51&%? AL roraLas | UNIT PRICE ég‘T:}*:??*;L,’;‘E?L (ANGALTOTAL X5
NO.
1. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 $107.00 $21,400.00 $64,200.00 $56.00 $11,200.00 $33,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, PBF 5X7 + BDL3-X GTE PBA-1010ADA
2. PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" x 12" 200 $123.26 $24,652.00 $73,956.00 $56.00 $11,200.00 $33,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, PBF9X12 + BDL3-X GTE PBA-1020ADA
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 $12.19 $2,438.00 $7,314.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, 800-87 GTE PS
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO Exsred

B
.

BID TABULATION FORM T
2010

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 20

Solicitation #: 2015-586
15 _ Department: TRANSPORTATION

;w%‘/vl

- .5, ( y CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC., GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
L ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
DESCRIPTION EST ANNUAL| 1 oy {‘”"“ALT%}?L SYEARTOTAL | T pRice {‘”"”A”%}t“ 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO.
4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" x 12" 200 $15.94 $3,188.00 $9,564.00 $8.50 $1,700.00 $5,100.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, 800H-86 GTE
5. ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER 150 $106.69 $16,003.50 $48,010.50 $88.00 $13,200.00 $39,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SK-0203 GTE HPBA-1150
6. MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 200 $75.44 $15,088.00 $45,264.00 $88.00 $17,600.00 $52,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, AS3009-SS-84-PNC GTE RM-~1000C

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: & 5& 5&;

DATE: ; 2’ &-g j 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4 2015

El Paso

All-merizaCity

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.

Department: TRANSPORTATION

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP

ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
TEM EST. ANNUAL ANNUAL TOTAL | 5 yvpaR ToTAL 5r M= |3 YEAR TOTAL
o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE (EST ANNUAL G- | Gt ToTAL x3) UNIT PRIGE (ESTANUAL QT | (i ToTAL 239
7. HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS 150 $20.75 $3,112.50 $9,337.50 $15.00 $2,250.00 $6,750.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-4038-P29 GTE CF-260
8. HARDWARE H((;?ESL'\)‘TAL SLIP TEE 150 $21.38 $3,207.00 $9,621.00 $10.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0474-P29

GTE TF-250RR

9. HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE 200 $10.06 $2,012.00 $6,036.00 $9.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0357-PNC GTE PBH-425
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ( ; \/l L
Yy

DATE: l 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015 ‘

El Paso

| o |

AB-imerica Gity

L8
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

ITEM DESCRIPTION EZT[} :»T#%L UNIT PRICE f:yr’: ;ﬂ'@i‘é}?’; o oA UNIT PRICE é?r?}%@;i%?& oA ToTAL

NO. ‘

10. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE 220 $11.63 $2,558.60 $7,675.80 $8.00 $1,760.00 $5,280.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0454-PNC GTE PBH-420

11. ADA ROUNV?".IP_::I,SZI;I EEJ;ggRASSEMBLY 210 $80.46 $16,896.60 $50,689.80 $26.00 $5,460.00 $16,380.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, BDL3 + PBC-X GTE PBH-ADA

12. SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL 150 $33.38 $5,007.00 $15,021.00 $90.00 $13,500.00 $40,500.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-3106-P29 GTE PTSA-200

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: C; 5& AN

DATE: ; ) q L; i 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

sl
Sxed
All Sity
| , l f

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

imem DESCRIPTION ESTANNUALL 11 oy {‘”””"”%}i“ SYEARTOTAL | \iT pRicE {‘""”"”%)E‘L 3 YEARTOTAL

NO.

13. ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" x 15’ 100 $260.13 $26,013.00 $78,039.00 $180.00 $18,000.00 $54,000.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, PB-5100-15 CPI

14. 90 DEGREE ALUM ELBOW 200 $9.94 $1,988.00 $5,964.00 $9.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0457-P29 GTE EF-240

15. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) 150 $6.31 $946.50 $2,839.50 $6.00 $900.00 $2,700.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0309-2.13 GTE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: & Zs ;’ E;

DATE: 5. '2 i L j 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



CITY OF EL PASO Exond

BID TABULATION FORM Ty
Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Bid Op ning Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015 Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.| GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
ITEM
DESCRIPTION EZle :ﬁ#g\?" UNIT PRICE (AEST:I&:QVEJQEOSFI; g&ﬁﬁﬁg&[ﬁ; UNIT PRICE 22{‘1 g@;i%?k . Eﬁﬂg&{ﬁ;
NO.
16. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $4.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0448-PNC GTE CN-H-150A
17. SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) 200 $0.44 $88.00 $264.00 $0.25 $50.00 $150.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, FS-3217-SS (none stated)
18. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $4.06 $812.00 $2,436.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0443 GTE CN-H-150A

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Q }&/ C

DATE: g‘ 2 "{ ) 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015
i

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

e o

All-mericaGity
i ' ! l i f
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

= DESCRIPTION AR UNIT PRICE {22"%’,}@3&%;“ owonL romaLay | UNIT PRICE ég{lfl‘:ﬁé‘g}& (AL TOTAL <

NO.

19. GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE 200 $0.25 $50.00 $150.00 $0.50 $100.00 $300.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0354 GTE RW-150

20. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE 200 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0448 GTE

21. BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL 250 $125.75 $31,437.50 $94,312.50 $118.00 $29,500.00 $88,500.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

PELCO, SP-1014-TX

GPI

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: : ; §S g& :

DATE: 55“ i’\ j

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



‘ CITY OF EL PASO
Z; BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

Adl-imerica ity

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP

ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTiJﬁII\lTNéJé\IIé S)TY x (ANNUAL TOTAL £3) UNIT PRICE (ESTi]ﬁlI\ITN;JRI,\IIE él)TY.x (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3
NO.
12" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
22 | w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 800 $13.75 $11,000.00 $33,000.00 $12.50 $10,000.00 $30,000.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & NMODEL McCAIN, M19278 GTE TV-12-A
18" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
23.|| w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.00 $1,300.00 $3,900.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE IN HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL GTE TV-12-A7-EXT

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: : ; )S ; g

DATE: _ ¢ 5 ( l6/

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bld Openlng Date FEBRUARY 4 2015

El Paso

-imgricatily

et = 4
A

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

. o

SRR

5
.
9.”

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.
'* ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED D [:]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 21 30
Within consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 24 (none stated)

s Ty G S

APPROVED BY: :g 5& {%:

DATE: 5 l "\C §

NOTE: The information contalnecl in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.




Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid O

ing Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-Amsrica City
| 1K

. 2010 :

Solicitation #: 2015-586

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

Department: TRANSPORTATION

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

CONROE, TX

ITEM EST. ANNUAL ANNUAL TOTAL | 3 ypaR TOTAL e5r At | 3 YEARTOTAL

o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (EST. ANNUAL g)w X | (ANNUALTOTALx3) UNIT PRICE (EST. ANNUAL '(EJ)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL 23}

1. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 $53.00 $10,600.00 $31,800.00 $39.75 $7,950.00 $23,850.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2011-08 CHI/TP PB-S10-823-Y

2. PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" x 12" 200 $70.00 $14,000.00 $42,000.00 $66.00 $13,200.00 $39,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL SE-2013-08 CHI/TP PB-S10-B43-Y
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.25 $2,250.00 $6,750.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL N/A
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

SIGN & SUPPLY R10-46 5X7.75

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

10



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso
All-Aimesica City
i i ! i B F

‘2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

CONROE, TX
'T_E"" EST. ANNUAL ANNUALTOTAL | yp oo, ANNUALTOTAL | 5 yenprorar
o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (Esrbmm:& cEq)w. x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTiJI:III\lTN;IQLé S)w. x| (ANNUALTOTALx3)
4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" x 12" 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.25 $2,250.00 $6,756.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL N/A SIGN & SUPPLY R10-4b-9X12
5. ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER 150 $98.00 $14,700.00 $44,100.00 $58.25 $8,737.50 $26,212.50
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SK-0230 CHITP 6113 *PAINT YELLOW
6. MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 200 $65.00 $13,000.00 $39,000.00 $59.00 $11,800.00 $35,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO AB-3009-62-SS

CHITP 5624

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: g >\_J ;;

DATE: ‘2! l/L ) 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

11



Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015 _

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-imerica Gily

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION Sy | ONTPRGE | mmamaers | YENIOTAL | uwremoe | ARSI | svess rora
NO.
7. HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS 150 $19.50 $2,925.00 $8,775.00 $13.00 $1,950.00 $5,850.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4038 CHITP 5860
8. HARDWARE H((;?:EZSLI'\)ITAL SLIP TEE 150 $20.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $4,950.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4092-SBE CHITP 2750 * PAINT YELLOW
9. HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE 200 $9.50 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 $7.25 $1,450.00 $4,350.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0357 CHITP 5357

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:Q L\
DATE: 5’2 3 6

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

12



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bld Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015 -

s e e

El Paso
Bo, sl

k%)
iy

%i

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

CONROE, TX
im AA 5 { ' i
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTh/:lr;lTNFl’JQI&S;'Y. x (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3) UNIT PRICE (EST'.JI:IIIQTN;J;\IIEE)TY. x (ANNUAL TOTAL % 3)
NO.
10. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE 220 $11.00 $2,420.00 $7,260.00 $7.25 $1,595.00 $4,785.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4071 CHITP 5358
ADA ROUND PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY
11. WITH 2" PLUNGER 210 $49.00 $10,290.00 $30,870.00 $16.00 $3,360.00 $10,080.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2149-08 CH/ITP PB-S10-300Y
12. SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL 150 $31.00 $4,650.00 $13,950.00 $37.00 $5,550.00 $16,650.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-3106 CH/TP 2583 *PAINT YELLOW

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of co

APPROVED BY: Q/ i

DATE: _ ¢

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

ntract.

13



El Paso
Al-America Gity

T

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid OpenivngvDate: FEBR_UARYV4, 2015

y\”/

J ..
PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
EST. ANNUAL ANNUAL TOTAL YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (EST'.J?III\ITN:)J}QII&(EJ)TY. x &NNUAL TOTAL3) UNIT PRICE (EST’.Jﬁr;l_l{\I;JlI%lég)TY. x (ANNUAL TOTAL 1.3
NO.
13. ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" x 15" 100 $248.00 $24,800.00 $74,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO PB-5100-15 + PB-5402-PNC (none stated)
14. 90 DEGREE ALUM ELBOW 200 $9.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $11.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0457-DS-PNC CHITP 4366 *PAINT YELLOW
15. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUNM) 150 $6.00 $900.00 $2,700.00 $7.50 $1,125.00 $3,375.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0309-2-13 FLEM/ TP 7245

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 14



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

A-fimericatity

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

CONROE, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION Caummy | oTeRCE | manan | SENIOTAL | uwremos |(SMALIOH | sveasromal
NO.
16. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $3.75 $750.00 $2,250.00 $2.90 $580.00 $1,740.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-044-M1 CHI/TP 232
17. SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) 200 $0.45 $90.00 $270.00 $0.29 $58.00 $174.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO FS-3217-SS DELTA /TP 5271
18. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $3.75 $750.00 $2,250.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0443 CHITP 4290
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY: BE'

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

15



Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015
7 2 ?j" 2 : e i S L

L & 2 -
b - ‘ o

e

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
il}imlelgaini
- 2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

( ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
. . %ﬁk
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTGQTTN;J}QIE:S;Y' x (ANNUAL TOTAL x5 UNIT PRICE (EsTbgr;lTNglglég;'v. x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3)
NO.
19. GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE 200 $0.23 $46.00 $138.00 $0.45 $90.00 $270.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0354 CHITP 2127
20. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE 200 $2.75 $550.00 $1,650.00 $1.90 $380.00 $1,140.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4088 CHITP 231
21.| BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL 250 $118.00 $29,500.00 $88,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

PELCO SP-1014-TX

(none stated)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Z ; g / C
T 4
DATE: __; i E ‘\5

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Al-merica Gty

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015
: o

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTiJI:lrI\ITNFl,J’;\ll&g)'I’Y. X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3) UNIT PRICE (ESTbI'\\INITNll;J;\lI&S)TY. x (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)

NO."
12" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
22. | w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 800 $10.45 $8,360.00 $25,080.00 $15.15 $12,120.00 $36,360.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE HOOD.

MANUFACTURER & MODEL ECONOLITE E8265P1-12 TP 5540 UNIVERSAL FIT ALL MANUF. EARS NOT CL

18" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
23.| w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 50
FLAT PAINT INSIDE IN HOOD.

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

N/A
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

(none stated)

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 17



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

imerica City

Pt

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bld Opemng Date FEBRUARY 4, 2015

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION D
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED l_—_l

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within __ consecutive calendar days 3045 373
Within ____ hc_;urs or overnight after receipt of 30-45 72

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY"

S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRE

LIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

APPROVED BY: : ; k §;

DATE: 4 ! i 6 : 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CONMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 18



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Openin

Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
Qﬂimermamw
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEARTOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (Esrhﬁh:plgrglég;v. x (ANNUAL TOTAL x5 UNIT PRICE (ESTiJl:ll;\I_II_\Ill,Jé-\IIég)'I’Y. x (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
1. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x7" 200 LEFT BLAN $6,486.00
(PT ’ &43
x .
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0246-PNC
2. PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" x 12" 200 LEFT BLANK $3,700.00 $11,100.00
(PRIGE 1850
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2013-PNC
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 LEFT BLANK $3,358.00 $10,074.00
i i i
(P%v si%.79
MANUFACTURER & MODEL

PECO SF-1004-02

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecution of contract.

DATE: _,’

APPROVED BY: ; 2 i&&&

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso
All-Americagity

T

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX
EST. ANNUAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (EsT.U/:ll:xTNll,Jé\II‘_:g)TY. x (ANNUALTOTAL x 3) UNIT PRICE (EsrhANrI\J]!qLJ}glég)Ty. x (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" x 12" 200 $16.79 $3,358.00 $10,074.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SF-1004-08
5. ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER 150 $70.71 $10,606.50 $31,819.50
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO AB-3051-PNE
6. MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 200 $70.71 $14,142.00 $42,426.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO AB-3009-62-SS-PNC

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: (\ i :

DATE: ; '2 IJL ) 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Pasc
Ail-fmerica ity

' 2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION ESTANNUALL 17 poice {*”"”A”%}i“ SYEARTOTAL | 7 pRice {‘““”A”%)E‘L 3 YEAR TOTAL

NO.
7. HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS 150 $23.00 $3,450.00 $10,350.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4093-NPT-SBE-P29
8. HARDWARE H(OS$:EZEOL|\)ITAL SLIP TEE 150 $15.00 $2,250.00 $6,750.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4092-P29
9. HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE 200 $14.14 $2,828.00 $8,484.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELGO SE-0445-DS-PNC

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: :i i[, ;

€
DATE: QES‘ l ;l )

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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BID TABULATION FO

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015
kel e s

; .
i

CITY OF EL PASO

RM

El Paso
>

Stat|
Tily

T

‘2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586

Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

) . HOUSTON, TX
flTEl\Il -
DESCRIPTION ESTANNUALL iy by {‘”"”A”%}?L SYEARTOTAL | T price {‘““”“”%}i“ 3 vEAR TOTAL
NO.
10. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE 220 $14.00 $3,080.00 $9,240.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0445-DS-PNC
11. ADA ROUNV?,;:S;,' EEJ;S:;SSEMBLY 210 $61.00 $12,810.00 $38,430.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2149-08-P29
12. SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL 150 $47.57 $7,135.50 $21,406.50
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-3311-P29

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: %

DATE: & l 4; j

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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\ CITY OF EL PASO
6§-‘ BID TABULATION FORM
Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4

El Paso
ey

Ty
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION Caumniy | WNTPRCE | | SYEIOTAL | owrece | Aoy | SUEATTOTAL

NO.
13. ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" x 15' 100 $212.80 $21,280.00 $63,840.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO PB-5100-15-PNE
14. 90 DEGREE ALUM ELBOW 200 $13.14 $2,628.00 $7,884.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4091-P29
15. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) 150 $13.14 $1,971.00 $5,913.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4204-14-PNE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ; g }L k
= p—
DATE: '2 l l 3

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso
s o]

All-imerica ity
f
Al
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION “QUaNTiTy | UNTPRICE | Esramunares | SYEARTOTAL |y price et |3 YEARTOTAL

NO.
16. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $16.57 $3,314.00 $9,942.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
17. SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) 200 $10.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
18. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $16.57 $3,314.00 $9,942.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ;z 5& / :

DATE: L 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO

_ BID TABULATION FORM J
Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015 Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ' ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (EST;Jﬁrl\lTNFl,J};\IIé (EJ)TY.x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (Esrhmn%t %W.x b romix\ 3
NO. '
19. GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE 200 $15.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
20. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE 200 $69.00 $13,800.00 $41,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
21. BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL 250 $125.00 $31,250.00 $93,750.00
BIDDER'S LIST BIDDER'S PRICE
$25,000.00 $75,000.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO 1014-TX-PNC

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

el
e S

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-Aimerica City

i i l l ' f
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL - 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (EST':JA;\\‘II\ITN;JFI{\II(_:S)'I’Y.X (ANNUAL TOTAL % 3) UNIT PRICE (EST':J%I:I.I{\I;J};\II(_:(E))T'Y.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
12" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
22. | w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 800 $28.40 $22,720.00 $68,160.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SM-1034-P29
18" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
23. | w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 50 $28.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE IN HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ;; 5&%

_oHY

DATE: 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO ,.m
BID TABULATION FORM ki1

T 2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

Project Name:TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bld (o) ening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION l:'

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED D
PAYMENT TERMS: __%-30DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: (none stated)
Within consecutive calendar days

Within __ hours or overnight after receipt of

(none stated)

verbal order in cases of emergency.
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID,

BIDS SOLICITED: 6 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 0 BIDS RECEIVED 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID: 0

APPROVED BY: Q l}Y

DATE: ) l L 5 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 27



GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS

259 BROADWAY 2201 E. DIVISION ST. 1309 CLARK ST.
NEWBURGH, NY 12550 ARLINGTON, TX 76011 ROUND ROCK, TX 78681
TRAFFIC PARTS INC. PACIFIC SIGNAL SUPPLY MCCAIN INC.

P.O. BOX 837 P.O. BOX 3478 2365 OAK RIDGE WAY
SPRING, TX 77383 ARLINGTON, WA 98223 VISTA, CA 92081

2015-586





