CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Capital Improvement
AGENDA DATE: April 4, 2017

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Andrew Goh, City Engineer, (915) 212-1845
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, (915) 212-181 ]

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All
STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 7 Enhance and Sustain El Paso’s Infrastructure Network
SUBJECT:

~

Discussion and action to award Solicitation 2017-814 City Site Work and Parkway Structures to MARTINEZ BROS.
CONTRACTORS, LLC for an estimated award of $9,537,775.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The scope of work consists of the construction/installation of various types of concrete and fencing structures as well as
items associated with electrical systems, City right-of-way preparation, earthwork, landscaping and irrigation system
improvements at various locations citywide. The contractor thru project assignments/tasks from the Capital Improvement
Department shall construct these infrastructure improvements on parkways and City property right of way. Project
assignments/tasks under this contract will be issued from various funding sources to complete projects that are simple
and/or have fast track requirements/schedules.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on February 7, 2017 and February 14, 2017. The solicitation was posted on City website on
February 7, 2017. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on February 9, 2017. There were a total of (106) viewers.
Two (2) bids were received, from local vendors.

PROTEST
No protest received for this requirement.

D Protest received.

COUNCIL REPRESENTATIVE BRIEFING:

Was a briefing provided? [X] Yes or [ | No
If yes, select the applicable districts.

[ Distriet 1
(] District 2
[ ] District 3
|1 District 4

PPS FORM 0Q1, Rav. 3, B/9/2016
{Discard Pravious Versions)



[ ] District 5
[] District 6
(] District 7
D District 8
All Districts

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION: N/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

The funding source will be provided by the user department requiring the service

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
*******ﬁ*******ﬁ***REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION******ﬁ**ﬁ*ﬁ********

DEPARTMENT HEAD: M gy 7

c/

PPS FORM 001, Rev. 3, B/9/2016
{Discard Pravious Versions)



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(Low Bid)

**-}rirk-k-k-k-i:-k******1\-***-k***-k*******i-i*******POSTI N G LAN G UAG E B ELOw1\-*********17:*********-ic****-k-k********-k***********

Please place the following item on the REGULAR AGENDA for the Council Meeting of APRIL 4, 2017.

STRATEGIC GOAL 7: Enhance and Sustain El Paso’s Infrastructure Network

Discussion and action to award Solicitation 2017-814 City Site Work and Parkway Structures to MARTINEZ BROS.
CONTRACTORS, L.LC for an estimated award of $8,537,775.00.

Department; Capital Improvement

Award to: MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, LLC
El Paso, TX

[tem(s): Base Bid | & Base Bid 1l

Term: 730 Consecutive Calendar Days

Base Bid I $5,241,686.00

Base Bid II: $4,296,089.00

Total Estimated Award: $9,537,775.00

Account No.: Various

Funding Source: Community Development Block Grant, Certificates of Obligation-Street Infrastructure and
other sources

District(s): All

This is a L.ow bid, unit price contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and Capital Improvement Departments recommend award as indicated to
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, LLC the lowest responsive, responsible bidder and that J.AR. CONCRETE INC.
dba JAR Censtruction, Inc. be deemed non-respansive for its failure to submit a complete bid.

It is requested that the City Manager be authorized to establish the funding sources and make any necessary budget
transfers and execute any and all documents necessary for execution of this award.

Work under this unit price contract is only an estimated value and will be ordered, performed, invoiced, and paid by
measured quantity. The actual cost of this contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated value and will be the
sum total of unit prices at the end of the contract term.

As a part of this award, upon the review of the City Attorney, the City Engineer may without further authorization from City
Council approve coniract changes which are necessary for proper execution of the work and carrying out the intent of the
project, which are in accordance with applicable law, do not make changes to the prices and are within the appropriate
budget.



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

e el £
2016 Award Winner M

!sm TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES HiD NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: Btarch 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS, CONTRACTORS, | J.ARCONGRETE INC. DBA J.AR
LLG CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER1 QF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID |
N, — TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL [QUANTITY x UNIT  TOTAL (QUANTITY x
. oty yMIT DESCRIPTION OF (TEM AMDUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE}IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
4-INCH SIDEWALK {PLACEMENT) = REFER TC THE CITY OF
1 | 148000 ] sF EL PASO DESIGN STANDARDS FOR CONSTRUCTION $3.75 $555.000.00} $5.70 $843,600.00 50.00]
(DSC), SECTION 6 FOR DETAILS .
4-INCH SIDEWALK {REPLAGEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC,
2 | 205,000 | SF SECTION 6 FOR DETAILS $4.60 $820,000.001 53.50 $717,500.00 se.oeﬂ
4-INCH SIDEWALK REINFORCED/G-INCH NON-
3 | 27,000 SF REINFORCED {PLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC, $4.25 $114,750.00 $5.00 $135,000.00 $0.00§
SECTION § FOR DETAILS ,
4-{NCH SIDEWALK REINFORCED / 6-INCH NON-
4 | 22,000 sk REINFORCED (REPLACEMENT} -REFER TO THE DSC, $4.70 $103.400.004 $4.50 $99,000.00 $0.00
SECTION 6 FOR DETAILS T
§-INCH CONCRETE STEM-WALLS (PLACEMENT) ~ REFER
5 | 6,000 SF | TOFIGURE 35, DETAIL NC. 3 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $10.00 $60,000.00 59,00 £54,000.00 $0.00
6-INCH CONCRETE STEM-WALL (REPLACEMENT) - REFER
6 170 SF | TOFIGURE 35, DETAIL NO. 3 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $14.00 $2,380.00 511.00 $1,870.00 $0.00
CURB AND GUTTER {PLACEMENT)~ REFER TQ THE DSC
CURB AND GUTTER (REPLACEMENT) ~ REFER TO THE
8 | 7,800 LF DSC SECTION & FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS 514.00 $109,200.00§ 524.00] $187,200.00 $0.00]
RHEADER CURB FOR EXPANSIVE SOIL (PLACEMENT} -
g | 500 LF REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 6 FOR APPLICABLE $11.00 $5,500.00 519,00 $9,500.00 $0.00]
DETAILS
HEADER CURB FOR EXPANSIVE SOIL (REPLACEMENT) -
10 30 LF REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 6 FOR APPLICABLE $16.00 $480.00 $72.00 $2,160.00 50,00
DETAILS H
Approved By: l/ <
2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 10 26

Date:



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

T i
lam TTLE:  CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BIG NO: 2017.814
BIDDATE:  March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, JAR CONCRETE INC, DBA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
. BIDDER10OF 2 BIDDER Z OF 2
¥ T BASEBID I
el est € TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x
SMET | uwr DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AmOUNT | UNIT PRICE) IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
STANDARD CURB (PLACEMENT) — REFER 70 THE D5C
11| 9726 | LF SECTION § FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS $10.00 $47,260.00 $8.00 $77,808.00 $0.00
STANDARD CURB (REPLACEMENT] -~ REFER THE DSC 1
12 | 700 LF SECTION 6 FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS $14.00 $3,800.00] $20.00 $14,000.00 $0.0
TXOOT PINNED CURE [PLACEMENT] — REFER TOTXDOT
13] 100 | LF FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS $12.00 $1,200.00] $19.00 $1,900.00) $0.00
TXDOT PINNED CURE [REPLACEMENT) — REFER TO
14| 370 LF TXDOT FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS $16.00 $5,920.00] $20.00 $7.400.00 $0.00}
INCH ROLLED CURE [PLACEMENT ) ~REFER THE DSC
15| 80 LF SECTION & FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS $12.00 $960.00] $17.00 $1,360.00 $0.00]
%INCH ROLLED CURE (REPLACEMENT] ~REFER THE DSC
16| se0 | LF SECTION 6 FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS $15.00 $7,500.00 $18.75 $9,375.00 $0.00}
41NGH REINFORCED/6-INGH NON-REINFORCED
CONCRETE RESIDENTIAL DRIVEWAY (PLACEMENT) —
17 1 248 | SF | ppper THE DSC SECTION 6 FOR APPLICABLE DETAILS %6.00 $1,440.00 $13.00 $3,120.000 $0.09
ZANCH REINFORCED CONCRETE / 6-INGH NON-
REINFORCED CONCRETE RESIDENTIAL DRIVEWAY
18 | sg00 | SF (REPLACEMENT] . REFER THE DSC SECTION § FOR $7.00 $56,000.00 $6.00 $48,000.00 50,004
APPLICABLE DETAILS
-NCH CONCRETE COMMERGIAL DRIVEWAY
9] 380 | sF (PLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC, SECTION 6 FOR $8.00 $2,800.00 $13.00 $4,550.00 $0.00
DETAILS
6-INCH CONCRETE COMMERCIAL DRIVEWAY
20 | 8000 | SF | (REPLACEMENT)- REFER TO THE DSC, SECTION 6 FOR $10.00 sso.noo.oou $9.00 572.000.00“ so.GOi_
DETAILS
Approved By: [ e
pp E 1‘ gs’ ﬁ £ Z 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 2 of 26

Date:



CITY OF EL PASO

Prooursmént:
BID TABULATION FCRM P Winnefo
BID TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES D NO. 2015314
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, JAR CONCRETE INC, DBA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASEBID] .
ITEM} EST . TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNITf  TOTAL {QUANTITY x
1 awy | w7 DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE} IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGHRES
WHEELCHAIR RAMP / CURB CUT (PLAGEMENT) - REFER
21 | 23000 | SF TO DSC SECTION 6, ANDSECTION D264 OF THESE $12.00 $276,000.00 $7.70 $177.100,00] $0.00}
SPECIFICATIONS FOR DETAILS
WHEELCHAIR RAMP / CURB CUT {REPLACEMENT] -
22 | 14000 | SF |REFER TO DSC SECTION 5, AND SEGTION 0264 OF THESE $14.00 $196,000.00) $11.00 $154,000.00 $0.00}
SPEGIFICATIONS FOR DETAILS
CAST [N PLACE ADA TILE (PLACEMENT] - REFER TO DSC
23| 4o SF SECTION 6, AND SECTION 0264 OF THESE $50.00 $2,000.00 $36.00 $1,440.00 30.901
SPECIFICATIONS FOR DETAILS
SURFACE MOUNT ADA TILE (PLACEMENT) - REFER TO
24| 40 SF DSC SECTION 6, AND SECTION 0264 OF THESE $50.00 $2,000.00} $36.00 $1,440.00 so.oot
SPECIFICATIONS FOR DETAILS
WHEELCHAIR RAMP / CURB CUT WITH CONCRETE
26 | 4o 5F | PAVERS [PLACEMENT) - REFER TO DSC SECTION 6, AND $50,00 $2,000.00 $15.00 $600.00 $0.00
SECTION 0264 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS FOR DETAILS
WHEELCHAIR RAMP / CURS GUT WITH CONCRETE
PAVERS {REPLACEMENT) - REFER TO DSC SECTION 5,
26 | 40 5F AND SEGTION 0264 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS FOR $75.00 53,000.00, $23.00 $920.00 50.00
DETAILS
MEDIAN RAMP / CUT (PLACEMENT) - REFER TO DSG
27 | 100 SF SECTION 6, ANDSECTION 0264 OF THESE §12.00 $1,200,00 $20.00 $2,000.00 so.oow
SPECIFICATIONS FOR DETAILS
MEDIAN RAMP / CUT (REPLACEMENT] - REFER TO DSC
28 | s00 SF SECTION &, AND SECTION 0264 OF THESE $43.00 $7,800.00 $25.00 $15,000.00 50.00
SPECIFICATIONS FOR DETAILS
Approved By: _ ¢/ €
Date: M 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 3 of 26



140

CITY OF EL PASO

Drate:

i~y

i Fescarameat
BID TABULATION FORM 2016 o Wi
a1 TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-514
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, JAR CONCRETE INC, DEA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX ELPASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDERZOF 2
BASE BID | L L _ . .
\TEM EST TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {GUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x
UNITY DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Al T PRICE) IN PRICE} IN UNIT PRICE} IN
# | awf MOUN FIGURES AMOUNT FIGURES AMOUNT FIGURES
DRAINAGE FLUME (PLACEMENT) - REFER TO DSC
29 450 SF SECTION 2 FOR BETAILS $20.00 $8,000.00 $54.00 $24,300.00] 50.00f
DRAINAGE FLUME (REPLACEMENT) - REFER TO DSC
30 600 SF SECTION 2 FOR DETAILS $24.00 $14,400.00 %45.50 $27,300.00 50.004
ROCKWALL (PLACEMENT} - REFER TO THE DSC SECTION
3 795 PERCH 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $136.60 $103,350.00 3$125.00 $89,375.00 $0.00
ROCKWALL (REPLLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE BSC
k¥4 50 PERCH SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $150.00 $7,500.00 $200.00 $10,000.00 $0.00,
RETAINING ROCKWALL (PLACEMENT) -REFER TO THE OL
33 20 PERCH DSC SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $140.00 $2.800.0 5151.00 $3,020.00 $0.004
RETAINING ROCKWALL {REPLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE
34 530 PERCH DSC SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $150.00 $79,5800.,00 $148.00 $78,440,00 $0.00)
RED ROCKWALL (PLACEMENT) -REFER TO THE DSC
as 4 PERCH SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $185.00 $185.00 $165.00 $165.00 $0,008
RED ROCKWALL {(REPLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC
35 1 PERCH SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $210.00 $210.00F $200.00 $200.00 $0.004
ROCKWALL RE-POINTING INCLUDES PREPARATION AND
CLEANING OF EXISTING JOINTS AND RE-POINTING WITH
a7 200 SF COLOR MATCHED PORTLAND CEMENT MORTAR (2,500 $5.00 $1,000.00 $5.00 $1,000.001 £0.00
PSI). REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION
DETAILS
Approved By: o
o 3 é £ Z 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 4 of 25



CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Date:

4

Eam TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES EID NO: 2017-814
BID PATE: March 5, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
: L MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || J.A.R CONCRETE INC. DBA J.AR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX £L PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 QF 2 HIDDER 2 OF 2
"BASE BID I T .
ITEM EST TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x
# ary UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT FRICE) IN AMOUNT UNIT PRICE} IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
ROCK RIP RAP {PLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC
38 g 5F SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $30.00 £270.00 $10.00 %90.00 $0.00%
ROCK RIP RAF (REPLACEMENT) -REFER TO THE DSC
39 8 SF SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $40.00 $320.00i £11.00 $88.00 $0.00¢
ROCKWALL COLUMNS (PLACEMENT) ~ REFER TO FIGURE
40 4 PERCH 36, DETAIL 43 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $320.00 $1,280.00] £200.00 5800.00 $0.008
ROCKWALL COLURMNS [REPLACEMENT) —~ REFER TO
41 4 PERCH FIGURE 36, DETAIL 13 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $340.00 $1,360.00 $220.00 $880.00] $0.00§
4-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE SLAS {PLACEMENT) ~ L
42 69 SY REFER TO FIGURE 37, DETAIL 14 OF THESE $42.00 52,898.00§ £50.00 £3,450.00} 50.00,
SPECIFICATIONS
8-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE SLAB {(PLACEMENT} -
43 40 SY REFER TO FIGURE 37, DETAIL 14 OF THESE $50.00 $2,000.00 $116.00 $4,640.00 $0.004
SPECIFICATIONS
REINFORCED FOOTING FOR CONCRETE SLAB OR ROCK
44 200 sy | WALLS (PLACEMENT) - REFER TO FIGURE 37, DETAIL 14 $50.00 $10,000.00 $45.00 §9,000.00 $0.008
OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS
CONCRETE BUS PAD W APPROACH CONCRETE PAD
45 1 EA {PLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC SEGTION 3 FOR $8,000.00 $8,000.004 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $0.00]
CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
8-INCH CONCRETE PAVING (PLACEMENT) ~ REFER
46 80 8y TOFIGURE 38, DETAIL 17 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $85.00 $6,800,00 $120,00 $9.600.00} $0.00§
8-INCH CONCRETE PAVING (REPLACEMENT) - REFER TO
47 570 sY FISURE 38, DETAIL 17 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS 5105.00 $50,850.00 $100.00 SST.OOO.DDE sa.oe!
Approved By, _ & ¢~
3 /ISR 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 5 of 26



CITY OF EL. PASCG
BID TABULATION FORM

iam TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NQ: 2017-814
BID DATE: BAzrch 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
L R MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || J.A.R CONCRETE INC. DBA J.AR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID {
rreml esT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x
p ary UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE} IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE) N
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
- - 1
10-INCH CONCRETE PAVING {PLACEMENT) - REFER TO
48 50 sy FIGURE 38, DETAIL 17 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $100.00 $5,000,00} $128.00 $6,400.00 $0.001
10-INCH CONCRETE PAVING (REPLACEMENT) — REFER TO
49 100 SY FIGURE 38, DETAIL 17 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $120,00 $12,000.00 $115.00 $1 1,500.001 $0.00§
12-INCH CONCRETE PAVING (PLACEMENT) - REFER TO
50 150 sY FIGURE 34, DETAIL 17 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $80.00 $13,500.00{ $143.00 $21,450.00 $0.00
12-INCH CONCRETE PAVING {(REPLACEMENT) — REFER TO
51 50 sY FIGURE 38, DETAIL 17 OF THESE SPECIFICATIONS $120.00 $6,000.00 $200.00 $10,000.00]| $0.008
JERSEY BARRIER, DECORATIVE, FLUTED, REINFORCED
CONCRETE STRUCTURE {PLACEMENT) - INCLUDES 0&1
52 2 cY REQUIRED FORMING, REINFORCED CONCRETE $6006.00 $1,200.00 $650.00 51,300.00 $0.6
PLACEMENT AND REBAR
JERSEY BARRIER, DECORATIVE, FLUTED, REINFORCED
CONCRETE STRUCTURE (REPLACEMENT} - INCLUDES
53 2 cy REQUIRED FORMING, REINFORCED CONCRETE $800.00 $1,600.004 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 S0.004
PLACERMENT AND REBAR
MISCELLANEOUS REINFORCED CONGRETE $TRUCTURE
[DRAINAGE INLETS AND OUTLETS, MANHOLES] REPAIR
{PLACEMENT) - REFERENCE THE CITY OF EL PASO
sa | 4 CY | DESIGN STANDARDS FOR CONSTRUCTION SECTION 2 $450.00 $1.800.00 $2,220.00 $8,880.00 $0.004
FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
Approved By; e
Date: 3 /7 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 6 of 26



CITY OF EL PASO

elfence
BID TABULATION FORM e Procsrtosar
2016 Award Winner &
RBID TITLE: CIY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES B NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEFARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
g MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, J.A.R CONCRETE INC, DBAJA.R
LG CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASOQ, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID ]
meml  EsT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TQTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x
" QTyY UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE} IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT UNIT PRICE} IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
MISCELLANECQUS REINFORCED CONCRETE STRUCTURE
[DRAINAGE INLETS ANC QUTLETS, MANHOLES] REPAIR
55 20 cY {(REPLACEMENT) - REFER TQ THE DSC SECTION 2 FOR $700.00 514,000.00 £800.04 $14,000.00 39.005
CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
CONCRETE CHANNEL LINING {PLACEMENT) - REFER TO
56 20 sY THE DSC SECTION 2 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $75.00 81 .500.001 $107.00 $2,140.00 $0.00¢
CONCRETE CHANNEL LINING (REPLACEMENT) - REFER
57 20 sY TO THE DSC SECTION 2 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS $100.00 $2,000.00, $200.00 54,000.00 £0.00]
8-NCH REINFORCED RETAINING CONCRETE WALL
{PLACEMENT]) - TO INCLUDE REQUIRED FORMING,
58 2 cYy REBAR, AND FOOTING. FOOTING NOT PAID AS A $450.00 $900.00 $1.500.00 $3,000.00 £0.00
SEPARATE LINE ITEM. SEE DETAIL 21 FOR THE SUM OF:
8-JNCH REINFORCED RETAINING CONCRETE WALL
{REPLACEMENT) - TO INCLUDE REQUIRED FORMING,
59 2 cy REBAR, AND FOOTING, FOOTING NOT PAID AS A $750.00 $1,500.00§ £3,000.00 $6,000.00; $0.60
SEPARATE LINE ITEM, SEE DETAIL 21 FOR THE SUM OF:
ADD EXPOSED AGGREGATE TEXTURE FINISH LISING 3/4-
60 1290 sY INCH MAX RIVER ROCK $6.00 $720,00 $10.00 $1,200.00 50,008
WROUGHT IRON GATE, VARIABLE HEIGHT, (FLACEMENT)
§1 40 SE ~REFER TO THE D5C SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION §25.00 £$1,000.0 $10.00 $400.90) $0.00
DETAILS Bu
Approved By, _ &<
Date- e e B 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 7 o1 26



CITY OF EL. PASO

Bt
Gy
e X = -
X ~is 2 BID TABULATION FORM R Ao ee
iBID TITLE: CiTY SITE WORK AND BARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO:; 2017-814
BID DATE: Rarch 16, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
: MARTINEZ BROS, CONTRACTORS, f  J.A.R CONCRETE ING. DBA J.A.R
LLC GCONSTRUCTION {NC
EL PASO, TX EL PASD, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASEBID |
qeml st TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY xUNiT]|  TOTAL {QUANTITY %
by ary UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE} IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE}IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
WROUGHT IRON GATE, VARIABLE HEIGHT,
g2 4o sp | (REPLACEMENT)-REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 4 FOR $25.00 $1,000.00 $11.00 $440.00 s0.00}
CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
WROUGHT IRON FENCING, VARIABLE HEIGHT,
63 40 SF (PLAGEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 4 FOR 5§15,00 $600.00 $0.00 $360.00 $0.00
CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
WROUGHT IRON FENCING, VARIABLE HEIGHT,
64 40 SF {REPLACEMENT) - REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 4 FOR $15.00| $600.00] $11.00 £440.00 50.00]
CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
CHAIN-LINK FENCE, VARIABLE HEIGHT WITH 1 FOOT [3-
STRAND] BARBED WIRE EXTENSION ABOVE CHAIN-
65 | 250 sF | LINKFENCE (PLACEMENT) - ITEM PAID BASED ON NET $9.00 52,250.00 $7.50 $1,875.00 $0.00]
AREA OF INSTALLED METAL FABRIC. REFER TO THE DSC
SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
GHAIN-LINK FENCE, VARIABLE HEIGHT, WITH 1.FOOT [3-
STRAND] BARBED WIRE EXTENSION ABOVE CHAIN- LINK
FENCE (REPLACEMENT) - [TEM PAID BASED ON NET
66 | 40 SF | AREA OF INSTALLED METALFABRIC. REFER TO THE DSG $9.00 $350.00 513.00 $520.00 $0.00¢
SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS .
CHAIN-LENK FENCE, VARIABLE HEIGHT,
(PLACEMENT) - ITEM PAID BASED ON NET AREA OF
67 500 SF INSTALLED METAL FABRIC, REFER 70 THE DSC $9.00 $4,500.00 $12.00 $6,000.004 $0.004
SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
CHAIN-LINK FENCE, VARIABLE HEIGHT,
(REPLACEMENT) - ITEM PAID BASED ON NET AREA
Ga 500 SF OF INSTALLED METAL FABRIC. REFER TO THE DSC $12.00 $6,000.00 $12.00 $6,000.00 §0.00
SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
Appraved By, _ /<
2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 8 of 26

Dale:

5



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

iam TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-813
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || J4.AR CONCRETE INC. DBA LAR
LLE CONSTRUCTION ING
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
. BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID o o
em|  est TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x
p ary UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE; IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
CHAIN-LINK FENCE, SWINGING GATE, VARIABLE HEIGHT
WITH 1-EOOT [3-STRAND] BARBED WIRE EXTENSION
ABOVE GHAIN-LINK FENCE {PLACEMENT) - ITEM PAID
69 | 40 SF BASED ON NET AREA OF INSTALLED METAL FABRIC. $23.00 $920.00 $11.00 $440.00 $0.008
REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION
DETAILS
CHAIN-LINK FENCE, SWINGING GATE, VARIABLE HEIGHT
WITH 1.FOOT [3-STRAND] BARBED WIRE EXTENSION
ABOVE CHAIN-LINK FENCE (REPLACEMENT) - ITEM PAID
Fi) 40 SF BASED ON NET AREA OF INSTALLED METAL FABRIC. $23.00 5920,004 $15.00 5600.001 $0,008
REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 4 FOR CONSTRUCTION
DETAILS
CHAIN-LINK FENCE, SWINGING GATE, VARIABLE HEIGHT,
(PLAGEMENT) - ITEM PAID BASED ON NET AREA OF
71 40 SE  |INSTALLED METAL FABRIC. REFER TO THE DSC SECTION $25.00 $1,000.00 $12.10 $484.00 $0.00{
4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
CHAIN-LINK FENCE, SWINGING GATE, VARIABLE HEIGHT,
{REPLACEMENT} - ITEM PAID BASED ON NET AREA OF
72 40 SF |INSTALLED METAL FABRIC, REFER TO THE DSC SECTION $30.00 $1,200.00 $15.00 $600.00 $0.004
4 FOR CONSTRUCTION DETAILS
PARKING METER PIPE (PLACEMENT) - INCLUDES
FABRICATION AND INSTALLATION OF PIPE, SAW-CUTS,
73 15 EA CORING, CONCRETE PLACEMENT AND MATCHING TO $140,00 $2,250.008 £200.00 $3.000.00 $0.00]
EXISTING SURFACE FINISH. SEE DETAIL 25 FOR THE SUM
OF:
Approved By: v (o
D‘;fe; y; g 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 9 of 26



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM
Iam TETLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
SRR MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || J.AR CONCRETE INC. DBA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
__BASE BID 1 L B
TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT FOTAL {QUANTITY X UNIT]  TOTAL {CQUANTITY x
ITEM] EST PRICE) IN PRICE}IN. UNIT PRICE) IN
AMOUNT AMOUNT u
" ary UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM FIGURES FIGURES AMOUNT CURES
PARKING METER PIFE (REFLACEMENT) - INCLUDE
FABRICATION AND INSTALLATION OF PIPE, SAW.CUTS,
74 2 EA CORING, CONCRETE PLACEMENT AND MATCHING TO $200.00 $400.00f $300.00 $600.00 $0.00]
EXISTING SURFACE FINISH. SEE DETAIL 25 FOR THE SUM
OF:
PARKING METERS PIPE BASE PLATE MOUNT
75 | 10 EA {PLACEMENT]) - INCLUDES BOLT PLATE AND §125.00 $1,250.00] $150.00 $1,500.00 $0.00
INSTALLATION, SEE DETAIL. 25 FOR THE SUM OF: 7
PARKING METERS PIPE BASE PLATE MOUNT
6| 6 EA {REPLACEMENT) - INCLUDES BOLT PLATE AND $135.00 $810.00] $300.00 $1,800.00 $0.00f
INSTALLATION. SEE DETAIL 25 FOR THE SUM OF:
4INCH STAMPED COLORED CONCRETE (PLACEMENT) -
INCLUDES A MINIMUM OF THREE STAMP PATTERNS,
COLOR TINT AND APPLICATION OF TINT AND SEALER.
BOTH POWDER AND LIQUID RELEASE AGENT REGQUIRED
77 280 sY DEPENDING ON THE APPLICATION. COLOR MATCH $65.00) $18,200.00 $71.00 $19,880.00 S0.0U%
ADJACENT CONCRETE OR AS DIRECTED BY INSPECTOR.
SEE TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS, DIVISION I}, ITEM 5326
4-INCH STAMPED COLORED CONCRETE (REPLACEMENT) §
INCLUDES A MINIMUM OF THREE STAMP PATTERNS,
COLOR TINT AND APPLICATION OF TINT AND SEALER.
BOTH POWDER AND LIQUID RELEASE AGENT REQUIRED
781 45 Y DEPENDING ON THE APPLICATION. COLOR MATCH §75.00 $3,375.00 NO BID 50.00 $0.004
ADJACENT CONCRETE OR AS DIRECTED BY INSPECTOR.
SEE TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS, DIVISION [, ITEM 5326
Approved By: V'
2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARIGVAY STRUCTURES Page 10 of 26
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Tevtaraads o
2016 Award Winndér ain

!BiD TITLE:
BID DATE:

CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES
March 15, 2017

BID NO: 2017-814

DEPARTMENT: CAP{TAL IMPROVEMENT

MARTINEZ BROS. GONTRACTORS,
e

EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2

J.A.R COMCRETE INC. DBA JAR
CONSTRUCTION INC

EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 2 OF 2

“BASEBIDT

ITEM| EST

HNIT

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

TOTAL
AMOUNT

{QUANTITY x BNIT
PRICE} IN
FIGURES

TOTAL
AMDUNT

(QUANTITY x UNIT

PRICE) IN
FIGURES

TOTAL
AMOUNT

(QUANTITY x
UNIT PRICE) IN
FIGURES

79 1,300 sY

6-INCH REINFORCEDSTAMPED COLORED CONCRETE
{PLACEMENT} - INCLUDES A MINIMUM OF THREE STAMP

SEALER. BOTH POWDER AND LIQUID RELEASE AGENT
REQUIRED DEPENDING ON THE APPLICATICN, COLOR
MATCH ADJACENT CONCRETE OR AS DIRECTED 8Y
INSPECTOR. SEE TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS, DIVISION
0, ITEM 5326

PATTERNS, COLOR TINT AND APPLICATION OF TINT AND

$60.00

§78,000.00

I NO BID

$0.00

$0.00

80 530 8Y

6-INCH REINFORCEDR STAMPED COLORED
CONCRETE (REPLACEMENT) - INCLUDES A MINIMUM OF
THREE STAMP PATTERNS, COLOR TINT AND
APPLICATION OF TINT AND SEALER. BOTH POWDER AND
LICID RELEASE AGENT REQUIRED DEPENDING ON THE
APPLICATION. COLOR MATCH ADJACENT CONCRETE OR
AS DIRECTED BY INSPECTOR. SEE TECHNICAL
SPECIFICATIONS, DIVISION i, ITEM 5326

$65.00

$34,450.004

NO BiD

$0.00

$0.00

81 1 EA

CITY MONUMENTS {PLACEMENT) - INSTALLATION WILL
INCLUDE CONCRETE BASE, CITY MONUMENT,
MONUMENT HOUSING AND LID. A LICENSED SURVEYOR
MUST SET THE MONUMENT AND PROVIDE ELEVATION
CERTIFICATION, REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 3 FOR
DETAILS

$1,000.00

$1,000.00

NO BIR

$0.00

$0.00

82 15 sY

CONCRETE PAVERS {REPLACEMENT] - SEE THE DETAIL
28 AT THE END OF THIS SECTION

§75.00

$1 .125.00§

NO BID

SO.GO[J

$0.GD§

Approved By:
Data:

[l

2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES

Page 11 of 26



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM _ (il
L 2016 Award Winnir e
BID TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: Mareh 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
' MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, J.A.R CONCRETE INC. BDBA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASG, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER1 QOF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID |
reml st TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT|]  TOTAL {QUANTITY x
" aTy UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE} IN AMOUNT LINIT PRICE] 1M
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
8-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE APRON, (PLACEMENT) ~
83 5 EA REFER TQ THE DSC SECTION 2 FOR CONSTRUCTION $275,00 %1,375.00 NO BID 50.00 $0.008
DETAILS
ADJUSTMENT OF MANHOLES -
84 80 EA REFER TO THE DSC SECTION 2 FOR CONSTRUCTION $250.00 $15,000.00 NO BID £0.00] SU.GDL
DETAILS
85 55 cY PLACEMENT OF TWO SACK MATERIAL $110.00 $6,050.00; NO BID $0.00; 50,008
16-INCH THICK REINFORCED CONCRETE DRIVEWAY
86 B8 cY {#4 REBAR @ 12 INCH O.C. BOTH WAYS) (PLACEMENT) $1580.00 $13,200.00 ) NOBID £0.00 $0.003
REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING ASPHALT PAVING h
87 | 43,400 SF AND COMPACTED BASE COURSE $0.55 $23,870.00 NO Bll_:i $0.004 $0.60
Z-INCH THICK HMAC TYPE "C"”, 5-INCH THICK CRUSHED
STONE BASE TYPE “A" GRADE 3 (TXDOT ITEM 247), 24"
B8 5,000 Y THICK COMPACTED SUBGRADE(PLACEMENT) £24.00 $120,000.0C NO BID $0.00 $0.00
3NCH THICK HMAC TYPE "C", 8-INCH THICK CRUSHEDR
STONE BASE TYPE "A"GRADE 3 {TXDOT ITEM 247), 24"
89 950 8Y THICK COMPACTED SUBGRADE (PLACEMENT) $30.00 528,500.001 NO BID 50.00 $0.004
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 2-IN.CALIPER TREES
80 300 EA {PLACEMENT} $37T0.75 3N 1.225.00“ NO BID 50.00 $0.00

Anproved By.

Date:

[ o
LT L
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CITY OF EL PASGO
BID TABULATION FORM

BIDY RO: 2017-814

BID TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES .
BID DATE: March 15, 2047 * |DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
- MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || J.A.R CONCRETE INC. DBA J.AR
LLE CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER2OF 2
BASE BID |
eml  Est TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT, TOTAL {QUANTITY x
s ary UNIT DESGRIPTION OF ITEM AMODUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE} IN AMOQUNT | UNIT PRICE) IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 3-IN. CALIPER TREES
o | 300 EA (PLACEMENT) 730,85 $218,255,00 NO BiD $0.00 50.008
a2 | & EA PROVIDE AND INSTALL 15 GALLON SHRUBS $150.75 $1,144.50 NO BID $0.00 50,00}
93 | 1,082 EA PROVIDE AND INSTALL 5 GALLON SHRUBS $43.50 $47,067.00l NO BID $0.00 $0.00]
os | 157 ga | PROVIDE AND INSTALL ONE GALLON PLANT MATERIAL 521,25 $3.936.2 NO BID $0.00 s0.000
95 k1] EA INSTALL TREES FURNISHED BY THE OWNER $550.65 $17,070.15] NO BID $0.00 so.00
96 | 279 LF PROVIDE AND INSTALL 36-inn. x 24-in ROOT BARRIER $15.80 54,408.20 NO BID 50.00| 50.001
o7 20 EA | PROVIDE AND INSTALL 2-n, DOUBLE CHECK BACKFLOW $574.58 $11,491.60§ NO BID $0.00 so.ooL
PREVENTER (PLACEMENT)
PROVIDE AND {NSTALL WATER PRESSURE REGULATOR
a8 20 EA | WILKINS MODEL BF-4 SERIES BRONZE BODY OR INLINE $109.39 §2,187.80) $254.00 $5,080.00 $0.00
PRESSURE REGULATOR 30 PSI {PLACEMENT)
PROVIDE AND INSTALL TBOS RAIN BIRD BATTERY-
39 20 EA OPERATED SYSTEM (PLACEMENT) $233.67 $4.673.40 $177.60 $3,540.00 $0.00
Approved By: __ /< '
2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES

Date: X /¢8/7F
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATICN FORM

iBlD TITLE: CIiTY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, | LAR CONCRETE INC. DBA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIODER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASEBIDI
meml  mst TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNET]  TOTAL (QUANTITY x
S gy | wwr DESCRIPTION OF ITEM ARGUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE}IN
FIGURES FIGUAES FIGURES
PROVIDE AND INSTALL REINFORCED CONCRETE BOX
100 20 gA | FORBACKFLOW 17 INCHES BY 30 INCHES WITH SCREW $651.57 $13,031.40] $335.00 $6,700.00 $0.00f
DOWN STEEL CHECKERS LID (PLACEMENT)
PROVIDE AND INSTALL ELECTRIC REMOTE VALVE RAIN
101 20 EA BIRD MODEL 100-PESB WITH LATCHING SOLENOID $200.63 $4,012.60 $225.00 $4,500.00 50,008
{PLACEMENT)
FROVIDE AND INSTALL RAIN BIRD /4-IN. DISTRIBUTION L
102 3,600 LF TUBING {PLACEMENT) 50.07 $252.00 50.15 3540.00 $0.00
PROVIDE AND INSTALL DRIF EMITTERS-XERI-BIRD OR
103} 1,200 | EA ZARCO BRAND (PLACEMENT) $0.33 $396.00] $24.00 $28,800.00 $0.004
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 3/4.IN. PVC PIPE SCHEDULE 40
104 | 9,000 LE {INCLUDES EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, ALL FITTING) 50.50 $4,500.00§ $2.50 $22,500.00 50.00{
(PLACEMENT)
PROVIDE AND INSTALL RAIN BIRD Y-STRAINER
108 20 EA {PLACEMENT) $21.90 $438,60 $23.00 $460.00 $0.008
PROVIDE AND INSTALL ¥-IN. PLD DRIPLINE TUBING
106 | 9,000 LF (INCLUDES EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, ALL 50,32 $2,880.00% $1.00 $8,000.003 $0.004
FITTINGS)PLACEMENT)
PROVIDE AND INSTALL %-IN. AGRIFIM MODEL MAXI-FLOW
ADJUSTABLE MFBA EMITTER DISTRIBUTION MANIFOLD
1097 | 360 EA 170 ID X 240 OD DISTRIBUTION TUBING EMITTER $21.85 $6,555.00 $23.50 $7,050.00} $0.008
{INCLUDES ALL FITTINGS) (PLACEMENT)
Approved By, _ ¢/ ¢
YV 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 14 of 26
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2016 Award Winné

" fip)

BID THLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: PMarch 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || JLA.R CONCRETE INC. DBA JA.R
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX E£L PASO, TX
: BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID |
S — TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL [QUANTITY x UniT)  TOTAL {QUANTITY x
3 ary UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT FRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE}IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
BLACK POLY PIPE 3/4 - IN. (THAT CAN WITHSTAND
108 [ z000 | DAY SUNLIGHT AND BURIED UNDER ROCK MULCH) $0.22 $440.00 $1.00 $2,000.00] so.00}
BLACK POLY PIPE 1 - IN. (THAT CAN WITHSTAND
t08| 1000 | DAY SUNLIGHT AND BURIED UNDER ROCK MULCH) 50.76 $360.00 $1.00 51,000.00 $0,00]
FURNISH, INSTALL SWPPP (SILT FENGE, CONSTRUCTION
10| 730 DAY ENTRANCES! EXITS, ETC. ) £104.00 $75,920.00 $30.20 $22,046.004 $0.00¢
11| 730 DAY | FURNISH, INSTALL AND MAINTAIN TRAFFIC CONTROL $120.00 $87,600.00 $50.00 $36,500.00] $0.00{
142 | 17,000 | CY €UT AND FILL $10.00 $170,000.00 52.20 $37,400.00 £0.00]
13| 3 cy IMPORT FILL $20.00 $720.00! $215.00 $7.740.00 $0.00]
114 1 AC _ GLEARING AND GRUBBING $3,050.00 %3,050.00 S$8,000.00 $8,000.00 $0.00
1151 1,000 cy MINOR GRADING $10.00 $10,000.00) $8.50 $8,500.00 $0.00
PERFORM SELECTIVE DEMOLITION

116 1,000 SF $3.00 $3,000.00] $3.65 $3,650.00] $0.00
17 58 cY CONSTRUCT 6-FT. WIDE CONCRETE STAIRS $335.00 51 B.TSS.DUH $365.00 S21,S35.00H SO.Dﬂl

Approved By, _ 1/
Date: Y 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 15 of 26



CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

| 2016 Award Winné '

BID NO: 2017-814

aID TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

o ' MARTINEZ BROS, CONTRACTORS, | J.A.R CONCRETE INC. DBA LAR

LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
""" EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
-BASE BID
meml  est TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT]  TOTAL (QUANTITY x
s aty UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE)} IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE) IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
FURNISH AND INSTALL 42-IN. HIGH HANDRAILS ALONG

118 | 486 L¥ STAIRS $75.00 $36,450.00 $50.00 $24,300.00 $0.00

119 36 EA FURNISH AND INSTALL STEEL BOLLARDS $450.00 $16,200.00 £500.00 $18,000.002 SD.GOL
120 30 EA FURNISH AND INSTALL REMOVABLE HOLLARDS $500.00 $15,000.008  $1.000.00 $30,000.00] $0.001

40-IN. TALL BOLLARD [CONCRETE WITH METAL SLEEVE)
124 4 EA WITH MOUNTING ASSEMBLY $500.00| $2.000.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 50.00(
FURNISH AND INSTALL PARK AREA LIGHT ASSEMBLIES
122 25 EA ON STEEL POLES $9,100.00 $227,500,001  $10,300.00 $257,500.00) $0.00F
PROVIDE AND INSTALL
123] 42 EA LIGHTED BOLLARDS $3,050.00 $128,100.00 $3,450.00 $144,900.00 $0.00§
PROVIDE AND INSTALL STEP LIGHTS
241 M EA $1,600.00 $65,600.0 $1,610.00 $66,010.00 $0.00
SCARIFY 12-IN, UNDER PAVING
1261 41,793 | SF 50,50 $20,896.50] $0.20 $8,358.60 50.00]
FURMISH AND INSTALL TAKE A BOOK — LEAVE A BOOK
128 4 EA DISPENSERS %1,250.00 §5,000.00 $910.00 $3,640.00 50.00]
CONSTRUCT ENTRANCE
127 4 EA MONUMENTS $1.850.00 57,400.00 $1,210.00 $4,840.00 so‘oo!

Date:

=

Approved By: __ /¢
Bles Ll F

2017.814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES
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2816 Award Winnér £t

BID TITLE!: BID NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL tMPROVEMENT
MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, | J.AR CONCRETE INC. DRA JAR
e CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX ELPASO, TX
BIDDER T OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID |
SN - TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY xUnIT]  TOTAL {QUANTITY x
3 ary UNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AROUNT PRIGE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE}IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
PAINT TRAIL CENTER LINE
128 | 4,080 LF $0.62 $2,511.00 $0.60 $2,430.00) $0.00{
PAINT LONG JUMP
129 1 EA $617.00 $617.00 $604.00 $604.00} $0.00(
PAINT 100 METER DASH
130 1 EA $617.00 $617.00 $604.00 $604.00] $0.00(
PAINT 200 METER DASH
13 1 EA $925.00 $928.008 $910.00 $910.00; $0.00§
PAINT SUPER LONG HOPSCOTCH
132 1 EA $620.00 $620.00 $604.00 5604.00 £0.00{
PAINT RUG DESIGN, 5-FT. X 10-FT.
133] 10 EA $1,050.00 $10,500.00) $1,030.00 $10,300.00 $0.00
PAINT LETTERS ON ASPHALT ROADWAY, 22-IN,
t34] 12 EA $93.00 $1.116.00 $91.00 §1,082.00 50.00}
PAINT LETTERS ON ASPHALT ROADWAY, 14-IN,
135{ 18 E4 562.00 $992.00 $61.00 5976.00f $0.00]
PAINT DRIVEWAY CROSSING STRIPES 3041, X 10-FT.
136{ 18 EA $185.00 $2,660.00 5182.00 $2,912.00 $0.004
PROVIDE AND INSTALL FRANKLIN RED OR PADRE $26.400.000
CANYON SCREENINGS, 3-IN. WiTH WEED FABRIC
137 | 33,000 | SF UNDERLAYMENT $0.28 $9,240.00 $0.80| ;IDDER'S PRICE $0.00]
$2,400.00

Date:

Approved By. e
BLSLLE

4
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

1 Pracarsueals
2016 Award Winndr )
iain TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017814
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
RETY MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, | J.A.R CONCRETE INC. DBA JAR
LLE CONSTRUCTION ING
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASEBID |
trem| Est TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x
p ary uNIT BESCRIPTION QOF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) AMOUNT FRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNST PRICE} IN
IN FIGURES EIGURES FIGURES
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 4-IN. DESERT TAN OR RAINBOW
13g | 23000 | SF ROCK MULGH, 4-i. DEPTH WITH WEED FABRIC $1.50 534,500,001 $1,10 $25,300.00] $0.00
UNDERLAYMENT
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 4-IN. DESERT TAN OR RAINBOW
ROCK MULCH MIXED WITH FRANKLIN RED OR PADRE
733 200 | SF | o4 NYON SCREENINGS 4-IN. DEPTH WITH WEED FABRIC $343 $626.00 $1.30 $260.00 $0.004
UNDERLAYMENT
FPROVIDE AND INSTALL 1-IN, TO 2-IN, FRANKLIN RED
i40 | 22,2306 | SF ROCK WITH WEED FABRIC UNDERLAYMENT $0.68 $14,671.80 $1.10 $24,453.00 50.00{
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 2-IN. TO 4-IN. ROGK WITH WEED
141 82,000 | SF EABRIC UNDERLAYMENT 50.84 $68,880.00 $1.30 $106,500,00 $0.00}
SCREENINGS WITH WEED FABRIC UNDERLAYMENT
142} 17181 | sE $0.31 $5,326.11 $0.80 $13,744.90 $0.004
6-IN. X 61N, CONCRETE CURB MOW STRIP
143 so00 LF $12.00 $6,000.80 $11.00 $5,500.00| $0.00]
FURNISH AND INSTALL ENGINEERED WOOU FIRERS
144 | 6,800 SF $1.60 $6,800.00] $2.00 $13,600.000 $0.00{
CONSTRUCT GARDEN WALL WITH FOOTING (3-FT.
145 | 250 LF HT.MAX) $36.00 $7,500.00 §$38.00 $9,500.00 so.oaL
CONSTRUCT SALT FINISHED CONCRETE PLAZAS {4-IN.
146 3,751 SF DEPTH) $6.00 $22,506.00 $11.00 $41,261.00 so.onl
Approved By, __ V'

Date: B L& ¢ &
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CITY OF EL. PASC
BID TABULATION FORM

Sl

2016 Awa

rd Winndér

EBID TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-814 N
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
: e MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || JLAR CONCRETE INC. DBA J.A.R
LLe CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2

BASEBID ] . . .

rem| st TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT ~ TOTAL {QUANTITY x
¢ | ary uNIT DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNFT PRIGE} IN
. FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
BERMUDA SOD (INSTALL OVER 12-IN.OF NEW TOFSOIL}
147 | 95000 | SF $1.40 $133,000.00} $1.60 $152,000.00 $0.00(
PROVIDE AND INSTALL PARK NAME SIGH
148 2 EA $2.500.00 £5,000.00 $910.00 $1.820.00 $0.00
PROVIDE AND INSTALL TRAFFIC SIGNS
149 5 EA $500.00| $2,500.00 $800.00 $4,000,00 $0.00}
PROVIDE AND INSTALL FLUME AND GRATE
180 1 EA §2,750.34 $2,750.34 $3,630.00 $3,630.00 $0.00
PROVIDE AND INSTALL HOT THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT
151 2,150 LF MARKINGS $1.25 $2,667.50] $1.25 £2,687.56] $0.00]
PROVIDE AND INSTALL RED FRANKLIN RIP RAP
152 1,765 SF $1.29 $2,276.85 $12.00 $21,180.00| $0.004
INSTALL BUTTRESSES
153 4 |PERCH $250.00 $1,000.00 £163.00 $652.00 $0.00
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 6-IN. COLORED CONCRETE
154 | 500 SF PAVING $8.50 $4,250.001 516.10 $8,050.00 50.00]
PROVIDE AND INSTALL FUNGTIONAL RIP RAP

165| 55 |PERCH 5150.00 $6,250.00] §11.00 seos.ncu so.eui

Approved By: 1/ ¢

Date: ;éé;,ga z
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM
Iam TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: Msreh 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
: . MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, || J.AR CONCRETE INC. DBA JA.R
Le CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID | o . .
——— TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x untTl]  TOTAL {QUANTITY x
g | are | UNIT DESCRIFTION OF [TEM AMOUNT PRICE} IN AMOUNT PRICE} IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE}IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 6-IN. PERFORATED PIPE
186 | @50 LF §30.00 5§25,500.00] $5.00 $4,250.00 $0.001
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 24-IN. HDPE PERFORATED PIPE
157 | 20 LF $60.00 $1,200.00] $600.00 $12,000.00 $0.00(
WEED FABRIC UNDERLAYMENT
158 3 RL $600.00 $2,400.00§ $685.00 52,085.00 $0.00;
PROVIDE AND INSTALL CONSTRUCTION SIGNS
158 4 EA $750.00 $3,000.00) $1,000.00 $4,000.00, $0.00]
£4,426,099.90
SUM TOTAL - BASE BID | {ITEMS 1 - 159) §5,006,686.00 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE $5,106,203.90
MOBILIZATION {NOT TQ EXCEED 5% OF THE TOTAL BASE BID |} $235,000,00 $250,000.00 $0.00
$4,676,099.90
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID | AND MOBILIZATION) $5,241,686.00 $0.00
' BIDDER'S PRICE $5,356,203.90
Approved By: L/ ‘
Date: ryrE 2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 20 of 26



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

TGl

2016 Award Winnér

lam TITLE:

BID DATE:

GCITY S17€ WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES
March 15, 2017

BID NO: 2017-814
OEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

MARTINEZ BROS, CORTRACTORS,
LLC

EL PASQ, TX
BIDBER1GF 2

BASE BID W - ENSTALLATION OF CONDUIT LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS, AND GROUND BOXES

J.A.R CONCRETE {NC. DBA JAR
CONSTRUCTION INC

EL PASO, TX
BIDDER20QF 2

ITEM

EST
aTty

UNIT

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

TOTAL
AMOUNT

{QUANTITY x UNIT

PRICE) IN
FIGURES

TOTAL
ANMOUNT

{QUANTITY x UNIT
PRICE) IN
FIGURES

TOTAL
AMOUNT

{QUANTITY x
UNIT PRICE) IN
FIGURES

14,000

LF

PVC CONDUIT 3-INCH INSTALLED BY TRENCHING TG
INCLUDE, SAW CUT, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,
COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION
VI, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATION

$23.45

$326,300.00

$8.20 $128,800,00

50,008

65,000

LF

PVYC CONDUIT 2-INCH INSTALLED BY TRENCHING: TO
INCLUDE, SAW CUT, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,
COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION
VI, "INSTALLATION OF CONDLHT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS

$18.00

51,170,000.00

$5.00 $585,000.00

$0.06]

10,000

LF

PVC CONDUIT 3-INCH INSTALLED BY DIRECTIONAL

BORING: TO INCLUDE, BORING, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,

COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISICN
VI, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES” SPECIFICATIONS

$40.00]

5400,000.008

522.90 $229,000.00

$0.00

8,000

LF

PVC CONDUIT 2-INCH INSTALLED BY DIRECTIONAL

BORING: TO INCLUDE, BORING, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,

COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL, REFERENCE DIVISION
Vi, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS; FOR THE SUM
QF:

$37.00

$333.000.00

$17.00 $153,000.00

$0.008

Approved By: __ v
Date: _9Q éib"Z(?
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2016 Award Winnér o)

81D TTLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2017-814
BID DATE: farch 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVENMENT
' ' MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, | J.A.R CONCRETE INC, DBA JA.R
LLE CONSTRUCTION iNC
_ £L PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
e L BIDUER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
BASE BID Il - INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,; AND GROUND BCXES
meml st TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT)]  TOTAL {QUANTITY x
‘ ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRIGE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE} IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
GROUND BOX TYPE A INSTALLED IN PLACE: TO
INCLUDE, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, COMPACTION,
CONCRETE REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND DISPDSAL OF
5 340 EA WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION Vi, $1,420.00 $462,800.00§ $430,00 $146,200.00 so.onﬂ
“INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS; FOR THE 5UM
QF:
GROUND BOX TYPE C INSTALLED IN PLACE: TO INCLUDE,
EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, COMPACTION,
CONCRETE REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND DISPOSAL OF
5 160 EA WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION VI, 51,480.00 $148,000.00 $305.00 $30,500.008 $0.008
“INSTALLATION OF CONDUFT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS
FOUNDATION, TRAFFIC SIGNAL TYPE 24A INSTALLED IN
PLACE: TO INCLUDE, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,
COMPACTION, CONCRETE REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION
7 80 EA | Vi, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS, $1,800.00 $152,000.00] $1,200.00 $95,000.00) 50.00}
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS
2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 22 of 26
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Procurraiel
2016 Award Winnéry

BID NO: 2017-814

Ieio TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES
BID DATE: Mareh 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
: N MARTINEZ BROS, CONTRACTORS, | J.AR CONCRETE INC. DBA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
T T e e BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
oo BAGE BID AL = INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS, AND GROUND BOXES . N
PN — TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY xuNIT]]  TOTAL {QUANTITY x
" ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEH ANDUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT UNIT PRICE) IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
FOUNDATION, TR#FFIC SIGNAL TYPE 30A INSTALLED N
PLACE: TO INCLUDE, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,
COMPACTION, CONCRETE REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION
8 190 EA | v, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS, 53,150.00 $598,500.00, $1,407.00 $267,330.00 $0.00¢
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS
FOUNDATION, TRAFFIC BIGNAL TYPE 36A INSTALLED IN
PLACE: TO INCLUDE, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,
COMPACTION, CONCRETE REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION
VI, “iINSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
g 0 EA AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS $3,950.00 $118,500.00 $2,500.00 $87,000,00 50.004
FOUNDATION, TRAFFIC CONTROLLER INSTALLED IN
PLACE: TQ INCLUDE, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,
COMPACTION, CONCRETE REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION
10 30 EA | vi, "INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS, $3,250.0¢ $97,500.00 $910.00 $27,300.004 §0.00
AND GROUND BOXES"” SPECIFICATIONS
2017-814 - CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES Page 23 of 26
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2016 Award

W Frvcwreests

Winn (ﬁa

iam TITLE:
810 DATE:

CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES
March 15, 2017

BtD NO: 2017-814

DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS,
LLC

£L PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 2

“BASEBID I - INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT. LO

OPS, FOUNDATION

J.AR CONCRETE INC, DBA JAR
CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 2 OF 2
S, AND GROUND BOXES - .

ITEM

EST

ary UNIT

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

TOTAL
AMOUNT

{QUANTITY x UNIT
PRICE}IN
FIGURES

TOTAL
ANMOUNT

{QUANTITY x UNIT
PRICE]} IN
FIGURES

TOTAL
AMOUNT

(QUANTITY x
UNIT PRICE) IN
FIGURES

11

40

GROUND BOX TYPE A REPLACEMENT: TO INCLUDE, NEW
TYPE A GROUND BOX, REMOVAL OF OLD/BROKEN BOX
AND INSTALLATION OF NEW GROUND BOX, SAW CUT,
LOOP SEALANT, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, COMPACTION,
CONCRETE REMOVAL, CONCRETE PLACEMENT, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL, REFERENCE DIVISION
VI, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOBS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES™ SPECIFICATIONS

$1,650.00

$66,000.00

$600.00

$20,000.00

30.004

12

GROUND BOX TYPE C REPLACEMENT: TO INCLUDE, NEW
TYPE C GROUND BOX, REMOVAL OF OLD/BROKEN BOX
AND INSTALLATION OF NEW GROUND BOX, SAW CUT,
LOOP SEALANT, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, COMPACTION,
CONCRETE REMOVAL, CONCRETE PLACEMENT, AND
DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION
VI, "INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES"” SPECIFICATIONS

$1,850.00

$9,250.00

$800.00

$4,000.00

SG.OOW

13

GROUND BOX TYPE 1 REPLACEMENT: TO INCLUDE NEW
TYPE 1 GROUND BOX, REMOVAL OF DLD/BROKEN BOX
AND INSTALLATION OF NEW GROUND
BOX/COMMUNICATION,

EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, COMPACTION, CONCRETE
REMOVAL, CONCRETE PLACEMENT, AND DISPOSAL OF
WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION VI,
“INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES"” SPECIFICATIONS

$3,750.00

$18,750.00

£806.00

54,000.00

50.00§

Approved By: <
Date: =3
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CITY OF EL. PASO

BID TABULATION FORM 2016 Award Winnd® ooy
iam TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES BID NO: 2047-814
BID DATE: Maech 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
S : MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS, | J.A.R CONCRETE INC. DEA JAR
LLC CONSTRUCTION INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASG, TX
e s e BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
e - BASE BIDH - INSTALEATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS, AND GROUND BOXES
meml  esr TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL {QUANTITY x
: oty uNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT PRICE] IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRICE} IN
FIGURES EIGURES FIGURES
PROVIDE AND {INSTALL AUDIO PEDESTRIAN PUSH
14 2 EA BUTTONS $1,360.00 $2,720.00) $1,510.00 $3,020.00% $0.008
PVC GONDUIT 2-INCH INSTALLED BY RIRECTIONAL
BORING: TO INCLUDE, BORING, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL,
COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
16 | 1,000 | F | PISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION $47.00 $47,000.00 $26.20 $28,200.00 $0.00}
) VI, "INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS,
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS
PVC CONDUIT 4-INCH INSTALLED BY TRENCHING: 70
INCLUDE, SAW CUT, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL
COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND L
16 | 1,000 LF | DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION $30.00 $30,000.00 $20.00 $20,000.00 $0.000
VI, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOES, FOUNDATIDNS,
AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS
PVC CONDUIT 1-INCH INSTALLED BY TRENCHING: TO
INCLUDE, SAW CUT, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL
COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
17 1,940 LF BISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION $16.00 $31,040.00 $12.00 $23,280.00] $0.008
VI, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS,
FOUNDATIONS, AND GROUND BOXES" SPECIFICATIONS
PROVIDE AND INSTALL 2 #6 THHW AND 1#6 THHW
18 g 1K.FT, GROUND $11.00 $24.20 $217.80 so.col
Approved By:

Date:

<
35/55/?
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

o Frocoremests

2016 Award W'mncr(@

BID NO: 2017-814

BIO TITLE: CITY SITE WORK AND PARK WAY STRUCTURES
BID DATE: March 15, 2017 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
B MARTINEZ BROS, CONTRACTORS, J.AR CONCRETE INC. DBA JAR
L CONSTRUGTION ING
------ _ R R EL PASQ, TX EL PASO, TX
e T e T e BIDDER 1 OF 2 BIDDER 2 OF 2
oo  BASE BID o INSTALEATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS, FOUNDATIONS, AND GROUND BOXES - .
meml  esv TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT TOTAL (QUANTITY x UNIT]|  TOTAL {QUANTITY %
s | ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF [TEM AMOUNT PRICE) IN AWMOUNT PRICE) IN AMOUNT | UNIT PRIGE}IN
FIGURES FIGURES FIGURES
PROVIDE AND INSTALL SERVICE POLE, SERVICE
19 5 EA ENTRANCE AND SERVICE FEEDER $5,730.00 £28,650.00 $8,500.00 §42,500,00 $0.007
PVC CONDUIT 1-INGH INSTALLED BY DIRECTIGNAL
20 | 1,940 LF | BORING: TO INCLUDE, BORING, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, $10.00 $19,400.00 $12.00 $23,280.00 $0.00(
COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND
PVC CONDUIT 3/4-INCH INSTALLED BY TRENGHING: TO
INGLUDE, SAW CUT, EXCAVATION, BACKFILL
COMPACTION, PAVEMENT REMOVAL & PATCHING, AND oL
21 | 1,940 LF | DISPOSAL OF WASTE MATERIAL. REFERENCE DIVISION $7.00 $13,580,00 $10.50 $20,370.00 50.0
VI, “INSTALLATION OF CONDUIT, LOOPS,
FOLUNDATIONS, AND GROUND BOXES” SPECIFICATIONS
SUM TOTAL - BASE BID il (ITEMS 1 - 21) $4,096,089.00 $1,338,997.80 £0.00
MOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF THE TOTAL BASE BID Il) $200,000.00 $5,000.00 50.00
SUM TOTAL {BASE BID Il AND MOBILIZATION) $4,295,089.00 $1,043,597.80 $0.00
$6,620,097.70
TOTAL BID - BASE BID | AND BASE BID I £9,537,775.00 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE $7,300,201,70
AMENDMENTS NC. 1, 2, 3, 24 ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES
{BID BOND SUBMITTED YES YES
Page 26 of 26
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CITY SITE WORK AND PARKWAY STRUCTURES
Solitation No. 2017-814
VIEW LIST

Date/Time Name Company
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2/7/2017 14:28 Counts, Tim

2{7/2017 15:41 Matthews, Jonathan
21812017 0:45 Mallari, Herold
2/8/2017 6:47 Wang, Jon

2/8/2017 8:15 WEIDENFELLER, WOLFGANG

2/8/2017 8:35 Weissman, David
2/812017 8:40 capino, mark
2/8f2017 11:01 Munoz, Audrey

2/8/2017 15:43 CAMPOS, JESUS

2/9/2617 10:57 ortiz, abel
2/9/2017 11:59 Treto, Breanna
2/9/2017 16:19 Candee, Kim
2/9/2017 17:21 Mejia, Saul
2/9/2017 18:08 Brower, Eric
2/9/2017 21:51 Royo, Joaquin
2/10/2017 7:55 Brandenburg, Leslie
2M10/2017 8:19 romero, ron
21072017 8:28 Lara, Eric
2/10f2017 9:01 Ferguson, Garett
211012017 13:25 DIAZ, RIBERTO
2110/2017 14:35 Rolando, Caldera
211072047 15:29 Beauregard, Brian
2M10/2017 15:36 TYREE, BRUNO
2110/2017 16:44 Hernandez, Beto
2/13/2017 7:59 Tyson, Mike
2/13/2017 8:36 Parlgj, Peter
2/13/2017 9:20 Phillips, Suzanne
2/13/2017 9:31 Boulton, Melany
2/13/2017 10:28 Loya, Abraham
211412017 0:56 Gibson, Patty
21472017 13:30 Justin, Wilkes
21412017 16:48 Leanos, Nancy
2/14/2017 18:58 Rothstein, Phillip
2/15/2017 11:58 leos, juan
211512017 17.52 Popenoe, Jeff
2115/2017 20:45 Velazquez, Joshua
2/16/2047 9:49 McGlohon, David
2/16/2017 15:58 Acosta, George
211712017 8:09 Naranjo, Lizandro
21772017 8:16 Wilson, Yvonne
211712017 8:18 Padilla, Ryan
2M17/2017 11:50 Fournier, Kari
21772017 15:44 Medina, Mercedes
22012017 0:22 Devonish, Kevin
212112017 10:01 Steadman, Sid
212212017 16:31 LegerBaillio, Lisa
2/22/2017 20:05 Harper, Damon
2/23/2017 15:04 Lopez Molinar, Ricardo
2/23/2017 15:05 Tapia, Ruby

Accent Landscape Con
Sites Southwest

Deltek Inc.

Team Designers and A

C & C ROAD CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Triple M Recreation
bidprime
Encon International,

KEYSTONE CONTRACTORS

Dodge Data And Analy
CF Jordan Constructi
Horizone Constructio
Mr.

Ztex

Big R Bridge

triple m recreation
Danny Sander Constru
Arcadis

MRD LANDSCAPING
Stinger Bridge and |
Balfour Beatty Commu

CONTRACTOIRS & ENGIN

Border Demolition, |

Parking Market Resea
Erie Metal Specialti
OHL USA

VEMAC

construction Bid Sou
Haydon

Aztec Contractors, |
Bath Engineering Cor
Prime Irrigation

The PlayWell Group |
Empire welding And F
Arrow Building Corp.
The Acosta Group, LL

Hendee Enterprises |

EDl-Integrative Cons
Mirador Enterprises
DEVO Design and Cons
Master Cuts Landscap
IW Incorpeorated
Monhar Construction
Banes General Contra
Tapias General Contr



50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
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74
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77
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82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
N
92
93
94
95
86
97
98
99
100
101
102
103
104
105
106

2/23/2017 17:25 Femandez, Robert
2/24/2017 7:18 Johnson, Kesha
2/24/2017 8:16 Fuller, Anna

2/24/2017 11:44 Contreras, Bardo
2/27/2017 9:35 Guardado, Carlos

212712017 10:36 Hernandez, Alberto

212712017 14:38 Stallard, Robert

2/28/2017 10:34 Motsinger, Sarah

2/28/2017 17:05 Nava, Vicente

212812017 20:27 Kurt, Pitzer
3M/2017 10:43 Gallardo, Frank J
3M/2017 12:48 Kirk, Yoshida
3M/2017 14:11 Martinez, Ben
37212017 22:17 Gaglio, Michael
37312017 10:39 Ortiz, Jose
31312017 17:19 Aguirre, Hector

3/712017 9:32 Sebastian, Bilancieri
3/712017 10:43 Wood, Jane
3/712017 12:11 Stange, Ashley
31712017 15:10 martinez, avelardo
3/7/2017 18:17 Monigomery, Brian

3/8/2017 7:00 Chambers, Lorri

3/8/2017 9:38 Luna, Hector
3/8/2017 10:28 Valdez, Teresa
3/8/2017 11:04 Romero, Julio
3/8/2017 18:26 vijay, kumar

3/9/2017 8:42 Paul, Gilcrease
3/9/2017 10:26 Arenivar, Miguel Angel
3/9/2017 10:42 Armando, Rodriguez
3/9/2017 13:18 Rugh, John
3M0/2017 5:13 Stephen, Dowdy
3M0/2017 7:17 Campa, Miguset
3M10/2017 8:18 Lowrance, Glaria
3M0/2017 9:04 Carreon, Manuel
3M0/2017 9:46 comaduran, richard

3/10/20617 10:07 Duran, Eddie

3M0/2017 10:18 Duran, Eduardo

3M0/2017 12:51 Solo, Alex
3M1/2017 2:07 Banquil, Lovely
3M1/2017 6:14 Kirkland, Baxter
3M3/2017 7:00 Kevin, Gillman
3M3/2017 8:28 Felix, Lupe
3M3/2017 8:40 Concha, David
3/13/2017 9:10 peggy, koehn

3M13/2017 11:17 Management, Source

3/13/2017 12:05 Hernandez, Cecilia

31312017 12:55 Mata, David

3/13/2017 13:03 Cedillo, Alex

3/13/2017 15:57 Lomeli, Abel

311372017 16:04 Borja, Javier
3M4/2017 6:03 arzaga, jesus

3M14/2017 15:30 Hessney, Steve

3M4/2017 20:57 Frank, Watson
3M472017 21:26 Bid Clerk, Bid Clerk
3M512017 10:22 Cortez, Angel

3M5/2017 12:07 NAVAR PAYAN, ELEAZAR

311512017 1:44 Ovies, Guillermo

Arrow construction
WTAGC

Tri-State Electric L
JAG

Best lronworks

CSA Constructors
construction reporte
Best Iron Works And
BidNet

Jobe Materfals
Strategic Partnershi
Martinez Bros. Contr
High Desert Native P
PlayWell Group

A And M Construction
Bellabianca Media
Construction Reporte
MTI

martinez irrigation
Montgomery Sprinkler
Virtual Builders Exc
Black Stallion Const
MRD LANDSCAPING
SiteOne Landscape Su
Mobius

HUB

Santana contracting
Venegas Engineering
AMTEK

Larwel Industries
HACEP

Jobe Materials
Tri-State Electric L.
comaduran constructi
Aztec Contractors In
Noble General Contra
DRS Rock Materials L

RBK Construction, In
iSqFt

Prime Irrigation And
CEA Group

Dodge Reports

The Planlt Room
Unintech Engineers
Highridge Constructi
Lomeli And Sons Land
Martinez Bros Contra
pmi

Bowen Industrial Con
Advanced Starlight |
Prime Vendor Inc.
GCC Sun City Materia
J.AR. CONSTRUCTION
JAR Construction



