CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD'S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Animal Services
AGENDA DATE: May 26, 2020

CONTACT PERSON NAME/PHONE: Paula Powell, Animal Services Director, (915) 212-8703
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, (915) 212-1181

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All
STRATEGIC GOAL NO. 8: Nurture and Promote a Healthy, Sustainable Community

This purchase relates to the 2025 strategic plan as follows: 8.3: Enhance animal services to ensure El Paso's pets are
provided a safe and healthy environment. This contract will support the Department in keeping El Paso’s pets safe and
healthy.

SUBJECT:

The award of Solicitation No. 2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies to Intervet, Inc., dba Merck Animal Health for an initial
three (3) year term for an estimated award of $825,000.00. The award is to include a two (2) year option award of
$550,000.00 for a five {5) year award of $1,375,000.00. The award of this contract will provide medical supplies for the
Department of Animal Services.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:
Animal Services has reviewed Salicitation No. 2020-708 and recommends the contract be awarded to Intervet, Inc., dba
Merck Animal Health for Group IV, offering the lowest bids.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on February 25, 2020 and March 3, 2020. The solicitation was posted on the City's website
on February 25, 2020. The email (Pumail) notification was sent out on February 27, 2020. A total of ten (10) bidders
were solicited; one (1) being local. five (5) bids were received; none being local.

PROTEST:
No protest received for this requirement.
] Protest received.

CONTRACT VARIANCE: “
No cost variance.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

Motion to award solicitation 2015-005 Veterinary Medical Supplies on 10/2/2014. Motion to award solicitation 2016-766
Veterinary Medical Supplies on October 16, 2016.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:
Amount: $ 825,000.00
Funding: 225-2580-25120-531120

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
N/A

s  REQUIRED AUTHORIZATIQN ot ikiebinirkinininkinionkes
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COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(Low Bid)

********************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW************************************************
Please place the following item on the REGULAR AGENDA for the Council Meeting of May 26, 2020.
STRATEGIC GOAL NO. 8: Nurture and Promote a Healthy, Sustainable Community

This purchase relates to the 2025 strategic plan as follows: 8.3: Enhance animal services to ensure El Paso's
pets are provided a safe and healthy environment. This contract will support the Department in keeping El
Paso's pets safe and healthy.

Award Summary:

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies to Intervet,
Inc., dba Merck Animal Health for an initial three (3) year term for an estimated award of $825,000.00. The
award is to include a two (2) year option award of $550,000.00 for a five (5) year award of $1,375,000.00.
The award of this contract will provide medical supplies for the Department of Animal Services.

Contract Variance: No contract variance.

Department: Animal Services

Award to: Intervet, Inc., dba Merck Animal Health
Madison, NJ

Item(s): Group IV

Initial Term: 3 years

Option to Extend: 2 years

Annual Estimated Award: $275,000.00

Initial Term Estimated Award: $825,000.00 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $1,375,00.00 (5 years)

Account No.: 225-2580-25120-531120

Funding Source: Animal Service Fund

District(s): All

This is a low bid, unit price contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and Department of Animal Services recommend award
as indicated to Intervet, Inc., dba Merck Animal Health, the lowest, responsive and responsible bidder and
that Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC dba Covetrus North America and MWI Veterinary
Supply dba MWI Animal Health be deemed non-responsive in all groups for not selecting Price Adjustment
Factor. Deem Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc., non-responsive in all groups for not submitting
manufacturer’s price list with their bid. Also, that Premier Scientific, LLC be deemed non-responsive for
not acknowledging amendment.

In accordance with this award, the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future options if
needed.



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achlesemear of

2019 Award Winner La

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708|
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding Midwest Veterina
Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. supoly. Inc y
North America dba Merck Animal Health PP ?' .
Lakesville, MN
Dallas, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION — _— p—
CR MARKUP g MARKUP 0__5 MARKUP
NET NET NET
ITEM Medical Supply Catalog - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT -_10 % DISCOUNT
1. + % MARKUP + % MARKUP + % MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number - Catalog*
Dated - —_ —
*discount applies to all non manufacture
rice locked items
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR D D lz'
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER O ] ]
RETAILER ] [ ]
OTHER (I 1 ]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is]

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achirvement af

C CrCe
P Procurewent

D Awwasel Winner &

|BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding
Company, LLC dba Covetrus

Intervet Inc.

Midwest Veterinary
Supply, Inc.

North America dba Merck Animal Health Lakesville, MN
Dallas, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
o, [] 0
ITEM DESCRIPTION NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
% MARKUP g MARKUP % MARKUP
NET NET NET
ITEM Medical Supply Catalog -___ % DISCOUNT - ____ % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT
2: + % MARKUP + % MARKUP + % MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number
Dated —_ _—
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] U
DISTRIBUTOR D D I:I
JOBBER D D D
DEALER D D D
RETAILER D l:l D
OTHER ] ] -

APPROVED BY: Is!

DATE: 042812020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies

NOTE: 7he mformation contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION
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BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding Midwest Veterina
Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. Subblv. Inc y
North America dba Merck Animal Health Lakgslzr?:ie M.N
Dallas, TX !
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
E ESCRIPTION _— — —
ITEM D % MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET NET NET
ITEM Medlcal Supply Cata]og L % DISCOUNT R % DISCOUNT SR % DISCOUNT

3 + % MARKUP + % MARKUP + % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

Price List or Catalog

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number - _

Dated —_—

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER £l ] ]

DISTRIBUTOR D OJ D

JOBBER ] ] ]

DEALER D Ll D

RETAILER D Ol l:]

OTHER ] ] ]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is!

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Athlevement of

E‘i(_?wf'\‘iﬂ'
la Prnenroment:
»

2009 Awand v

&

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding Midwest Veterina
Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. ! gu v | Yy
North America dba Merck Animal Health Lakepsizrﬁien:n-N
Dallas, TX !
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
EM DESCRIP — — —
o TION g MARKUP OR MARKUP % MARKUP
NET NET NET
ITEM Medlcal Supply Catalog - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - °/u DISCOUNT
4: + % MARKUP + % MARKUP + % MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number —_ op—
Dated - T—
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] [
DEALER ] ] )
RETAILER ] 4 ]
OTHER 3 c ]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: isf

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achicrement of

ML
3" 1a Fiocurement
2017 Award Winncr =

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding Midwest Veterina
Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. Supply. | rinary
North America dba Merck Animal Health La::’s':,i’:;e“;N
Dallas, TX !
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION — — —
% MARKUP % MARKUP g MARKUP
NET NET NET
ITEM Medlcal Supply Catalog - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT

5 + % MARKUP + % MARKUP + % MARKUP

Discount/iMark-up or Net proposed from the

Price List or Catalog

{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number = -

Dated —

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER ] [ ]

DISTRIBUTOR ] ] O

JOBBER ] ] ]

DEALER ] ] ]

RETAILER D D D

OTHER L (I ]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: st

DATE: 04/2812020

20:20-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achivvrment ol

2009 Award Winner E

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding
Company, LLC dba Covetrus
North America
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary
Supply, Inc.
Lakesville, MN

Group I: Controlled Substances

DESCRIPTION:

Pentobarbital sodium 6 grainsimi -

Pentobarbital sodium 6 grainsiml -

Pentobarbital sodium & grainsiml -

250m| 250ml 250ml
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: PI-HS-030-250-0 NO BID NO BID
1. |B!DDER'S BRAND: Med Pharmex Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $104.90 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $72.76 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle
ITEM |MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: VINB-KETO-7021 NO BID NO BID
2, |BIDDER'S BRAND: Vedco Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $6.12 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST {after Discount or Mark-up) $4.71 NO BID NO BID
{no qty
TOTAL COST {ITEMS 1 - 2) $77.47 provided) NO BID NO BID

Group Wl: Veterinary Supplies

DESCRIPTION:

Soda lime bag 3 Ibslbag

Soda lime bag 3 Ibs/bag

Sada lime bag 3 [bs/bag

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: J0553 sku: 055781 NO BID NO BID
1. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Jorgensen Laboratories Inc. NO BID NO BiD
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up}) $7.80 NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $5.91 NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-.708 Velerinary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Arhirvement nf
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2019 Award Winner i

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding

Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. M'ngSt ‘Iuletlt'e]rcl:nary
North America dba Merck Animal Health PPIY: Inc.
Lakesville, MN
Dallas, TX
'DESCRIPTION: Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle Isoflurane gas 250 mi/bottle Isoflurane gas 250 mifbottle
ITEM |MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 11695067772 sku:029405 NO BID NO BID
2. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Piramal Critical Care Inc. NO BID NO BID
|PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $27.83 NO BID NO BID
|CITY'S COST {after Discount or Mark-up) $20.49 NO BID NO BID
|DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator tape {" Autoclave indicator tape 1" Autoclave indicator tape 1"
ITEM [MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: STLF24MMHS sku: 037283 NO BID NO BID
3. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Crosstex International NO BID NOQ BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $5.69 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $3.76 NO BID NO BID
) Anesthesia bags Anesthesia bags Anesthesia bags
DESCRIPTION: 5,1,2 8 3 lter 5,1, 2 & 3 lifer 5,1, 28 3 liter
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: skiq2:196%’6‘;0f}?lzg;i‘swtz)::gsa NO BID NO BID
ITEM |BIDDER'S BRAND: Jorgensen Laboratories Inc. NO BID NO BID
4 $6.00
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up} Bidders cost: NO BID NO BID
$6.00, $6.00
$5.28
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) Bidders cost: NO BID NO BID

$5.28, $5.28

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Ist

DATE: 04/2812020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achievement of

2019 Awared Winner i

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services)

Butler Animal Health Holding
Company, LLC dba Covetrus
North America
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary
Supply, Inc.
Lakesville, MN

Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3

DESCRIPTION: Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 mlibottler milbottle Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 mifbotile
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 1469SB sku: 001505 NO BID NC BID
5. |BIDDER'S BRAND: k] NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $18.63 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $14.39 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Parvo Test Kits Parvo Test Kits Parvo Test Kits
TEM iMANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: VINV-MODE-0007 sku: 068701 NO BID NO BID
6. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Vedco Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $101.17 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $89.03 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator strips 100/box | Autoclave indicator strips 100/box | Autoclave indicator strips 100/box
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: o :::: ?\:a?\tlf'; :::lsr‘ll :gB - NO BID NO BID
7. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Inc. ) NO BIb NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $18.85 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $12.06 NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isi

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708

DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

dutler Animal Health Holding
Company, LLC dba Covetrus

Intervet Inc.

Midwest Veterinary
Supply, Inc.

North America dba Merck Animal Health Lakesville. MN

Dallas. TX akesville,

DESCRIPTION: Electric clipper blade #40 Electric clipper blade #41 Electric clipper blade #42
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 64265 sku: 033368 NO BID NO BID
8. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Andis Company NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $34.17 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $25.23 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Elizabeth collar size 20 Elizabeth collar size 21 Elizabeth collar size 22

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 273350 sku: 001106 NO BID NO BID
9. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Epiq Animal Health NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $6.01 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $4.73 NO BID NO BID

ITEM
10.

DESCRIPTION:

IV Admin Set {length, drops, # of sites or a
manufacturer and PIN of what |s preferred)

IV Admin Set {length, drops, # of sltes ora
manufacturer and PIN of what Is preferred}

¥ Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites ora
manufacturer and PIN of what Is preferred)

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: J0400 sku: 008464 NO BID NO BID
BIDDER'S BRAND: Jorgensen Laboratories Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $1.49 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $1.31 NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Iaf

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterlnary Medical Supplies

10




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Achirermrst of

HHY Avward Winmer i

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding
Company, LLC dba Covetrus
North America
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary
Supply, Inc.
Lakesville, MN

DESCRIPTION: §V catheter 22 gage / Box of 50 IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 51 IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 52
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: VINV-CAT2-225V sku: 050605 NO BID NO BID
11. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Vedco Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $1.58 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $1.06 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Non-woven sponges 4 x 4 Non-woven sponges 4 x 4 Non-woven sponges 4 x 4
Case of ten boxes Case of ten boxes Case of ten boxes
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 1014336 sku: 019925 NO BID NO BID
12. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Dukal Corporation NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up} $4.78 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $2.54 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION:

Surgical gloves latex/PF
4 boxlcase; Size 6

Surgical gloves Jatex/PF
4 boxlcase; Size 7

Surgical gloves latex/PF
4 box/case; Size 8

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 5787003 sku: 068956 NO BID NO BID

13. |BIDDER'S BRAND: —— Heaul'_‘fg’e LI NO BID NO BID

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $40,22 NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST {after Discount or Mark-up) $28.41 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Suture Sorboeryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 || Suture Sorbocryl 310 FS-2, 36", 12 | Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12

’ CT/Box NFS-2 CT/Box NFS-3 CTiBox NFS-4

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: L943 sku: 029293 NO BID NO BID

14, |BIDDER'S BRAND: CP Medical Corp. NO BID NO BID

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $59.71 NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $52.54 NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY: isf

DATE: 0412872020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies

"




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION
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|BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708|
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for fnformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Bufler Animal Health Holding Midwest Veterina
Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. Supplv. Inc ry
North America dba Merck Animal Health Lak:s‘:fzie M-N
—Dallas TX ;
. Suture Sorbocryl 210 FS-2, 36", 12 | Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 | Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12
DESCRIPTION: CT/Box CT/Box CT/Box
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: L943 sku: 029293 NO BID NO BID
15. |BIDDER'S BRAND: CP Medical Corp. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (befare Discount or Mark-up) $59.71 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $52.54 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" | Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CTibox 1" | Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1"
needle needle needle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 308575 sku: 017266 NO BID NO BID
16. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Bacton Dickinson & Company NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $15.71 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $13.82 NO BID NO BID
§333.10 i $230.68
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 - 16) Bidgerscost: | 2.9 NoBip |CostatEach $23068 | WITHOUT
$34168 provided) no celox MAND ITEMS
= Excantac
Group lIl: Veterinary Medication
DESCRIPTION: Cephalexin 500 mgitabs/500 Cephalexin 500 mgltabs/500 Cephalexin 500 mgitabs/500
' tab/bottle tabjbottle tab/bottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 68180012202 sku: 067798 NO BID NO BID
4. [|BIDDER'S BRAND:; Lupin Pharmaceuticals NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $37.07 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $32.39 NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY: is!

DATE: 04/28i2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies

12




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Achirveand wl

2010 Award Winner i

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies

BID # 2020-708|

BID DATE: April 15, 2020 DEPARTMENT: Animal Services
Butler Animal Health Holding . .
Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. M'd‘g%t :Ietlermary
North America dba Merck Animal Health La:gsl:\‘f};; ";iN
Dallas, TX L
] Doxycline 100 maftabsi500 Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500 Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500
DS e tabs/bottle tabsibottle tabs/botile
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 67405055005 sku: 065765 NO BID NO BID
2 BIDDER'S BRAND: Harris Pharmaceuticals NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $37.91 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $31.25 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Metronidazole 250 mgitah 500 Metronidazole 250 mgitab 500 Metranidazele 250 mgitak 500
) tab/bottle tablbottle tab/bottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 23155065105 sku: 061808 NO BID NO BID
3 BIDDER'S BRAND:; Avet Pharmaceuticals NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (befare Discount ar Mark-up) $15.87 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $13.84 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg. | Enrofloxin (Baytril} tablets 68 mg. | Enrofloxin {Baytril) tablets 68 mg.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: VINV-ETB3-0605 sku: 068802 NO BID NO BID
'Tf'“ BIDDER'S BRAND: Vedco Inc. NO BID NO BID
" |PRICE LIST COST (befare Discount or Mark-up) $66.71 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $56.70 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Xylazine 100 mgiml 50 miibottle Xylazine 100 mgi/ml 50 mlibottle Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 mi/bottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 1XYLO06 sku: 061035 NO BID NO BID
5. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Bimeda Animal Health Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $23.06 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $19.70 NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: isi

DATE: 04128/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies

13



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION
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IBID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding
Company, LLC dba Covetrus
North America
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc,
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary
Supply, Inc.
Lakesville, MN

DESCRIPTION: Rimadyl 75 mgitab 180 tabsfbottle | Rimadyl 75 mgitab 180 tabsibottle | Rimadyl 75 mgitab 180 tabsibotile
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 10000316 sku: 024736 NO BID NO BID
6. BIDDER'S BRAND: Zoetis Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $177.05 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up} $177.05 NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Covenia inj. 10 miibottle Covenia inj. 10 mifbottle Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 10001498 sku: 045533 NO BID NO BID
IT-E " BIDDER'S BRAND; Zoetis Inc. NO BID NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $324.35 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $324.35 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL COST {ITEMS 1-7) $655.28 pi’;:ig‘e‘g) NO BID NO BID
Group IV: Vaccines
DESCRIPTION: Bordetella 25 dosesitray (Nabivac | Bordeteila 25 dosesitray (Nabivac | Bordetella 25 dosesftray {Nabivac
Intra Trac, ADT) Intra Trac, ADT) Intra Trac, ADT)
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 11695067772 sku: 029405 065313 NO BID
ITEM [BIDDER'S BRAND: Piramal Critical Care Inc. Nobivac Intra Trac 3 NO BID
b PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $27.83 $162.14 . .o NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $20.49 $56.75 gy amaose NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: sl

DATE: 04/268/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Achievement of

b Pascwrement

20189 Aswand Winnger &

|BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding
Company, LLC dba Covetrus
North America
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal

Health

Midwest Veterinary
Supply, Inc.
Lakesville, MN

DESCRIPTION: [Feiine Nobivac HCPCH 25 dosesitray] 2" "::;::;:;m’ Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 dosesitray
T MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 065288 sku: 006427 065266 NO BID
2 |BIDDER'S BRAND: Merck Animal Health Nobivac Feline HCPLH NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up} $147.00 $147.00 ., v NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $147.00 $51.50 .sz_'o',';c’,'ﬁ NO BID
DESCRIPTION: K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 dosesitray | K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 dosesitray | K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 065288 sku: 011276 065288 NO BID
3. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Merck Animal Health Nobivac DAPPV NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $162.00 $177.19 gy ose NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $162.00 $56.75 .% NO BID
DESCRIPTION: RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 dosesitray | RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 dosesitray | RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 dosesitray
T MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 065448 sku: 065448 065488 NO BID
4. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Merck Animal Health Nobivac 3 year Rabies NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $149.88 $150.00 .o, 0¥ NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $149.88 $52.50 .31_& NO BID
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1-4) §149.98 p'r::’;g“ U750 | e NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardiexecution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Ist

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO

Achievemenl oi

&,

o Temoremrral
B I D TA B U LATIO N H ) Aavard Winner 4,

|BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BIC # 2020-708
BID DATE: April 15, 2020 DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

Butler Animal Health Holding . .

Company, LLC dba Covetrus Intervet Inc. Mnd\gﬁst :Iet;::nary

North America dba Merck Animal Health PPl Inc.
Dallas, TX Lakesville, MIN

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE
CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO
EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT. Izl @ D

INO OPTION OFFERED. |:| |:| D

PAYMENT TERMS: Net - 30 days Net - 30 days

[BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 1-3 _ .
Within __ consecutive calendar days. {exchudes special order and equipment] 5 1-2 Business
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 24 Left Blank Left Blank
order in cases of emergency

AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEGED: Yes Yes No

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIREUﬁEL[VERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
|BIDS SOLICITED: 10 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 1 BIDS RECEIVED: 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0 NO BID:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and doeas not constitute actual awardlexecution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is!

DATE: 04/28/2020 2020.708 Veterinary Medical Supplies i6




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATIO

N

Achicvement of

n’ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁ?«?

2019 Award Winner n

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba S
MVI Animal Health CIILIRTE Lo S
N Grand Prairie, TX
Boise, ID
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
s Al OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET X NET NET
ITE . - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT
1; Medical Supply Catalog ¥ % MARKUP ¥ "% MARKUP ¥ Y, MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable}
List Number
Dated -
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] (xI] [
JOBBER ] ] Cl
DEALER ] ] Ll
RETAILER ] ] UJ
OTHER ] 3 1

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation Is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isi

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Velerinary Medical Supplies

18



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Achicvement of

fa Fievrement
20109 Award Winngr

..,

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVi Veterinary Supply Co dba
MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC

Grand Prairie, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FA

CTOR

NET OR % DISCOUNT | NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
il OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET X NET NET
ITE . - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT
2 Medical Supply Catalog ¥ % MARKUP ¥ 7 MARKUP ¥ % MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number
Dated - _—
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER L] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR Ll X ]
JOBBER [} ] ]
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER [} ] ]
OTHER ] 1 1

NOTE:

The information contained in this bid tabulaticn is for information only and does not constitute actual awardfexecution of contract.

APPROVEDBY: __isl

DATE: 04128/2020

2020-708 Veterlnary Medical Supplies



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Ackicyement of

Cagellonce

tEmrnl
2019 Avward Winner [

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

APPROVED BY: Ist

DATE: 04/28/12020

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba . S
MVI Animal Health P"’g‘r:*;ds;ﬁ'i‘:ifc%;"c
Boise, ID '
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCCUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET X NET NET
ITE . - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT
3: k= Eiod ¥ % MARKUP ¥ % MARKUP ¥ MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable}
List Number
Dated _ _ —
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER L] [ [
DISTRIBUTOR ] X] ]
JOBBER D I:' D
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER Cl D D
OTHER ] -a__ ]
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardiexecution of contract.

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achicverment &t

Croclmcs

Ia Procwremient

2019 Awared Winner =

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba ; S
MVI Animal Health P'etr;"r'egds"f,'rz'i‘:i':‘};“c
Boise, ID a !
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT ET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET X NET NET
ITE : - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT

4 Medical Supply Catalog F % MARKUP F ¥ MARKUP ¥ %, MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

Price List or Catalog

{note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number T—

Dated _ — —_—

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER ] ] ]

DISTRIBUTOR ] x] O

JOBBER ] ] ]

DEALER ] ] ]

RETAILER L_—l D D

OTHER L] 1 ]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for Information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVEDBY: __ fsf

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achirvernent of

]
e Prncwrement

2080 Award Winnuer B

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba . N
MVI Animal Health Premier SCIEI.It-Ific, LLC
L Grand Prairie, TX
Boise, ID
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET X NET NET
ITEM : - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT - % DISCOUNT
5: Medical Supply Catalog ¥ % MARKUP ¥ % MARKUP ¥+ % MARKUP
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
List Number -
Dated - _—
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] L]
DISTRIBUTOR [——-' @ D
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ) (] []
RETAILER D D D
OTHER 1 1 1
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation 1S for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: sl

DATE: 0412812020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Achicvement of

%}tc ~ace
In Procatement
2019 Award Winnor =Y

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba
MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

Group I: Controlled Substances

DESCRIPTION:

Pentobarbital sodium 6 grainsiml -

Pentobarbital sodium 6 grains/ml -

250ml 250ml
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 51311-0103-25 NO BID
1. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Virbac NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $88.00 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $88.00 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10mlibottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 13985-05-8410 NO BID
2. |BIDDER'S BRAND: VetOne NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $6.95 NO BID
CITY'S COST {after Discount or Mark-up) $6.15 NO BID
TOTAL COST{ITEMS 1 -2) $94.15 NOBID
Group lI: Veterinary Supplies
DESCRIPTION: Soda lime bag 3 Ibs/bag Soda lime bag 3 Ibs/bag
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 50119 NO BID
1. |BIDDER'S BRAND: VetOne NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $7.45 NO BID
CITY'S COST {after Discount or Mark-up) $6.14 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not consfitute actual awardiexecution of contract.

APPROVED BY: fai

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achicverment of

2009 Award Winner

.,

|BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba . o

MVI Animal Health Premier Scientific, LLC

. Grand Prairie, TX
Boise, ID

DESCRIPTION: Isoflurane gas 250 milbottle Isoflurane gas 250 miibottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 3060 NO BID
2, |BIDDER'S BRAND: VetOne NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $24.11 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $24.11 NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator tape 1" Autoclave indicator tape 1"
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 1322-24MM NO BID
3. |BIDDER'S BRAND: M NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $6.74 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $5.89 NO BID

. Anesthesia bags Anesthesia bags
DESCRIPTION: 5,1,2& 3 liter 5,1, 2 & 3 lter

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 0, 91316041, 9131642, 91316043 NO BID
4. |BIDDER'S BRAND: ot ot s st NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $137.93 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $118.91 NO BID

APPROVED BY: sl

DATE: 0412812020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Endi:ﬁ"" of
li)l.-cl'rutnﬂnrwl .

2009 Award Winner F

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies

B1D DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI1 Veterinary Supply Co dba
MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3

NOTE: Th

DESCRIPTION: Vethond-3M Surgical glue 3 miibottle miibottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 1469SB NO BID
5. |BIDDER'S BRAND: M NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $17.39 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $14.99 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Parvo Test Kits Parvo Test Kits
renq [WANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: ,Pmdmﬁ’g;g‘:?g;"p‘:ck o NO BID
6. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Zoetis NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $149.95 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $149.95 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator strips 100/box § Autoclave indicator strips 100/box
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: SSsl 100 NO BID
7. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Cross NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $41.38 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $38.05 NO BID

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 04128/2020

2020-708 Velerinary Medical Supplies

e information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Achievement of

n’l‘n‘:l"lum!mi
20109 Award Winner L

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI| Veterinary Supply Co dba
MVI| Animal Health

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

Boise, ID
DESCRIPTION: Electric clipper blade #40 Electric clipper blade #40
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 64076 NO BID
8. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Andis NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $21.97 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $18.44 NO BID

DESCRIPTION:

Elizabsth collar size 20

Elizabeth collar size 20

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Clinic Collar NO BID
9, |BIDDER'S BRAND: VetOne NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $2.83 NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $2.11 NO BID

ITEM
10.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation IS for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DESCRIPTION:

IV Admin Set {length, drops, # of
sites or a manufacturer and PIN of

IV Admin Set {length, drops, # of
sites or a manufacturer and P/N of

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: TruCare Biomedix IV NO BID
BIDDER'S BRAND: Medline NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $132.09 *Boxof40 NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

$106.28

NO BID

APPROVED BY: Is!

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

Athicvement of

2019 Award Winner e

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba

Premier Scientific, LLC

ITEM
11.

e ‘;’;ii’:;' ealth Grand Prairie, TX
DESCRIPTION: IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 50 IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Introcan Safety NO BID
BIDDER'S BRAND: Medline NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $174.29 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $140.23 NO BID

ITEM
12,

DESCRIPTION:

Non-woven sponges 4 x 4
Case of ten boxes

Non-woven sponges 4 x 4
Case of ten boxes

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Avant Sterile NO BID
BIDDER'S BRAND: Medline NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $58.19 ‘Caseof12 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $46.82 NO BID

DESCRIPTION:

Surgical gloves latex/PF
4 boxlcase: Size 6

Surgical gloves latex/PF
4 box/case; Size 6

e MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Sensi Encore NO BID
13. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Ansel NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (hefore Discount or Mark-up) $35.23 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $32.39_ NO BID_
. Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 | Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12
DESCRIPTION: CT/Box NFS-2 CT/Box NFS-2
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 8032 Securocry 1 NO BID
14. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Securos NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $60.08 “Price locked NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $60.08 NQO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: sl

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies

Fi)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achievement of

Grigellencs

20009 Award Winner )

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708|
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba
MVI Animal Health

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

Boise, ID
. Suture Sorbocryl 210 F5-2, 36°, 12 | Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12
i — CT/Box CTIBox
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 8031 Securocry 1 NO BID
15, |BIDDER'S BRAND: Securos NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $60.08 ‘Price locked NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $60.08 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" | Syringes 3 mf, 21G, 100 CT/box 1
needle needle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 8881513132 NO BID
16. |BIDDER'S BRAND: CARDL NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {hefore Discount or Mark-up) $12.80 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $12.21 NO BID
B836.68
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 -16) Biidﬂ’c Price NO BID
$436.69

Group n: Veterinary Medication

ITEM

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DESCRIPTION:

Cephalexin 500 mgitabs/500

Cephalexin 500 mgltabs/500

tab/bottle tab/bottle
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 65862-0019-05 NO BID
BIDDER'S BRAND: AuroB NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $42.03 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $38.65 NO BID

APPROVED BY: st

DATE: 04/28/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medlcal Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

‘Achievement of
Crrellnes

2119 Award Winner .

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708|
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba
MVI Animal Health

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

Boise, ID
. Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500 Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500
DESCRIPTION: tabs/bottle tabs/botile
ITEM IMANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 42806-0312-05 NO BID
2, ’BIDDER'S BRAND: EPICP NO BID
IPRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $52.16 NO BID
|CITY'S COST {after Discount or Mark-up) $41.97 NO BID
. Metronidazele 250 mgitab 500 Metranidazole 250 mgftab 500
IDESCRIPTION' tablbottle tab/bottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Left Blank NO BID
3. |BIDDER'S BRAND: UNICH NO BID
PRICE LIST COST {before Discount or Mark-up) $16.18 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up} $15.80 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg. | Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Enrosite Chewable NO BID
4, |BIDDER'S BRAND: VetOne NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $222.03 “Price locked NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $222.03 ‘forB200 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 mi/bottle Xylazine 100 mgiml 50 mi/bottle
TEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 13985-0704-10 Anased NO BID
5. |BIDDER'S BRAND: VetOne NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $29.39 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $26.18 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardiexecution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isi

DATE: 04/268/2020

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Ackievement of

In Procwrement

2009 Awward Winnet

B

BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba . S
MVI Animal Health Premier Scientific, LLC
s Grand Prairie, TX
Boise, ID
DESCRIPTION: Rimadyl 75 mgitab 180 tabsibotlle | Rimadyl 75 mgitab 180 tabsibottle
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: Ostifen Chew NO BID
6. |BIDDER'S BRAND: VetOne NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $81.00 “Price locked NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $81.00 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: Covenia inj, 10 mi/bottle Covenia inj. 10 mi/bottle
. 10001498
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: T L T NO BID
7. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Zoetis NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $324.35 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $324.35 NO BID
TOTAL COST {ITEMS1-7) $749.98 NO BID
Group IV: Vaccines
) Bordetella 25 dosesitray (Nabivac | Bordetella 25 dosesitray (Nabivac
SR Intra Trac, ADT) Intra Trac, ADT)
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 1391-04 erice determined by Mir NO BID
1. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Merck NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (hefore Discount or Mark-up) $162.14 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $162.14 NO BID

NOTE:

The information contained in this bid tabulation Is for Information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Ist

DATE: 04/28/2020

20:20-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies lo



Achirvement af

CITY OF EL PASO

= e
In Procutethents

BID TABULATION 2019 Award Winner F)
BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
BID DATE: April 15, 2020 DEPARTMENT: Animal Services
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba . .
MVI Animal Health Premier Scientific, LLC
. Grand Prairie, TX
Boise, ID
DESCRIPTION: Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 dosesitray] ' e Nobivac HCPCH 25
dosesitray
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 1444-01 price determined by Mir NO BID
2. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Merck NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up} $147.00 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $147.00 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 dosesitray | K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 dosesitray
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: LEFT BLANK Price determined by Mir NO BID
3. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Merck NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $177.19 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $177.19 NO BID
DESCRIPTION: RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 dosesitray | RAB K% RABVAC 3 50 dosesltray
ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 140082 Price determined by Mir NO BID
4. |BIDDER'S BRAND: Merck NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $136.22 NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $136.22 NO BID
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 -4) $622.55 NO BID

*Please nole MW will honor sheller pricing
agreements between vendors and Cily of
El Paso.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecution of contract.

APPROVED BY: s/

DATE: 0472812020 2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies £y




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achirvemeat of

Grgellence

IBID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies
BID DATE: April 15, 2020

201 Award Winner )
BID # 2020-708'

DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba
MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS, THE TERM OF THIS
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE
CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO
EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO {2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION 1S EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

[] L]

HiN

iNO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS: Net - 30 days Net - 30 days
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 2.4 7

Within __ consecutive calendar days.

[Within ___ hours or ovemight after raceipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency Left Blank 48
AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEGED: Yes No

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

‘BIDS SOLICITED: 10 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 1  BIDS RECEIVED: 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0

NO BID:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is!

DATE: 0412812020

2020.708 Veterinary Medical Supplies
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Medicomart
2323 Corporate Dr
Waukesha, Wl 53189

Med- Vet International
{American Health Serv)
13822 W Boulton Blvd
Mettawa, IL 60045

Patterson Veterinary
822 7th St
Greeley, CO 80631

Unimed Government Services
21370 Heywood Avenue
Lakeville, MN 55044-9077

2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies

Henry Schein Animal Health
400 Metro Place North, Suite 100
Dublin, Ohio 43017-7545

El Paso Vet Supply
1515 Wyoming Ave
El Paso, TX 79912

First Veterinary Supply
17187 N Laurel Park Dr #300
Livonia, Ml 48152

MWI Veterinary Supply Co
3041 W. Pasadena Dr.
Boise, ID 83705

Merck Animal Health
35500 W 91st St
De Soto, KS 66018

Midwest Veterinary Supply
11240 Grader St # 300
Dallas, TX 75238





