CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD'S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Parks and Recreation Department
AGENDA DATE: June 13,2017

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Tracy Novak, Parks and Recreation Director, 212-1708
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, 212-1181

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: All

STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. #4: Enhance El Paso’s Quality of Life through Recreational, Cultural and Educational
Environments.

SUBJECT:

Award Solicitation #2017-930 Sports Officials as recommended by the Evaluation Committee and the Parks &
Recreation Department to El Paso Umpire Association (TASO). for an initial three (3) year term estimated award
of $1,309,440.00. The award includes a two (2) year option to extend in the amount of $872,960.00 for a total five
(5) year award of $2,182,400.00. The period of award is from June 13,2017 through June 12, 2020 with an option
to extend two (2) years,

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

N/A
SELECTION SUMMARY':

Solicitation was advertised on March 14, 2017 and March 21, 2017. The solicitation was posted on City website
on March 14, 2017. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on March 16, 2017. Total of two (2) bidders
were solicited; two (2) local vendors. One (1) bid was received; One (1) local vendors.

PROTEST

No protest received for this requirement.

COUNCIL REPRESENTATIVE BRIEFING:

Was a briefing provided? [_] Yes or D No
If yes, select the applicable districts.

D District 1
|:| District 2
D District 3
[l District 4
[ ] District 5
D District 6
D District 7
D District 8
D All Districts

PPS FORM 001, Rev. 3, 8/9/2016
{Riscard Previous Versions)



PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

August 14, 2014, City Council approved a bid award to El Paso Umpires Association, Solicitation 2014-315, for
a three-year contract ending August 31, 2017.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

$436,480 annually.
522110-451-1000-51270-P5113

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A

*******************REQUIRED AUTHORIZATION********************

‘ i

|

PPS FORM 001, Rev. 3, 8/9/2016
(Discard Previous Versions)



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(LOW BID OR BEST VALUE BID)

*****************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*******************************************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of June 13, 2017.

STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 4 Enhance El Paso’s Quality of Life through Recreational, Cultural and
Educational Environments.

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2017-930 Sports Officials to EI Paso Umpire Association
(TASO) for an initial term estimated award of $1,309,440.00. The award is to include a two (2) year optional
amount of $872,960.00 for a total five (5) year award of $2,182,400.00.

Department: Parks & Recreation

Award to: El Paso Umpire Association (TASO)
El Paso, TX

ltem(s): Groups 1,2,5,6, &7

Initial Term: 3 years

Option to Extend: 2 years

Annual Estimated Award: $436,480.00

Initial Term Estimated Award:  $1,309,440.00 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $2,182,400.00 (5 years)

Account No.: 451-51270-522110-1000-P5113

Funding Source: General Fund — Recreation & Cultural Contacts

District(s): All

This is a Best Value service contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and Parks & Recreation Department recommend award as
indicated to El Paso Umpire Association (TASO), the most advantageous offer to the city. In accordance with
this award the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise future options if needed.

*******************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW**********************************************

DATE: 6/8/2017



Evaluation Criteria

El Paso Umpires
Assaciation (TASO)

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

Best Value 36 months

SOLICITATION TEFLE: SPORTS OFFICIALS

PARKS AND RECREATION DEPARTMENT
SOLICITATION NO: 2017-930

B. CAPACITY TO UNDERTAKE CONTRACT

1) Offer must provide name, phone number and address of all officials

to be used in the fulfillment of the contract for each sport.

2) Include your organization's procedure for evaluating the officials you
employ. Provide availability of officials and any reslricts on location of

work sites.

3) Provide informaticn on program or computer software used for
assighments

SUBTOTAL EVALUATION FAGTOR BY

C. EXPERIENCE AND QUALIFICATIONS

On page 20 list certificaton and qualifications of all officials assigned.

tnciude a separate page for each sport. Include all officials’ names,
addresses and phone number. Certifications shall be from on of the
organizations listed on Page 23, Part 3.2 (#4). Provide copies of
ifications on each official,

D. REPUTATION & QUALITY OF THE BIDDER'S SERVICGE
(1) Does the vender comply with safety guidelines and service

schedules?
(2) Does the vendor promptly address and resolve new and/or

complex issues?
{3) What is your overall satisfaction with the vendor/company?
SUBTOTALEVALUA OR ; Shny

Grand Total

El Paso, TX
50 50.00
10 4.33
5 3.33
5 3.33
20 11.00
15 7.33
15 7.33
5 0.0¢
5 5.00
5 5.00
15 10.00
100 78




Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

maepd ol
ceﬁn&c&
Wi g

2016 Award Winnat

a

Solicitation #: 2017-930

Bid Opening Date: APRIL 5, 2017 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION
(TASO)
EL PASO, TX
" UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
NOTTO ESTIMATED MEASURE COST 3 YEAR TOTAL COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
e Eweeep | AMNUEL | o cosT (FORMULA: A x | (FORMULA: D X CoST (FORMULA: A x | (FORMULA: D X
o DESCRIPTION coat (ER |(CAMES PER|| R0 ey | (PEROFFIGIAL) | gy ¢ roaL 3YEARS=3 | (PER OFFICIAL} | by o = 1o7AL | 3 YEARS=3
- YEAR) YEAR TOTAL) - YEAR TOTAL)
GAME) PER GAME) COST) COST)
{A) (B} (C} {D) {S) [(3)]
$22.00 -
1. VOLLEY BALL - OFFICIAL $25.00 2200 1 $23.00 $50,600.00 $151,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
2. VOLLEY BALL - ASSIGNER $3.00 2200 1 $3.00 $6,600.00 $19,800.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP 1 - GRAND TOTAL:

$57,200.00

$171,600.00

COMPETATIVE-BASKETBALL $18,00- .

1. OEFICIALS $25.00 2500 2 $21.00 $105,000.00 | $315,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
COMPETATIVE. BASKETBALL -

2. SCORE KEEPER $10.00 2500 1 $10.00 $25,000.00 | $75,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
COMPETATIVE BASKETBALL -

3. ASSIGNER $3.00 2500 1 $3.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL | 3212.0-

4, OFFICIAL $25.00 500 1 $21.00 $10,500.00 | $31,500.00 $0.00 $0.00

This is a Best Valuze Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: j@@é;
DATE: ';!-f 8~ !‘ l

2017-930 SPORTS OFFICIALS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract,




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

benpmint of

i
U

2016 Award Winnér

Solicitation #: 2017-930

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION
(TASO)
EL PASO, TX
EstimaTeD | UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL
NOTTO || ANNUEL (g?gillﬁi cosT COsT (FORMULA: D X COST COST (FORMULA: D X
ITEM EXCEED | GAMES PER PER OFFICIAL) | (FORMULA:AX | 3 YEARS =3 (FORMULA: AX | 3YEARS=3
NO. DESCRIPTION cost (prr |yt | REQUIRED | 'l Bxc=TotaL | vEaRTOTAL | o OFCMY X ¢ = voTAL | YEAR TOTAL)
GAME) PER GAME} COSTY COST)
{A} (B} < (D) (G} D)
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL. -
3. SCOREKEEPER $10.00 500 1 $10.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL -
6. ASSIGNER $2.00 500 1 $2.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 2 - {ITEMS 1 THRU 6) - GRAND TOTAL: $154,000.00 | $462,000.00 $0.00 $0.00

1. 8 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $28.00 400 il NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

2. § & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 400 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
$27.00-

3. 10 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $29.00 400 2 NO BID NG BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

4. 10 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 - 400 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: 2&1
patE: H-1%- 171

2017-930 SPORTS OFFICIALS

NOTE: The information confained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardfexecufion of confract.



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

CEITAcTT
7 Frotmeman..

2076 Awardd Winniar y

@

Solicitation #; 2017-930

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION
{TASO)
EL PASO, TX
_ UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
NOTTO | ESTIMATED | oo o COST 3 YEAR TOTAL COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
ITEM EXCEED ANNUEL (OFFICIALS COST (FORMULA: A X | (FORMULA: D X COST {FORMULA: A X |(FORMULA: D X
NO DESCRIPTION COST (PER (GAMES PER|| -0 woer | (PEROFFICIALY | BXC=TOTAL | 3YEARS=3 | (PER OFFICIAL) | BXC=TOTAL | 3YEARS=3
GAME) YEAR) PER GAME) | COST) YEAR TOTAL} COST} YEAR TOTAL)
(A (B} (€ [{8)] (G} (D)
5, 42 8 UNDER - OFFICIAL ?;050' 400 2 NG BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
G. 12 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 400 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
7. 14 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $$2§50:0' 400 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
8. 14 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 400 1 NO BID NO BID NO BiD $0.00 $0.00
9. 16 & UNDER - OFFICIAL ii%%%— 200 2 NQ BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
10. 16 & UNDER -~ ASSIGNER $3.00 200 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 50.00 $0.00
$28.00 -
11. 18 & UNDER - OFFIGIAL $30.00 100 2 NO BID NO BID NG BID $0.00 $0.00

This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY; g Q
BATE: "{~lj_l-'l r]

2017-930 SPORTS OFFICIALS

NOTE: Ihe information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of confract.




Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation # 2017-930

Bid Opening Date: APRIL 5, 2017 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
; EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION
(TASO)
EL PASO, TX
e— ) TOTAL ANNUAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL
NoTTo | e (gsgsc?ﬁ& cosT cosT (FORMULA: D X cosT COST  |{FORMULA:D X
(TEm F (FORMULA:AX | 3 YEARS=3 (FORMULA: AX | 3 YEARS =3
NG, DESCRIPTION COST (PER (GAyE’iSR?ER REQUIRED || (FoR OFFICAL ) o oo ToTaL | vear ToTal) || FER OFFICIALY | by ¢ = ToTAL | YEAR TOTAL)
GAME) PER GAME) coST) cosT)
{A) (B) {C} (D) (C} (D}
12, 18 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $£0.00 $0.00

GROUP 3 - (ITEMS 1 THRU 12) - GRAND TOTAL:

o

SORIBA

$23.00 -
1. | LEAGUE & PLAYOFFS - OFFICIAL § "0 1, 550 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
2. || LEAGUE & PLAYOFFS - ASSIGNER|  $3.00 500 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

$23.00 -
3. TOURNAMENT (1) - OFFICIAL $25.00 100 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
4. | TOURNAMENT (1) - ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 NG BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
5. TOURNAMENT (2) - OFFICIAL $20.00 100 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

NOTE- The information contained in this
This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: gﬁ
pate: _H-%-17)

2017-930 SPORTS OFFICIALS

hid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardfexecution of confract.



CITY OF E>L PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Movimrnl of

E :\ecr{&q&-
F R Fracaomnts .

Solicitation #: 2017-930

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION
(TASO)
B EL PASO, TX
UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
woTTo | ESTMATED | e e COST 3 YEAR TOTAL prd 3 YEAR TOTAL
TEM o | ANNUEL o taLs COST (FORMULA: A X | (FORMULA:D X cosT (FORMULA: A x | (FORMULA: DX
DESCRIPTION (GAMES PER (PER OFFICIAL} | 5y c=ToraL | 3 YEARS=3 | (PER OFFICIAL) e 3YEARS =3
NO. COST (PER|" year) | REQUIRED YEAR TOTAL} BXC~IOTAL | YEAR TOTA
GAME) PER GAME) COST) COST) L)
(a) (B) {C) @) <) (D)
6. | TOURNAMENT (2} - ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
ONE PITCH TOURNAMENT -
7. OFEICIAL $20.00 100 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
ONE PITCH TOURNAMENT -
8. SCOREKEEPER $10.00 100 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
ONE PITCH TOURNAMENT -
9. ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 NO BiD NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 4 - {ITEMS 1 THRU 8) - GRAND TOTAL:
1. 8 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $25.00 100 1 $25.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
2. 8 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 $0.00 $0.00

This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

approveDEY: K8

pATE: H o |81

2017-930 SPORTS OFFICIALS

NGTE- The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract,




Date:
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CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

M6

Wit meal of

Pracwrmints

Award Winnér E

Solicitation #: 2017-930
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION
(TASO)
EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL |, YEAR TOTAL

NOT TO MEASURE COST COST
EXCEED ANNUEL (OFFICIALS COsT (FORMULA: A X (FORMULA: D X COST (FORMULA: A X (FORMULA: D X

ITEM DESCRIPTION (GAMES PER (PER OFFICIAL) | By o = L | 3YEARS=3 [ (PER OFFICIAL) ey 3 YEARS =3

NO. COST(PER|"" yEaR) REQUIRED XC=TOTAL | AR TOTAL) BXC=TOTAL | v AR TOTAL
GAME) PER GAME) COST) COoST) )

(A) {B) ©) (D} (G} o
3. 10 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $30.00 150 2 $30.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
4, 10 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 150 1 $3.00 $450.00 $1,350.00 $0.00 $0.00
5. 12 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $31.00 350 2 $31.00 $21,700.00 $65,100.00 $0.00 $0.00
6. 12 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 350 1 $3.00 $1,050.00 $3,150.00 $0.00 $0.00
7. 14 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $32.00 350 2 $32.00 $22,400.00 $67,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
8. 14 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $3.00 350 1 $3.00 $1,050.00 $3,150.00 $0.00 $0.00
; $30.00 -
9, RECREATIONAL OFFICIAL $34.00 100 1 $32.00 $3,200.00 $9,600.00 $0.00 $0.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract,
“This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: Q .@

DATE:

- 1811

2017-830¢ SPORTS OFFICIALS



CITY OF EL. PASO P—
BID TABULATION FORM Gt
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P Brewrinab

2016 Award Winhar '.

Solicitation #: 2017-930
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION

(TASO)
EL PASO, TX
i
No EsTiMaTED | UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL | 5 veaR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL | 4 e AR TOTAL
TTO MEASURE COST COST
TTEM Exceen | ANNUEL || oon s COST (FORMULA: A x | (FORMULA: D X COST (FORMULA: A x | (FORMULA: D X
DESCRIPTION (GAMES PER (PER OFFICIAL) g 3YEARS =3 | (PER OFFIGIAL) gy 3 YEARS =3
NO. COST (PER |yt REQUIRED BXC=TOTAL |y o hy BXCsTOTAL | V=i =?
GAME) PER GAME) COST) COST) )
(A} (B} ] (D) (c) (D)
10. | RECREATIONAL SCOREKEEPER $10.00 100 1 $10.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
11. RECREATIONAL ASSIGNER $3.00 100 1 $3.00 $300.00 $800.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 5 - (ITEMS 1 THRU 11} - GRAND TOTAL: $62,950.00 | $188,850.00 $0.00 $0.00

raGROUR:G:YOUTH:EQOTBALLES

1. M{TE - OFFICIAL $30.00 500 3 $30.00 $45,000.00 $135,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
2. MITE - ASSIGNOR $3.00 500 1 $3.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
3. MINOR - OFFICIAL $31.00 500 3 $31.00 $46,500.00 $139,500.00 $6.00 $0.00
4, MINOR - ASSIGNOR $3.00 500 1 $3.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execttion of contract.
This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to defermine an awardee.

APPROVED BY; g { ;

pare: - 18-17 2017-930 SPORTS OFFICIALS 7



Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

. Bid Opening Date: APRIL 5, 2017

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

e bfrremrs] sl
e Bone

i (r':\]:;;;.(gr‘::\:‘.inm-
Solicitation #: 2017-930
Departmeni: PARKS AND RECREATION
EL PASO UMPIRE ASSQCIATION
(TASQ)
. EL PASO, TX
esTimateD | | UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL | 4 vEAR TOTAL TOTAL ANNUAL | 5 vEaR TOTAL
NOT TO MEASURE COST COST
ANNUEL (OFFIGIALS COST (FORMULA: A X {(FORMULA:D X COST (FORMULA: A X {FORMULA: D X
ITEM DESCRIPTION EXCEED | (GAMES PER {PER OFFICIAL) | & x c=Toral | 3YEARS=3 | (PER OFFICIAL) o 3 YEARS =3
NO. COST(PER|" ygag) | REQUIRED YEAR TOTAL) BXC=TOTAL { veAR TOTAL)
GAME) PER GAME) COsT) COST)
(A) (8) (C) (D) <} (D)
5. INTERMEDIATE - OFFICIAL $31.00 500 3 $32.00 $48,000.00 $144,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
6. INTERMEDIATE - ASS[C_*ENOR $3.00 500 1 $3.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
7. MAJOR - OFFEICIAL $34.00 100 3 $34.00.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BIDDER'D PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
$10,200,00 $30,600.00 °
8 MAJOR - ASSIGNOR $3.00 100 1 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 £0.00 $0.00
a. TOURNAMENT - OFFICIAL $34.00 50 4 $34.00 $6,800.00 $20,400.00 $0.00 $0.00
10. TOURNAMENT - ASSIGNOR $3.00 50 1 $3.00 $150.00 $450.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 6 - (ITEMS 1 THRU 10) - GRAND TOTAL: $151,250.00 | $453,750.00 $0.00 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE :
$161,450.00 $4184,350.00 - e
NOTE: The infermation contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: é .@

DATE: Q, - l&"i i

2017-830 SPORTS OFFIGIALS



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM
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Solicitation #: 2017-930
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION
(TASO)
EL PASO, TX
UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
ESTIMATED MEASURE COST 3 YEAR TOTAL COST | 3YEAR TOTAL
NOTTO | anNUEL COST (FORMULA: 4 X | (FORMULA: D X COST (FORMULA: A X |(FORMULA: D X
EXCEED (OFFICIALS " :
'LEM DESCRIPTION cOST (PER (GAMES PER|| oo nors | (PEROFFICIAL) | By c=TOTAL | 3YEARS=3 | (PER OFFICIAL) | Bx c=ToOTAL | 3 YEARS =3
. GAME) YEAR) PER GAME) COST) YEAR TOTAL) cosT) YEAR TOTAL)
A (=) ©) D) ) (D}

1. SINGLE FIELD OR GYM $50.00 2 1 $40.00 $80.00 $240.00 $0.00 $06.00

2. ONE COMPLEX OR FACILITY $150.00 10 1 $40.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $0.60

3. | MUTIPLE COMPLEX OR FACILITY | $300.00 10 1 $40.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $0.00

GROUP 7 (ITEMS 1 THRU 3) - GRAND TOTAL $880.00 $2,640.00 $0.00 $0.00

This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shail be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: Q—,
DATE: ﬂ—-;ﬁ*i Z

]

N

2017-930 SPORTS OFFICIALS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does hot constitute actual award/execution of contract.,



Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS
Bid Opening Date: APRIL 5, 2017

CITY OF EL PASO |
BID TABULATION FORM

e e
Precoewests oo i
| 2016 Award Wikinér o

Solicitation #: 2017-930

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO UMPIRE ASSOCIATION

(TASO)
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT {TS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED
OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF
SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

100% - 10 DAYS

BIDS SOLICITED: 2 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 2 BIDS RECEIVED:

1

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:

1

NO BID: ©

This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall he evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: g .gg

DATE: q - ’l% =1 2017-830 SPORTS OFFICIALS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information onily and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

10




El Paso Umpires Association (TASO)
Attn: Perry A, Huddleston, President
433 Grace Place

El Paso, TX 79915

Texas ASA - District 4
Attn: Jorge Mijares
8446 Whitewater Lane
El Paso, TX79907-4938



