CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Streets and Maintenance — Fleet Division
AGENDA DATE: July 14,2015
CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Ted Marquez, Streets and Maintenance Director, (915) 212-7015

Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, (915) 212-1181
DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED: ALL
STRATEGIC GOAL: No. 6: Set the Standard for Sound Governance and Fiscal Management

SUBJECT:

The Streets and Maintenance Department — Fleet Division would like recommend the award of Solicitation
No. 2015-587 (Heavy Duty Vehicle Body Repair and Painting) to RJ Border International P dba Border
International for an initial three (3) year term estimated amount of $195,000.00. The award is to include a two
(2) year optional amount of $130,000.00 for a total five (5) year award of $325,000.00.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The City currently owns over 500 heavy duty vehicles most of which are operated daily. The approval of
this contract would allow for the body repair of these vehicles in case of accidental damage. Local
business is being supported.

PRIOR COUNCIIL ACTION:

Yes. Council previously approved contract 2012-095 on February 28, 2012, item 9.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on 02/3/2015 and 02/10/2015. The solicitation was posted on City website on
02/03/2015. The email (Purmail) notification was sent out on 02/05/15. Total of twenty-one (21) bidders
were solicited; twenty-one (21) local vendors. Five (5) bids were received; all local vendors.

Elite Wash Detail failed to bid on all items and it is recommended that they be deemed non-responsive.

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department: Facilities and Fleet Management
Annual Amount: $65,000.00
$195,000.00 (3 years)
Funds Available: Dept: 231 Div: 37020 Acct: 531210 Fund: 3600 Program Code: P3711
Dept: 231 Div: 37020 Acct: 531250 Fund: 3600 Program Code: P3701
Funds Source: Inventory Purchases Materials and Supplies

Equipment Outside Repair Services

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
N/A

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Ted Marquez, Director, Streets and Maintenance Department



COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(BEST VALUE BID)

POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW***

Please place the following item on the CONSENT agenda (under BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT) for the
Council Meeting of JULY 14, 2015.

STRATEGIC GOAL: No. 6: Set the Standard for Sound Governance and Fiscal Management

The award of Solicitation No. 2015-587 (Heavy Duty Vehicle Body Repair and Painting) to RJ Border
International LP dba Border International for an initial three (3) year term in the estimated amount of
$195,000.00. The award is to include a two (2) year optional amount of $130,000.00 for a total five (5) year
award of $325,000.00.

Department: Streets & Maintenance — Fleet Division

Award to: RJ Border International, LP dba Border International
El Paso

ltem(s): All

Initial Term: 3 years

Option to Extend: 2 years

Annual Estimated Award: $65,000.00

Initial Term Estimated Award:  $195,000.00 (3 years)

Total Estimated Award: $325,000.00 (5 years)

Account No.: 231-37020-531210-3600-P3711
231-37020-531250-3600-P3701

Funding Source: Inventory Purchases Materials and Supplies
Equipment Outside Repair Services

District(s): All

This is a Best Value, services contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and Streets & Maintenance Department — Fleet Division
recommend award as indicated to RJ Border International, LP dba Border International, the bidder offering
the best value bid. In accordance with this award the City Manager or designee is authorized to exercise
future options if needed.

Elite Wash Detail failed to bid on all items and it is recommended that they be deemed non-responsive.

e rrrr ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW R ek



COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET

SOLICITATION NO. 2015-587
SOLICITATION TITLE: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
FACILITIES & FLEET MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION

Cost

Part A- Shop Billing Rate: Body Tech $40.00 $53.00 $70.00 $87.00

Part A- Shop Billing Rate: Frame Tech $40.00 $55.00 $70.00 $87.00
Part B - Parts $95,399.07 $101,913.18 $75,026.22 $82,107.84

Part C: Painting Service - Hourly Rate $40.00 $26.00 $70.00 $87.00

Part D: Mechanical Repair Service Rates $50.00 $75.00 $62.00 $87.00
Total $95,569.07 $102,122.18 $75,318.22 $82,455.84

(# points/percent max) 60 47.29 44.25 60.00 54.81

Reputation & Quality of the Bidder's Service

(# points/percent max) 25 23.65 3.00 16.00 8.33

Past Performance

(# points/percent max) 5 5.00 1.67 3.34 5.00

Bidder's Operational Information

(# points/percent max) 10
1. Does bidder have a maintenance /service facility locally (within the Municipal

City Limits of El Paso, Texas? (5 points) 0.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
2. How many total hours is the Local Shop Open for repairs per week? (5 points) 5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
GRAND TOTAL 100 POINTS 80.94 58.92 89.34 78.14

(100 points/percent max)




Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

BODY TECH

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

El Paso

Mcﬁ;

"

2454403
Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

ELITE WASH DETAIL
EL PASO, TX

EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &
DIESEL

SHOP BILLING RATE:

SHOP BILLING RATE:

$75.00 PERHOUR

$40.00 PERHOUR

FRAME TECH

$75.00 PERHOUR

$40.00 PERHOUR

ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ o oc Al\llEI\?JIAI\CATT(ETDAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED ANEST”‘ﬁATOED | | 3 YEARESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL |2 o | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | "oy +eNDED TOTAL
. QUNTITY @ty ijﬂ?E PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @Qry Xuiﬁ?E PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
AUTOCAR
1. DOOR STRIKER 6 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.59 $57.54 $172.62
3080560 OR EQUAL
AUTOCAR
2. DOOR SHELL R/H 5 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $4,583.00 $22,915.00 $68,745.00
A5001101-001 OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015,

APPROVED BY: Isl.

to determine an awardee.

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso
M‘ Ghy
1 ' i l ; ¥
ZOVAL

Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

ELITE WASH DETAIL EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &
EL PASO, TX DIESEL
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ o o ANESJ'MATOETDAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED ANEST'MATETD | | 3 YEARESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL |2 o | PRICE PER UNIT AL T EXTENDED TOTAL || PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL 1y rpnpep TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ry XUT\?FC):E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @ty XU,?\IT"I'():E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
PETERBILT
3. BACK PLATE 20- 5 EACH $93.25 $466.25 $1,398.75 $94.51 $472.55 $1,417.65
18151 OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
PETERBILT
4. BUMPER 15- 5 EACH $683.28 $3,416.40 $10,249.20 $1,234.94 $6,174.70 $18,524.10
06399E15100000 OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
INTERNATIONAL
5. SUPPORT 3997006C1 5 EACH $82.26 $411.30 $1,233.90 $75.76 $378.80 $1,136.40
OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
INTERNATIONAL
6. SHIELD 4009785C91 5 EACH $138.88 $694.40 $2,083.20 $110.15 $550.75 $1,652.25
OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
FREIGHTLINER
7. A22-58515-004 MIRROR CASE 5 EACH $443.13 $2,215.65 $6,646.95 $237.17 $1,185.85 $3,557.55
ASSEMBLY R/H OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015,

APPROVED BY: Isl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 2




Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Solicitation #: 2015-587

El Paso

i‘““"’i“*ﬁ“ﬁ?

243343

Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

ELITE WASH DETAIL

EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &

ALL DIRECT AND INDIRECT COSTS FOR PAINT, PAINTING
MATERIALS AND LABOR WILL BE BILLED AT:

THE VENDb WIL‘L BILL THE CITY FOR ONLY LABOR
COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE MECHANICAL REPAIRS
IDENTIFIED ABOVE:

BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE

$75.00 PERHOUR

EL PASO, TX DIESEL
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ im oF ANEI\?J 'MATTOETD | | 3 YEARESTIMATED ESJL\"CATOED | | 3 YEARESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | 2 o | PRICE PER UNIT AL TOTAL | ey TENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | “Co ' eNDED TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ry XuiﬁgE PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @ty Xuquﬂ)CE PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
STERLING
8. PLASTIC DOOR CLIP 60 EACH $11.98 $718.80 $2,156.40 $0.47 $28.20 $84.60
AFJSTP1109 OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
FORD
9. DOOR PANEL RETAINER 110 EACH $11.98 $1,317.80 $3,953.40 $0.33 $36.30 $108.90
NBOZQOO'S OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRlCE
(NONE STATED)
$9,240.60 $27,721.80 $31,799.69 $95,399.07
PART B TOTAL (ITEMS 1-9)
ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL

$50.00 PERHOUR

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl,

DATE: __03/23/2015

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO pett
BID TABULATION FORM bl

2000

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015
=
ELITE WASH DETAIL EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &
EL PASO, TX DIESEL
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
INOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
[BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
NON-STATED
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) lj
{IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED D |:|
10% - 10 DAYS
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 2% 30 bvs
ET - 30 DAY
e

e

an awar

G i S S T i i i i i i i i S
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine dee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: __ 03/23/2015, 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION



Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

BODY TECH

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

El Paso

Af-Smeticatiy

"y

24510
Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC

EL PASO, TX

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
BORDER INTERNATIONAL
EL PASO, TX

SHOP BILLING RATE:

SHOP BILLING RATE:

$53.00 PERHOUR

$70.00 PERHOUR

FRAME TECH

$55.00 PERHOUR

$70.00 PERHOUR

ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ ¢ AhfSTJ\“ﬁ’*TT OETDAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED NEST'MATT EDA 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | o o | PRICE PER UNIT U ceper | EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PERUNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | eyrenpEp ToTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ry XUI?\II?JI') EPER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @ry Xum)CE PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
AUTOCAR
1. DOOR STRIKER 6 EACH $15.96 $95.76 $287.28 $15.99 $95.94 $287.82
3080560 OR EQUAL
AUTOCAR
2. DOOR SHELL R/H 5 EACH $3,795.00 $18,975.00 $56,925.00 $3,501.10 $17,505.50 $52,516.50
A5001101-001 OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015

APPROVED BY: Isl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION



¥l Paso
st

 Bimerion)
1111
U
243143
Solicitation #: 2015-587
FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

i

Department:

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC
EL PASO. TX BORDER INTERNATIONAL
’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ ¢ ESTIMATED | 3 VEAR ESTIMATED ESTIMATED | 5y EAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | 1o o or | PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | ey renpEp TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | “py e nen ToTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ry XuiﬁlT?E PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @ry XU'T\%CE PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
PETERBILT
3. BACK PLATE 20- 5 EACH $101.55 $507.75 $1,523.25 $78.64 $393.20 $1,179.60
18151 OR EQUAL
PETERBILT
4. BUMPER 15- 5 EACH $1,203.48 $6,017.40 $18,052.20 $958.99 $4,794.95 $14,384.85
06399E15100000 OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
5. SUPPORT 3997006C1 5 EACH $78.44 $392.20 $1,176.60 $73.90 $369.50 $1,108.50
OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
6. SHIELD 4009785C91 5 EACH $115.85 $579.25 $1,737.75 $103.99 $519.95 $1,559.85
OR EQUAL
FREIGHTLINER
7. A22-58515-004 MIRROR CASE 5 EACH $231.14 $1,155.70 $3,467.10 $197.00 $985.00 $2,955.00
ASSEMBLY R/H OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015

APPROVED BY: Isl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Bid Opening D

ate: MARCH 4, 2015
g

El Paso

Ath-Emeieatay.
‘[“;f
Pitats]

Solicitation #: 2015-587

Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

IDENTIFIED ABOVE:

ALL DIRECT AND INDIRECT COSTS FOR PAINT, PAINTING
MATERIALS AND LABOR WILL BE BILLED AT:

THE VENDOR WILL BILL THE CITY FOR ONLY LABOR
COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE MECHANICAL REPAIRS

-
RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC
EL PASO. TX BORDER INTERNATIONAL
’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = o ANE[\?J '“ﬁATTngL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED ESTIMATED | 3 \EAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | 2o o | PRICE PER UNIT A s EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | "oy 1ENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ry XUF"\:?.IF) PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @ry XUT\:T'II'():E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
STERLING
8. PLASTIC DOOR CLIP 60 EACH $22.00 $1,320.00 $3,960.00 $1.18 $70.80 $212.40
AFJSTP1109 OR EQUAL 50 UNITS BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$44.00 $132.00
FORD
9. DOOR PANEL RETAINER 110 EACH $44.80 $4,928.00 $14,784.00 $2.49 $273.90 $821.70
N802900-S OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
100 UNITS $89.60 $268.80
$33,971.06 $101,913.18 $25,008.74 $75,026.22
PART B TOTAL (ITEMS 1-9)
ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE

$75.00 PERHOUR

$70.00 PERHOUR

$82.00 PERHOUR

NOT

. This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors s

hall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: __03/23/2015

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 7



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exd
BID TABULATION FORM "y
2010
Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING Solicitation #: 2015-587
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015 Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE
. . V
- RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC
EL PASO. TX BORDER INTERNATIONAL
’ EL PASO, TX
- i G i
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
{BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED l:l D
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS .2% - 10 DAYS

T T T T e 5 R S
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Pr evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: __03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 8



Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

BODY TECH

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

El Paso

At-Smevioaliyg

"y

28440

Solicitation #: 2015-587

Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.
EL PASO, TX

SHOP BILLING RATE:

SHOP BILLING RATE:

$87.00 PERHOUR

$0.00 PERHOUR

FRAME TECH

$87.00 PERHOUR

$0.00 PERHOUR

ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ o o ANESJ/'\’\SATTOETDAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED NE,\?J ”‘SATOED 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL |\ oo | PRICE PER UNIT xrrice pen | EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT ANNUAL TOTAL | oo e NBED TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ry UNIT) PE (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @ry XU'?\IT"II'():E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
AUTOCAR
1. DOOR STRIKER 6 EACH $12.98 $77.88 $233.64 $0.00 $0.00
3080560 OR EQUAL
AUTOCAR
2. DOOR SHELL R/H 5 EACH $3,300.01 $16,500.05 $49,500.15 $0.00 $0.00
A5001101-001 OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: __03/23/2015,

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION



Bid Openig Date: MARCH 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

El Paso

%“i‘i‘ﬁ"&

26¥443

Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.

EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = oc ANESTAM/*TTOET'D | | 3 YEARESTIMATED A EST'MATTED 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL |2 o | PRICE PER UNIT L)J( L é EXTENDED TOTAL || PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | "oy renDED TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ry UF;\llTlT():E PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @Qry Xum)CE PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
PETERBILT
3. BACK PLATE 20- 5 EACH $126.73 $633.65 $1,900.95 $0.00 $0.00
18151 OR EQUAL
PETERBILT
4. BUMPER 15- 5 EACH $1,506.25 $7,531.25 $22,593.75 $0.00 $0.00
06399E15100000 OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
5. SUPPORT 3997006C1 5 EACH $92.45 $462.25 $1,386.75 $0.00 $0.00
OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
6. SHIELD 4009785C91 5 EACH $136.03 $680.15 $2,040.45 $0.00 $0.00
OR EQUAL
FREIGHTLINER
7. A22-58515-004 MIRROR CASE 5 EACH $289.43 $1,447.15 $4,341.45 $0.00 $0.00
ASSEMBLY R/H OR EQUAL
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015,

APPROVED BY: Isl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION

10




Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso

Af-BmeticaGhy

1 l l ' ! v
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

i
TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ ¢ R ESJL\MATETDAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED ESTIMATED | 5yEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL |22 | PRICE PER UNIT | ANN ” L TO EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT | ANNUAL TOTAL | "oy rENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @Qry UT\I'TIT():E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @ry Xuli\jFll_lr()lE PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
STERLING
8. PLASTIC DOOR CLIP 60 EACH $0.34 $20.40 $61.20 $0.00 $0.00
AFJSTP1109 OR EQUAL
FORD
9. DOOR PANEL RETAINER 110 EACH $0.15 $16.50 $49.50 $0.00 $0.00
N802900-S OR EQUAL
PART B TOTAL (ITEMS 1-9) $27,369.28 $82,107.84 $0.00 $0.00
| ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL
— . = s T o g 7
ALL DIRECT AND INDIRECT COSTS FOR PAINT, PAINTING
’ .00 PERHOUR .00 PERHOUR
MATERIALS AND LABOR WILL BE BILLED AT: $87.00 $0.00
. .
. .
BILL THE CITY FOR ONLY LABOR
COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE MECHANICAL REPAIRS $87.00 PERHOUR $0.00 PER HOUR
IDENTIFIED ABOVE:

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: __03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAI

NTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 11



El Pase

CITY OF EL PASO

A3 Aty
BID TABULATION FORM 1114
2030
Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING Solicitation #: 2015-587

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015 Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
|NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
[BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), I:I
{IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION |:I
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED D

PAYMENT TERMS: 3% - 10 DAYS

s N

T

G G i R i T 2

BIDS SOLICITED: 21 LO 21 BIDS RECEIVED: 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: __03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 12



ADVANCE AUTO COLLISION
REPAIR CENTER

7676 ALAMEDA AVE.

EL PASO, TEXAS 79915
772-2690

AMERICAN FLEET PAINT
& BODY SHOP

220 CHELSEA

EL PASO, TEXAS 79905
772-8086

FREEWAY BODY SHOP
3110 GATEWAY EAST
EL PASO, TEXAS 79905
533-7233

LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC.
3800 ADMIRAL

EL PASO, TEXAS 79925
593-0191

LOS ANGELES BODY SHOP
9844 CARNEGIE

EL PASO, TEXAS 79925
595-3200

AUTO BODY EXPERIENCE
6838 GATEWAY EAST

EL PASO, TEXAS 79915
772-7622

HI-TECH BODY & PAINT
4201 DYER

EL PASO, TEXAS 79930
565-7007

RIVERSIDE COLLISION CENTER
1421 LEE TREVINO

EL PASO, TEXAS 79936
590-0505

R & S PAINT & AUTO BODY
11251 ROJAS DR.

EL PASO, TEXAS 79935
593-8181

RV AUTO

1500 WYOMING

EL PASO, TEXAS 79902
532-6566

SOUTHWEST AUTO COLLISION
1000 TONY LAMA
EL PASO, TEXAS 79915 (598-3267)

TEXAS CUSTOM BODY & PAINT
1510 GOODYEAR DR.

EL PASO, TEXAS 79936
590-9966

SUPERIOR BODY & PAINT SHOP
3512 DYER
EL PASO, TEXAS 79930

CALIFORNIA BODY & PAINT
1681 N. ZARAGOZA

EL PASO, TEXAS 79936
921-6522

HUIZAR BODY SHOP
6717 ALAMEDA AV
EL PASO, TX 79915

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC
13675 GATEWAY WEST
P.0. BOX 26489

EL PASO, TEXAS 79926

JUNIORS AUTO COLLISON
4200 DYER ST
EL PASO, TX 79930

PERFORMANCE PAINT & BODY
8253 ALAMEDA AV
EL PASO, TX 79915

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
12253 GATEWAY WEST
EL PASO, TX 79936

BORDER INTERNATIOAL TRUCKS
12283 ROJAS DR
EL PASO, TX 79936

J & J COLLISON CENTER
116 RAYNOLDS ST
EL PASO, TX 79905



