




COUNCIL PROJECT FORM 
(LOW BID OR BEST VALUE BID) 

 
*****************************************POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW******************************************* 

 

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of AUGUST 8, 2017. 
 
STRATEGIC GOAL NO. 6: Set the Standard for Sound Governance and Fiscal Management  
 
Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation No. 2017-1143 Ford Proprietary Parts and Service (Re-Bid) to 
Casa Ford Inc. for an initial term estimated award of $2,055,000.00. The award is to include a two (2) year optional 
amount of $1,370,000.00 for a total five (5) year award of $3,425,000.00. 
 
Department:  Streets and Maintenance 
Award to: Casa Ford Inc. 
 El Paso, TX 
Item(s): All 
Initial Term: 3 years 
Option to Extend: 2 years 
Annual Estimated Award: $685,000.00 
Initial Term Estimated Award: $2,055,000.00 (3 years) 
Total Estimated Award: $3,425,000.00 (5 years) 
Funds Available: 532 - 37020 - 531210 - 3600 - P3711 
 532 - 37020 - 531250 - 3600 - P3702 
Funds Source: Internal Service Fund – Inventory Purchases 
 Internal Service Fund – Equipment Outside Repair Services 
District(s): All 
 

This is a Best Value, parts and service contract. 
 
The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and the Streets and Maintenance Departments recommend awarding as 
indicated to Casa Ford Inc., the bidder offering the best value bid. In accordance with this award the City Manager 
or designee is authorized to exercise future options if needed.  
 
The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and the Streets and Maintenance Departments recommend that MacHaik 
Ford Lincoln be deemed as non-responsive for failing to provide the services required under this solicitation.  
 

*******************************************ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW********************************************** 



Eya!uatfon Criteria 

REPUTATION & QUALITY OF THE BIDDER'S SERVICE 
#1 
#2 

COMMITTEE SCORE SHEET 
Best Valuo 36 month• 

SOI..ICITA ilON TITLE: FORD PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-BID) 

-------r------------r--------~S~TR~E=ETS~=AN~D§QMA~IN[TEN~A~NCCNEDEPA~ENT NO: 2017-1143 

Cua Ford Inc. 

El Paso, TX 

MacHalk Ford 
Uncoln 

Southwest Truck 
SIIHDBAMHC 
KenwcrthyiFord 

El Paao,TX 



1: 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

FORD PROPRIETARY PARTS· UGHT 

List Number 
Dated 

WHOLESALER 

DISTRIBUTOR 

JOBBER 

DEALER 

RETAILER 

APPROVED BY: 

CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

+ ..i:iL_% MARKUP 0 
FROM COST 

FP5-042 
APRIL 2017 

0 
0 
0 
[X] 

0 

+...,L%MARKUP 
FORO 

COMBINATION 

0 
0 
0 
[X] 
0 

DATE: 2017-1143 FORD PROFRIETARY PARTS ANO SERVICE IRE· BID)· STREETS AND MAINTANENCE 

0 + %MARKUP 0 

NO BID 

0 
D 
D 
D 
D 



I 

CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

CASA FORD, INC. 
ELPASO, TX 

MACHAIK FORD LINCOLN 
GEORGETOWN, TX 

$90,03 

$90.03 

Tha lnfonnatlon contained In thla bid tabulation Ia for lnfonnatlon only and doea not constitute actualaward/e~ecutlon of contract 

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 2017·1143 FORD PROFRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE·BID) ·STREETS AND MAINTANENCE 

NOBIC 

NO BID 

NO BID 

' 



CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

CASA FORD, INC. 
ELPASO, TX 

MACHAIK FORD UNCOLN 
GEORGETOWN, TX 

$279.11 

The Jnfonnation contained In this bid tabulation Ia for Jnfannatlon only and does not constitute actual awardfoxecutfon of contracL 

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 2017-1143 FORD PROFRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-BID)- STREm AND MAINTANENCE 

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES 
DBA HC KENWORTHIFORD 

TX 

NO BID 

' 



CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

CASA FORD, INC. 
ELPASO, 1X 

MACHAIK FORD LINCOLN 
GEORGETOWN, 1X 

$112.47 

$95.60 

$231.38 

$198,67 

$196.67 

$1,286.94 

The lnfonnatlon contained In this bid tabulation ~ for lnfonnatJon only and doe a not conatltut9 actual award/executfon of contract. 

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 2017-1143 FORD PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-B!D}- STREETS AND MAJNTANENCE 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

• 



UstNumber 
Datod 

WHOLESALER 
DISTRIBUTOR 
JOBBER 
DEALER 
RETAILER 
OTHER 

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 

CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

FROM COST 

i;oRb• 

EPS-3§42 

APRIL 2017 

E3 
D 
00 
D 

MACHAJK FORD UNCOLN 
GEORGETOWN, TX 

PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR 

FORDO• 

F~~642 ftLUE !li!IMQN!! 

APRIL2017 

B 
D 
0 
D 

2017-1143 FORD PROFRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-BID)· STREETS AND MAINTANENCE 

FORP' 

l'l.Q..m!;! 

El 
D 
D 
D 



The lnfonnatlon contained In this bid tabulaUon Is for lnfonnatfon only and doe& not conetltute actual awardlexecutlon of contract. 

CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

BID ITEM: FORD PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-BID) 
BID DATE: JUNE 21 2017 

BID #2017-1143 
DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE 

PART B: SERVICE LABOR RAiES- FORD MEDIUM AND HEAVY 
DUTY TRUCKS 

REGULAR HOURS: 

AFTER HOURS/EMERGENCY 

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING- FORD MEDIUM AND HEAVY DUTY 
TRUCKS 

DESCRIPTION I MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 

TEN PRICE UST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNTIMARK·UP); 

1. CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK~P or NET): [A] 

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B): [B] 

TOTAL COST (City's Coat+ Labor Coat}: (A+B] 

DESCRIPTION I MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 

TEN PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): 

2. PITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or JMARK·UP or NET): [A] 

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B): [B] 

TOTAL COST (City's Coat+ Labor Cost}: [A+B] 

CASA FORD, INC. 
ELPASO, TX 

$9D.B3 PER HOUR 

NO BID PER HOUR 

3W7Z-826D-M 

$58.78 

$64.85 

$90.83 

$166.48 

9wn-3A674-B 

$110.87 
CORE $70.00 

$121.95 
l+l CORE $70.00 

$90.83 

$212.78 

WfCORE $282.78 

MACHAJK FORD UNCOLN 
GEORGETOWN, TX 

NO BID PERHOU 

NO BID PERHOU 

3W7Z-82SD-M 

$56.78 

$49.96 

NO BID 

$49.98 

9W7Z-3A674-8 

$110.87 

$94.24 

NO BID 

$94.24 

NuTE: 1 nlsla a tsest va ue t"rocurement. r ce anu otner r.ctorB a au ue ev•luated to determ na an .awaroee. 

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 2017-110 FORD PROFRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-BID)- STREETS AND MAJNTANENCE 

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES 
DBA HC KENWORTH/FORD 

ELPASO, TX 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

PER HOUF 

PER HOUF 



The Information contained In thl• bid tabulation Is fer lnfcrmaUon only and do'ea not canatftute actual award/execution of contract. 

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 

PARTS AND 

CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

CASA FORD, INC. 
ELPASO, TX 

MACHAIK FORD LINCOLN 
GEORGETOWN, TX 

2017·1t.U FDRD PROFRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE·BID) ·STREETS AND MAINTANENCE 

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES 
DBA HC KENWORTHIFORD 

EL TX 

NO BID 

NO BID 

' 



Tho lnfonnatlon contained In this bid tabulation II for lnfOnnatfon only end does not constitute actual award/execution of contmcL 

~~h. 
CITY OF EL PASO 4 J! BID TABULATION 

BID ITEM: FORD PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-BID) BID# 2017·1143 
BID DATE: JUNE 21 2017 DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE 

. ·--- .. - '"- '"- - ~-·· 

I CASA FORD, INC. MACHAIK FORD UNCOLN SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES 

ELPASO, TX GEORGETOWN, TX DBA HC KENWORTH/FORD 
L--~ ..• ------- .. ELPASO, TX 

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING -FORD LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES 
·· :fRONT-BRAKE ROTOR" . . FRON"rBRAKEROTOR"'' F,RONI~~JlQ!CIIV-DESCRIPTION I MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: I. PAmt!'SU2z.1V1%W. __ .PART'#: &iiiz:1V1zt:u •. " \.--- .PART,#:SU2Z-1V12S-Uf 

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: DR3Z-1125-C DR3Z1125C NO BID 

TEN PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $40.58 $40.58 NO BID 

•• CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or IMARK·UP or NET): (A] $44.63 $34.49 NO BID 

LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B): [BJ I $90.83 NO BID NO BID 

TOTAL COST (Cfty's Coat+ Labor Cost): (A+B] ' $136A8 $34.49 NO BID 

''""•PEOAJ:ASSY' -. ""-PEDAL' ABBY.- ... "'PEDAL*ASSY," . 
DESCRIPTION I MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: I 'PAiiii'ff.:1C3z-9'FS36.i:L._ .Pmi£3~Fil3s.BA' PARf,i::fc3Z-IifsS6.iA. , __ 

'" 

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 1 C3Z-BF836-C EC3ZBFB36A NO BID 

ITE PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $124.95 $138.93 NO BID 
M 
7. CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or IMARK·UP or NET): [A] $137.45 $144.49 NO BID 

LABOR COST (assume ono (1) hour labor from PART B): [BJ $90.83 NO BID NO BID 

TOTAL COST (Cfty'a Cost+ Labor Coat): IA•BI $228.28 $144.49 NO BID 

TOTAL- GROUP II (ITEMS 1·7) $2,273.36 $1,604.64 NO BID 

GRAND TOTAL (GROUP I+ GROUP II) $4,666A7 $2,791.68 NO BID 
BIDDER'S PRICE $4,674.47 

CONTRACT TOTAL (GRAND TOTAL X 3) $13,898.41 
BIDDER'S PRICE.i13 723.41 

$8,374.74 NO BID 

NOTE: Thlals a Beat Value Procurement Prfce and other fl!lctora shall be evaluated to detarmlna an sward eo. 
The JnformaUon contained In this bid tabulation Ia for lnfonnatlon only and doea not conatltuto actual award/execution of contmcL 

APPROVED BY: 
DATE: 2017·1143 FORD PROFRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE-BID)- STREETS AND MAINTANENCE • 



AT lrTSSOL.E DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION 
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GMNG THE 

ICCINTRAI"CIR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD 
"~ '""L"~ 11•u OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS 

ICC>NTI<ACIT BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS 
UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDmONS. THE 

lcnrv .IANAG!oR OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION 

THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE 

YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 
IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

TERM OF CONTRACT. 

APPROVED BY: 

CITY OF EL PASO 
BID TABULATION 

CASA FORD, INC. 
ELPASO,lX 

MACHAIK FORD UNCOLN 
GEORGETOWN, 1X 

DATE: 2017-11<13 FORD PROFRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE (RE·BID)· STREETS AND MAINTANENCE 

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES 
DBA HC KENWORTH/FORD 

ELPASO,lX 

D 



1: 
- ·--· -~·-·-- ~-·-··~ .. --·~ 

... " .. ~,,,. ""'''" -·--~~ ~ 

! 
2iJ1;Z'"1·:1.43· Ebrcil1 PtoRrietii~cRalits,and .Sei:Vice"(Re,Bid)~ 

; · · · ·· · ·- Bidei~rs ~Li~t. · ·· ··- ····· ·· · · ··· 
,, ' 

- -~, ' ' ' ' -~·- --·- ''' "' "' 
., ··-·-·· ' '' 0-AAU ····-· 

CASAFORD SHAMALEY FORD VIVA FORD 
5815 MDNTANAAVE. 11301 GATEWAY WEST 5550 N. DESERT BLVD 
EL PASO, TX 79925 EL PASO, TX 79936 EL PASO, TX 79912 



“Delivering Outstanding Services” 1

Streets and Maintenance Department

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service 2017-1143

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service
2017-1143

August 8, 2017



“Delivering Outstanding Services” 2

Streets and Maintenance Department

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service 2017-1143

Strategic Plan Goal:

6) Set the Standard for Sound Governance and Fiscal Management



“Delivering Outstanding Services” 3

Streets and Maintenance Department

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service 2017-1143

Purpose of Contract

• To purchase Ford brand name parts and services that are used to
maintain the City’s Fleet.

• These parts and services are vital for the maintenance of the City’s
fleet that are of the Ford brand.



“Delivering Outstanding Services” 4

Streets and Maintenance Department

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service 2017-1143



“Delivering Outstanding Services” 55

Streets and Maintenance Department

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service 2017-1143

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service 2017-1143

Contractor Casa Ford, Inc.

Item(s) Ford Parts and Service

Initial Term 3 years 

Option 2 years

Estimated Award $2,055,000   Initial Award
$3,425,000   Total Award with Option

Funding Source Streets and Maintenance – Internal Service Fund – Inventory Purchases 
and Equipment and outside repairs

Account No. SAM - 532-37020-531210-3600-P3711
SAM – 532-37020-531250-3600-P3702



“Delivering Outstanding Services” 6

Streets and Maintenance Department

Ford Proprietary Parts and Service 2017-1143

Questions & Comments


