


























































































.ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE RATIFYINC THE 20I5 ITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE.
CODE AND AMENDINC TITLE 9 ( HEALTH AND SAFETY). CHAPTER 9.52 (FIRE
PREVENTION CODE), OF THE EL PASO CITY CODE, TO PROYIDE FOR LOCAL
AMENDMENTS TO TH E 20 I5 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. THE PENALTY BEINC AS
PROVIDED IN SECTION 9,52,030,I2 (VIOLATIONS PENALTIES) OF THE EL PASO CITY
CODE.

WHEREAS. the Cir," Council has deerncd the local arnendments a

lor thc City of El Paso

NOW.'I'HEREFORE. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OE IlIE
CITY OF EL PASO:

^@
Feetions,

Footcotes:

--+8i-

Nete erdimnee No, 17
in6€€e

+all be January l; 20
gra*erthatdate.
9.52.010 - Short title. 

^

fhis chapter may be cited as the "Firc Codc"

W
P.52.020 - Adopted..

A. The book entitled "lntemational Fire Codc," 2015 Edirion, a copy of which authenticated
by the city clerk is on file in the city clerk's otlice, is hcrebv adopted as the Fire Code ofthe
€*yeiry, as tully as ifcopied at lenglh in this chapter, but with the amendments set forth in
this chapter.

B. That qAny references made in this chapter to "lFC" shall mean the 2015 Intemational Fire
Code.

Formatt€d: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: centered, Space After 0 pt

Formatted: Font (DeIault) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Form.tted: JuniUed, Space After: 0 pt, tine spacing:

single

Formatred: Font (Default) Times New Roman. 12 pt

Formatted: Spa.e After 0 pt Line spa.ing: single

Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Rornan, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Font:(Defa!lt)Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formaited: Fonr: (oefault) Times New Roman. 12 pt,

Not Bold

Formatted: Font (Delault)Trmes New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt.

Not Bo d

Formatted: Font (Defa!h) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatl€d: ront. (Default, T,mes New Roman l2 pt
Not Bold

Formatted: Foni (Defaulr) Irmes New noman 12 pt

Eo.matted: Fonr (D"fdu I lnes New Romar. 12 pt

Formatt€d: Font (Default) rimes Ne!{ Roman 12 pt

Form.tted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt
Not Bold

Formatted: Iont (Defauh) Tires New Romao. r2 pi

Formatted: Fontr (oefauh) T mes New Roman 12 pt

Formaiied: Font (Deiault)Trmes New Roman 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Eormatted: Font: (D€fault) Times New Roman

Formatted: Ionr (Default) rnes New Roman l2 pt

Formatted: Space Afte. 0 pt

Formatted: Space After 0 pl, Llne spaonq: sinqle

Formatted: Space Alter 0 pt

formatted: Font: (Default) Times N€wRoman

Fo.matied: Font (Default) Tlmes New Roman, 12 pt

Formarted: Font (Default)Time! New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Delault) Iimes New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

18 1006-10891896128 2lRedline of Ordinance Ado ins tFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAs

I',tl

WHEREASTon Ma! I I . 20l6.Sitv. CounciI adoptcd Ordinance0l85l8 which adoptcd
thc 2015 edition ofthe International Fire Code: and



C. That wwhcnever reference is made in thc 2015 Intemational Fire Code. or any other
referenced standard or code, to "the authority having jurisdiction" for enforcement of the
provisions thereof, the term "eo&--o$i+ialAHJ" shall be substituted therefore, unless
olhenrise provided for in this chapter

D. ftq1The provisions in the 2015 Intemational Fire Code are intended to be cumulative of
other provisions and chapters of the El Paso City Code pertaining to fire prevention, unless

otherwise expressly stated herein. To the extent that any provisions ofthe 2015 lntemational
Fire Code are in conflict with Title l8 of the City Buildine & Colrstruction Code, the !]!s1
restrictive Code previ+ieeri<*J+tle l shall applyqovem.

p.52.030 - Chapter l, Scope and Administration, amended.^

Jntemational Fire Code, lge+zQLlEdition. Chapter l. Scope and Administration, is hereby
arj€pt€+IlliIglin its entirety with the following amendments:

p.52.030.1 Sectlon 102.1Fonstruction and d€sign provisio s, ametrded.
Intemational Fire Code, :e0+20XlEdition, Section 102.1 Construction and design
provisions, is hereby amended to add paragraph 5 to read as follows:

rc#€osstfir€liofi on ign?+o+kions-Section 3l 1.7 Vacanl Buildrnes Ordinanc!

51LI-7. Vacant Eb'rildings Ordinance. Vacantjlglis!! shall also complv with the
orovisions beas{e{iaed$yqf Chapter 18.40 (Vacant Buildings) of the El lMity Code.

9.52.030.2 Sectlotr 103.1 Generrl, smcnded. Intcmational Fire code, 2e09.2-9-!I
Edition, Section 103.1 General, is hoeby amended to read as follows:

103.1 General. The Fire Prevention Division is established within the fire departmmt.
The function ofthe division shallbe implcmentation, administration and enforcemmt ofthe
provisions ofthis CedeEllDlq, or any other standard referenced within the El Paso CiN

r e,+,siq.l qe!!!e
Fditi€n; Se€ti€n l0

104.6 eflieiol .€€orC!, The fire eode oftieial shall keep o{lleial re€ordr as.oquired by
seetions 101,6,1 t
five yeani or t'or a5 l€,rtt a.i the stsu€tHre or aetiyiE to whieh sueh re€ords relate remains iF

Formatted: Fonr: (Default) Iimes New Roman, 12 pt

Eormatted: Fontr (Defauh) Trmes New Roman, 12 pt,

Eold

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

commented lu2l:IhE69.s2.030.1sectior 103.1.

Formatted: Font {Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatl€d: Font (Derault) Times New Roman, l2 pt

9.52.0-10.2 - Scction l0l.l.l Rcsl

l0-1.1. I Residcntial carc homcs.
Tle AHJ may conduct firc inspcctions oircs idcntial carc homcs includins adult and child. Fo.matred: ndent Left 0 5". Space After: 0 pt

dny care homes, rcsidential adult carc- and child tbstcr firnilv honrcs
Formatted: lo.t ,Defaur'. lrme, \en Roman 12 pt

tormatted: Forr rDefdulfl T,re. New Roqdr l/ pr

Font.olor Purple, Strikethrough

Formatted: Font (Defaulr) Trmes New Roman Bold

Formatt€d: Font:(Defaulr)Times Neur Roman 12 pt

comm€nt.d [ull: Moved to 9.52.050.2, se.tion 311.7
Vacant Euildina, Odananc€

Formatr€d: Font (Defa!lt) TLmes New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: tontr (Default) Times N€w Roman, 12 pt

| 18 1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinptFc2olsw/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAs



9,51,030,4 Se€tion l0'1,9J Performoaee bosed desEnr eCded, Intemotienal Fire

+olle,*,+

101,9,3 Pcrformanee bosed dcs'gnJerfernr@

tir€ seenarios,  s \yith perforrmn€e rquirementsrfire seenarios elay be speeified by a

€r**qr€eF-if-+$uildieg-€rfirci+rt,.

ire

t+re++es-fu+o{+sr

104.9,1 Performonec bosed desi-n submi+tals--he t'ollswing requir€d doeHments shall

spceiti€ations aod draw

cg.S]0.+5{ tue
2$1)+Editi(,l- Se!+xlB l1),1,1{) Ii}re B}\.t5ti!I1li(xFi $ l}erel},+ a+}Nr}dr{+lo rcad as k}lk)\," rl

l{}91}+i+€ ie+el'ti8&$k}6& +ha ++e€$d3{+l6e+al'ri}al+ +xr+e +lr€i+Hl+on{} *r r+}+{-+rt,+te

the onsin and €asrie, iirt(l clrr'urtiitar).e\ ()1 ary fire, €i+t.tio+*rkrtHritjlar{lo$ x+drtioti.

l+*o+Rl+tio+ tllal +{)|+l(l he relak+t(} tr ilde.s! rct }tr lrr(,t-$!ts sllall+}ol lx rxade paft of the

Fublr€+e€€'{].++€cl){+}l'rliI€ijtcc$v++ c+x+r+{rl lr+r,,.

tse€+\€ep+ieor *g+\reth+*i+l-
th!€trtc.o|t{r.{ Ji+c
*+re;t1!l?rtio++{uer rr.(luiredxt Appefidir A-+irc ir}v!-+igittto+ieF!€ci +eqrl$ted 1}} }he Clly
ef€++{ror{fr€{.\+rirtr+FEfPi*t+.+hel*Pi^*r}k r1rg=\.t+thHnt+f+c-Sta i
ti+i{eds{tt{$+io+€+{}i+@ir}. lili
(xl+ed, oFtratc{l artd nr.rirrraifled l+yruch :l(}refl}Br'Etitl a!si,.r$-++++$! l})i{\x]]+t\l +rin}r

FaJ+$$#f re ifl +€51i€a+i$r++c.r!,

p.52.030.+lsection 1(N.12 Plar review srd approval, rdded. Intemational Fire
Cod;, 20150r) Edition, Section 104.12 Plan rerie* and approual iJ hereby added io read as

follows:.

t04.12 Plan reviclr and approval, The +ke eo,rleoli+;jal{tll shall examine or causc to be
cxamincd submitted plans and acconpanying documents for cvidcnce ofcompliance with
the provisions of this W'1yp191. Plans shall be approved prior to thc start of construction.
or installation ofany lirc protection system. The subnrittal ofplans fbr rcview docs not
constitute an authorization to proceed until the required pennit is obtaincd-

9.52,030.&!lsectioD +OU!!J:qPermits required, aoended. International Fire
Code, 2009 Edition, Section l05.l.l Permits required. is her6y amended to read as follows:.

l{+.l.ll_l,O,l Permits requircd. Pcmlits and licenses required by this IiIqCodc shall be
obtained fiom the e{{k]{ul!Lu. Permit and license fees, as requircd ffii++$+'

Formatted: Ionr. IDefauli/ Iimes Nes Roman. '2 pt

Formatted: Fontr (Defauh) Times New Roman, l2 pt

Commant€d lu3ll Moved to 9.52.030.3 section 104,12

Plan,eview a.d approlal, added.

Formalted: Eolr LDelduh Ti-.. N.w Po-d1 '2 pl

Formatted: Font (Default) Iime! New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman l2 pt

Forma(€d: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Commenred lu.tl: Moved to 9.52.030.ls Section 113.6

Permitr requir.d,.dded

formatted: Font (Default) Tlmes New Roman. 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Default) Trmes New Roman, l2 pt

Forma €d: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

| 1.8- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedlineofordinanceadoptinplFc2015w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52llAs



h the schedule as e\tablished h the licuble

authontv, shall be paid to the qeity prior to issuance of the pcnnit or license. This fee is

oharged to pay part ofthc expense ofenforcing this section. Any person commencing work
or pcrfonning any action rcquiring a pennit under this fllqCode without first obtaining the
necessary permit shall be subject to a fec ofl?00% ofthe schedulcd permit tle in addition
to the scheduled pennit fcc and othcr pcnalties set fbrth in Section 1093 of thislil! Code.
lssued permits shall be kept on the prcmises dcsignated therejn at all tirnes and shall be

readily available for inspection by the eode osieial4EJ.

9.52.030.9{Section 105,!.!,,! P.!y!D9n-! fequrgq, qdqcd. It{g4ational Firc Code.
2009 Edition, Section l05,l.l.l Payment required, is hereby added to read as follows:.

l05.l.l.l Payment required. A permit, although issued, shall not be valid until tics have

been paid.

Exception: The City of El Paso, the County of El Paso, the El Paso Housing Authority. the
State ofTexas and the Untied States Governrnent are exempted from payment ofthe permit
fees required in this chapter; provided, that only such facilities as owned, operated and

maintained by such govemmental agencies shall be exempted from payment of such permit
fees.

Pi5! g3ottq:Seett9!

pa+agrapl ;Operatio*rlpeeni*-r'.1*reby+*eatled+r*erd :

]. OpeFa$olra] P€flIxts-Ln 1)l}eratirlml peHtli++llor'r rheappircna+lo+{)rrd+re+an+ r.ratxr

exeeea o*eyea++ntes,;r:+

p.52-030.r+lqsection +0#!!ItrTime limit of applicstion, rmcdded.
lntemational Fire Code, 2e0+20!LEdition, Section 1-0-12-3!l,1Time limit ofapplication,
is hereby amended to read as foilows:

Section $*!!laTime limitation of application. An applicatioo for an operational
permit for any proposed work or operation shall be deemed to have been abandoned ifall
applicable tbes are not paid in tull within 30 days after the date ofsigning ofthe permit
application..

9g3l)-Hiee{iort+(}*+.?ir@e
klilirri S.e!1io$ 11]++ lxd+atkxr. i:heretry arienile<l to+ea(l a!*)lk)\tr.

I05.++ Fl\niretion- A{++rperi++ai'. r'l-r*r++:'ltaII r€+rrarrt rr+el}ecI tiir ]'llt+a perit*l tr{ 1+$r3

a5 5?e€i{i€dj+{he pcrlrrt, u le!\ re\oked, Pcrmil! are nol trilnsl.3{.abte.**t{B} llrarr:|i u+

o,e€qrtF€]l rtile{lliol1, lerrlrre} or c\rnerihip lihilll require lhal ++e*1es+i+}t i+ucrl

q+il#3se€ti 0+J4*flleti@H!

fello*s..

105,1 €enstru€tion do€uments, e€nstrueti€n do€sments shall b€ in a€e€{denee t'ith
@

Formatred: Fonl: (Defaull) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Commented [u5]: Moved to 9 s2 0304 se.tron 105 r 1 1

Paynent reqUred, added

to.matted: Font (Default) T mes New Roman, l2 pt

Formatted: Font (Default)Time! New Roman, 12 pt

commented lu6l: see 9 52 030 5 seciro.105 5

105.6 Requircd operarioMl pennns

The AliJ is adhonzed ro issue opentioml pemns and,or
licelEcs fo.lhc opcorio$ srr lonli in *ctions 105.6.1
through 105 6.52.

formatted: Fontr(Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Font color: Purple, Strikethrough

Form.n€d: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Font color Purple, Strikethrough

Formatted: lont (oefault) limes New Roman 12 pt

Formatted: Font (De{dulU TrmF! New Roman 12 pl

torm.tted: Font LDelauli, Trme. New Rond^. r,) pl

Formatt€d: rort (DefaJh)Time5 Ne6 Romdn. l2 pt

Formated: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman. l2 pt

Formatted: Font (Delault)T.mes New Roman l1 pr

Commantcd IuTl; Movedto9.52.030.16section 113.7

Tlme thI ofapplicatron, added

Formatted: ront (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Default) Iimes New Roman, 12 pt

t

| 18- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdootinFrFC2015w/tocalAmendments(Title9.52)las



9.52.030.+4lScction 105.6 Requircd operational pcrmits, amended. Intcmational
Fire Code. 2{x}q 1) l5-Edition. Scction I 05.6 Required opcrational pcnrrits, is hcrcby
arnended to read as tbllolvsr.

105.6 Requircd opcrational permits. Tho t1\1e lnliLrllr!L!.! i:' authori;.ud k) i\suc
r)pcrationrl pcrnrits and (n Iiccn\cs lirr thr'opcratiorls sct lorlh rn scclions l{)5.6.1 throu!!h
t05.6.52.

I 05,6,1 Aerosol produet

€?+r(t}se+-+e*hk

105,6,2 ,itmusem€nt building* /\+l operational pennit is required to sperate 6 spe€ial

ai!5€ri€nr$$ifdir,r&

105,6,3 Afiotion foeilities. 1ln operational permit is requireC to use a Group H or Greup S

Brateri+i+an+e.liixnab]e{)F€ombt}"tiffieb.

105.6,1 eornivols and foirs, Ao opc{ational p€rrni{ is requir€d to €onduet a eanri\al or
lli*

- 105,6,5 €cllulose nitrste film, In operatio.al Fenn:tis requircd to storei handle or use

@
1e5.6.6 Combustible dust predu€ing operctione ,\n o.era+ioEa@+€

operale a grain el€r'atori llour stareh millr leed {Fill or a plant pulve.izint aluminHrni eoalr

105,6,7 €ombustibl€ fibers. /\n eperatrenal Fermit is reqHired tbr tlre storagea{d

@
lg5,6J eompress€d t&s€s. An operational pemlit is required for the atorag€i use or

arneccffiHo#
Exe€pti6nr V€+rielc"j equipped l'or and Esint eompressed $s as a t'uel fer prepellin6 the
+ehiele

Formatted: Font rDeldult' Trmes Ne6 Roma4 2 pi

Formatted: Font: (Defauh) limes New Roman, l2 pt

commenr€d [u8l: Moved to9.s2.030.5 section 105.6
iequir.doperationalpermit',amended.

tormatt€d: Font (Default) Tim€s New Roman. 12 pt

Forma(ed: Fontr (Delaut) T mes New Roman, 12 pt

A.$€.H$q$uMt+P) tormattcd: Fonl:(Default)Times New Roman, l2 pt
^T)?e 

of€as

18'1006 10891896128 2lRedline of Ordinance Adoptins IFC 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Tatle 9.52)lAS



eofi{rsiY€

Htgh++o+i€

2{X)

k€r+{+d.+iir1p@y+rant 6.000

50.+exidi"ieg{ie€lsdiqe oJqge+)

L )-.

T*bte-+e#o
PeFu+i+A.me$Et+fuF€qoge$ie slEids

Tox+

105,6,9 eovered mf,ll buildings. nn €perational p€rmit is r€quirC fer:

l, The plaeerBnt efretailfixtureo and displays, eon€ession equipmenti displals ofhighl,
@
2, Tho display of liqBiC er gas firC equipment in the mall,

3, The use sf open flame or flame produeing equipment in the mall,

/05,6 /P €'rrsteri€ll{rtr, An ep
en sitq user hanCl
+o#

Formaned: Font: (Defau t) Trmes New Roman l2

Formatted: Font (Defa!lt) Times New Roman, 12 pt
Ifl5id€€{ildi+}g

eal€ns)

eu$ide
E$i+di+g(gail€+s)

FtrF+$able 6C

+n€* 51lC

Oxidiziflt-tin€lud€r'oxlg€o) r$ 50

6{)

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdoorinstFc2015w/Localamendments{Title9.52}lAs



P}}ii€a}€f#tHr+baa++oFi9dieated
ab( Ye

]lJ+s'i'€!'l)tt:J.7&*
105,6,1I €uttifg .nd ryelding, An op€rational permit is requited to eondu€t €ultint or

@
105,6,12 Dr] eleonin- plon+s, /\n operationel permit is requi.ed tg engage in the business

el€aRiot.eqr}iplrleEf

105,6,13 Erhibit. ond tFode shows, An operatienal pefinit is rEuired to ope.ate exhibits
all+lfadesholvs.

105.614 Erplosives,  n operatienal penni{ is tquited for the manufaeturei storagq

€ede

'rceptionr Storaff in

@
105,6,15 Fire hldrrnts and yclt€s, nn €perational pe.mit is requirC to use or operale

lire hydrants er !a

eublie

tHpplies *re st ste

105,6,16 Flemmobl. and eombustible liquids, nn op€ratiooal pcrmit is required:

l, To use or operate a pipeline for the transportation rvithin I'aeilities offlammable er
eombustible liquids, This requirement shall not apply to the oftr site ttansportation if,

ipr{19

systems;

2, To stercr hanCle er uso €lass I liquiCs in ex€ess sf5 gallons ( 19 t) in a builCint or in

the+€U€,,,*iig:

",1, The sterage or B

€plr+ien of the €ode 6

Formatt€d: Font (Default) Times New Roman 12 pt

18'1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdoptinqlFC2015dLocalAmendments{Title9.52)lAS



$r6h+iq+ids-ari..
tnorc+]rit+Jge+5'

3, To stor€; hanCle or use €lass ll or €lass llln liquids in e,rcels of 25 gallons (95 t) irr a

eon+eetion*it+ei+bu l+req*ipneo+

4, To store; handle €r use €lass lllB liqurds inta6l(s oDortable ta+ks {br fueling motor
iflrf,€nt.

Dx€eption, Fuel oi ir+e

5, Teremoveebsslorll liquids from an under$ound storage lank used f'er freling metor
vehieles by aay means other than the approved; stetionary on site pHmps normally used li]f
di"pensi+Fpurpsses.

6, To eperate tanl( vehi€lesi eqBipm€nti tanksr plants, terminalsi wellsi t'uel CispensHrg

s{ari
liquids are produ,eed, proeessed, tmnsponed' stored, dispensed or used,

7, To install alteri remeYe; abandonr pl"ee+emqoroi}fos+€l+efYi€o{{€Hiore{hel+90

+lammag+e orcomgu

8, To €hange the type of eo tents itored in a flammable or €ombustible liquid tank to a

9, Tornanst'aeturq@

le, To engage in the dispensing ol liquid foels into the fuel tanks 6f meter vehieles al

ll, To utilize a site t-or the dispensiog,ofliquid f'uel+fiom laFk lehi€les into the f'uel lanks
of motor Yehiele* m

@
105,6,17 Floor finiehing, nn operational permit is reqBired f'or t'loer 6nishing €,r ssrfaeiflg

105,6,18 Fruit .nd erop.ipe$ing, ,\n operati€flal pennit is requirC to ()perate a liuil 6r
ercp-ri?rr+ing t'a€ility or €oidu€t a tiuil ripefling pro€ess using ethylene gos,

105,6,19 Fumig&tion ond thermol inseetieid6l fogg'ng, 
^n 

operational permit rs

| 18 1006 10891896128 2lRedline ofordinance adoptinE lFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Tit,e 9.52)lAs



1Q5,6,30 llurordous met€riEls, ,\n operirti(nlal pe. rit is requir€d to lkrre, tra sporl (nr

sile. d;tfler*e. $lcoFhfir+leln+firRkrt]-.rnat!,r ]. : iJr erttt!\ r+-1ke arit}un+ lr'te*++Tal+k
I)5+'r+

105,6.20.1 Exempt materials. The following materials are specifically exempted Iiom
any ofthe permitting requirements in 105.6.?021: 

^

a. lnert gases, which do not support combustion, to include argon, helium, krypton, neon,
xenon, compressed air, carbon dioxide, and nitrogen. These gasses are subject to regulation
under Section 105.6.++Llwhen stored as cryogenic fluids.

b. Any hazardous material that is handled, used, stored, or disposed ofand is kept for
noncommercial purposes at a private residence in Permissible Quantities.

c. Any mate al contained in a transportation vehicle when said vehicle is not being used
for permanmt haz ardous materials storage.

d. Any material, which is held solely as a pharmaceutical product.

e. Any hazardous waste material in a hazardous waste management facility that is
permitted by the State pursuant to 42 U.S.C. Section 6925; povided. however, such
materials shall be listed in the permit application ifone is otherwise required.

i Radioactive material(s) regulated at the Federal or State level: provided, however, that
such material(s) be listed in the permit application ifone is otherwise required.

g. Any material to the extent it is used in Permissible Quantities in routine agricultural
operations by the end user.

h. Commercial products kept in Permissible Quantities and used at a facility solely for
janitorial purposes.

i. Any material in interstate transmission facilities or interstate pipeline facilities regulated
by 49 U.S.C. Sec.6010l et. seq. (1997) and any amendments thereto, and any materials in
pipeline facilities regulated by Chapto I l7 ofthe Natural Resources Code, Vemon's Ann.
Civ. Stat., and any amendments thereto, or subject to Texas Railroad Commission Pipeline
Safety Laws and Regllations, and any amendments thereto.

TABLE 105.6.20
PERMIT AI\IOT]NTS FOR HAT,ARDOUS i\IATERIAI,S

TYPE OF MATERIAL AMOUNT

Cornbustible liquids See Section 105.6.16

Corrosive materials

formatted: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Commented tul0l: rable,.moved

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

Form.tted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

18 1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinFrFc20l5w/LocalAmendments(Tatle9-52)lAs

Commented lugl:Moved to 10s.5 211 Ex€mpt matenals

tormatled: Font (Defauh) Times New Roman, 12 pt



Cases^ pee Section 105.6.8 | _-
r --...- Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 
.12 pt

Liquids 55 gallons

1000 pounds

See Section I 05.6. l4

Solids

Explosive materials

Flamrnable materials

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Fonti (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Gases 
^

.See Section 105.6.8

Liquids See Section I 05.6. I 6

Solids

Oxidizing materials

Gases 
^

Liquids.

Class 4.

Class 3

Class 2

Class I

Solids

Class 4

100 pounds

.See Section 105.6.8

Anv Amount

I gallon

I 0 gallons

55 gallons

Any Amount

I

_l

I

I

I

_.- _ *-,__--_l

Class 3 I 0 pounds

Class 2 I 00 pounds

Class I 500 pounds

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdootinelFC2015w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



Organic peroxides I

I

_l

I

I
I

Liquids.

Class I 
^

Class II 
^

,Any Amount

Class lll Any Amount

I

Class IV I gallon

2 gallons

No Permit Required

Anv Arnount

Any Amount

I 0 pounds

20 pounds

No Pcrmit Required

Class V

Solids

Class I

Class ll
Il

I Class lll

Class lV

Class V

Pyrophoric materials

r
Cases. 1A,ny Amount

Liquids Anv Amount

Solids Any Amount

Toxic materials See Section 105.6.8

Gases l0 gallons

Liquids I 00 pounds

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Defaul0 Times New Roman, 12 pt

-i

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

t8-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinelFC2015w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



Solids

Unstable (reactive) materials 
^

Liquids.

Class 4^

Class 3.

Class 2

Class I

Solids

Class 4

,A.ny Amount

Any Amount

5 gallons

l0 gallons

Any Amount

Anv Amount

50 pounds

I 00 pounds

Class 3

Class 2

Class I

Water-reactive Materials

Liquids^

Class 3 
^ i J

Class 2 
^

,Any Amount

Class I 5 gallons

Solids 55 gallons

Class 3 Any Amount

Class 2 50 pounds

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 1 2 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Defaul0 Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdootinqlFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



Class I 500 pounds

igns-in

ion+i€Rs-m

105,6.31 HPM Faeilities, An eperatienal pennit is rEuirC te stere; handle er use hazardeus

eredu€ti€n-materials"

105,6-22 High piled storage. An eperational permit is required to use a building or

105,6.23 Het werk eperetions i\n eperatienal permit is required fer het rverk ineludin&
bu+notstimi+ed-e:

2, Use of portable hot rvork Euipment inside a strueture,

3, FixeC site het werk equipment sueh as rvelding beeths,

4, Het rverk eeindueted within a wilCt'ire ri'k area,

5, Applieatien ef reef eoverings n'ith the use ef an e-en tlarne Ceviee,

6, When appreveC; the fire eeCe elleial shall issue a permit to earry eut a hot werk

ehapter anC shalt be re

isi€rl,

105.6.24 Industriol ovens' An eperatienal permit is requirC f'er eperati,en ef inCustrial

evengregulated by €hafier 2l ef the IF€; and as amended by this e ode,

195,625 tumber yuds and rveedwerkht plonts, An operatienal permit is required fer

105.6-16 tiquid er gas.fueled vehieles er equipment in essembly buildings- An

@i$gs.

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt

Formatted: b0

18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdootinElFC20lSw/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



105.6.17 tP gss, /\n operatioflal permi{ i* rquirC for sterage and u5e of t+ € as .in

105,6,18 Ilegnesium, ,\n operatienal pennil is required to mell; east; heat treal or grind

105,6.29 luis€ellonoous eembustiblc ster6ge, ,\n operational permit is required te slore
in an) builCing or upenefly premises in exeeis of2r50g eBbi€ t'eet ("1 m r |gress+elur+eef
e@si ilor eefltainers! rubber tirei; rubberr €ork or
si+i+a+ecFrb$st{ble- *

Instru€tion$ afld s{ipulatifls ofthe p€nni.hall be adherC to,

E*cce+io{++e€+€a+i€Fa

l0
wi+h a tor€h; or to us€ a t€r.cl or gp€n flarn€ deviee in o wildfi.e risk area,

105,6J2 eper flomes ^id €endl€s,+n eperetional permit is rEsired +o useopen flames
.r €andles in eonn if}g
estabtishfi+eEts

105.633 ergenie eoatings, ,tn operational permil is reqEired t'or any organie eoatint

dajt

105,6,31 Ploe€so{ ossembly. ,\n opcratifiral permit is {equired to op€rate a pla€e oi
a$,embbl

195,6,35 Private fire hldran3s. ,\n operatir)nal permit is reqsired for thc removal tiom
@
F*eeptios+ A per$}it is

-105,6,16 hrote€hai€ speeh
"nd handling (,fp

105,6.37 Pyroxylin plesti€s. ,\n op€ratisral permit is requi.ed t'or storag€ or llanClint of
more than 25 pounds ( I I kg) oleellclose ritra{e (f}roxylin) pl*s{ies and for the asserltrly or
maeBk€+t*eolar+ielei ifl,;€+vif,€?}fox)4in plas+i€+

105.6.38{qRefrigeration equipment. An operational permit is required to operate a

mechanical refrigeration unit or system regulated by Chapter 6 ofthe IFC, and as amended
by this Code, containing in excess of 20 lb{9=lJ<g)p9q4!qof refiigerant, other than air or

Exception: Air conditioning units or systems.

Formattcd: Font {Delault) Times New Roman, 12 pt

I 18- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedlineofordinanceadootinsrrc2ol5w/Localamendments(Title9.52)lAs



105,6,39 Repair goroges ond motor fuel dispensing faeilities, /\n sperati6nal permit is

required tor thc opemtio
drsp€€+i€€+ei+i+i€+

105,6,10 Roeftop heliports, nn eferalional pennit is required t'er the operati{x} ola
ro€*€p+e+ipe*

105.6.11 Spro!'ingor dipping,  n ope.atioflal peBnit is req{rireC to €enCuet a spra, int or

105.6.'ll Storete ofserop tire. end tire b!produ€ts, nn operatienal perfFil is rEuired te
estatr*,-esnd
eu]'i€ f€cl€-l-.nr-r) of totol relume of serap tires and t'or indoer storage of ti.es and tire
bypf€cll€!.;

[0&6,13 Temporor]' membrone strBetEr€s ond t€nts !nd canopies, nn cperational

@@inr
@l@rI
E*eeetieEs+

l, Tents used exelusively l'er reereatienal eampint purposes,

2, Fabrie eanopies and awnings open on all sides whieh eomply with all ofthe fellewing:

2,1, lnCiyiCHel €a opies shall have a maJ(imum size of?00 square t'eet (65 m lI

2,2, The aggregate area of mcltiple eanopies plaeed side t y side without a flre brealr
rl{€{al.

l,l. 
^ 

minitnum clearonee of l2 feet(1,7 m) to strueturcs artd other tents shallhe

105.6,44 Tire rebuilding plonts, ,\n eperational permit is requireC t'or the operatiofl and
mai€{€naa€ee ding++afft=

105,6,'15 Waste handling,/\o op€ratiooal lenni{ i requkeC for *}e operstion ef
auk
materiat-.t*se*+*ti*i+iUes-

105,6,16 \l/ood pr6duets, An operatiofli* permit isrequired to stor€€hips or hotg€C

@!I
105,6,47 B&tter!' s) stems, An operati()nal pemrit is rEuired to install sta+iorHry lead acid

l05.6.48flBlasting operations. An operational permit is required to conduct blasting
operations. Requirements as set forth in Chapter +Xrof the IFC, and as amended by
Section 9.52.120 of this Code, must be met in order to obtain a blasting pe.mit.

18 1006 10891896128 2 Redline of ordinance Ad rine lFc 2015 w/ tocalamendmenrs (Title 9.s21lAs



105,6J9 Blaiter's li€ense, /1 blester's lieense shall be rquireC [o eonduet any blasting
operati€+$\+i afi..€

rvith €hapter l3 efthe II€.and as amended by this eode,

105.6.50 Commercial Day Care facilities-Children. An operational permit is required
for the operation of a commercial child day care facility.

105.6,51 For Use Pcrmit. The lir€<rtjHAHJ may require an operational permit to be

issued fbr any operation, process, special event, public display. or exhibit not specifically
covered by this Ejlgcode when the l]+e€lHllE l deems such operation, process, special
event, public display. or cxhibit to be hazardous.

105.6.52 Outside Storage of Combustiblc Material Permit, Except for opcrations
subject to 105.6.25, 105.6.29, and I05.6.42, an operational pennit is required for f'acilitics
located at non-residential properties, where the Outside Storage ofCombustible Material
exists, in a quantity greater than de minimis, as defined in this Subsection.

105.6.52.1 Definitions.

"Baled storage" means combustible material that has been placed in containers other than
fully-enclosed containers approved by the Department or grouped together by use ofmetal
or plastic bands for ease in loading, transporting and storing in units.

"Combustible Material" means any material or solid waste that poses a significant fire
hazard ifignited by a flame. spark, or any other source of ignition, will readily bum under
such conditions, and includes, but is not limited to paper, cardboard, wood, plastics, rubber
and fluff(as defined in this sub chapter). Combustible Material shall not include non-solids,
or explosives, as defined by Chapter 33 ofthe IFC.

"De minimis" means the Outside Storage ofCombustible Material (as defined in this sub

chapter) ofa total volume ofless than seventy-five (75) cubic yards at a facility.

"Depanment" means the Fire Department ofthe City of El Paso, Texas.

"Fluff' means any material that is a by-product ofthe recycling process that includes but is
not limited to, shredding operations, metals separation, compacting or ffanspott operations.

"Loose storage" means the stomge ofcombustible material that is neither baled nor enclosed
in containers.

"Non-residential Property" means any property in a district other than a r€sidential- or
aparnnent-zoned district.

"Outside Storage" means storage ofany Combustible Material not in a building or structure.
Storage ofCombustible Material in a fully-enclosed container approved by the Department
shall not be consideted Outside Storage.

"Pile" means any accumulation ofCombustible Material in a heap or mound.

| 18- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedline ofOrdinance Adoptinq IFC 2015 w/ LocalAmendments {Title 9.52)lAs



"Unit" means a separate and distinct aggregate ofhomogeneous stacks, bales, pallet storage

units. containers and/or piles ofCombustible Material.

105.6,52.2 Permit Application. The owner or a legally-authorized representative ofthe
owner of a facility regulated by this ordinance shall complete and submit a permit
application to the Deparhrent, in accordance with the following requirements:

A. An applicant shall submit to thc Department an application for an Outside Storage of
Combustible Material Pcrmit upon excecding the Dde MHrinimis volume ofCombustible
Material stored outside at the facility;

B. An applicant that holds a current, valid Outside Combustible Material Storage Pmnit
shall submit a permit renewal application 60 days prior to the pennit's expiration;

C. An applicant for an initial permit or permit renewal shall submit at a minimum, the

following information, which shall be requested on the permit application form supplied by
the Department:

l. Name and physical address of facility;

2. Name and mailing address offacility owner;

3. Name and mailing address ofproperty owner;

4. Dcscription of all Combustible Material stored outside;

5. Estimated quantity (volume) ofCombustiblc Material stored outside;

6. Facility diagram indicating storage area locations for each Unit stored outside;

7- Method of storage for each Unit (baled or loose);

8. Proof of tinancial responsibility in accordance with Section 105 6.52.8 ofthis ordinance

and as required by any other applicable ordinance; and,

9. The appropriate Tier I or Tier 2 permit fee in the amount set by City Council through its

budget resolution or other duly adopted resolution.

D. If an owner or a legally-authorized re?resentative ofthe own€r of a facility regulated by

this Section fails to submit to the Department an application required by this Section' said

failure shall be considered a violation ofthis Section and shall be subject to the penalties

described in Section 9.52.030.+914

105.6.52.3 Issuance. Term end Denial of Permit

A. The Department shall review all permit applications submitted in accordance wth
Section 105.6.52.2 and.

B. Within 60 days ofa permit renewal or new permit application submitted in accordance

with Subsection 105.6.52.2, the Depa ment shall issue a permit renewal or a new permit

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, l2 pt,

Not Highlight

Formatt€d: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

| 18- 1006- 1089 1896128 2lRedline ofordinance Adootins lFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments {Title 9.521lAs



which, unless revoked, shall be valid for a period oftwelve ( l2) calendar months to the
apPlicant, or

C. The Department shall deny the application in writing and shall inform the applicant of
any deficiencies ofthe permit application ifthe permit application was incomplete, or

D. Within 30 days of a permit application for a previously revoked pemit, the Department
shall deny the application in writing if the revocation period of twelve ( l2) months has not
yct elapsed-

105.6,52.4 Revocation of Permit. The Department may revoke, lbr a p.aiod ofup to
hvelve (12) calendar months fiom date ofwrittm notification, an Outside Storage of
Combustible Material Permit issued to an owner or a legally authorized representative ofthe
owner of a facility ifone ofthe following conditions occur:

A- Applicant has supplied the Department t'alse, incorrect or misleading informarion on an

applica on tbr permrl reneual or ne\ permil:

B. More than two (2) written notices ofviolation ofthis Section resulting fiom inspections
by the Fire€*lieial{flf have been issued within a pcriod oftwelve ( l2) months to a holder
ola current, valid permit; or

C. During or imrnediately following a fire at a permitted facility, a violation ofthis Section
has occurred and has been documented by the F{ree*ieiCAH1.

105.6.52,5 Right to Appeal Permit Revocatio.l. The right to appeal a permit revocalion
is provided in the City Fire Prevention Code 9.52.030.18 Section 108.1 Board of Appeals
and in accordance with Chapter 2.30 ofthe City Code.

105.6.52.6 Permit Requirements.

A. Tier l. For facilities that maintain no more than one ( I ) Unit ofloose storage and/or no
more than one ( l) Unit ofbaled storage, thc following requirements shall be met:

L A facility fire plan, subject to approvalby the l,i+e€fuAHl, that includes: a

description ofall Combustible Material at the facility and the manner in which it is stored,
routes offacility evacuation for employees, fire awareness and prevention orientation
training for t'acility employees, site plan indicating fixed structures, Units and fire
extinguisher locations, a facility fire alarm system, and a description ofsecurity measurcs to
restrict public access to Combustible Material stored outside;

2. A minimum of one ( I ) R?e 2A2oBC fire extinguisher per Unit, with a distance of no
more than 50 feet between the extinguisher and the closest point ofthe Unit;

3. A minimum of one ( l) qpe 2A20BC fire extinguisher mounted on each vehicle used to
manage, load, or move Combustible Material;

4. lnstallation of a security measurc to restrict public access to Combustible Material
stored outside by use of a physical banier, such as a fmce or wall, in accordance with
applicable zoning ordinanc{s)l

I 18-1006-10891 896128 2lRedhne ofordinanceAdoptinp lFc 2015 w/ l-ocal amendments {Title 9.52)lAs



5. Payment ofOutside Storage ofCombustible Material Permit Tier I permit fee in the
amount set by City Council through jts budget resolution or other duly adopted resolution.

6. Proof of Financial Responsibility for the facility, in theprincipal sum of$1,000,000.00
and in accordance with Subsection 105.6.52.8 ofthis ordinance.

B. Tier 2. For facilities ihat maintain more dran one ( I ) Unit of loose storage, more than
two (2) Units ofbaled storage, or any combination ofmore than two (2) Units ofloose or
baled storage, the lollowing requirements shallbe met:

l. Provisions I 4, frermit requirements for Tier l;

2. Payment ofOutside Storage ofCombustible Material Permit Tier 2 permit fee in the

amount set by City Council through its budget resolution or other duly adopted resolution;
and

3. Proof of Financial Responsibility for the facility, in the p ncipal sum of$2,000,000.00
and in accordance with Subsection 105.6.52.8 ofthis ordinance.

105.6.52.7 Storage. Combustible Material stored outside shall be maintained in
accordance with the following requirements:

A. For Units ofloose storage:

L Unit height shall not exceed eight (8) feet;

2. Unit footprint shall not exce€d a perimeter measurement ofthree hundrcd (300) feet;

3. A buffer zone shall be established between each Unit and the physical banier indicated
in the permit application ofat least twenty (20) feet; and

4. A storage sepamtion space shall be established between individual Units of
Combustible Material ofat least twenty (20) feet.

B. For Units ofbaled storage:

L Unit height shall not exceed twelve (l2) feet;

2. Unit footprint shall not exceed a pe meter measurement oftive hundred (500) feet:

3. A buffer zone shall be established between each Uoit and the physical barrier indicated

in the permit application ofat least twenty (20) feet: and

4. A storage separation space shall be established between individual Units of
Combustible Material ofat least twenty (20) feet.

C. Storage Separation Space and Fire Safety Buffer Zone

l. No storage of Combustible Material shall be allowed within the buffer zone or in the

storage separation space described in this Subsection. In addition, said buffer zone and

18 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedline ofOrdinance Ado ne IFC 2015 w/ Lo€alAmendments (Title 9.52)lAS
I



storage separation space must at all times be kept free and clear ofequipment, material
and/or accumulation of waste.

2. A reduction to ten ( l0) feet for the fire safety buffer zone, as described in the
immediately preceding paragraph, may be allowed at a facility where Combustible Material
is stored in containeN approved by the Department.

l. A reduction ofthe storage separation space may be allowed where the Combustiblc
Material is stored in containers approved by the Department.

10S.6.52.8 Financial Responsibility.

A. Insurance. No permit applicant shall be issued a permit until the applicant presents

evidencc satisfactory to the Mqi+r+IAHJ that the applicant meets the tbllowing
minimum insurance requirernents:

l. The applicant shall procure and shall maintain during the term ofthe permit such public
liability insurance naming the permittee performing work associated with the permit as

insured, co-insured or additionally insured for claims for damages for personal injury,
including accidental death, as well as tbr claim for property damage that may arise fiom
outside storage ofcombustible material associated with the facility identified on the permir.

2. Minimum limits of liability and coverage shall be $1,000,000.00 tbr a Tier I Permit or
$2,000,000.00, tbr a Tier 2 Perrnit. for each occurrence and in the
aggregate. Permit applicants that are govemmental entities may comply with the insurance
requirements ofthis Subsection by providing certification that they are self-insured.

3. Such insurance shall be written by an accredited insurance company under the
supervision of the Board of lnsurance Commissioners ofthe State ofTexas. Evidence of
compliance with these insurance requiremmts shall be considered as having been met when
a copy ofthe insurance policy or a certificate ofinsuEnce has been filed with and approved
by the {ireol{i.ci*}$1. Such policy shall include an endorsement that the City is named as

an additional insured to thc full amount of the policy limits and that the ffiAUf
shall be notified at Ieast thirty (30) days in advance in the event the policy or policies are

canceled and ten ( l0) days in advance for non-payment ofpolicy premiums. The cenificate
ofinsurance shall recite or attach such endorsement for additional insured and the notice
requirements. The permitee shall maintain said insuaance with a solvent insurance company
authorized to do business in Texas. The policy shall provide that the insurer will defend
against all claims and lawsuits which arise and will pay any finaljudgment ofa court of
competentjurisdiction against the City, its officers, agents. servants or employees, and
pennittee. his ofticers. agents, servants or employees. Failure to keep thc insurance policy in

full force and eftect throughout the term ofthe permit shall be grounds for permit
revocation.

4. A permit applicant who has provided certificates ofinsurance to the Ciry pursuant to the
requirements of a Chaptcr ofthe City Code other than this Subchapter that meot all ofthe
requirements established in this Subchapter shall not be required to obtain an addjtional
insurance but is roquired to provide such certiticatcs ofinsurance showing present coverage
as required in this Subchapter. A permittee who has multiple permits under this Chaprer is

| 18-1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinslFC2ol5w/Localamendments(Title9.52)lAs



required to provide only one current valid certificate ofinsurance for all such permits but
may be required to provide a copy ofthe current certificate ofinsurance with each
application under this Subchapter.

105.6.52.9 Nontransfcrablc. Permits issucd under this chapte, shall be personal to the
permittee. and shall not be assigned or transferred to any other person or entity.

9.52.030.l5{Section 105.7 Required construction permits, am€nded. Intemational
Firc Code, 20041Q!!Edition, Section 105.7 required construction perrnits, is hereby
amended to read as follows:

105,7 Requircd construction permits. Where rcquired, application for construction
permit shall be made to the building ofticial in accordance with Section 105 ofthe
Intemational Building Code and Title 18, Chaptcr 18.08 (Building Code) ofthe El Paso City
Code.

105.7.13.1 Private fire hvdrrnt construction plans,

Private fire hydrant construction Dlans. Private fire hydrant construction Dlans shall be

submitted by a Texirs liccnscd flrc protdition contractor or a Texas !iccnscd Dlllstcr
plumber.

P.52.030.16 ltrtertr.tiotrrl Firc Code Sobsection 106.23!: Certilicates of
Occupancr! The buildrnE owner or an occupant or other person having chargc or control of
a building. structure or premises or their duly authorizcd agent shall have a valid certificate
ofoccupancy availablc for review. upon request by the fire code official conducting an

ot'flcial inspection ofa building. structure or premises. Failure to provide a valid certificate
ofoccupancy upon request to thc tire code otllcial shall result in the denial ofthe issuance

ofan operational permit by the fire code otlcial, unless the building existed prior to
November 23 . I 95 5 and has not b een structurally altered or expericnced a change in u \e
since Novernber 23. 1955.

+52-olOJqJ1&,5.1 Except as provided in Ordinance No. 1448 and other applicable
law, it shall be a violation ofthis title ifa building owner or an occupant or other person
having charge or control ofa building, structure or premises does not obtain a certificatc of
occupancy lrom the burlJing offieial.

J!0.54953-ofs.l63 ln accordance with applicable law, the fire code official shall be
authorized to take immediate action when life safety issues require such action.

45Le3ei5J1l0-L] The provisions ofthis Subsection 9.52.030.16!, including a

determination that a ccrtificate ofoccupancy is not required because the building existed
prior to November 21. 1955 and has not been strucrurally altoed or experienced a change in
use since Novemb er 2 3, I 95 5. shall be subj ect to the appeal process ret'erenced in local
amendment 108.1 ofSubscction 9.52.030. l{}LLof the City Code.

Note: Section 9.52.030.16 shall take effect 180 days after passage ofOrd- No- 17969.

Forma(€d: Font (Defa!lt) Times New Romao, 12 pt

Commen!€d tul ll: See e.t2.010-8 sccrion 106.5

C.nifiqte of Occuparcy, addcd.

Formatted: Font (DefauiJ limes New Roman 12 pt

Forma(ed: tont. (Defauk) Irmer New Roman. l2 pt

tormatred: Font (Default) limes New Roman, 12 pt,

Formati€d: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt
Bod

Fo.m.tted: Font (Default)Times New Roman 12 pt

Eormatted: Fontr (Default)Times New Roman, l2 pt,

Not Sold

Form.tted: Font (Default) Times New Romafl, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (DefaLrlt) T mes New Roman, 12 pi

fo.maned: ronr De'"ulr, T,m"\ Nes Pomdn '2 pr

tormatted: Font:(Defa!Lt)Tlmes New Roman, 12 pt

18-1006 10891896128 2LRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptanslFC2015w/tocalAmendments{Title9.52)lAs

9.52.030.7 Scction 105.7.13.t Private fire hrdrant construction plans. added.



Eormatted: Fontr(Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Commented tu13l: See 9.52 010.10 sccron l0r I 1.2

Ftc hydmrl nor opemri!.. added

formatled: Font (Defau t) Times New Roman, 12 pt

rormatted: Font {Defa!t) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Cornm€nt d tul,{: See 9.52.010.1I Sccrion 108.1 Board
of applals esrablished, amendcd.

tormatt.d: ronr:(Defauh)Iimes New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Foni {Default)Times New Roman, l2 pt

Formattcdr Fontr (Oefault) Times New Roman. 12 pt

Comment€d futSl: see 9.52.010.12 Secrion 109.4
violdlion pctuhies, nmended.

rormatted: Fonr:(Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

Eormatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

commented tul6l: See 9.51 010 Il S{rion 109.5

Formatted: I ont rOefault, I'me( New Roman 12 pt

torm.lled: Forl De'aullr Trm". N"6 Romdn. l. pl

Commented [ul7]: see') 5l 1)ll) 14 S0rlidr I I I ,1 l.ilu.

formatted: ronr \D"fdu r Ti-a, \a^ Ro-d 'r pl

Formatted: Font (Defa!lt)Times New Roman, 12 pt

Commented [u12]: see 9 52.030 9 section 107.2 1 1

Prlvate frre hydrani test and rn5pecton records, added

Formatted: Font (Delault)Trmes New Roman 12 pt

18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineof OrdinanceAd tine IFC 2015 w/ tocal amendments lTitle 9.s2) lAs

9.52.030.17 Scction 107.2,1,1 Privatc fire hydrant test and inspection rccords,
added..lnternational Firc Codc. 2009 Edition. Scclion I07.2.2.2 Privatc firc hydrant tcst and
inspcclron records. is llercby addcd to rcad as tbllo$'s:

107.2.1.1 Privatc fire hydrrnt tcst and inspcction rccords. Privalc tirc hydrant tcsl and

inslection rccord\ shall hc lllcd $ ith thc +r+e M+:!+rl+{l+li+r \ llJ lr,lthin two \yorking days

Ii,nn lhc pn\arr lrlLlr.Irr'\ (lJrc,'l-l(\l ln\IL(lri'n

9-52.030.1E Section l0?.2.1.2 Fire hydrant not operative, addcd. Intemational Firc
Code, 2OO+20I! Edition, Section 107.2. L2 Fire hydrant not operative, is hereby addcd to
read as follows:^

107.2.1.2 Firt h-r. dranl not opcralive. If lirc hydranl is no1 operativc and ls not rcpairijd
at the Iimc of its tcsrinspcctioD. thc hydrant's condition must bc rcported to thc l-ire
Mar"thfl++Ot'Etje4lll immedratcly.

9.52.030,19 Section 108.1 Bo.rd of apperls csta[rlished, amend.d. lntemational
Fire Code, 2oo$lQllEdition. Section 108.1 Board ofappeals established, is hercby
amended to read as follows:.

l0S.lBoardolappcals.Appealsolorders.decisionsordetenrinatiursbytheadde
e+1+r+ll!L!.Lrclative to the application and interpretation ol$+;L!IqCode may he dppealed

b (hc Construction Board of Appeals in accordancc with Chapter 2.30 oI the City Code.

9.52.030.20 Section l09.{violation penaltics, amcnded. Intgnational Fire Code,
2O0+20XiEdition, Section l09.3aviolation penalties, is hereby amended to read as

follows:^

1og.{Violation peralties. Persons who shall violatc a provrsion of this flqcodc ot
shall fail to conlply \{ith any ofthe rcquircmcnts thcreolor \r'ho shall erect. install. altcr.
repair or do work in violation oi thc approvcd construction documents or dircctlve ofthe
code otllcial, or of a pcflnit or certificatc uscd undcr provisions of this lgqCode. shall bc
guilty ofa misdenleanor. punishablc by a finc ot' not rnorc than two thousand dollars. Each

day that a violation continucs alier due noticc has bcen scrved shall bc deemed a sopirratc
ot-tcnse.

9.52,030.20.1 Section 109.+lcitations, .dded. Intemational Fire Code, }00+?11!!
Edition, Section 109.4 Citations, is hereby added to read as follow:.

1o9.+icitations. The lire olli!r{l \llJ shall have the authori!- to issuc citations firr
violations olprovisions of this Code.

9.52.030,20.2 Sectiod lll,4 Failure to comply, ameoded. International Fire Code,
2009 Edition, Section I I 1.4 Failure to comply. is hereby arnended to read as follows:.

I I l.,l Failure to comply. Any p!'rson who shall continuc any lvork al'tcr having bccn
served with a stop work ordly. cxccpl such work as that pcrson is directcd to perionn to
remove a !iolatron or unsaf'e condilion. shall be liablc lo r tinc olnot more than twc)

thousand dollars. [!qll !li\ thrt a ! it]lallqL!!(U!!r)qC!al!r:r !lq! lr!)trq!!! hcen ser\ cd s[irll
bc (lecmc(l a scouratr ol-tcnsc.



;
W
p.52,040 - Chapter 2, Delinitions, amcndcd..

Jnternational Fire Code, 2e0+2QllEdition, Chapter 2, Definitions, is hereby adopted in its
entirety with the following amendments:

9.52.040.1 Section 202 General Definitions, amended. Intemational Fire Code, ?009
201 5 Edition, Section 202 General Definitions, is hereby amende+rctifC{Uy adding or
changing the following definitions in their appropriate places:

"Adult Foster Care (AFC) Homc" rneans a home that providcs supervised. 24-hour .
living anangements fbr people who are unable to continue livinq independentlv in
their own homes because oia ohvsical. mental or ernotional lirnitation.

@ "Alter of Alteralion'-ryAns__aAny change or
modification in construction or occupancy.

"Authoritv Havins Jurisdiction (AHJ)" means an oreanization. office. or individual .
responsible for enfbrcins the requirements ofa code or standard. or for approving
equipment, materials, an installation, or a procedure.

sUItD$iC€FFtCt+t" B ui ld ins Otfi c i alL fl ga.n s. WWhere the term " Building
Official" is used within the fire prevention code and this chapter, it shall have the same
meaning as set forth in Section 18.02.-l+t182.4,1 Zof this Code.

w€.

@ means anysurface water, groundwater,
drinking water supply, land surface or subsurface strata, or ambient air within or under
the control of the United States.

"Fire Barrier" rneans a tire-resistance-rated wall assembly of materials permanently
tixed in place desisned to restrict thc spread offire in which continuity is rnaintained.

FIRE €HIEF theefi-reer er ether persen eharged with the administratien ef the
t5

auth€nz€d+eef€s€ntat*s

FIRE DISTRICTlneans a-.heavily populated or congested commetcial area as

described in Chapter 18.08 of the City Code, also known as the'limits established by
law'.

"Flame Effects" means a device of solid. liquid, or eas. desiqned specificallv to produce.
an open flarne when ienited to displav a thermal. phvsical. visual. or audible
nhenomenon as defined in NFPA 160. Such devices include paraftin wax candles. LP
gas candles, torches. LP-gas bumers, and'sky lantern'wpe flame illuminated aerial
devices.

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, '12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, Bold

formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, '12 pt

Formatted: bl, lndent: Left: 0.9"

Formatted: Normal

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Not Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: lndent: Left: 0.6"

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Normal

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Not Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: b1, lndent: Left: 0.5"

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Not Bold

Formafted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: b1, lndent: Left: 0.9"

Formatted: Normal

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Not Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinFlFC2015w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



*Vacant" has the same meanine Y, gNjf- - {sas {efined by Chapter 18.40 (Vacant
Buildings) ofthe EI Paso City Code.

W
9.52.050 - Chrpter 3, General Requirements, amended..

Intcmational Fire Code 2015 Edition, Chapter l. ScoDe and Administration, is hereby ratified in
its entirctv with the ti)llowing ame dments:.
9.52,050.1 Section ll0,l Ceneral. amcndcd.

R ter 9 0 of the Cit C

rormatted: Font (Oefault) Tlmes New Roman, l2 pt,

Not Bold

Formatted: Font (Delault) Times New Ro.nan, l2 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman. Eold

Formatt€d: Font (Default) Times New Roman 12 pt

Formatted: lndent Left 0.5"

Formatted: Defauh Paragraph Font, Font.olor: Auto

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formaned: Ioll tD"ldu I Ir n"\ N"^ Domrl I pr

Formarted: lndeni Lefl: 0 5

formatted: Font (oefault) Times New Roman, 12 pt

or+is-authorjzC+€prese,rtatlve

FIRE oFFI€IAt Where the term "fire offi€ial" is used rvithin this eode it shall
meaa*eli+e+i#++lllt4*

AJRISDI€+{oN*L A*€* "Jurisdiction within the eirytljly
limits of the ei
Territori*l Jurisdietion (ETJ), Ret'er to €urrent metes and troundaries of the eity ot El
Pas+

PERSoN means a ipr+€rporati€urjein+
venturei assoeiationr er ether legal mtityi any $oup ofthe feregeing organized tbr a

busi$e'5?t Pe\HF*lry€eYesfieEtatel}d+

Formatted: ndent Le{t 06

Formatted: Font: (D€fau t) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Forma ed: Indentr Left: 0 5 , First line: 0

ip its entirety r,ith the f'ollowiflg ame{drn€fltli:

^,52,050,1 Seetio
Fire eede, 20gq Edi
k}+ea4as.*+torvsi

| 18 1006 10891896128 2lRedline of ordinance Adootins lFc 2015 w/ tocalAmendments lTitle 9.52llAs

"Fostcr Farnilv Honllj mcans a honrc that is thc primarv rcsidencc ofthc tbsler parcnts .
and providcs carc tbr six offewcr childrcn or voung adults, undcr thc rcsulation ofa
child-olacine ascncv.

"Rerrair Carage" means a buildine. structure. or oortion thereoF used for servicing. or .
reoairine motor vehicles. or a buildine. structure. or ponion thereofused for installation
ofallermarket parts and accessories on motor vehicles.



304,1 Weste aeeumulatien prehibited €embustible waste material; ineluCing but not
timitea te eomUust
aeeurnu{ate++br*i}di@

9,52,050.3 Seetien 310 Smeking; deleted, lnternatienal Fire €edeJ009 Editien, Seetion
lnr

Seetion atZ'Z Posts

-3f*Pests.

t teeated not less than 5 feet ( 151'l rnrn) fiom the preteeted ohieet,

9.52.050.+Isection 3 15.3
:Aisles.

added.

3f 5.{.5: Aisles. In areas where miscellaneous combustible materials are stored, an aisle
ofat least 30 inches width shall be provided for every 50 linear feet ofpiles, palletized,
racked, or bin storage.

315.3 Outside storage. Outside storage, including but not limited to pile storage of
combustible materials, shall not be located within l0 feet pe48-nr+nlof a property line,
building, and or structure. Outside storage, including pile storage shall be maintained from
an existing fence line a minimum distance equal to the height of the material stored.

Exceptions:

l. The separation distance to a property line is allowed to be reduced to 3 feet el4{nril)
for storage not exceeding 6 feet €l829rnn+|in height.

2. The separation distance to a property line is allowed to be reduced when the hre
e*ir;ialAHJ determines that no hazard to the adjoining properry exists.

9.52.050.61 Section 315.3d2 Height, amended. @
rartion; Seetion g

315.3.2 Height. Storage in the open, including but not limited to pile storage, shall not
exceed 20 feet (6e96rnr++Iin height.

Formatted: b1

Formatted: b1

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinslFC2Ol5w/Local Amendments(Title9.52)lAS



p.52,060 - Chapter 4, Emergency Planningand Preparedness, amended..

Jntemational Fire Code, 2{J0r}lQNlEdition, Chapter 4, Emergency Planning and

Preparedness, is hereby adopt€+ratified in its entirety with the following amendments:

q.+.06{L}Sa€+i6n ao#ftRet+n@
Edition! Se€tion '108,2,2 Innoun€ementsi is h€reby amended te read as follows:.

a 
,|98,?:l Announeemed!!, Ii:Theatersi:motion pieture *Ea{e.si audiloriglE', and similar

announeement shall be made i$ both English and Spanish not more than l0 minutes prior tt)

9.52.050.{Section 315.34.3 StoFage sepora+ieu-*Width, .dded. }c+ernatio,1++iFe

tbllirvsl

315.3{.3 Storage separation width. A minimum of20 fe€t (6096mrB}width separation
between all outside storage, including but not limited to, pile storage, shall be provided.

_Wiej'

(Ord. No. 17423,9-21-2010, eftl l-l-2011:O.d. No. 17969. | 3,3-5-2013)

eY€H{-o#i+e or oth€r-eBte€enei+

Fdition, Seetiffr 10

408_J+Places of Assembly

408.-l+l Overcronding in Places of Asscmbly. The number ofpersons in any building
or portion thereofshall not exceed the amount permitted in accordance with the Building
Code or Fire Codc. The owner, supervisor or manager responsible for admitting persons

shall be responsible for keeping an accurate occupant count at all times during business

hours. In places of assembly with a capacity of 100 ot more p€rsons, the occupant count

shall be kept in wriften from and made readily available to Ht+!+lAH! or his authorized

representative upon request or at each 30 minute intervals.

408.+!.2 Authority of f,re o$eiall!$[ in overcrowded conditions' No person shall
permit overcrowding or admittance ofany person beyond the approved capacity ofany place

ofassembly. The tireelliei+lAHJ, upon finding any overcrowded conditions or obstructions

in aisles, passageways or other means of egress, or upon finding any conditions which
constitutes a threat to life safety, shall cause the performance, presentation, spectacle or
entertainment to be stopped until such condition or obstruction is corrected.

408.12,3 Olfense for allowing overcrordding. Any owner, supervisor or manager who
shall admit persons in excess of the occupant capacity set by the H4i*g€tWAUl shall

Formatred: Font (Delault) Trmes New Roman. 12 pt
Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman Bold

Formrncd: tont (Default) T,mes New Roman l2pl

Formatted: Font: (Defauh) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatr€d: Font (Deraullr r'mpi New Roman l? pr

18 1006-10891896128 21 Redline of ordinance AdootinE IFC 2015 w/ tocal endments lTitle 9.52llas



be guilty ofa misdemeanor off'ense punishableby a fine as provided in the City Code. Each
person admitted or ticket sold in cxcess ofsuch number shall constitute a separate offense.

408.12.4 Failure to comply. For failure to comply herewith. the l:]reot'ffiAHJ may, in
the name ofthe City. apply to a coun of competent jurisdiction for an injunction to compcl
compliance. Failure to comply with this subsection shall make the person so failing, and any
person by whorn he was ernployed at the time he failed to comply, subject to the
enforcement provisions ofSection 109 ofthe IFC and Section 9.52.030.++.LLof the City
Code, and he or she shall in addition show cause, ifany exists, why he or she should not be
eligible for a permit for two (2) years after the date of violation. These penalties are in
addition to any criminal penalties provided for by this chapter.

(Ord. No. 17423,9-21-2010, eft. l-l-2011)

p,52.070 - Chaptcr 5, Fire Service Features, amended.^

,lnternational Fire Code, 200+20!LEdition, Chapter 5, Fire Service Features, is hereby
adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

ifl
its-apP{oPiatefra€e

in€ €{
the m6st remote _Fproved aecesr'egreiri mat}door,

9.52.070.{Section 503.1.4 Facilityy.rds! added. lf,tematioB+l-E+ee€de. )

503.1.4 Facility yards An approvcd tire apparatus access road shall be provided to within
150 feet (4920rnn+{f all outside combustible/flammable materials storage, including but
not limited to pile storage, located in automobile wecking yards, junkyards, recycling
facilities, or wrecking yards.

9.52.070.+lsocrton 503.2.5 D.ad erdr, rEende4 lf,teri{*ie€r++ire )

50*5D!!34 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of250 feet
(76.2 m) in-hlrtth shall be provid€d \+itFwith width and tumaround provisions rn

accordance with Table 10J.4. .n approred area

9,52.070.42section 505.1 Address identificltion, amended. k{+r}at}e*it}+ir+Q+lq

505,1 Address Numbers. New and existing buildings shall be numbercd in accordance
with Title I8 ofthe City Code.

9.52.0?0,-! Section 506.1.1.1 Elcctric Cate. !ddcd.

rormatted: Font (D€fauit)Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Fonl:(Defauh) Times New Rornan, Bold

Formatted: Font (Deiault) T rnes New Roman, 12 pl

commGnlcd [ul8l: Moved to9-s2.170.7 Section D103.4

Formaried: Font (Delault)Trmes New Roman, l2 pt

tormalted: Font (Default)limes New Roman l2 pt

506.1.1.1 Electric Catc.

| 18 1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinartc20l5w/LocalAmendmenrs(Title9.52llAs



An arrDroved electric Knox Switch shall be installed on ele€t c access qates where
rcquircd by thc AHJ.

9.52.070.5 {Section 507.3.1 Minimum pressure requirement, added. }cterca+ienC
Fire eode, 2009 Edition, Se€tion 507,l, I I\4 inimum pressure requirement, i+e+€by ad{l€d {o
rea4a++eilo,*s.

507.3.1 Minimum prcssure requirement. When the water supply system is intended to
provide fire fighting capability, the watcr supply system must also be designed to maintain a

minimum pressure of20 psi under combined fire and drinking water flow conditions.

(
section ofthe Tex. Adnrin. Code)

9.52.070.61section 507.4.1 Flow t€st adjustments, sdded. +lr+ef6..}ti€l}a}ffiq
'009 Edition; Se€ti

507.4.1 Flow Test Adjustmeots. Water flow test data shall be adjusted to account for
daily and seasonal fluctuations, large simultaneous indust al use, future demand on water
supply. or any other condition that could affect the water supply. The fire protection system
design shall be based on not more than 9070 ofthe water flow test capacity. The water flow
test data shall only be valid ifthe required data is obtained within three-If!-.L5)j/ears fiom
the date plans are submitted to the tire€odeeff,ci+lAHJ.

9.52.070,fu_Section 507,5,1 Where required, c*eep+ios-{ddedalfglds!1,

te€dd-aflex€epfi€n+o

507.5.1 Wherc Required,
Where a Dortion ofthe facility or buildins hereafter consrructcd or moved into or within
the iurisdiction is more than 800 t'cct frorn a hydrant on a fire aDparatus access road. as

measured by an dpploled route around the exterior of the facilitv or building. on sitc tlre
hydrants and nrains shall be rrrovided where reouired by the .4HJ

F*€cp+ios+

3, Ifthere are two (2) fire hydrsnts *ut are within 600 ti€t ( 183 m) of the fa€ility €r

apPli.

Formatted:ronr (DF{aulu Trmc\ New Roman '2 pr

Formarted: Font: (Default)Tim€s New Roman, 12 pt

I 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedline ofordinance AdootinR ttc 2015 w/ tocalAmendments {Title 9.52)lAs



Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Field Code Changed

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdootinslFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS

rl



2gr9 rc sedbn 507 - Fiie ?rot€ction tf,ater Supdle!
M.rh@ rir rfd Mr) kz.d b rr.ru.d. rr6d or&idir

Commented [ul9]: Added

Formrtted: Font:(Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt

tormatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt

Formatted: Font (Delault) Irmes New Roman, l2 pt
I

I

d E6 Frh.thlr't.d.E E@n Itd1[d r. ir !!el!dn 'lrnGI
E es - *d. ..d,. Ib *r !!.r.rrl

'.d,.-FrodndrrabE l...ri t
'b.oi6rrl,lhIlilnarn!"t[dl
ic rat - El'tui t .r,

I
$

PUBUC SIREST

FII
Et,ILOING

I
t
I
I
t
I
I
t
I
I
t

6
b/.! e.r!F breftt.rr*.tB?Lo'd

{dllhFrh.dldEE@bcrJlbq n!.fnlhotaortur.-

I
I
I
,
,
,
t
I
,
I

&

I
I

9.52,o70.qsection 507,5.5 Clear sp.ce around hydrantq amended. lilt€+$arioJ+at
Fire €'odc; 2009 Edition, Se,ction 50?5,5 €lear spa€e around hydrants, is hereby amended to

507.5,5 Clear space around hydrants. A 5-foot el*l+ft+)clear space shall be

maintained around the circumference offire hydrants except as otherwise required or
approved.

18 1006 10891896128 2 | Redline of Ordina nce adoptina lFc 2015 w/ Local AmendnEnts LTtle gla lA5



9,52.070.8 Scctio[582.5.7 Pri,latc firc h\drants. addcd.

507.5.7 Private fire hvdrants.
All private fire hydrants shall comply with the cunent EPWU hydrant installation
specifications.

9.52.070.8.1 Scction 507.5.7.1 DAT\'. added.

507.5.7.1 DATV.
Installalion ofa Davidson Anti-Tfiorism Valve is oDtional on a Drivate fire hvdrant Formatted: lndent Lelt 0 5 . Space Afte. 0 pt

Formated: Font:(Defauh)Times Ne!'/ Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: font {Oefault, Times New Roman l2 pr

Form.n€d: Font:(D€fault) Times New Roman, 12 pt,
Bold

Formatted: Font:(Default) Times New Roman, Bold

formatted: font {Default) Times Net{, Roman, 12 pl

508,1,2 SeDaration,
The /i/e conrr,rr.l cerrer shall be serrarated liom the temainder ofthe buildinq bv not
less than a I -hour fi re-resistance-rated fire barrier constructed in accordance wilh S ection
707 ofthe /r/ernallbral Brll/dirs Code or horizontal assemblv consfiucted in accordance
with Section 7l I ol the bkmalientlBriuirzlalk-ol. bsth. No openDss sh?ll be
permitted b!'tween the tlre comnrand center and the buildins beine protccted.

9.52,079,9 S€€tio6 508,1-5 Requircd f..toresr porogr^ph added. lntersatienal Fire

parapph+€+ead{sJolo*s

-508#-ReS"ire+t€&tE

IU, The eonrrnand eenter shall be separated frem the rema inder of the tr uildint try notless

pennitted between the tire eernrnand eenter anC the truildint being preteeted,

(OrC=+l€=-l?4e#)lr-l+lffi{tllJ

p.52.080 - Chapter 9, Fire Protection Systems, amended.^

Jnternational Fire Code, 200+2015 Edition, Chapter 9, Fire Protertion Systems, is hereby
ndop+e+alitldin its entirety with the following amendments:

9.52.080.1 Section 901.2.2 Supporting data, sdded. lfl{efr1atio6alredq+$9

901,2.2 Supporti[g data. The supporting data in the form ofhydraulic calculations
required by li+e+ode-t*{ieinlllH.l for iostallation or modification ofall fire suppression
systems shallbe valid ifthe flow test data is within llears Aom the date plans are
submitted.

9.5?,070.9 Scction 508. 1.2 Scparation. amcnded.

| 18 100G10891896128 2lRedline ofordinance Adootine lFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAs



Exccptions:

l. Crou R-t where guestrooms are not more than three stories above the lowest level
ofexit discharge and each guestroom has at least one door leading directly to an exterior exit
access that leads directly to approved exits.

2. A rcsidential sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be

allowed in buildings, or portions thereot, ofCroup R- 1.

3. Detached one- and two-f'amilv dwellines and multiplc sinslc-t'amilv dwellines
(townhouscs) not morc than three stories above gmde Dlane in height with a separate means

of egress. and thcir acccssory sfuctures not mo[e than thrce stories aboye-cradl pl4!! !!
heiqht conforming with the nrovisions ofthc Intemational Residcntial Codc

9.s2.080.$lscction 903.2.819.2 Group R!-2-raddedwggbgg!$ iddsL
lntematioo+l Fireeode, 1009 Editirm, Seetion 901,2,8,2 €roup R 2' is hereby added to reeC

903.2.8!l!.2 Group R$2_lyg!9hg!!g!.- An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
in accordance witlr Section 903.1.1 throughout lalLfloofliolbtd+di+91+rl{t+a Group RS-2
warehouse fire area

cecds 12,000 squarc flet

Cornment€d [u20]: Moved to9.52.070.8 se.tion 507.5.7
Piivate nre hyd.ants, added lseeabovel

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font:(Defau t)Times New Roman, l2 pt

tormatted: Normal lndent Left 0.3"

Form.tted: Font (Default) Tlmes New Roman, 12 pt

18- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedline of ordinance Ado tinc lFc 2015 w/ tocalAmendments {Title 9.52)lAs

9,52.080,2 Sectiotr 901.4.5 Privrtc lire hydrrtrtq rdde4 ln{€rRa+i€f,a++ire€1}dq
2{

901-45507.5.7 Private fire hydrants. All private fire hydrants shall comply with thc
aHrreve+currcnt EPWU FireHydrant -]!!!qlultg!_!Specifi cations.

9.52.080.3 Section 901.4.5.1 Breakablc flange, added. lnternational Fire Codc, 2009
Edition, Section 901.4.5.1 Brcakablc flangc, is hcreby addcd to read as follows:

901.4.5.1 Breakable flange. Private fire hydrant's breakable flange shall not be bclow I

inch and shall nol extend above 6 inches from final gade.

9.52.080.+lsection 903.2.8.1 Group R+, &ddedamcndcd.]+t€fl}t}tit)l+++ire{Uq
i:

903.2.8J@ An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with IFC

Section 903.1-as+Hnen&shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Croup R+
fire area. For CrouD R-2 occuDancics. an auiomatic sprinklcr system shall bc providcd

throughout all floors ofbuildings with a Croup R-2 llrc area where more than hvo srori$
in hcitht. includine baserncnts. or wherc havinq rnore than l6 dwellinq units.



9 51,080,6 Seegon 903.f,,8J Group R 1! odded. +ltematienal Fi.€ Code, 2009 Edition,
Saetion 903.2,8,3 Group R 1 is hereby added to read *s fol'otrs:

@ies-
9.52.080,k Section 903.2.11.3 Buildirgs 55 feet or more in height, lmended.

+R{efl,atioFdfffi*20e+Edi+i{r+,-Se€+i{*agpBBildr"g#S.etsor more-rH

@
903.2.11.3 Buildings 35 feet or more in height. An automatic sprinkler system shall be

installed throughout buildings with a floor level having an occupant load of30 or more, that
illocated 35 feet (++S63nm) or more@

- measured to the finished floor

Exceptions:

-+--Ai?€"{€fl"€l+€

?1. Open parking structures.

31. Occupancies in Group F-2.

9,52.080.5 Scction 903.3.1.2.1 Balconies 8nd decks. amended.

903,3,1.2.1 Balconics 8nd decks.
SDrinklcr protL'ction shall bc providcd firr cx tcrior balconies. ccrcss balconics. decks and

sround uoor Datios ol dwcllins units and sl inp units wherc thc buildins is ofTlDc V

construction. provided there is a roofor deck above. Sidewall srrrinklcrs that are used to

Drotect such arL:as shall be Dermitted to be lftated such that their defloctors are within I inch

to 6 inohes bclow the structural membcrs and a maximum dista!1ce oJ l4 inches below the

deck ofthc cxterior balconics and docks that urc consmrctcd ofopen wood loist
constructton.

952.080.6 Scction 903.-1.5.3 Frecre Protcction. addcd,

903.3.5.3 Freeze Protection.
Where aboveground water-filled suDDlv Dipes. risers. system risers. or feed mains for a

flre Drotection svstem pass throuqh areas subiect to temDeratures below 40 desrees

Forma[ed: ]ndent Left 0.3

Formatted: lndent Lell: 08

Fo.matted: Normal lndent: Leftr 03'

Formatted: Font: (Defauh) Tirnes New Roman. l2 pt

Formatt€d: Norma. lndent Left: 0
9.52.080.7 Section 903.4.2 Alarms. amedded.

903.4.2 Alarms,

| 18 1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinstFc2ol5w/tocalAmendmenrslTatleg.s2)lAs



903.4,4.1 Warehouse buildines (Sl/S2).
In warehouse buildines requirine sorinkler svstems. where no fire alarm is requircd. a

notification device shall beprovided in normally occupied office areas. Notification
devices shall also be provided in storaee areas where audio and visual notification would
be evident within those areas.

903.5.1 Undcreround Pipe.
All undersround tlre line pioe not installed v EPWTJ shall he hvdrostaticallv testcd Der

NFPA l3 and NFPA 24 reouircments.

9.52.080.1I Scction 904.3.5,1 Sinqle tensnt buildins. addcd.

90,1.3.5.1 Sinph tenan t hui td

Formarr€d: Font:(Default)Times New Roman, l2 pt

tormatted: Norma. lndent Lelt: 0.3

Forma(ed: ndent Lett 0.5

Eorm.tted: FontrNot Bo d

Fo.matt.d: n.lenr lFft 0 5

Formatted: Font Not 80 d

torm.rted: Font rDefau[, TrFes \e( Romdn l2 pr

In a sinsle tenant buildine. where sprinkler monitorins is installed in accordance with
903.4.1. automatic fire-extinquishine svstems shall be connected to sprinkler monitorine
and a notification deviqq (hom strobe) slall be placed in or near the space frlolectqlby
thc automatic fire-extinguishinq svstem at a location approved bv the AHJ.

9.52.080.{asection 906.3.5 Minimum extihguisher requirements, added.
i+elseet--

islrerebyrxkle*ro rea*asftrtlo,*r;:

906.3.5 Minimum extinguisher requir€ments. Each individual occupancy shall have, at
a minimum, one 2A IOBC extinguisher lor every 3000 square feet, or fiaction thermfl
Greater protection may bc required depending on the nafure ofthe hazard-

9.52.080.1J Scction 90?.2..1.1 Portablc Classrooms. added.

An anproved audible device. located on tlre exterior and intcrior of the buildine in an

approved location. shall be connectcd to each automatic sprinkler systcm. Such sprinkler
water flow alaml deviccs shall bc activatcd bv water flow equivalent to thc flow ofa
sinele sprinklcr ofthc s,nallelit orificc sizc installed in the system. Wherc a firc alarm
svstem is installed. actuation of thc automatic sprinkler system shall actuatc the buildins

9.52,080.8 Section 903.4.4 Multi Tenart Buildings, sdded, lnt€malioEolffiq
r0tfq Edition' Seet

903.4,4 Multi Tenart Buildirgs. In buildings requiring sprinkler systems with multiple
tenants, where no fire alarm is required, each tenant will have the minimum ofone
notification device (hor/strobe) to provide audio and visual notification upon activation of
the monitoring alarm system, in a location approved by the eedeelleialAEJ.

9.52.080.9 Section 903.4.4.1 Worehouse buildinss (Sl/S2). edded.

9.52.080.10 Scction 90-1.5.1 flndersround Pipc. addcd.

| 18-1006 10891896128 2lRedline ofordinance AdootinF tFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAs



907.2.3.1 Portable Classrooms.
In addition to the required notification devices, a manual fire alarm box that initiates the
occupant notification signal shall be installed in oortable classroorns when a rnanual fire
alarm svstcm is installed on the campus as per Section 907.2.3.

9.52.080.14 Section 907.2.24 Nlixed Usc Buildines. added.

907.2.24 Mixed Use Buildinss.
In mixed use buildinss. not classified as hieh-rise. provided with a sprinkler monitorine
svstem or fire alarm system as required elsewhere in this Fire Code or El Paso Citv Code,
all notification devices shall activate upon alarm activation.

9.52.080.15 Section 907.6.3 lnitiating device idcntification. Erception l. amended.

Exceptions: Firc alann svstems in sinele-story buildinss less than 22,500 square f'eet in
area and not classifled E occupanc-v.

9.52.080.16 Section 907.6.6 i\lonitorine. amcndcd.

907.6.6 Monitorins.
Fire alarm systerns required by this chapter or bv the lntemational Buildine Code shall be
monitored by an approved supcrvisins station in accordance with NFPA 72. Monitorins
and reoortinsbv the supervisine station shall identify the specit'ic initiatins dcvice
address. location. device tvpe, floor levcl where applicable for alanr. trouble and

supervisory status, as appropriate.

9.52.080.17 Section 912.2.1.1 Distance. addcd.

-g!2J.Ll 
prstelse.

The fire department connection shall be placed no further than 30 feet frorn an approved
fire access road when not located on the building.

9.52.080.18 Section 912.2.1.2 Nlarkines. addcd.

912.2.1.2 Ntarkines.
The curb irnrnediately adjacent to the tlre department connectron shall be painted red. lf
no curb is rrrovidcd, a six inch nrinirnum red sffipe shall be painted on the pavernent

immediately adjacent to the FDC. Thc painted curb or stripe shall measure l0 f'eet. The
pavement immediately adjacent to the painted curb or stripe. shall be hash marked in red
paint and extend out a minirnum of l0 t'eet or as desimated bv the AHJ.

9.52.080.19 Section 912.2.1.3 Pathrvar. addcd.

912.2.1.3 Pathwav.

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Normal, lndent: Left: 0"

18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinslFC2015w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



An unobstructed. Ievcl surface no less than 36 inches wide shallbe provided liom the fire
deDartment connection to the nearest point ofthe flre department access road

9.52.080.20 Section 912.2.1.,1 Shrrcd firc linc. addcd,

912.2.1.,1 Sharcd fire linc.
Wlcrc a firc nrotcction svstem rs sunolied lili tc flrc h Formatted: lndent Lettr 0.5", Space After: 0 pt

Formaned: Font (Oefa'rlt) Times New Roman, 12 pt

formatted: lont rDefault) lrmes New Roma.. 12 pt

Formatt€d: Fontr (Default) Iimes New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

rormatted: Font (De{ault)Times New Roman, Eold

Formatted: lont (Defaui) lrmes Npd Romal 12 pt

the fire department connection for that svstcm shall be connectcd to the firc protection

svstem above the chcck valvc.

P sl,s80ilq +t{9n

@
907.2.15 High piled eombustible storog€ oreos, ,\n autsmatie smeke deteetions system

rtorageareas wh€Ye.Eui

9.52.080.1+2lsection 912.50.1 Backflow protection device enclosures, added.
llrt
@

912.5!.1 Backflow protection device enclosures. Backflow protection devices shallbe
provided freeze protection by means ofa "hot box" style insulated enclosure meeting or
exceeding ASSE 1060 standards.

Existing backflow protection devices that are protected with wrapped style insulatron
shall be retro-fitted with the appropriate enclosure no later than l2 months aticr thc
adoption of thcsc ammdrteDl!

@
@
p.52.090 - Chapter 10, Means of Egress, amended..

Jntemational Fire Code, 2e0+2gliEdition, Chapter 10, Means of Egress, is hereby il@
rariticd in its entirety with the following amendments:

9.52,090.1 Scctiofl 1004.5 Outdoor arcas, amcndcd.

18 1006- 1089 | 896128 2lRedline of ordinance Adootinr IFC 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAS

Section 1004,5. Outdoor aress.
Yards. patios. courts and similar outdoor areas accessible to and usablc bv the buildins
occupants shall be orovidcd with mcans ofcsress as requircd by this chapter. The
occupant load ofsuch outdoor areas shall be assiqned bv the AHJ in accordance with the
anticipated use. Whcre outdoor areas are to be uscd bv persons in addition to the
occupants ofthe buildins. and the path of esress havel liom the outdoor areas passei

throuqh the buildine. mcans ofcqrcss reouirements for the b!ildine shall be based on the
sum of the occurrant loads of the buildine DiLls the outdoor areas. ln Assembly GrouD A-2



occuDancies. the aggregate ()ccuDant load ofoutdoor and indoor areas will also bc used in
determining fire Drotection requirements when outdoor areas have no means ofegress
othcr than throush thc buildin{.

E*""rt-iona,

l. Outdoor arr'as used exclusivell tbr service ofthe buildinc need onlv have one

@Ls aflges!

ln llin II l Cro

9.52.090..l'lsectioo +ge8lqlg.l,9.&LElectromagnetically Iocked egress doors,
amended.

@
$081q1q.1,939 El€ctromagnetically locked egress doors. Doors in the means ofegress

that are not otherwise required to have panic hardware in buildings with an occupancy in
Croup A, B, E, M. R-l or R-2, S and doors to tmant spaces in Croup A, B, E, M, R-l ot R-
2, S shall be permitted to be electromagnetically locked ifequipped with listed hardware that
incorporates a built-in switch and where installed and oleratinq in accordance with the
tbl lowine: rneat@e+orYi

1. The liste+hardware that is amxed to the door leafhas an obvious method ofoperation
that is readily operated under all lighting conditions.

2. The l.is+e4hardware is capable ofbeing operated with one hand.

3. Operation of the listedhardware @
intcrruDts thc Dower to the electronugnetic lockj!!L!qbgk!s the door immediately

4. Loss ofpower to the }istcd hi+d+r+Ielockinq s\stem automatically unlocks the door

5. Wherepllric or /ir? exil hard$erc isrceuired bv Section 1010.l. | 0. oDcration of
rhe Danic ot /ire erit hartlware also rcleascs the electromasnetic lock.

6. The lockins systcm units shall be /lsted in 4qqotdltce lrrIh UI-294

9,52.090.3 Tablc 1020.1 Corridor Firc Resistance Rstine. €rccotion rdded.

-Iable 
1020.1 Corridor Fire-Resistancc Ratinq

tormatted: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pl

Eormatred: b], Left, Righr 0 , No bullets or
numbering, Adjusr spa(e between Latin and Asian text
Adjun space between Asian text and numbeE

Form.tted: Font 'Derdul Trmp\ NF^ Romdn ll pr

18 1006 10891896128 2lRedline of Ordinance Adoptina IFC 2015 w/ Local Amendne!1t5 (TatlcglalA!

Forma$cd: Not Expanded byl Condens€d by. Pattern:

Clear

Commented [u2l]: added



[88] TABLE 1020.1
CONRIOOR FINE.RESISTANCE RATING

OCCUPANCY
OCCUPANT

LOAD SENVED
BY CORHIOOF

REOUIRED FIBE.BESISTANCE
RATING (hours)

mthout
aFlntler ayatatn

Wl$ a!.tnlL.
ayatam'

-l. -2, ll-3 .\ ll Not Permltted I

I t-4. lt-5 Grcatcr than l0 Not Pcrmiltcd

A. l], 1,. lj, !r. S. t ' (ireater than J0 I 0

R Grcatcr 0un l0 Not Pcrmittcd 0.5

t,2.. t-4 A Nol l'ermrtled 0

I-t,I-l Alt Not Pcrmiflcd I

a. !'o( mquitemcoa fo. ocrup.Dcl€s ia Crcup l-2, i€c Scdiotre,lO72 rtd
407 3 of th. Intenatrcadl Building Cod..

b For a rcductioo in tha fre-rcaietalcc 6lint fr occuparEiB tt Group l-3,
sr€ S€cuon {oE.t ofthe Inknotidal BulldingCd4

c. BnrldrrlgJ Gquippcd throughoot wtth ,n outaiaic tptiaHer qs/f.ar ra

aenrdarcc *,ith Scaion 90l.l.l | fi 903.3 I 2 whcrc rllowcd.

d. For R occuoancics with Corridor lrn.nt I o..l meatr than l0 a ur

lira-rcsistdnc. r !itlgslull bs pcrnrittcd without sprinkler system.

(OrC, No, l712l,I)21 2010,ct}, I I 3{)ll)

lnternational Fire €ode, 2009 Edition, ehapter 22, Motor fuel Dispensing Faeilities and

ing
tle$citio+ir+i*app+epiate-pheer

REPAIR GAEICE, A ieine€r
repalring nrotor vehieles

M

Fo.matted: Font (Default) Trmes New Roman, 12 pt

Form.(ed: Fo.t lDefaultr T,mes New Rorar. l2 pt

Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

I

| 18,1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdoptinstFc20lsw/Localamendments{Title9.52)lAS



Fo.matted: Font (Default)Trm€5 New Roman, l2 pt

Commdr€d tu22l: Moved to9 s2.1oo.7sectio^
3206 6.1.4 Labeling accest doors

formatt€d: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

tormatted: Font: (Defaulr) Tirnes New Roman, 12 pt

Formattcd: Nomal, Right 004 , Dont adju( space
between Latin and Asian text Dont adiu( space

betwe€n Asian text and numbe6

Fonhatted: Font (Detault) Times New Roman, l2 pt
Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold, Expanded by 0.05 pt

Forma(€d: Font:(Defauh)Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formalled: Font {Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Not Hrghlight

Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

commented [u23]: Moved to9.52.100.2 seclion
3201 1 2App|cabilrtv, added

form.tted: I o.t. rDefaJlt I mes New Roman 12 pt

Forrn.tt€d: tonr (Defauli) T.me( NFw Roman 12 pr

commenled [u24: Moved to 9.52.100.6 Setion 3206.1.1
Fire Prot .tion,:dded.

Formaned: Ionr .Derdull, Trm"\ N"^ Rondn l/ pr

Formatted: Forr Defdu r Tr-e, \e^ DoF d1 2 pl

Formatted: Nolmal, luniJled lndent Left 0 07", Riqht

004 Don t adjust space between Latin and Asian text,
Don t adjust space betlveen Asian textand numbers

Formaned: Font (Detault) Trmes New Roman, 12 pt
Not Hiqhliqht

tormatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold, Elpanded by 005 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) T mes New Roman, 12 pt
sold

Formatted: Font (Oefault) Times New Roman, Bold

p.52.110 - Chapter 23, High-Pilcd Combustible Storage, amended..

Jnternational Fire Code, 2UOqlI!.iEdition, Chapter llllHigh-Piled Combustible Storage,
is hereby adepte+IlliIglin its entirety with the following amendments:

9.52.f'fe1g0.l Section 
'3e43291.3 

Water flow test data adjustmentJ added.
i*

hcrebfad&+Mlo*r
}}Mf2qli Water flow test data adjustment. The water flow test data shall be adjusted

by the system designL'r to account for daily and seasonal fluctuations, large simultanmus
industrial use, and future demand on the water supply system, or any other condition that
could affect the water supply. The fire protection system design shall be based on not more
than 90o% of the water flow test eapaii+d!.!q.

p.52.110,2 Sectlotr 33063206.6,l.4ilabeling access doors, added. }rr*ernatiena}Iire

l3e6l2!!,6.1.4 Labeling access doors. Fire department access doors shall comply with
200+2!ILIFC Section 509.1. Fire department access doors shall be plainly marked with the
words, "Fire Access DoorqF+e4+etter+ at least 6 inehei ( I52 mm) higlr on a-vrhile
trackgerrrtd

9,52.110.3 Seetion 13l I Erisling Buildingsr added. Iol€.national Fir€ eoCe, 200') Edition, .
Seetion 23 I I Existint Buildints; is hereby adCed to read as tbllows:

23.t+
$g$TIN€-BUII,DINGS

9.52.100.1 Scction J20l.l.l Purposc and Inlent added.

^ 23ll+.32011-l Purpos€ and intent. The City Council hereby finds, as a matter directly
aff'ecting public satlty, protection ofproperty, and the life safety ofpersonnel involved in
fire suppression activities, that all existing buildings used for high-piled combustible storage
must comply with IFC chapter:fl?, as amended.

9.52,100.2 Section 3201.1.2 Applirabilitr. addcd. .:

*1142QLL2 Applicabilltyr The provisions oflFC Chapter 3f12, as amended, shall
apply to all existing buildings used for high-piled combustible storage, on or after December
8. 1998, regardless ofthe datc ofconstruction or prior issuance ofa Certiticate of
Occupancy for that building.

g3tH329q!:1Flre protectio4 All existing buildings used for high-piled combustible
storage must comply with the fire protection systems requiremmts identified in IFC Table
2f0612!0.2 and the qEg[lnternational Building Code, 2{01)-Hr++o+(lBC), as amended.

9.52.100.3 Section 3201.1.3 EITective date. added.

| 18- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedline of ord inance Adoptins tFc 2015w/ tocal Am end me nts {Title 9.52)las



^--2+tHl29LLl Effective date. After thc elfectivc date, it shall be unlawful for any
person, firm, or corporation to use, or pennit the use, ofany building, structure, or Porlion
thoeoi for high-piled combustiblc storage which does not fully comply with the
requirements of IFC Chaptcr 212, as amended.

9.52.1 00.,1 Section -1 0l I added

lfter the eff'REtir'g da!g, iJ:shrll be unla\\l'Hl tilr an, personr ti.m, or cerpglatien:lg u!c, or

lll+.51!!L!!l Appeals. The owncr ofa buildirg or an owner's duly authorized agent

may appeal a dccision ofthe Fire Codc Ofllcial or the Building Ofiicial related to this

Section. All appeals shall be directed to the Construction Board ofAppeals, in accordance
with ChaptersZfqandJ&qaof the El Paso City Code.

p.52.1;!&!![- Chapter ]?59, Hazardous Materials-Ceneral Provisions,

omeudedAAgdgd..

Jntemational Fire Code, f0e+20015 Edition, Chapter 2750, Hazardous ['{+teFiaki

Gsrer+lM atcrials C cncra L Provisions, is hcrcb y .rdopted in its entirety \t rth thc lollowrnB
amendments:

9.52.91e!10.1 Section X70]5!0f.3.1.1 Records, amended. llrter€atioRo+ffiq
1U09 Ed'tioft See

^ 
?7859q3.3.1.1 Records, Any pcrson, finn, or corporation responsible for any

unauthorized discharge reponable under subsection X+15!Q1.3.1.5(a)0 shall maintcin
accurate records ofthe unauthorized discharge ofhazardous mate als including the date.

time, mateaial, and quantities. Such records shall be kept for at least three yeats ftom the

date of the unauthorized discharge, and shall be subject to inspection by the gre-ol#/lHl
upon request. Any person who knowinSly falsifies or destroys such records shall be in

violation ofthis Firc Code.

9.52.I+0!!!.2 Section ?7e3!!Q1.3.1.5 Response Expenses, emeEdedgddld'
International F*
al+lcrrd€d t(+rc+d-asdr}+o.#ri:

. 17!!03.3.1.5 Response Expenses. Any person or persons causing or responsible tbr an

abandonment or an unauthorized discharge or threatened unauthorized discharge of
hazardous materials resulting in emergency action, other than routine investigation by the

fire department, the department ofenvironmental services, or any other city department,

shall beiointly and severally liable to the city for its reasonably and necessarily incurred

expenses, as defined below, resulting from such emergency action. Hazardous materials

response expenses are defined as those non-reusable matqials and supplies which are

required for responding to hazardous materials emergmcies and which are actually

Formatted: Fonr:(Default) Tlmes New Roman, 12 pt

Not Highlght

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Form.tt€d: Normal, lndent Left. 007 , Right 0.04 ,

Don t adlust spa.e between Latin and Asian text. Don t
adjust space between tuian text and numbers

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

tormated: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Formalted:lo.l ,Defdu 
_ lr-e,\esRomdn 12pl

Formatt€d: tont (Defduhl Tim., NFw Ronan 12 pt

Fo.maried:ronr \Oeiault, lrme5 Ne* Dom"n '2 pl

Formatted: Font (Defaull)Ti.r'es New Roman 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Fonr: (Default) Tlmes New Ronran, Bo d

torm.lled: iont (Deraulr)Trme\ Ne, Roman l2 pt

Formatted:Fonr .DF{dulr, l,mes \e* Poman l2 pl

Formattcd: Font: (Defauh) Times New Roman, 12 pt
Bold

Formatted: Fonr .Oefdulr, Irmes New Roman l2 pl

Formatted: Font (Default) Ti,nes New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Forman€d: foni: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman 12 pt,

Bold

Eormatted: Font:(Defauh)Iimes New Roman, l2 pl

Formated: font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

tormatted: Font (Delault)Times New Roman 12 pt

Forma(ed: Eont (Defauh) T mes New Roman, 12 pt

Iormatted: lndent First liae: 0.2"

| 18 1005 10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceadootinFlFc2o1sw/LocalAmendments(Title952)lAs



expended in an emergency action. Hazardous materials response expenses are defined to
also include reusable response equipnrent which is required for responding to hazardous
materials emergencies and which is rendered non-reusable during an emergmcy action due
to damage other than by wear and tear. Hazardous materials response expenses shall include
all labor costs, to include but not be limited to overtime expmditures, necessary to mitigate
the emLrgency action. Hazardous materials responses are not considered to be routinc
firefighting services. Hazardous materials rcsponse expenses shall not include routine
firefighting services.

9.52.+;I0l!!.3 Section 37e,5901.3.1.6 Local repo idg requircments, added.
rlg+€q+rfe€teH+H5

hereb}.ad#teread.+s h'tlo*s-

2?e35!01.3.1.6 Local rcporting requiremenas. The fireolHAHJ shall be immediately
notified by the person. firm or corporation responsible when an unauthorized discharge
within the city limit boundaries or within the city's extra territorial j urisdictional boundaries,
becomes reportable under state, or federal laws or as follows:

a. Any unauthorized discharge ofa hazardous material which presents an endangerment to
public health. public welt'are. or the cnvironmcnt, or any unautho zed discharge ofa
flammable or combustible material which presents a fire hazard, or any unauthorized
dischargc of a hazardous material or exposure that results in an injury requiring transport to
an off-site medical facility.

b. The person who has care, custody or control ofproperty, materials or equipment shall
promptly notify the Hlli€i+IAHJ by calling 9l I irnrnediately upon discovery of an
unauthorized discharge ofany hazardous material reportable under subsection
2+O{0Q1.3.1.50(a) above. Inxnediate notification as required in this section shall be
perfomed p or to or concurently with necessary initial response actions, but under no
conditions shall notification be delayed unnecessarily. At the time ofnotification the
following information shall be provided:

1) What is the location ofthe incident?

2) Has ftere been a fire or explosion?

3) Is anyone sick or injured?

4) What is thechemicalname or idcntity ofany mate al involved in the release, ifknown?

5) Ifchemical name is unknown are any diamond shaped or other markings visible on the
vehicle or container? (colors/names/numbers/symbols)

6) What type ofvehicle or container is involved?

7) What is an estimate of the quantity ofmaterial that was released?

8) What was the time and duration ofthe release?

9) Is there any smoke or vapor cloud visible, audible sounds or unusual odor?

J 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdootinplrc2olsw/tocalAmendments{Title9.52)lAS



l0) The name and telephone number of the pc{son or persons to be contactd for
further information.

9.52.130!-!!.4 Scction g0659gOTransportation of Hazardous Materials, added,

$@d€d+rr+ea+d--klk
??ee500o
TRANSPORTATION OF HAZARDOUS NIATERIALS

2?e65006.1 Standing or parking. It is unlawful for a motor carrier or operator to
allow motor vehicles used to tmnsport hazardous materials to stand or park on any street,
alley or lot within the limits ofthe ei+e!!], except as provided for in accordance with
Section 340651q0.6.2 of this Etqcode-.un+es$tl1e#]iei+isslesn-peHnilalkrwi+g

beamesded-

p.52.13Q![- Chapter ]35!. Explosives and Fireworks, amcnded..

lnremational Fire Code. :$U+2QXLEdition, Chapter 950, Explosives and Fireworks, is
hereby adopt(+ratified,in its entirety with the following amendments:

BitioF_

330+5@!.1,3 Fireworks. Fireworks are declared to be a nuisance. No person shall
p€iisess-manufacture, s+()rersell-.Mlq or use fireworks within the eitfcl!4imits of El

Paso eFlvi
H€req+eFtzo+e-,axcept as provided in Sections 9-52.03001q++5. ( Reouircd operational

amcnded
ttorage at trlast si .

Exeeptas provi
is

@
Exception: The use offireworks for fireworks displays as allowed in Section ge85!QE.

9.52.13014),2 Sectior 330+5!0!.2.4 Financi.l responsibility.{mesde+. lntimati{raai
Fire €ode, 2009 Editiorh Se€tion 3101,2,4 Finaneial .es'ronsibility, is hereby amerded fti
rea4a+$sl+ervs.

3f,el5O0!.2.4 Financial respotrsibility. Before a permit is issued, as required by Section

3fe15601.2, the applicant shall file with thejurisdiction a corporate surety bond in the
principal sum of$1,000,000 or a public liability insurance policy for the same amount, for
the purpose of the payment ofall damages to pqsons or propetty which a se from, or are

Formattedr lndent Left 05"

formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman. 12 pt,

Bold

tormatted: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman, Bold

Formatted: ro.rr (Defauli l,oes Ne6 qomdn l2 pl

Formatted: Font (D"fdu'r Irmes New Ro-a1 2 pt

Forma[ed: Font] (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Fonr (Defaulr) Irmes New Roman. r2 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt

Foftnan€d: Font (Default) Times New Roman 12 pt
Bold

Formatted: Fon! (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

18 1006'1089 I 896128 2lRedline ofOrdinanceAdootinq IFC 2015w/ Localamendments (Title 9.52)laS



caused by, the conduct of any act authorized by the permit upon which any judicial
judgment results. The €€d+o$+i+lAtlJ is authorized to specify a greats or lesser amount

when, in his or her opinion, conditions at the location ofuse indicate a greater or lesser

amount is rcquired. Covemment entities shall be exempt from this bond requirement. The

ei+gtlshall be named as an additional insured on the insumnce policy or an additional
obligee under the corporate surety bond, at no cost to the ei+yclly. A bond required by this
section must be executed by a corpomte surety and approved by the €ire4fii€i+lAEJ. If
applicable, an insurancc policy shallbe written by an accredited insutance company under

the supervision ofthe Board oflnsurance ofthe state. Evidence ofcompliance with this
requirement shall be considered as having been met when the policy, a copy thermf, or a
certificate of insurance has been filed with and approved by the @!HJ. Such
polity shall include an endorsement that the FiI€€-fmAHJ shall be notificd at least thirty
(30) days in advance in the event the policy or policies are canceled.

9.52.130!!Q,3 Section 33O$!!!.2.4.3 lndemnity agreement' added. lctemational
Fire €lode, 2009 Edition, Se€tioo 3.lg l,?,1,3 lndemflity alreement, is heretty {ddedloJead

33O{!!!.2,4.3 Indemnity agreement. The applicant shall be required to enter into an

indernnity agreement with the City indernnirying the City and any ofits agents or
employees, for any personal injury, property damage or other civil liability whatsoever.

caused by an activity, condition or event arising out ofany act perfomed under the permit

The tire otleial sholl provide the appn+ved t-onr for this irrdemnity ogreement'

9.52.130!20.4 Section $e+5001 6.f lmmediate Notilication, added. lntematioaal
Fire €ode, 2009 Edithn, Seetion -l301 ,6' I Inrnrediate Notitication; is hereby added te read

$e+5601.6,1 lmmediate Notilication. ln case ofmechanical failure or traffic accident

involving any conveyance carrying explosives, the f,reotl+ialAUJ and the police
department shall be notified immediately.

9,52.130!20.5 Section $e+50q1.7.f Disposal of explosives, explosive materials or
fireworks, added.

$ef5!91.7.1 Disposal of explosives, explosive materials or firer orks' The City may

file a fuliatwith l@municipal CourtlQurlrequesting an Order of Disposal

and/or Destruction for explosives, explosive materials and/or fireworks pursuant to authority
ganted by the 20092oXllntemational Fire Code, Section 33{+I0Q1.7. Said Motion shall be

filed with a swom atldavit ofthe Fi{eetI€iCAE lstating the underlying circumstances of
the seizure and the City shall verify that the explosives, explosive materials and/or fireworks
are not being held as evidence to be used in any pending case. A hearing shall be held before
ajudge ofthe El Paso Municipal Court. Ajudge shall, as soon as practicable, hear the

matter, after giving reasonable notice to the @\Hf and the person whose

explosives, explosive materials and/or fireworks havebeen removed or impounded. The Etre

e*leialAHf and the person whose explosives, explosive materials and/or fireworks have

been removed or impounded shall each have the opportunity to present evidence and make

argument on their behalf. The formal rules ofevidence do not apply to a hea.ing under this

section.

I 18-1006-10891895128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinqlFc2015w/LocalAmendmentsfiitle9.S2)la5



Thejudge hearing the case shall make his or her ruling on the basis of a preponderance of
thc evidence presented at the hearing. lfthejudge finds that the explosives, explosive
materials and/or fireworks wcrc lawfully seized and that, at the time ofthe hearing, the
explosives, explosive materials and/or fircworks constitute materials or other items that
cannot be lawfully possessed. stored, handled or used in thejurisdictional limits ofthe
ei{yejry, thejudge shall glant the motion. The decision ofthejudge is final.

9.52.120.6 Scction 5608.2 I'crprit application, amcndcd.

5608.2 Permit applicalion.
Application for permits shall bc madc in writing to the AHJ at least l0 days in advance of
the date ofdisolav. Prior to issuinq pennits for a tlreworks disolav. plans lbr the
t'ircworks display. insocction ofthe display site and demonstrations ofthe display
oDerations shall be approved. A olan establishinq procedurei to follow and actions to be
taken in the event o[that a shell fails to iqnite or discharse liom a mortar or lails to
function over the f'allout arca or othcr malfunctions shall be orovided to the AHJ.

5608.2.-l Indoor displars.
Personncl shall bc pror ided to irnplcrnent r standbv tlre wllch ilcccntiblc k) (hc AllJ rl'
rrvrotechnics are used inside a buildinq.

9.52.f3012!,elscction 3302 Dcfinitions, amcnded. lntemational Fire Code. 2009
Edition. Scction ll02 Dctinitions, is hcrcby ainended to add thc follou,ing detlnitionsl

Bt,\S't ER'S 1,1( l!l*!E- ^, blar,ter's licenre ir tletlnetl as an inrtrunrent ir;uetl hJ

th+Ji+e++xir:o&i.++l autlr()n/ +lgjrt+ir+i*li+idra+;t$+4a3e++l+atlio i4- +*

ofth$.Hie!.i.-rero+ut+lrltrxrd+€$Lr$on:f r $.._tir+_*

FLAME EFFECTS- Flame effects means a device ofsolid, liquid, or gas,

dcsigned specifically to produce an open flame when ignited to display a thermal,
physical, visual, or audible phenomenon as defined in NFPA 160. Such devices include
paraffin wax candles, LP gas candles, torches, LP-gas bumers, and'sky lantem'O?e
flame illuminated aerial deviccs.^

0.S2-ll0J5ee+i,en .1-10.1.2.1 Ble s+ing +eee+ds.added, +Eteflr+ti€$nl++eQel009
k++t*}lr-Sd{$u gl+ Bk!!*rgfi*or(k ir.hercb,}+}*icd {e+ea+i}:+irl.l€,,v5:

Formatted: Font (Defa!lt) Times New Roman. l2 pt

Fo.matted: Normal, lndent Left 0

Formalr€d: Oefault Paragraph Font. Font color Auto

Formatred: Font:(Default)limes New Roman 12 pt

Commented [u25l: see definition u.d.r9 52.040.1
Sectron 202 General Oefi nitiont, .mend ed

Formatted: l-o.r Dp'aulr, lrm". Npr eorar '/ pr

torm.lt€d: Eolr rDelaultiTrme5 New Poman l2 pt

18-1006'10891896128 2lRedline of Ordinance Adoptins lFC 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAS

9.52.120.7 Scction 5608.2.-l lndoor displars. addcd.

9.52.120.8 Section 5609.1 Gcn(ral. amended.

560'9,I Getreral.
TenlDorarv storage ofconsumfi fireworks. 1.4G. is not allowed.



@
2 + revised €opy of the blasting plan eontaining aetuol date for the blasti

@
4, weether eonditions at the time qnd leeetion ofthe blasti if the blast is €ondueted

outM
5, Ground r ibratien o{ ai,blast r€eord& ifr€qBiredi whi€h shallin€lHCe the fellou ingl

a, Type of instrument. sensitiyit, and €alibration sigral or eertiti€ation ofannual
ealibeticn:

b, Exaet loeati(xr ofinstrument and the dEter time and distanee liom the blasti

c, Name of person anC finn tal(ing the reading as rvell as the peron aoalyzing dre soisnli€

'1#
r!-Tlleri+rratitxr ael#las1:]eYe] re€ofded

ex?+osiYee*i+hiF-theGi+

,\, Blasts under two (2) poEnCs of€xplosires in t6tal vieight per blasti or

B, Netnithstanding th€ loeati€n of develepeC properrr* $ithin the jurisdietienal area and

Fditioft Se€tion

i3e?+t*ostrier€+Mlasrifl - eperatiens sha+

within ore holf(y:) mile ofany permit beundaryr blastint operations shall be eondueted

9,51,130,9 Se€ti.on 3307,16 P€rmit r€quiredi added, lnrernation^l Fire €6de; 2009
ECitionr Seetion ll0a16 P€.mit.Euired, is hereby added to re6d as t'ellolvs:

p307.16 Pcrmlt requlrc4! ,\ blastint penni+ shall t e .€qui.€d fbr the use ef etplgli\ es er

rmewed upon oppli€

commented [u25]: see 105.6.49 Blasting operations
under 9.52.030,9 Section 105.6 R.quired oper.tion.l

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, l2 pt

Formaiied: Font (Default)Times New Roman 12 pt

18'1006-10891896128 2lRedline of Ordinance Adoptin8 lFC 2015 w/ LocalAmendmeltslTitle 9.52) IAS



L The permit fee set forth in AppenCix A Fee SeheCule b€lowi is submitted al€flg with the
appli€etiofl.&r renervah

?, The blastint aetivities at the st,$@
un€harg€di+€d

3, The applieant has eompliC with the requirernents ofthis Ghapter and €hapter 33 during
th€++€€eding+ea"

f,307.16,1 entoing Industriol Blasting 
^pplieants,

a, For all blasting pennit applieants seeking to eorduet oo^oing-industri+5ksti*g usir+$

l, Bhrts using under lw i

2, Blasts $'hi€h d6 net Btilize e blos{ helo eharge ioto a -eologi€ sfu€ture for the p{rrpos€

@
3' Blasts f'or whieh the maximum peak pertiele veleeity fer $ound vib+ation ifi inehes -'rr

oqus+io€.i

@
I , Name ef operator or o-erators €onduetiag the blasts;

2, ldentifieation o{ the antie:patod lo€ation er loeations 6fblasting a€tivities;

3, Deseription ofconCitionsi ifanyi whieh may eaus€ pgssible aCverse blasting efl'e€tsi

+- +vpe-slmatcrialte ;

@
6, Types ofexplesi\es anti€ipatC te be Esedi

]Mfoesl}-or-5teslniesr

@
b, \\tere approved by the fire otI€ialr ontoing inCust iol blesting appli€ants meeti€ the

Staadads.

3307.16,1 'tll Others 
^ll 

o$er blosting psrqit applieants shall submit the fsllo\yingl

@
@
+. +oeatisn sebla

18 1006 10891896128 2lRedline of Ordinance Adootinq IFC 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAS



5, eepy ef lrlSH,l €ertifieate efTrainint (Fenn 5000 2l) fbr allpersonnel involved in the
d€i+i€gaf,Abksting-operatiof,i

6, eopy of Insuran€e €ertifieate ot Blartitrg tiability €oterage,

The 6ode ellieial may reqHire aCCitional inlormatiofl,

9,51.130,10 Seetion 3307,17 Applieotior ti'edr 6dded, International Fire€ode, 2009
Edition; Seetion 3307,17 

^pplieotion 
filed, is hereby edded +o resd as t'ello$si

3

tles as required, lermits ti,r blastint shollbe granted by the eode offieial if he finds drat tlre

9,52,139,11 Seetien 330?,18 Addition.l lndcmnity r€qEircdr odded, Int€rnational
Fire €ode; 2009 ECition, Se€tien 3lg7,l8 ,lCCiti€nal lndemnity required, is hereby aCded k)

3307,18 Addi{ionol Indemnity reqEir€d, Tho -.esron or*orrpa€y+y-*hom-a}hs{er i5

^.51,130,1f S€€ti
Fire eode; 2009 Edi
readas{sue,*+

339?,l9 Bto

rf,a+roo

@irements for the issLanee of a

li€ense, An appli€ant t'or a blaster's li€ense shall:

Hresen+?€siri+€id +ili€e+iosr

2, Be fing€rprint€d by the police d€partrrent:

| 18 1oo5 10891895128 2lRedlane ofordinance Adootina tFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAs



3, Shet\ pr€ofthat the appli€ant has n€t been eenvieted efa erime inlelying moml
turpitude, This requirellrer+may be lraiYed by the fire oftl€ial er the €enstsuetion Board of
A,pp€al:i

-gea$]€a5{{r,vent]tsoB€Jeaf5 €€q

5, Be in adEuate physieal and nlental eonditien te perform the \rork requireC;

6, Be abl€ to understand ard give rritten and 6ral dire€tions in the Entlish langBagei

?,Netbeaddie'@i
8, Be qHalified by reasen oftrainingi knsryleCge and experience in the field ef

transporting; storing. handling an+ule of exFlosive materials;

9, Hale a n'erlcint knowledte of federal; sete and loeal laws and regulatiefls penainint te
e*fl€si+€'$a{€Fials+and

Ie, Have no re\ oledi st speMed or terfnin^tedli€e+je orhave io+,-suspeEsio+or
temination on appea
i'lvolvint blasfing aetirities pending in a federali state or mHnieipal eeurt of lar,

3307,19,1 Failu{e to Pa6$ Ifan applieant t'sr a blas{ing-lieense f+ils to pass the .€qui.ed
examiiatienr he sh

330?,19,1 tieense fee, ,\ fee in aeeerdan€e $'ith nppendix nr Fee S€hedule efthis €ode
i€e6se

ret'undabl€, Th€ appli€ant must renerv the li€ense rithin thirty da, s ef the date ef e*piratien
suel

lieense shall fsrnish proof that an eitht hour reliesher €ourse involving the use ofexplosires

3307,19,3 .\pplieabilit) of ti€ense, ,\ li€ense issued under this ehapter shallr€rnilin in

ieeRse-is

rerte*'ed should the pe

reei€nn iation;

330?,19 I tieense Tronsfer Prohibited. No license shall be re assitned o. transf'erred.

JJ07,19,5 Blester's ti€ense Susp€nsion aod R.\'oeotien, nll lieenses approled under
this aniele are eonditiened en all rverk being perf'enned in faithful and striet eomplianee
with the terms ofall t'ederal and state la$'s; pennitsi pertinent retulationsr ordilaflees o{id

norp+er@

| 18- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedline ofordinance Adoptins lFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52) lAs



3307,195 Notie€ of susp.nsion and r€roeotion, The fire ofli€ial may s.uspend a blaster's
li€ense or Bennit for any yielati(,n ef the €enditions 'et forth io subse€tion 3307,l9 ofthis

ful.ly pr€paidi addressed to tlrc lasf knorvn address efthe pers€n te lvhom tll€ iotiee is sent,

330?,19,? teg.l Romi{lcotions.The use ofe*plosives regulated by this ehapter during

misderneflnor and punished as provided in the eity €ode,

3307,19,8 Reoppli€etion, I person *'hose blaster's lieense hEs been re\oked may eot

3307,19,9 Hesring, ,\t any hearing €endueted pursuant to this se€+io6.1he+eipoAdeBl
lllatl have the rig
tatenlents.a'Id argu

prcptmaeranee-o++he-eUder+e

330?.19,10 nppeal 
^ 

person $'llose lieense or pennit has been suspended or revoked or
whose appli€atien fbr a license o{ pe{mit has been denied may appeal to the eonstru€titxr

}'€aI1l.ni1d.{l€(#

9,51,139,13 Seeti

3307,10 Pre blost Surrcy, Suue€t ts the cxceptions as set forth in Seetioos 4307, 16, I (b)
-nd flg3,2,lr a pre

33o?,:e.l Notifie&tion. Tlre oryner er residmts efsueh builCings must be conta€teC by
letter at least sixty days bel'ere the stan 6fblastingr notif''ing them of the Fre blast survey

independent professional erlgine€. lieensed in the stote ofTexas and eapable ofeonduetint a

megraloreosmetie

330?,f,0,3 Written Rsport, ,\ nT itlen rep€rt ef $e sun'ey shall be sigrod by the person

I 18- 1006,10891896128 2lRedline of ordinance Adootinx lFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52llAs



qgeiei

r€pr€dlt#lre-$rrv€j1

@Fna+iel]at+k€@0+Ediri€li.

i5

approvali a written Blast Plan lvith all pertinent data to inelude the t'ollo\,!ing:

t- gateand+ine

-2=-+yfe-of€r(p Yes{o'berise4

3, Tetal peunds 6fexplosi\es t6 be used fer eaeh blosti

1- Diagrarn showing nurltrer oiholes anC typieal hole load:

5, Eurden, spaeing, depth and diarneter ofholes and sternming used:

-#]r+.i+-rl+d+#-e+ea+Si€i+lplaf,i

?, Te€hnieal da{n a d l\laterial Satet,'Data Sheets tbrall explosives used;

8, Fire sequenee diagrarft delay sequenee and mqximunr .oof,dgperSelayi

9, Blast loeation and distan€e sfblast tiem any strueture(s) 6f€en€emi and

+eJeismogapFdata-

The eontracter shall als€ submit a Blast Planr fer approlaL any time he plans te mal@a

ete

\\here the fire e{ficial eanr .* his diseretieni allorv the eentraeter te mal(e eertairi€hanges
r ithout submittint a.lether proposal, The €onfiaetor must horerer +!ste any eh+nte5i

i+i€fl.

3307

istas€e,

9.51.130,16 Seeaion 3307,13 Stemming meteri.li edded, lnternational Fire eode,
.009 Edirion; Secri

| 18 1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinptFc2ol5w/tocalAmendments(Title9.52llAs



330?.23 Stemming material. erushed rock (not pea lravel) shall be used tirr sternrrinB

@
l+oledia, Roeiesize

f+1leles lllr$B+]s

2rr 3r;;1lm+es

4.:-+etes 5./8..!!

5ffi

Edition, Se€tion 3307,21 ReliefTrenehesi is hereby added to rBd as tbllows:

-3
'he fire 6ffieial ean re

^t least 2 feet belr'ir
rvithi.+

treneh is 5 f'eet (reHnd olfto the ne*rest l'e(,t),

9.52.130.18 se€tion J307,15 Erplssive storig€ ot blost siteq sdded. Intema{.ional Fire

as Sollo$qi:

-330?-:+E*plosiy€'st6rege ot blasl sit€s, ,tll explosives must be stored in aeeordan€e
nith FeCerali Sate and teeal la$s and all matazines must be inspeeted and app{ov€d by

the fire oftieiali and no more than a one ( I ) day supply ofexplosives shall be stored on the
ir-

€perati€Rs{+e-6rueiig'

lrrternational Fire €ode; 2009 Edition; Seetion 330?,26 En'ironmental Perf'o.manee

@
339?.16 Environmental Performonee Stondsrd$ [Subieet to the exeeJ*io+s{et-Ld}-i$

$rbseetion33e?-+6+(b}e++his€eceJ

33+H5,+'Ale*flo*ito$sg-ted +@
moniter ea€h blas

Fo.mrtted: Eont (Default) Tlmes New Roman. 12 pt

18 1006 10891896128 2 R€dline ofOrdinance AdoptinE IFC 2015 w/ LocalAm€ndments (Title 9.52)lAS



that \yill re€srd any event efa reeerdable magnitudei os longas they meet the fellolving
€ri+eria-

l, Three seismie and o6e aeoustie €hannek

2, Seleetable seismie and eeoEsti€ trigger leyels:

3. ,\nalyze veloeityr a€celerationi displaeemenl and resultanti

1, N{easure beth linear and n ryeighteC seundi

-5Joirrehe+soun4r€eording+actei

-6--S€l€€+abf€-maximui+{€€ordiag-fa€gq

--:;7.-*€sPeflse2---3(}}h€*+zi

@sp;
9-€SMIUSBM-€ha"sfrii

+g- +ejestabMr*a+ion=

'30?,36,2 Sehmog
rhort reeort as eart ofa
seismographs te re€or

B07,f6J Video. T
efnobri shell be netod Y

penaai€ff{+€€ord.of{ho$16{+

eri+eri€'

l, Whenever there is €lereleped Fropeftr- r ithin one half mile of an) beHndary of s
permitted area; the maxinrurn peak partiele veleeifr'; as measured by seismegraphie

RI lt507 t y D,E, Sisl

S'pe€{FJl3r@iu*wPl
2, Whene\er there is no deyeloped preperty r ithin 6ne holf mile efaofbounda.y of the

@
$/=tD.w

18- 1006- 1089 I 896128 2lRedline ofordinenceAdoptins IFC 2015 w/ LocalAmendments (Title 9.52)lAs



Where "W" - the maxirnum rveights ef explesives; ir peunds; Where "D' the distanee; in

eguatte-7esl+b,

3, Vibratien tirnits, Blasting vibrations ean eause "thresheld" damage te residential

frEueney range a 0,5 ineh per seeend maximum partiele veloe ity; at tlre strueture; is

i€n

pres€n+ing a Response SpeeF

reeo*€iv€n-to{heS+e-ef#

3307.36.6 Air blast levels. Efferts sheuld be rnade te keep airblast levels te ene hundrC

a miereehene in the

@

Maxle+e+-in{B

+++egeea*

+S3dBeeak

+:9dB?eak

+Osdg"€ak

.* Gnh *-hen qprovet{ [r,t' t]re ll+t of Ee tal.

9.52.130.20 Section 3308.2 Permit application, amended. lnternational Fire Code,
2009 Edition, Sectron 3308.2 Permit application, is hereby amended to read as follows:

3308.2 Permit application. Application tbr permits shall be made in writing to the fire
official atleast l0daysinadvanceof thedateof display. Priortoissuingpermitsfor
fireworks display, plans fbr the display, inspections of the display site, and demonstrations
ofthe display operations shall be approved..

9.52.130.21 Section 3308.2.3 lndoor displays, added. Intcmational Fire Code, 2(XX)

Edition, Section 3308.2.3 Indoor displays, is hcrcby added to read as fbllows:

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Commented [u27]: see 9.52.120.5 section 5508.2 Permit
application, amended.

5608.2 Pemit application
Application for pemits shall be made in writing ro the AHJ
at least l0 days in advance ofthc date ofdisplay. Prior to
issuing pemits for a fircworks display, plam for the
fireworks disptay, iropcction ofthe display site and
demorutmtiorc ofthe display opemtiom shall be apprcved.
A plan establishing procedms to follow and actiom lo be

taken in the eveil ofthat a shell fails to ignite or discharge
frcm a mrtar or fails to function over the fallout area or
other malfunctions shall be provided to the AHJ.

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinslFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



3308.2.3 lndoor displays. lfpyruechnics are uscd insidc a buildinS, the building rnust
contain a complete opcrational firc-sprinklcr systcm or provide personnel to implcnlcnt a

standby fire watch acccptable to the tlrc otlicial. 
^

9.52.130.22 Section lf0g Temporary Storage of Consumcr Firc Works, dclctcd.
lnternational Fire Code. 2009 Edition. Section Jl09 Temporary Skrrage ofConsumer Firlj
Works, is hereby deleted in its entiretl,.,

9.52.t3{l!l!.23 lScction 3-110 sq!.lllFIamc Elfccts, added. lntemational Firc Code,
lll{}q1q!t Edition. Section iX+llilll F lame Etlccts. is hercby addcd to read as firllorvs:

33IO FLANIE EFFECTS

*lg5!1q.1 Ceneral. The use offlamc elfects for entertainment, exhibition,
demonstration, or simulation must comply with NFPA 160. Flamc efltcts usjns LP qas

candlei and bumers must complv with the NFPA 160 edilion in use by the Texas Railroad
Cornmisrion.

*f056-19,2 Permit application, Prior to issuing permits for flame effects, plans for the
exhibition, inspections ofthe exhibition site, and demonstrations ofthe flame effects shall be
approved by the €€de-tl{fieilrJA[I.

commenred [u28]: see 9.52.120.7 Se.tion s608.2.3
lndoor displays, added.

5608.2.3 Indoo! displays.
PemMelshallbe prcvided ro implement a stmdby fiR
warch acccptablctothe AllJ il pyrct.chnics are 6ed iNide a

buildLrS.

Formatted: Fonl:(Def.ult)Tlmes New Roman, l2 pt

formatted: Font (Default) Tlmes New Roman, 12 pt

Co,nmented [u29]: see 9 52.120I section s60e 1

Temporary storage of.onsumer firework!, 1.4G is not

Formatt€d: Font (D€fault) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Eont (Default)T mes New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Delault) T mes New Roman 12 pt
33$56!q.3 Indoor use.

Personnel shall bc rrrovided to irnrrlcrnent a standby fire watch acceptable to thc AHJ if
technics are used insidc a build

tire-sprinkler systenr or proride personnel to irnplement a standb, fire \r'ateh a€eeptahle to
the li+e+ode offieial-

3+1e5!!!,4 Financial Responsibility. Before a pemit is issued lbr any flame effects
exhibition, the applicant must provide evidence offinancial responsibility as set forth in
section ?Bg+5601.2.4.

3+t050I!.5 Texas Flame EIIects operator's license required. At least one Texas Flame
Effects licgnsec must be present on-site at all times wherc flame effects are used,
discharged, or ignited.

p.52.f,l$!lll- Chapter ll5Z. Flammal,le and Combustible Liquids, amended..

Jnternational Fire Code, }$+l)llEdition, Chapter ll5l, Flammable and Combustible
Liquids, is hereby aCopted-ratilied in its entirety with the following amendments:

9.52.+4013!.1 Section 34e55?05.3.8.2 Location on property, exception added,
i..n

#l+Cded+e+eede++b

3. Mobile fueling dispensing activities shallnot be conducted within 30 feet e!l4-$]rxl of
buildings, building openings, combustible materials, lot Iines, public alleys or public ways.

Formatted: Font: (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt
Bold

Eorlnatted: Font:(Defau 0 Tirnes New Roman, Bo d

Formatted: Eo D"td . r _'- 
" l\p. Po d1 ' pr

18-1006'10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdootinplFC2015w/LocalAmendmentslTitle9.52) AS



9.52.+4e!J0.2 Section 34O65f00.1.2 Restricted Locationq added. lnt€Hra+i(}+al-E{t

{a}to*ri

+,1065290.1.2 Restricted Locations. lt is unlawful for any individual, firm, parmership or
corporation within the ei+Cjl]|limits, to install, enlarge or operate a bulk oil station,
refinery, or distilling plant, except when such places conform in location and construction
and maintain distances and safeguards as hereinafter specified. All storage ofoils and
gasoline in Classes I and II for the purpose ofrefining. or distilling orjobbing, or
wholesaling, and handled by motor vehicles for delivery, must be installed within the below
specified districts, as hereatler designated.

9.52.149!!q.3 Section f,$65290.1.3 Designated Districts, added. ll1temati()l}a}+Le

So+orr+s.

34065200.1,3 Designated Districts. The districts in which relineries, wholesale oil
stations, or bulk stations may be located are described as follows:

l. Beqinning at the intersection ofTexaco Road and the north Iine of Southcm
Pacific Railroad tracks: thence westerly aIons the railroad tmcks to the east line of
Clark Road. thence nonh alonq the east line ofclark Road to the south line of
Welch Avenue: thcncc castcrly alonq thc south linc of Welch Avenue to the south
line ofTampa Avenuei thence east alons the south line ofTampa Avenue to the
west line ofthe Westem Refininq South Plant: thence nonherlv alone thc welit
line of Westem Refininq South Plant to the west line ofthc Westem Refinine
North Plant: thence northerlv alone the west line ofthe western Rcfininq North
Plant to the south line ofGatewav Boulevard East: thencc easterlv alonq thc south
line ofGatewav Boulevard East to thc east linc of Airwav Boulcvard: thqncc
northerlv alone rhe east line of Airwav Boulevard to the south line of viscounl
Boulevard: lhence easterlv alone the south line of Viscount Boulevard to thc cast
line of the Trans Mountain Oil Co.: thence southerly alonq the east linc of thc
Trans Mountain Oil Co. to the north li e ofCatewav Boulevard Weit: thencc
westerlv alone the north line ofCateway Boulevard weit to the east line of
Airwav Boulevard: thence south along the east line ofAirwav Boulcvard to thc
south line ofGatewav Boulevard East: thence easterlv alonq Cateway Boulevard
East to the east line of Hawkins Roadi thence southerlv alone the east linc of
Hawkins Road to the east line of Freeoort-Ny'cMorani thencc southerlv alone thc
east line ofFreeport-McMoran to the south line of Freeport-McMoranl thencc
westerly alone the south line of Frecpon-McMomn to thc cast line of Westem
Refininq North spur fiack: thcncc southcrlv along thc east line ofthe spur track to
the north line ofSouthern Pacific Railroad trackl thence westerly alone the north
line ofSouthern Pacific Railroad tracks to the point ofbesinnins to includc
Westem Refinins South Plant. wqitem Refinins North Plant. Trans Mountain Oil
Co.. Navaio Oil and all propertv contained within the boundary specified in this
section.

18 1006 10891896128 2lRedline of Ordinance Ado inc lFc 2015 u tocalAmendments {Iitle 9.52llAs



2. Beginning at thc intqscction ofthe centerline of Lafayette Drive and the
centerline of San Paulo D ve westerly to the east side of Lot 7. Block 28; thence
northerlv to the south line of Lot l. Block 39; then easterly to the centerline of
Latayette Drive; thcnce southcrly to the Doint ofbeginning. to include the
MuniciDal Service Center

3. Beginning at a Doint nlarked by the intersectbn ofthe centerline ofBeech
Street and the northerlv risht-ot'-wav line ()1 Boeing Drive; thence weiterly along
the centerline ofthe Boeing Drive seDaration median to a Doint on the east iine of
Lot 24. Block 4. El Paso lntemational Airport Tracts; thon no(herly along the

21 BI k4
wide service taxiway; thence westerly alonq the south edce oithe taxiway to a
point oDDosite the easterly line ofLot I Block 4- El Paso Intemational Aimort
Tracts. cxtcndcd: thencc southwesterlv to and alons thc said eastcrly linc of Lol
lO Rld.l .{ ln h twentv-five t'eet northerlv ofthe north
right-ofl.way line of Boeing Drive; thence northwesterly rrerpendicular to the

B k4 1

I0. Block 4; thence westerlv rc a distance oftwo hundrc{ scventv-five tlet to a

Doint lvinq seventv-five lect north ofthe northcrly ritht-of"wav linc ofBoeinp
Drive and bcine within Lot 9. Block 4. El Paso Intcmational Airport Tractsl
thcncc northcrlv throuqh thc rlrnaindcr of Lot 9. Blfijk 4. and throueh Lot 8.
Block 4. to a Doint beinp the crly comcr of Lot 6. Block 4. El Paso
Intemational Airport Tracts: thence northeasterlv across Lot 5. Block 4. to a point
beins the northeastcrlv comer ofLot 4. Block 4. El Paso Intemational Airoort
Tractsi thence northeasterlv throuqh the aDoroximate ccnters of Lots I and 2.

Block 4. El Paso Intemational Airport Tracts to a point lying in the nonheasterly
riqht-of-trav line ofNorthrup Road: thence northwesterlv alone the riqht-of-wav
line ofNonhruo Road to a point in the southerly rieht-ol'-wav line ofAmerican
Drive: thfice northeastcrlv alonq the southerlv right-of-wav line ofAmerican
Drive to a ooint in thc southwestcrlv rieht-of-wav line ofConvair Road: thence
southeasterlv alons the risht-of-wav line ofConvair Road and alone an extcnsion
ot said line fbr a total distancc ofseven hundred tect to a point: thence
perpendicular to the abovc linc northeasterlv a total distance oftwo hundred tif'tv
t'eet to a point: thence perpendicular to the above line northwesterlv to a point: the
point beinq an intersection ofthis line with the northerlv riehFof-way line of
Convair Road extended: thence wqiterlv alonq the northerlv risht-of'-wav line of
Convair Road extendcd to an intersection with a line beine an extension of the
east line oiTaxiwal|"A"i thence north alone said extension of the east line of
Taxiway "A" to a point beins on the southeasterlv line ofRunwav 4-221 thence
northeasterlv along the southeasterly Iine of Runwav 4-22 to an intersection with
the south line ofthe Runwav 8-26 (left) stopwav: thcn casterlv alone said south
line of the Runwav 8-26 (left) storrwav to an intersection with the easterlv line of
Taxiwav "M" thence southeasterlv alone the easterlv line ofTaxiwav "M" to an
intersection with the north line of Militarv Careo Aproni then easterlv alone the
north line ofthc Militarv Carso Aoron and alone an cxtension olsaid line fbr a

distance ofapproximatcly one thousand one hundrcd tifty l'eet to a Doint; thence

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedline of Ord ina nce Adootinc lFc 2015 w/ tocalamendments lTitle 9.52llAs



northcastcrly parallcl to thc northerly Droperty line ofBlock 17. El Paso
lnternational Aimon Tracts lbr a distance ofaDproximately one thousand eishl
hundred t'eet to a ooint: thence easterly to a point lying in the extended easterly
rrroDcrty linc ol'Lot I'1, Block 17. El Paso Intemational Aimort Tracts. the Doint
also beinq one hundred twenty-five feet north of thc northwcst comcr olthc Lot
8. Block l7: thence southerlv to a rroint beinq the northlvcstcrly conrcr of Lrx 9.
Block l7 (FAA Tower Site): thence wes terly to a point bcins thc midDoinl of thc
east line of Lot 6 and the west line of Lot 7. Block 17. El Paso Intemational
Airport lraq]s; thq[ceJouthwcst.aly on a linc intcrsecting the midl)oints of thc lot
lines throush Lots 6. 5. 4 and 3 ancl the line extcnded straight across Lots I and 2

rh

westerly along the northerly right-of-way line ofBocirs Drivc to the pbint ol
beginning; all ofwhich has befi laid out and markcd on thc Dlat entitled "El Paso
lnternational Aimort Wholesalc Casoline and Fuel District" and datsl ADril I l.
t968.

4. A Dortion of Lots 7 and 13- Block l7- EI Paso Intemational Aimort Tracts. Units
9. El Paso Countv. Texas. beinq more particularlv described by metes and bounds
as lollows to witl liom a point. said ooint beinq the common southerlv corner of
Lots 6 and 7. Block I7. El Paso Intemational Airoon Tracts. Unit 9. the point also
lvine in the northerly risht-of-way line ofShuttle Columbia Drive: thence alone
thc northerlv rieht-of-wav lien ofShutle Columbia Drive 30.00 t'eet alons the arc
ofa curve to the riqht. whose cenfial ansle is l" I l'00" whose radius is 540.12 feet
and whose chord bears North 69'43'3 l" East a distance of 30.0 | feet to a rroint.
said point lvine on the northerlv rishFof-wav line of Shuttle Columbia Drive. said
point also beine the point ofbeeinninei thence No(h 2 | 

o5l'59" west a distance
of264.79 feet: thence North 8l'10'07" East a distance of402.14 t'eeti thence
South 8o49'53" East a distance of250.00 feet to a poini. the point lvine on the
northerlv nshl:oErdallirElllshrqlllg Columbia Drivq thencc South 8 l'10'07"
Wcst continuins alone the northerlv riqht-of-wav linc olShuttlc Columbia Dri\c
a distance of250.00 feetlfulrce continuing along thc northcrly right-oi.way line
ofShuttlc Columbia Drive 92.87 fect alone thc arc ofa curve to thc lcft, whose
c!'ntral anglc is 9'51'06" whosc radius is 540.12 I'cet and whose chord bcars South
76'14'34" Wcst a distance of92.76 tbct to thc point ofbeginning and containing
in all 2.148 acres ofland, morc or less, to include Chewon Oil Products.

i i1q6,!a,t Beg d the €enterline ef
Road southerl,'l ivc
t'eet in a straight line; thenee northerly to the €enterline of DBrazn+nreruei thenee $est€rly

r'106,1,3,3 Beeinn
Paeifie RailroaC traeksi{henee rvesterly along the railr€sd troeks to the east line of €larl(

thenee easlerl) al€ng the south line of Weleh AyenBe to th€ s€Hth line efTampa AreflBei
thenee east along the soEth lien ofTampa  v€nue to the west l.i6e ot'tl}e West€an Ret-ring
'outh llant: thene
rvest line oftlre Westem Refiniflt N€rth Plant: then€e no.t\€.I]'along the \1ax line€fth€

Formatted: Font:(Default)Times New Roman 12 pt

18 1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinslFC2015w/LocalAmendmentslTitle9.52)lAs



Westem Refining North Plant t€ the seuth line ofGateway Beulerard Easti then€e easterl,
llong the rosth lirred G eas{fiRe ef+iF#ay-E€Ceva

@ aleng the north line sf €ateeay
Boulerard West te the east line of ,\ir*'ay Boule\ardi then€e s6uth al€nt the east line of

line o[ Hanl(ins R6ad te the ast line ef Phelps D6Cge Retinery; then€e seutherly olont the

lt'esterly aleng the s6uth line of Phelps Dodge Retlnery ts tlre east lin€ 6f Westem Retlning

couthem Pa€itle Rai
RailreaC tra€ks to
Refining North lla ifl
tl1e],€ul1l,so,speei+]#irs€€tion

?106,t+3 Beginnin

kl the
loutherly to the poi

1106,1,3,'l Beeinni
-nd the northerly rig

line of tot I q Bkek 1r to a point lying ofle hundr€d t\yent]' five t'e€t nertherly of the north
ri tlr€
^eross tot l0r Bloe

no{th of the northerly right 6f way +ine of Beeing Drive and being \l'ithin tet 9r Bk}€k li El

^nd through tot B, B
laso lntemational ,\irporl Traets: thenec oortheas{€rly{.'ross Lot t BHe4Je-a?t)rrit

northeasterly through the aBBroximate €enters of t6ts I and 2! gleel( 1r El Pase
Intemational ,\irport Traets to a soint+iegj$+he-no*h{5s{€rly-figh+€ryise-€f
Northrup Roadi thenee northE'esterly along the right of say line of NsrtkBp R6sd to a

@along theright of \\,a,' line of €onvair ReaC and

I U-1006'10891896128 2lRedline ofOrdinanceAdoptinc IFC 2015 w/ tocalAmendments lTitle 9.52)lAS



-lont said extensi
line of Rsn*'ay 1 22; thenee northeasterly altxrg the seutheasterly line ef Runn'ay I 22 te an

Ta*i$ ay "M" thenee southeasterly along the easterl) line ef To,(iway "N'I" to an intersstien
with the north lifle ofN4ilitary €arto Ap-oni thm easterly along $e n6rth line ef the
Militar) eargo 

^pron 
and aloflg an eJrten*i@

.tpproxinmtely e
the extended easterly property line eft€t 8i Bloek l7i El Paso International 

^iq,ort 
T.a€ti

Blo€k1++Ie$€€{er*lrer+te+lpei@

ef tray line ofBoein

Apri+l--+96&

1106,1,3,5 
^ 

portio its
9; El Paso €ounB; Texas; beint rnore partieularly deieri\ed+y nrtes-an4bosf,d€-a{i{oll€rv.i

l7r El laso lntemationEl Airport Troets; Unit 9; th€ point also lyin€ in thenertherl, right ef
way line ef€enturion Drite: then€e alont the no.therly right of way li€n of€e{lkrri€n Drivc
10,00 f'e€t along the H$
is 510,12 feet and wh

Fsint' said point I

North S l' l g'gT" Easl o distonee of l02, l l feet: tlenee South S' 19'53" East a distanee of
450,00 f'eet to a poin
thcnce Eouth 81"10'07" We6t eontinuing aleng the nertherly ritht €f $ay line ofeenrurioo
nrive a distan€e of25

9'51'06" ryhs'e radius is 510,12 l'eet and nhese eherd bears South ?6" l'l'l4lr#es+-a

more or less, to inelude €h€vron gil Pr€duets,

9.52.+,10110.4 Section 3.1965700.5.4.5 Commercial, irdustrial, governmental or
manufacturing, amended. Intemational Firc €odei f{l0q Editienr Se€tir l106,5,1,5

| 18 1006,1089 | 896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoorinstFC2Ol5w/tocelAmendments(Title9.52llAS



€ornrnereial; industrial, governrnental or rranufheturingr paragraphs l; 2; and 6; are hereby
amende4+erea<I as$elle++;:

34e65706.5,4.5 Commercial, industrial, governmental or manufacturing.

l. Dispensing shall occur only at sites that have been permitted to conduct mobile
refueling as per IFC section 105.6, as amended by 9.52.030.1J-fof this €sdeCfuplgI

2. The representative of a mobile fueling operation shall provide to the jurisdiction a

written response plan which demonstrates readiness to respond to a fuel spill and carry out
appropriate mitigation measures, and describes the process to dispose properly of
contaminated materials.

6. Mobile fueling operations shall not take place within 30 feet of buildings, property lines
or combustible storage.

9.52.140!30.5 Section 34065700.50. l.ll-lSwitch loading, exception added.
la&€x€€ptr€n-{.

@
Exception: Switch loading is permitted when all precautions and practices are met in
accordance with API, RP 2003 - 1998 Protection Against lgnitions Arising out of Static,
Lightning, and Stray Currents.

9.52.f40!30.6 Section 34065700.6.1.3 Vehicle motor shutdown, exception added.

Exception: Tank vehicles where the operator carries and can utilize a remote emergency
shut-off device which, when activated, immediately causes flow of fuel from the tank
vehicle to cease.

p.s2. 
^

9.5A,lq0.l Adoptien

9.51.150.3 €enfliet with €iq' Cede+ In the event ef eenfliet betrveen any erdinanee;

9,52,150 €hapter 38, tiquefied Petrelenrn Gas shall eontrel,

W

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinelFC2015w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52llAS



formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt

9sJ6ryr Rqferynged Standar@. Formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt

Formatt€d: Font (Default)Times New Roman

Formatted: Font (Default)Times New Roman, 12 pt@
9,51,169,1 S€€tion APIr RP t{0J-999S}++d€€tioo 

^goid.t+*itionr*+isiFg-er*efctoti€r tightirl i+ioFr

Stra:- ('rrrrcrrt:i, iri herch! arnen€lc€i t(' re (l ' idl$\+!i

.tectiffi 3.106.5. 1 . 1 I is added to the " Relerenecd in code s€€'+i,oB+rHn$€+!1;

toftl-)l+}H.Bi+.ll._]+l+1}r-€I+-l.l=]1r+ )

9.52.170 - Appendix A, Board of Appeals, deleted and replaced with new Appendix A. 
^

Jntemational Fire Code, 2009 Edition, Appendix A, Board ofAppeals is deleted in its
entircty and replaced with Appendix A, Fee Schedule, to read as follows:.

Appendix +N
FEE SCHEDULE

Formatted: tont (Defauh) Iime! New Roman

ro.matted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

commented tu30l: Moved tos s2 22oappendix N Fee

Formatted: Font (Default) T mes New Roman 12 pt

Formatted: Fontr (Default) Times N€w Roman, 12 pr

tormatted: lon' rDefdultr T,mes Ne$ Roman 12 pt

Al0l License Fees.

A+ef\!!!.f The Fire€llieialAH.l is authorized to charge a separate fec for each license
and pennit required by this EjIqcode in the amount identified in the adopted budget
resolution for dre cunent fiscal year or othcr appropriately adopred resolution by the City
Council. When hourly rates are specified in the budget rcsolution or other appropriately
adopted resolution by the City Council, the minimum charge shall be as specified in the
resolution. There shall be no reduction in the hourly rate bas<d on sewices performed taking
less than the full hour.

Within the ordinance, budget resolution, application forms, and adopted IFC and
amendments, the term license may be also identified by and interchanged with the term
permit.

A]{+N]lll,2 Hazardous Materials.

A. When a license for hazardous materials is required by Intemational Fire Code Section
105.6, as amended by 9.52.030.H-trthis e{}d€elap!q. for a facility, the owner or operator
ofsuch facility shall pay a license fee as identified in the adopted budget resolution for the
current fiscal year or other appropriately adopted resolution by the City Council.

B. Temporary Workplaces: When a hazardous materials license is issued for a facility,
such location may have temporary workplaces at locations outside ofthe facility for which
the license was issued, provided that such temporary workplaces are listed on the chemical
description sheet submitted with the license application or on other forms designed by rhe

| 181006 10891896128 2lRedline ofOrdinanceAdootinF tFC 2015 w/ local Amendments iTitte 9.52)lAS



Fire Department. Licensees shall submit to the El Paso Firc Department any changes in the
location oftsmporary workplaces and receive approval ofsuch changes by the El Paso Fire
Department prior to using such tcmporary workplaces. To qualily as a temporary workplace:
the location shall have fewer than twenty-five reportable chemicals and shall be staffed less
than twenty hours a weck. Additional licenses shall not bc required for temporary
workplaces.

.+l{}N102 Reinspcction fees. For any re-inspection rcquired because the facility and/or
fire system failed to comply with this ltqcode or because the work was not ready tbr the
inspcction as requested: or the request is for a partial inspection, partial acceptance and/or
phase inspection, a fee shall be in an amount identified in the adopted budget resolution for
the current fiscal year or other appropriately adopted resolution by the City Council.
Inspections conducted by fire fighting companies requiring a Fire Inspector follow-up shall
be assessed a re-inspection fee in an amount identified in the adopted budget resolution for
the cunent fiscal year or other appropriately adopted resolution by the City Council.

++elN]!Unvestigation/Inspection fccs. For any investigation or inspection which is not
a part ofa regular license or permit program, whether during regular duty hours or at a time
other than regular duty hours, the fee shall bc identified in the adopted budget resolution for
the current fiscal year or other appropriately adopted rcsolution by the City Council. Said fee
may be in addition to any other required t'ees.

A{e4!]!!Fire Watch/St&ndby. The @!Ul. as d€fined in the IFC, shall have
authority to require a fire-watch, as defined by the section 202 IFC. Fire watch personnel
shall bc referred to as fire guards, and shall comply with NFPA 601, Standard for Security
Services in Fire Loss Prevention. If El Paso Fire Department peBonnel function as fire
guards, whether during regular duty hours or other than regular duty hours, a fee shall be
assessed in an amount identified in thc adopted budget resolution or other appropriately
adopted resolution by the City Council for the current fiscal year. Fire guards shall not be
assigned to other duties that will interfere with thei, fire watch function.

++0tNMsite Assessments,t{on-regulatory Inspections. Inspections that are outside the
regulation ofthe International Fire Code or an ordinance ofthe City ofEl Paso, and are not
initiated by the El Paso Firs Department, shall be assessed a fee as specified in the adopted
budget resolution for the current fiscal year or other appropriately adopted resolution by the
City Council. Such inspections include those requested in order to comply with an
applicable governmcnt regulation, or which are solely for the purpose ofconsulting or pre-
construction guidance. Home fire safety inspections shall be offered without charge.

*+06N!0ocommercial Safety Training. Cornrnercial tbr-profit entities requesting fire
saf'ety training to comply with applicable govemment regulation shall be assessed a fee as

specified in the adopted budget resolution or other appropriately adopted resolution by the
City Council for the cunent fiscal year.

.4$+N 107 Fire Protection Systems. A f'ee shall be assessed in an amount identified in the
adopted budget resolution for the cufient fiscal year or other appropriately adopted
resolution by the City Council for the plan review and a separate fee shall be assessed for all
fire protection systems initial acceptance tests/site inspections exclusive to El Paso Fire

18- 1006'1089 I 896128 2lRedlineofOrdinaflceAdootinFtFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendments(Titte9.52)lAS



Department review. Fire protection systems failing inspection, in whole or in part, shallbe
assessed a re-inspection fee in an amount identified in the adopted budSet resolution for the
curcnt tlscal year or other appropriatcly adopted resolution by the City Council.

*t0$N-!!&Building Permit Fire Finals. Fire final inspections for building permits shall
be assessed a fee in an amount identified in the adopted budget resolution for the currcnt
fiscal year or other appropriately adopted resolution by the City Council.

AI{+N]!1Expeditcd Services Fees. A fee shall be assessed for expcditcd inspectrons,
customized plan review, and plans reviewed by appointment upon rcquest in an anrount
identified in the adopted budget resolution fbr the current fiscal year or other appropriately
adopted resolution by the City Council. Such services shall be subject to availability and the
approval of the Fi+e€llici+l{S.1.

p.52.180 - Appendix B, Fire-Flow Requirements For Buildings, adopted and amendcd..

Jntemational Fir€ Code, 2{ie+20!LEdition, Appendix B, Fire-Flow Requirements For
Buildings, is hereby adopted in its cntirety with rhe following amendments: .

9.52.fSO150.1 Scction 8105.{Fire-Flo$ requirements for prilatc firc hydrants.
addcd. l+ersn+ior*l l: trc C{rd!.:1)orl+@}eB{rJ$r
p+i+a1!]li+esr.rnL. irleety+dde+tr++ead+x te]lr*:+:

Bl05.3tFire-Flow requirements for private fire hldrants. The minilnum rcquircd Firc
Flow fbr private tlre hydrants shall be 1000 gallons pcr minutc t!flr+){+}rr+++rrlry rhrrnttrlr}.

9.52.+8e!91.2 Section 8105.4!Fire-Flow data, added. lE+cr*s+ie€+l+ire4odqJ009

Bl05.,l-1Fire-Flow d!ta. The water flow test data shall only be valid ifthe required data is
obtained within threel!9lrears from the date plans are submitted to the tire€€d€
rl{{,eidAHJ.

W
P.52,f4U!@- Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, lqhglgbladopted
and amended..

.
DisfribHtionr is hereb, adopteC in i6 eiltiret) \vit$ th€ tbllowirc arnendments:

9.52.140!.60.1 Section C104.2 Eristitrg privite fire hydrrnts, added. liteFiati€r}el
Fire eode, 2009 ECition, Se€ti6n € lg'1,2 Existing pril,ate fir€ hydrant$ is he{€b} add€d to
read as fbllo*s.

C104.2 Existing privste {ire hydrants. Existing private fire hydrants on adjacent propmies
shallnot be considered available.

formatted: tontr (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt
Bold

Formatted: lont (DeIault, T,mes New Roran 12 pt

Formatted: Eont (Deldultr T m". N.s Romdn l/ pr

Formatted: Font (Default)Tlmes New Roman

Formatted: Font:(Default)Trmes New Roman, l2 pt

Colnn€ntcd fu3ll: Moved to9.52.1so-App.ndir 8, Fir.-
rbw Requ ircm€nt! for Euildingr, ir hereby adopt€d and

formatted: Fontr (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Forr (Dpfau'r)Trme< New poman. l/ pr

Formatted: Font:(Default)Times New Roman. l2 pt,

Bold

rormatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman, Bold

formatted: Font (Default) Times New Roman l2 pt

I 18- 1006,1089 I 896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdoptinptFc2ol5w/tocalAmendments{Title9.52)las



9.52.+95!60.2 Section Cl05.l Hydrant spacing, amended. Iat*natiena++*e€ode

Cl05.l Minimum number of hydrant requirements. The minimumpumber of hydrants
required shall be determined by the fire-flow^reguirements referenced in Table Cl05.l, as

amended. The requirements regarding the average spacing between hydrants and the
maximum distance from any point on sreet or road liontage to a hydrant are found in IFC
Chapter 5 Fire Service Features and Appendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to accept a deficiency ofup to l0 percent
where existing fire hydrants provide all or a portion ofthe required fire hydrant service.

9.52.{+0!60.3 Table Cl05.l Number and distribution of fire hydrants, amended.

tyerants; ir ner*

TABLE CI05.I - NUNIBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS

FIRE-FLOw REQUIREMENT (gpm) MINIMUM NUMBER OF HYDRANTS

I,7OO OR LESS

2,000 
-2,250

2,500

3,000

3,500 - 4,000

4,500 - 5,000

5,500

6,000

6,500 - 7,000

7.500 or more

for SI: I foot = 304.8 mm, I gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m.

2

)

3

4

5

6

6

7

Formatted: Font: (Defaulo Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, l2 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12

Formatted: Left

Formatted Table

Formatted: Left

Formatted: Left

Formatted: Left

Formatted: Left

Fo.matted: Left

Formatted: Left

Formatted: Left

Formatted: Left

Formatted: Left

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

8 or more'

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinslFC2olsw/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



a. Reduce by 100 for dead-end streets or roads.

b. W}ere streets are provided with median dividers which cannot be crossed by fire fighters
pulling hose lines, or whe.e arterial streets are provided with four or more traffic lanes and have
a traffic count ofmore than 10,000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on
each side ofthe street and be ananged on a altemating basis up to a fire-flow requirement of
7,000 gallons per minute and 400 t'eet for higher fire-flow requirements.

c. Whcrc new water mains are extendcd along streets where hydrants are not needed tbr
protection ofstructures or similar fire problems, fire hydrants shallbe provided at spacing not to
excecd I,000 feet to provide for transportation hazards.

d. Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

e. One hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per rninute or fiaction thereot'.

p.52.?0+!Zq- Appendix D, Fire Apparatus Access Roads, !$SIgUladoptcd and amcnded.^

Jnternational Fire Code, 2e0+?.(UlEdition, Appendix D, Fire Apparatus Access Roads, is
hereby adeptec-14lllg{in its entirety with the following amendments:

9.52.170.1 Section Dl0l.2 Roadwars qovcrncd bv Subdivision Ordinancc. added.

Dl03.l,l Access road lensth !tith a hydrant.
Wherc a fire hydrant is locatcd on a tlre arrparatus acceis road, thr: rninimurn goad ler4$r
shall be ,+0 tcct with the tirlj hvdrant locatcd on ccnter

9.52,1?0.4 Section Dl0J.l.l,l Access road with hrdrant access curbs. added.

Dl03.l.l.l Accers ro4d lrith hydr4rtaeecllclrrh9.

Formatted: Font: (Default)Tlmes New Roman. 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Fontr (Default)Iimes New Roman, Bold

Formatted: Font (Default) Iimes New Ronran, l2 pt

Formatted: lndent Flrst llne 0l

Forman€d: Font {Default)-limes New Roman, 12 pl

Dl0l,2 Roadwavs soverned bv Subdivision Ordinance.
Fire aoparatus access roads within subdilisions shall be as orescribed in the Subdilision

, 
Ordinance of the Citv of El Paso. Texas.

9.52.?00!29.1 Section D103,1 Access road width with a hydrant, amendcd,
Intemational Fire€ode;2009 Editionr Seetion D l0J,l ,\eeess road rridth rrith a hydrsrt; is
hereby a$ended+o+ead as

Dl03.l Access road width t ith a hydrrot. where a fire hydrant is located on a fire
apparatus access road, the minimum road width shallbe 28 feet (8534-mn+)gqluiyqqt'
shoulders. See Figure D103. I

9.52.170.3 Section Dl03.l.l Access rosd lcnsth with. hvdrant. added.

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedline ofordinance AdoptinF tFc 2015 w/ LocalAmendments lTitle 9.52)lAs



Hydrant access curbs are to be painted red and be conspicuously and legibly marked with
the warning "FIRE LANE-TOW AWAY ZONE" in white letters at least three inchcs
tall with a one-half inch stroke.

9.52.170.5 Section Dl0-j.l.l,l.l Access road rrithout hvdrant acccss curbs. added.

Dl03.l.l.l.l Access road without hvdrant access curbs.
If no curb is provided. a red stripe a minimum of 6 inches shall be painted on the
pavement and be conspicuouslv and legiblv marked with the wamine "FIRE LANE-
TOW AWAY ZONE" in white letters at least three inches tall with a one-half inch
stroke.

9.53,300.3 fiture D

^

8A
2t

Formatted: Font (Defauh) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Normal

TIrlt
8qt

:,i1"
EIGI]NEImE^rf,xrnrr

..{t-'
'E\l I,

"1tri
*-h l.*-' 

-l l-.-- I
I

'rqr{larc alrrJrlS

9.52.200Y0.03 Section D103.2 Grade, amended.ffi
eaitien; Seetien B l

D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads shall not exceed I I percent in grade.

Exception: Grades steeper than I I percent as approved by the fire chief, but not to exceed
15 percent.

9.52,?/Nn0.+Lsection D103.4 Dead ends, amended. ffi
Fditien; Seetion D

D103.4 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of250 feet (76.2 m)
shall be provided with width and turnaround-provisions in accordance with Table 103.4.

Commented [u32]: lmage removed

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

I 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinplFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



9.52.200.5 Table $14!2LE Requircments For Dead-Edd Fire Apparatus Access
Roads, amended. +literna+iona$ifljfue-:{$9+diioBrTable 103.4 Requirements For
Dead-End Fire Apparatus Access Roads, is hereby amended to rcad as follows:

Length (t'eet) Width (fteo Tumarounds rcquircd

0-250 20 None required

60 fect "T cul-de-sac". 60 feet "Y" or 90 feet diameter cul-
de-sac in accordance with Figure D I03.1

251 300 20

301 600' See

Note I

Over 600' See

Note I

20
90 feet diameter cul-de-sac in accordance with Figure

D103.I

Specialapproval
required

Special approval required

J'lote 1 - Intermcdiate turnarounds will bc required, spaced at a maximum distance of600' apart. Formatted: Font: (Default) Iimes New Roman, 12 pt

9.52.3005!l!! Section Dl0f.5 Fire apparatus access road gates, paragraph #1,
amended.
gate..?araFFh+@krrcaC as lblle.",rs-

l. The minimum gate width shall be 20 feet or ifa median or guard post are present, two
adjacent gates shall be allowed, the minimum width ofeach adjacent gate shall not be Iess

than l3 feet. The portion(s) reduced to ll +&glwidth shall not exceed 20 feet in length.

9.52.200170.+10 Section D103.6 Signs, amend€d. lst€mati{r}al+i}e@{}09
Edition; Se€tion D 10J,6 Signs; is hereby.HnendeC t6 read as tbllolvs:

D103.6 Signs and markings. Where required by the Mf,ei+lAHJ, Iire apparatus.
access roads shall be marked, at the expense ofthe owner. with permanent NO PARKINC
AT ANY TIME-FIRE LANE signs. Such signs shall be ofstandard size, color, lettering
and mounting complying with El Paso City Code, Title 19, Subdivision Ordinance -Design Standards for Construction. Placement offire lane signage shall meet the followinS:

l. One sign shallbe posted at each end ofan official fire lane. Each sign shall have a

single head arrow showing the appropriate direction ofthe fire lane.

2. A fire lane longer than 100 fi&q. shall have intermediate signs posted at even intervals.
lntermediate signs shall have a double headed anow indicating the fire lane is continuous.
The intermediate signs may be posted as necessary, but in no case shall the interval between
fire lane signs be greater than I00 ft.

Formarted: lndent First line: 02

18 1006 10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdiltanceAdoptinslFC20lSw/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



3. The fire lane sign shall be securely fastened to a suitable pole or support with a
minimum vertical clearance above the sidewalk of 7 fit'eel.

4. Whcn poles are used to mount lire lane signs they shall be placed 2 f{t'ect .6 inchesir+
behind the facc ofthc curb- In accordance with the El Paso City Code, Title l2 - Vehicles
and Traftic, no pole or obstruction may be placed within 5 t+&E. of a fire hydrant.

5. Fire lane signs shall be posted parallel to the lane or curb to which they apply

6. Wll-n the distance bctween the curb and a building. Iighr6{adddrdDq!9 or other structurc
is 8 *!q. or less, the iire lane signs may be posted on the face ofthe building, light
stan#pqbor other structure. The bottom of the sign shallbe located 7 &&9!. above the
adjacent sidewalk.

7-When required by the f,rc€*ieiirl{flf, the owner shall also cause curbs orfla.lernef,Fto be-
painted red and be conspicuously and legibly marked with the waming "FIRE LANE-
TOW AWAY ZONE" in white letters at least three inches tal I with a one-halfinch stroke. at
intervals not excecding 50 fcct- a red a InlnllllulT) inch
wide shall be painted on thc Davcmcnt and bc conspicuouslv and lcgiblv marked with the
warninq "FIRE LANE TOW AWAY ZONE" in white letters al least 3 inches tall with a
one-halfinch strokc, at intervals not exceeding 50 f'eet

!-lt is unlawful for any person, without lawful authority, to remove any signs designating a

fire lane. lt shall be unlauftl for any person to place, maintain or display any unauthorized
fire lane, or use the color red for the marking ofa no parking zone that purports to be,
imitates or resembles o{ficial signage or marking ofa fire lane.

9.52.Iee!2q.8 Figure D103,6 Fire Lane Sigtrs! ameoded. lq{ema+io+alMq
"00i1 Fdition; FiguFe D

Formatied: lndent: Left: 03'

Formatted: Font (Default)T mes New Roman, l2 pt

I 18 1006- 1089 | 896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinslFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendmentslTitleg.52)lAS



3
Field Code Changed

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinqlFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS

Formatted: Font (Deldult) Times New Roman l2 pt



Fhure D103.6
FLe Lene Si6nr Enmple 1: Fire lane'lntermediatC Slgn

.f u.6a'

rl

Emmple 2: Fire tane Tnd'Sigtt

'a.,--!Err!-Effia frtr

Eramfle 3: Fire L.ne t.d'SBI

rc

.ftltIl, r

,rx,,

4 G

Sr fthltia: r]nE llt-ffirir.m (}Arc-OBin St-rh.drtor frnfrirdm
SGCtid 7-24

9.52.2QiDru..D9 Section D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 26 feet in width, amended.
International Fire 6ede; 2009 Edition, Seetion De I 3,6, I Reads 20 to 26 t'eet in n'iCth; is

@

Commented [u33]: Note below Figure now states;

See Title 19-Subdivision and Oevelopment Plats, Article 2,

Subdivislon Standards

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 ptPARKING

AIAMTIIv{E

FIRE -
TOWAWAYZOxl: ;

N

I

:IJ

NYTIME

TIRE

IANE -di}
:tlu l$11 /lnri

AT I

Iqsn*lYIlr t

ATANYTN,IT

TtRT

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceAdoptinslFC2Ol5w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS

I

n
Li

ll

il
,Ji

il

NO

.t

0



;+isien

@
9.53,100,10 Seetien D103,6,3 Reade merethan 25feeti+wi{rth;{t!!gn4g4tlltglnatienal

eire eoae; lOOq Edit
arne+de4+e+ea4+v$[,sws :

D I 03. 6.{Roads les+thongp..1q 2 8 feet in width.

fire apparatus access roads less than or up to28 feet wide (SSmfshall be posted on both
sides as a fire lane.

9.52.300,1+10.13 Section Dl03.6.ll Roads more than lS!ffeet in width,

Df 03.6.{Roads more than 28 feet in width. Fire apparatus access roads more than 28

feet wide (&Sm)*and less than 36feet wide tl$shall be posted on one side of the road as

a fire lane.

9.52.?/l{J"12170.14 Section D103.6.43 Responsibility, added. lnten+ational€i+e€eCe

D103.6.43 Responsibility. The owner or his represantative of a building which is adjacent
to the fire lane shall be responsible for maintaining the fire lane and ensuring that the fire
lane free is clear of obsffuctions. It is unlawful to park any vehicle other than an authorized
emergency vehicle in any fire lane. Unauthorized vehicles parked in designated fire lanes

that block fire department or other emergency vehicle access may be towed to a designated
storage facility by the authority of the ti.reeedee$eial=AFL

9.52.2e+.y0153 Section D103.6.5{Records, added. @
eaitien; Seetien Btgl
D103.6.54. Records. The o{ficial records ofthe designation and location ofany such fire
lanes shall be kept by the *ireef*iei*lAHl. The Sreet$eialAHJ may require the property
owner to submit site plans for determining and recording fire lanes on the property.

9.52.2e+.1]qlf4 Section D103.7 Enforcemen! added. @
eaition; Seetion P

D103.7 Enforcement. The tireeode-e**.eiaAHJl is empowered to enforce all fire lane
violations when a designated fire lane is properly identified by signs, painted curbs, painted
pavement, and or by combination thereof.

Formatted: Font; (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt

| 18-1006-10891896128 2lRedlineofordinanceAdootinslFc2ol5w/LocalAmendments(Title9.52)lAS



Dl07,l One or tu o-fonrily dwelling resklentiel developments. Developm€nts 6fene or
F,ue*rnily drelli+gs where the nunlber ofdwelling units exe€eds 130 shall be provided
rlith separate and apprcved flre@
S*:tie+D104.*

E*ecptien+

l, The number of drvelling un its en + siflgle fire e.pa€grs-e€€€ss-.€al#lnot+e
ioereeseC unless fire apparatus a€6e!s _€ads *ill eonne€t rvith futuredevelopm€nts; a5

Cet€fisrn€d+y+hc+odc-o$i€+al

p.52.21fl![- Appendix E, Haz.rd Categories, adopted.^

Jntemational Fire Code, 20+)9?Q!LEdition, Appendix E, Hazard Categories, is hereby
a(]{?te+ratified iFjt$i*iretyand adoptcd in its entirety.

W
p.52.}}+l2q- Appendix F, Hazard Ranking, adopted..

Jnternational Fire Code, 2oo+?qllEdition, Appendix F, Hazard Ranking, is hereby adopted
ratitled and adopted in its entirety.

W
p,52.13+?9q- Appendix G, Cryogenic Fluids-Weight and Volume Equivalent\ adopted..

Jntemational Fire Code, 2oo+A)llEdition, Appendix C, Cryogenic Fluids-Weight and
Volume Equivalents, is hereby ratifled and adopted in its entirety.

(Ord-}ltl=*?-al+9-2-l-20}1l-e#-}-|.3+++ )

p,52.l,l+A1q- Appendir I, Fire Protection Systems-Noncompliant Cooditions, adopted..

Jnternational Fire Code. 200+2qXLEdition, Appendix l, Fire Protection Systems-
Noncompliant Conditions, is hereby ratified and adopted in its entirety.

(ec-+{c-l+t23.+}+-3++q-e$-}_l?o+!

rorm8tted: Font (Defauh) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Font {Default)Times New Roman, Bold

Form.[ed: ,ont (Defau r) ftre! \ei Roman 2 pt

formatted: lont LDefaLlt) .rfe{ Nes Roma.. 12 pr

Bold

Formatted: Font {Oefault) Times New Roman, Bold

Formarred: I ont (De'auit, Irmes New Roman 2 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pl
Eold

Formatted: Font (Delault) Times New Roman, Bold

Formatted: ronr Dpjdu" lrlp, \.r aon o1 pl

Formatted: Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt,

Bold

Formatted: Font (Oefault) Times New Roman, Bold

Formatted:ro1r Dprdu' lrn.,\.roorol - pl

18 1006'1089 | 896128 2lRedlineofOrdinanceadootinElFc2015w/LocalAmendments(Titleg-52llAS



Page 1: [1] Formatted user 7/31/2019 9:59:00 AM

Font: (Default) Times New Roman, 12 pt, Bold


