CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM DEPARTMENT HEAD’S SUMMARY FORM

DEPARTMENT: Parks and Recreation Department
AGENDA DATE: December 1, 2015
CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Tracy Novak, Parks and Recreation Director, 212-1708

Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, 212-1181
DISTRICT (S) AFFECTED:

STRATEGIC GOAL 3: Promote the Visual Image of El Paso.

SUBJECT:
The City of El Paso Parks & Recreation Department is recommending award to Mayfield Pool Supply, LP,
Third Gen, LLC dba Triple S Janitorial Supplies, and D. Gilmore Dist. Co. dba Sun City Pool Supply in
Solicitation 2016-261 Pool Chemicals estimated annual award is $112,339.63. The total (3) year estimated
award is $337,018.89, with an additional (2) year option to extend, $224,679.26 (2 years), estimated total
of award $561,698.15 (5 years).

We did not receive bids for items #15, 16, 19, 20, 21 and 24

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSION:

The Parks and Recreation Department is recommending the award of Solicitation 2016-261 Pool
Chemicals Mayfield Pool Supply, LP, Third Gen, LLC dba Triple S Janitorial Supplies, and D. Gilmore
Dist. Co. dba Sun City Pool Supply. This contract will provide Pool Chemicals for Parks and Recreation.
Proper chemical levels in the pools are critical to maintaining public health and safety. This purchase will
ensure that state and City codes are met and that proper and safe chemical levels are maintained.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on October 13, 2015. The solicitation was posted on the City website on
October 13, 2015 and the email (Purmail) notification was sent out on October 13, 2015. Total of twenty
bidders with sixteen local vendors were solicited and six bids were received with five being a local vendor.

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

The City of El Paso awarded a contract to 2013-083 (Pool Chemicals) On March 12, 2013 to Baron
Chemical Company, Environmental Compliance Resources, LLC, Leslie’s Poolmart, Inc., Mayfield Pool
Supply, LP, Triple-S Janitorial Supplies, and W.M. Smith & Assoc. Inc. dba WMS Aquatics for an initial
term estimated award of $227,924.04 (3 years).

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Department: Parks and Recreation Department
Annual Estimated Amount: $112,339.63

Initial Term Estimated Award: $337,018.89 (3 Years)

Total Estimated Amount: $561,698.15 (5 years)

Accounts: 451-51240-531260-1000-P5108
Fund Source Name: General Fund

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:
N/A

DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Name | Signature Date

PSS FORM 001, Rev.0, 11/3/14 Previous Additions Obsolete
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POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW*

COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(LOW BID)

Please place the following item on the REGULAR agenda for the Council Meeting of DECEMBER

1, 2015.

STRATEGIC GOAL 8: Nurture and Promote a Healthy, Sustainable Community

The award of Solicitation No 2016-261 Pool Chemicals to Mayfield Pool Supply, LP, Third Gen,
LLC dba Triple S Janitorial Supplies, and D. Gilmore Dist. Co. dba Sun City Pool Supply for an
initial term estimated award of $337,018.89 (3 years,) with an additional (2) year option to extend,
$224,679.26. The total estimated award of $561,698.15 (5 years). The initial performance period is
December 1, 2015, through November 30, 2018.

Department:
Award to: (Vendor #1)
Item(s):

Initial Term:
Option to Extend:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:
Award to: (Vendor #2)
Item(s):

Initial Term:
Option to Extend:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:
- Award to: (Vendor #3)
Item(s):

Initial Term:
Option to Extend:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Award:

Annual Estimated Amount:

Initial Term Estimated Award:

Total Estimated Amount:
Account No.:

Funding Source:
District(s):

2016-261 Pool Chemicals

Parks and Recreation

Mayfield Pool Supply, LP
El Paso, TX

6-9, 12-14, 22 and 23.

3 years

2 years

$63,735.90 (3 years)
$106,225.15 (5 years)

Third Gen, LLC dba Triple S Janitorial Supplies
El Paso, TX

1,2,10,17, 18 and 25.

3 years

2 years

$263,668.80 (3 years)

$439,448.00 (5 years)

D. Gilmore Dist. Co. dba Sun City Pool Supply
El Paso, TX

3-5and 11

3 years

2 years

$9,615.00 (3 years)

$16,025.00 (5 years)

$112,339.63
$337,018.89 (3 Years)
$561,698.15 (5 years)

451-51240-531260-1000-P5108
General Fund
All

DATE: 11/23/2015



This is a Low Bid, supplies contract.

The cost under this requirements contract is only an estimated minimum value. The actual cost
of this contract may be higher or lower than the total estimated minimum value and will be the
sum total at the end of the contract term, so long as increased funds are appropriated in the
budget.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing Department and Parks and Recreation Department
recommend award as indicated to Mayfield Pool Supply, LP, Third Gen, LLC dba Triple S
Janitorial Supplies, and D. Gilmore Dist. Co. dba Sun City Pool Supply, the bidders offering the
lowest responsive and responsible bids.

""""" * R ****ADDITIONAL INFO BELOW



Bl Paso

CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION FORM Ty

2010
Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

Project Name: POGL CHEMICALS
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

D. GILMORE DISTRIBUTING INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY
COMPANY, INC. dba SUN CITY POOL SERVICES, INC.
SUPPLY EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL | ANNUAL 3YR ANNUAL 3.YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF | QUANTITY | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO, MEASURE B) TOTAL TOTAL (B) TOTAL TOTAL
(A) (AxB=C) {C x 3 YRS) (AxB=C) (Cx 3 YRS)
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLETS W/STABILIZER ,
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR OUTDOOR POOLS 50 50 160 150 £87.49 $13,123.50 $39,370.50 $97.50 $14,625.00 $43,875.00
1. LB. Brand: CLEAR VIEW FBS/PAIL
QPL BRAND: v OMNI PRO GUARDS
- STOCK # ’ - ' OMNI 50# ' ~ 21785BPG
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR |
AND CUTBOOR POOLS 15 15 275 328 $68.00 $22,100.00 $66,300.00 $68.45 $22%246,25 $66,738.75
2. GAL.JCARBOY BRAND: NJA GA”%ARBO
QPL BRAND: TRANSGHEM UNIVAR
STOCK # ' ACID 15 279540
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL . .
POOLS 50 LB. BAG BRAND: N/A 50 70 160 $23.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $23.45 $2,345.00 $7,035.00
3. LBSIBAG .
QPL BRAND: v MISC - ARM & HAMMER
STOCK # ' - 200788 144-55-8
SOD¥UM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER .
CHLORINE LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH 50 2 4 $60.00 $240.00 $720.00 $77.10 $308.40 $925.20
4. | ONE (50) LB CONTAINERS BRAND: N/A | [ 5s/BAG »
QPL BRAND: } _ _ MISC & EGG ECO USA
STOCK # - 200829 INTO2E
LIGHT SODA B. ’ : e
TSORA ASHN§§LB BAG BRAND 50 2 5 $21.00 $105.00 $315.00 $23.35 $116.75 $350.25
5. LBSIBAG
QPL BRAND: , ‘ o MISC _  TRONOX
STOCK # ' 497-19-8

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation s for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Mﬁ«m 1T

DATE: _ 2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS « PARKS RECREATION e



Ll Paso

CITY OF ELPASO et
vt BID TABULATION FORM Wy’
& : 2010
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS Solicitation #: 2016-261
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
D. GILMORE DISTRIBUTING INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY
COMPANY, INC. dba SUN CITY POOL SERVICES, INC,
SUPPLY EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3YR ANNUAL 3YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF | QUANTITY _ | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED [ UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
MEASURE (8) TOTAL TOTAL (B) TOTAL TOTAL
{A) {(AxB=C) (C x 3 YRS) {AxB=C) {C x'3 YRS)
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY
CHLORINE) FOR ALL OUTDOOR POOLS 100 5 7 $127.00 $889.00 $2,667.00 $241.18 $1,688.26 $5,064.78
6. 100-LB. PAIL BRAND: N/A LBS/PAIL
QPL BRAND: B ‘ PPG , _ , UNIVAR
STOCK # o ' ' 635070
C;ﬁ%if? 3.? gg%?;"gg;afgifg L 1 1 3 $7.00 $21.00 $63.00 NO BID NO BID NG BID
7. ' : QT BOTTLE
QPL BRAND: _ CLEARVIEW
STOCK # 200764
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL .
POOLS 1 GAL. Brand: AQUA PURE ‘ 1 80 150 $57.10 $8,565.00 $25,695.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. GALLON
QPL BRAND: AQUAPURE
STOCK # ' ’ ‘ 300002
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS 1000 , ; -
. ) oy ) 1000 20 35 $40.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
g, | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE s ven g
* X
GPL BRAND: : LAMOTTE
STOCK # 0 ~ DPD#
PHENOL RED, PH, TEST TARLETS 1000 .
X 1000 20 35 $40.00 $1,400.00 $4,260.00 NO BID NQO BID NO BID
40, | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE | 0y crope
* BOX
QPL BRAND: B LAMOTTE
STOCK # ' ’ ' DPD #2
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
\

%
APPROVED BY: %}
i
SO
DATE: { {2 2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS ~ PARKS RECREATION 2




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El' Paso

h l ‘ ' li’
2000
Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

D. GILMORE DISTRIBUTING INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY
COMPANY, INC. dba SUN CITY POOL SERVICES, INC.
SUPPLY EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3YR ANNUAL 3-YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF | ¢ QUANTITY. || UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE MIN MAX {B} TOTAL TOTAL (B} TOTAL TOTAL
(A) (AxB=C) | (Cx3YRS) (AxB=C) {Cx 3YRS)
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST, (
TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 1000 8 14 $40.00 $560.00 $1,680.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11. BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLETS Pes
QPL BRAND: LAMOTTE
STOCK # DPD#3
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL
ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 _ . :
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED Basis)| 1000 1 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12. BRAND: LAMOTTE A,
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
CA HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS,
‘ TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX| 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13, BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLETS PR
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
CYA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS
1000 TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 LAMOTTE TABLETS PER
) BOX,
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE,
TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PERBOX| 1000 4 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15, BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLEYS pe
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #

NOTE: The information cgntained in this bid tabuiation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract:

-APPROVED BY:

DATE: X izi}v § (i’;

2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO ]
BID TABULATION FORM Wy

2000

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS Solicitation #: 2016-261

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 ] Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

D. GILMORE DiSTRlBUTiNG INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY:
. COMPANY,_%NC. dba SUN CITY POOL SERVICES; INC.
' SUPPLY EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3-¥R AMNUAL 3-YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF |« QUANTITY _| UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. ' MEASURE MIN MAX (B} TOTAL. TOTAL (B) TOTAL TOTAL
(A) (AxB=C) | (Cx3YRS) (AxB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, PH, TEST
TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 100 4 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16. BRAND: LAMOTTE BLETS P
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 1000 2 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17. | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE | meierspen
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL ALK, M/2 LOW RANGE,
TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 | 1000 2 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18. | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE | msierspe
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL CA HARDNESS,
Cﬁ%%%“ﬁgi‘g?giﬁg‘ ;‘Ziggf;%gs 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19. LAMOTTE b
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL CYA, CYANURIC ACID,
TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX| 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20. BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLETS P
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #

NOTE: The information cogtained in this bid tabulation is for information onlyand does not constitute actual award/execution of contract,

APPROVED BY: 4
DATE: Wioous : 2016:261 POOL GHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 4



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO | e
BID TABULATION FORM v

2010

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS Solicitation #: 2016-261
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 \ - Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

D. GILMORE DISTRIBUTING INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY
COMPANY, INC. dba SUN CITY POOL SERVICES, INC.
SUPPLY EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3-YR ANNUAL 3-YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF || ¢ QUANTITY —J UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE MIN MAX (8) TOTAL TOTAL (B TOTAL TOTAL
(A) (AxB=C) | (Cx3YRS) {AxB=C) (C x'3 YRS)
02 CANISTERS, 5{.} LB CANISTERS 50 70 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
. BRAND: N/A s
21. CANIETERS
QPL BRAND;
STOCK #
PHOSPHATE REMOVER BRAND: N/A 1 3 $35.20 $105.60 $316.80 NO BID NO 8ID NO BID
22, QT/BOTTLE
QPL BRAND: » ‘ BIODEX PH0S32
STOCK #

3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW RELEASE ‘ o
CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE TABLETS FOR 50 90 125 '$128.00 $16,000.00 | $48;000.00 $97.50 $12,187.50 $36,562.50
EROSION.FEED H i BSPAILS i s - AT 7 : BIDDER'S PRIC BIDDER'S PRICE

23. ON FEEDER) BRAND: PRO CHLOR LRspAL 55# *MINIMUM ORDER IS 48 PAILS (55lbs ea) AT A TIME ,ig o e et
QPL BRAND: AQUAFIT PROGUARD
STOCK # o ' : AF55 S ' 21785BPG
ENZYME CLEANER AND PHOSPHATE }
REMOVER BRAND: NATURAL POOL 55 8 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID
24, PRODUCTS DRUM
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
ACCU-TABS BRAND: ACCU@TAB 55 400 415 ~ NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25, LBSif’A!tT:!
QPL BRAND:
STOCK#

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED 8Y: &9‘ &

DATE: Olg 2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS « PARKS REGREATION 5



Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

ELE A ansion

A91-AT tm( £
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e tE MR ¢ 3

Solicitation #; 2016-261

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
// T — — ey ronmmon, R .

D. GILMORE DISTRIBUTING
|COMPANY, INC. dba SUN CITY POOL
SUPPLY

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY
SERVICES, INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
!ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS, THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE |
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

|BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), ’ ' '
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION T E
JOF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED " ] X
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: i 5 5

Within __ consecutive calendar days '

Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of 24 24

verbal order in cases of emergency.

NOTE: The

APPROVED BY: Q®
DATE: X\\KS S\

2016-261 POOL CHEMIGALS - PARKS RECREATION

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELJ IVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID,
information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




El Paso.

CITY OF EL PASO Ex
BID TABULATION FORM gy’

20080

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS Solicitation #: 2016-261
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 ' Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC. MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
PHOENIX, AZ EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3-YR ANNUAL 3-YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF | QUANTITY _ I UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE | ESTIMATED ESTIMATED -
NO. ’ MEASURE : (B} TOTAL TOTAL (8) TOTAL TOTAL
(AxB=C) {Cx 3 YRS) {(AxB=C) {CX3YRS)
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLETS W/STABILIZER _ _ )
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR QUTDOOR POOLS 50 50 100 150 $95.95 $14,392.50 $43,177.50 $87.50 $13,125.00 $39,375.00
QPL BRAND: LESLIE'S PROTECH
STOCK # ' ’ 12450 ' FODG050050AA
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR
AND QUTDOOR POOLS 15 15 275 325 NO BID NOQO BID NO BID NO-BID NO BID NO BID
2. GAL.JCARBOY BRAND: N/A GAU%{WBO
GQPL BRAND:
STOCK #
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL . ! i :
POOLS 50 LB. BAG BRAND: N/A 50 70 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.10 $2,310.00 $6,930.00
3. LBS/BAG
QPL BRAND: _ NASVAR SODA ASH INC
STOCK # ; TBOS5050050BUL.
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER
QHLQR!NE LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH 50 2 4 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID: NGO BID NO BID
4, | ONE (50) LB CONTAINERS BRAND: N/A | (psiBaG
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
H . . ;
HIGHT SODA ASHN?QLB BAG BRAND 50 2 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.25 $131.25 $393.75
5. LBS/IBAG
QPL BRAND: ‘ o o LPM NASURAL SODA ASH INC
STOCK # 81298 B083050050UL

NOTE: The information &zntained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: &*

e
pare: _AMLOWS 2016-261 POOL. CHEMICALS ~ PARKS RECREATION 7



(:ff“f'(3fz'EEi__{’l\f;() El Paso

Al-gmarise Gy

BID TABULATION FORM RITLK

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION.

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC. MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
PHOENIX, AZ EL PASO, TX
‘ ANNI ANNUAL 3-YR ANNUAL 3-YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF | ¢ QUANTITY _ | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED || UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE MIN MAX (B8) TOTAL TOTAL (B} TOTAL TOTAL
{A) {AxB =C) {C x 3YRS) {(AxB=0C) {C x 3 YRS)
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY
CHLORINE) FOR ALL OQUTDOOR POOLS 100 5 7 $127.95 $895.65 $2,686.95 $119.00 $833.00 $2,499.00
6. 100 LB, PAIL. BRAND: N/A LBSIPAIL _
QPL BRAND: LPM ~ PROCHCO
STOCK # 14191 CLHP70100
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FO
POOLS 1 QT. Bg%% BRENE:RN?;-L 1 1 3 $4.95 $14.85 $44.55 $4.72 $14.16 $42.48
7. QT BOTTLE|
QPL BRAND: LPM PROTECH
STOCK # ' ) 14916 FO62001012AA
ALGAECIDE OR ’ . .
~ ggghéﬁﬁéﬁz E;g%%;%%&Fng.;LL 1 a0 150 $30.95 $5,892.50 $17,977.50 $27.00 $4,050.00 $12,150.00
8. GALLON
QPL BRAND: ‘ LPM PROTECH
STOCK # R o 14030  F055001004AK
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS 1000 . . X .
v " A 1000 20 35 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.45 $1,100.75 $3,302.25
g, | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE o e
3 * u
QPL BRAND: LAMOTTE
STOCK # 6999-1000
PHENOL RED, PH, TEST TABLETS 1000 ; . : : .
4o, | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LamOTTE | , 1000 20 35 NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.88 $1,780.80 | $5,342.40
. o
QPL BRAND: LAMOTTE
_ STOCK # 6915A-M
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation Is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

W

e

APPROVED BY:

:

2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 8



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS :
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Pagso

AR-Baseing m!l

"y

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC. MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
PHOENIX, AZ EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3YR ANNUAL 3YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF |« QUANTITY .| UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. i MEASURE MIN MAX (B) TOTAL TOTAL {B) TOTAL TOTAL
(A} {AxB={_) {Cx 3 YRS) {AXB=C) {C X3 YRS}
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST,
TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 1000 8 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.80 $711.20 $2,133.60
11, BRAND: LAMCTTE TA“'-E@ PER I
QPL BRAND: ’ LAMOTTE
STOCK # 6905A-M
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL
ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 : - .

TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1000 1 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.88 $101.76 $305.28

12. BRAND: LAMOTTE S
QPL BRAND: ) - LAMOTIE
STOCK # ‘ ' 3920A-M
CA HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS,
TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX| 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.88 $152.84 $457.92
13. BRAND: LAMOTTE T"“‘;&: PER I
QPL BRAND: o LAMOTTE
STOCK # : _ 6848A-M
CYA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS
1000 TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $61.25 $183.75 $551.25
14. LAMOTTE TABEg; PER
QPL BRAND: ‘ _ 'LAMOTTE
STOCK# _ 6994A-M
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE,
'TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX] 1000 4 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NOBID
15, BRAND: LAMOTTE TasLErs pek | v
QPL BRAND: _ ,
STOCK # '
NOTE The mfarmatmn contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
Al

APPROVED BY:
pare: __ WD il g

2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS ~ FARKS RECREATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

ElL Paso

AFdurica Gy

A l l I ' ¥
ROLO

Solicitation #: 2016-261

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
. . . LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC. MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
* . PHOENIX, AZ EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3YR ANNUAL 3-YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF ||« QUANTITY UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE] MIN MAX 8 TOTAL TOTAL (8) TOTAL TOTAL
‘ (A} (AxB=C) (C x 3YRS) {(AxB=0) {Cx 3YRS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, PH, TEST
TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 100 4 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
186. BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLETSPER |
QPL BRAND:
STOCK#
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 1000 2z 2 NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17. | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE | materseen
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL ALK, M/2 LOW RANGE,
TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 1000 2 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18. | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLETS PER
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
_ INSTRUMENTAL CA HARDNESS,
Cﬁl'b%gj.? glggﬁi’?g %,22’ ;giTBmgTS 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 19‘ . LAMGTTE TAS{“BE;;‘?PER
QPL BRAND:
STOCKH
INSTRUMENTAL CYA, CYANURIC ACID,
TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX! 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20. BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLETS PER [I:
- BOX
GPL BRAND:
STOCK#

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY; é&@&

wWiolia

DATE:

2016-261 POOL CHEMIGALS » PARKS REGREATION
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Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015
- . ‘ . - .

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
iy

2010
Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC. MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
. - . PHOENIX, AZ EL PASO, TX
_ I .
ANNUAL 3-YR ANNUAL 3-YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF | ¢ QUANTITY _ Il UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE MIN MAX {B) TOTAL TOTAL (8 TOTAL TOTAL
(A) (AxB=C) (C x'3 YRS) (AxB=C) (C x 3 YRS}
©02 CANISTERS, 5‘? L.S CANISTERS 50 70 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BRAND: N/A v
21. CANISTERS
QPL BRAND:
 STOCK#
PHOSPHATE REMOVER BRAND: N/A 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.24 $27.72 $83.16
22. QTIBOTTLE ’
QPL BRAND: PROTECH
STOCK # FO58001012AA
3INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW RELEASE
CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE TABLETS FOR 50 90 125 NO BID NOBID NO BID $118.25 $14,781.25 | $44,343.75
23. EROSION FEEDER) BRAND: PRO CHLOR fﬁsggy
QPL BRAND: CLOR-MOR
STOCK # TFO19055AAA
ENZYME CLEANER AND PHOSPHATE
REMOVER BRAND: NATURAL POOL 55 8 12 NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24, PRODUCTS DRUM
QPL BRAND:
STOCK#
ACCU-TABS BRAND: ACCU@TAB 55 400 415 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25, iy
QPL.BRAND:
STOCK #

NOTE: The information coptained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

R
APPROVED BY: M

v

Lhiohs

DATE:

2016-26'1 POOL CHEMICALS « PARKS RECREATION
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Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

|EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDERTHE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE H
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

—

EEX Xanssas

au pigereyy ru

I i
Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.

PHOENIX, AZ

MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION T0

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

X

!NO OPTION OFFERED

verbal order in cases of emergency.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 3.5 1

Within __ consecutive calendar days

Within __ hours or overnight after receipt of 24 24

! F BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL, A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THEBID,

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: §§£§

>
DATE; WD L

2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO W
BID TABULATION FORM i
. 22010
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS : Solicitation #: 2016-261
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 _ » Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
- ’ THIRD GEN, LLC dba TRIPLE S.
. P . ’ j
SR ECTZL;“; Aggs%r(;o 1 ING JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
! ELPASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL T ANNUAL 3-YR ANNUAL 3YR
DESCRIPTION UNIT OF QUANTITY _ | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
' MEASURE } {8y TOTAL TOTAL (B) TOTAL TOTAL
(AxB=C) (C x 3 YRS) (AxB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLETS WISTABRILIZER
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR QUTDOOR POOLS 50 50 100 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID $87.25 $13,087.50 $39,262.50
4 LB. Brand: CLEAR VIEW LBS/PAIL BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
= $13,088.00 $38,264.00
QPL BRAND: . , ‘ _ } ‘ BID LAB
STOCK # : OMNI 50
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR : _ .
AND OUTDOOR POOLS 15 15 275 325 $74.60 $24,245.00 | $72,735.00 $66.90 $21,742.50 | $65,227.50
2 GAL.JCARBOY BRAND: N/A GALIGARBO BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
* ) Y. $20,515.80 $61.545.00 $21.743.00 $65,229.00
QPL BRAND; UNIVAR USA SEE SPEC SHEET MISC
: ' 279540 135#CBY 15 GAL
STOCK# {pick up empty's upon delivery)
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL. e , P .
POOLS 50 LB. BAG BRAND: N/A 50 | 70 100 $25.55 éiz,s§5,09 .$7,6§5.09 $25.50 $2,550.00 $7,650.00
3. LBS/BAG DER'S'PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
$1,788.50 $5,365.50
QPL BRAND: 7 , v  ARMB&HAMMER _ _ MISC
STOCK # 502685 50% BAG 200788 .
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER
CHLORINE LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH 50 2 4 $83.60 $334.40 $1,003.20 $62.00 $248.00 $744.00
f g - BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
4. | ONE (50) LB CONTAINERS BRAND: N/A | s/ s167.20 $501.60
QPL BRAND: ‘ } _ ESSECO USA MISC
STOCK # ~ 503233 50# BAG o 200829
LIGHT SODA AS”NszB‘ BAGEBRAND: | 2 5 $25.40 $127.00 $381.00 $22.50 $112.50 $337.50
5. LBSIBAG BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE. BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$50.80 $152.40 $113.00 $339.00
QPL BRAND: o N o ~ TRONOX S misc
STOCK # ' ’ ' ' 502573 50# BAY

NOTE: The informatior} ;j&}tained in this bid tabuiation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Mu
DATE: () , 2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS < PARKS RECREATION 13



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO R
BID TABULATION FORM Hp

2048

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS : Solicitation #; 2016-261
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 201 Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

: THIRD GEN, LL.C dba TRIPLE 8.
spscn;gwézggegrgc,, INC JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
i EL PASO, TX
ITEM : ESTIMATED ANNUAL. ANNUAL 3-YR ‘ ANNUAL 3-¥YR
, DESCRIPTION UNITOF | ____ _QUANTITY _| UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE MIN MAX B8) TOTAL TOTAL {B) TOTAL TOTAL
{A} {AxB=C}) {Cx3YRS) {AxB=C) {Cx 3 YRS}
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY .
CHLORINE) FOR ALL QUTDOOR POOLS 100 5 7 $261.00 $1,827.00 $5,481.00 $126.00 $882.00 $2,646.00
1R ‘ BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
6. 100 LB. PAIL BRAND: N/A LBS/PAIL $1,308.00 £3.91500:
QPL BRAND: ‘ _ o .~ PPG ‘ PPG
STOCK # 635070 '
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FORALL ] ' 5
. 1 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.37 $19.11 $57.33
POOLS 1 QT. BOTTLE BRAND: NJA BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
7. |QT BOTTLE $19.00 $57.00
QPL BRAND: : CLEAR VIEW
STOCK # ‘ ' ' - ’ 200764 *
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL ; ; :
POOLS 1 GAL. Brand: AQUA PURE 1 90 150 NOC BID NO BID NO BID $45.50 $6,825.00 $20,475.00
8. GALLON
QPL BRAND: AGUA PURE
STOCK # ' | ' 3000002
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS 1000 i : 5
o ; 1000 20 35 NO BID NORID NO BID $30.99 $1,390.65 $4,198.95
9 TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE |, ABLETS PER BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
- BOX $1.400.00 $4.200.00
QPL BRAND: - _ LA MOTTE
~ STOCK# S - ' o DPD #1
PHENOL RED, PH, TEST TABLETS 1000 i ‘ 5
- e ¢ ; : 1000 20 35 NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.99 $1,380.65 $4,198.95
10. TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE FABLETS PER BIDDER'S PRICE' | BIDDER'S.PRICE
BOX $1,400.00 $4.200.00
QPL BRAND: _ _ ) B » LA MOTTE
STOCK # DPD #2

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Qg m

parte: My = 2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 4



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

CAl-Bamtics Gt

'

piar s ]

Solicitation #: 2016-261

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

R . THIRD GEN, LLC dba TRIPLE S.
SF’ECT*;{%Z%E%?Q’ INC JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
» 1A EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3-YR ANNUAL 3YR
DESCRIPTION UNITOF | QUANTITY UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE i {B) TOTAL TOTAL {B) TOTAL TOTAL
{A) {(AxB=C) {C x3 YRS} {AxB=C) {C'x 3 YRS}
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST,
TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 1000 8 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.99 $550.86 $1,679.58
. ; BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
11. BRAND: LAMOTTE et il pritS
QPL BRAND: LA MOTTE
STOCK # DPD #3
ALK, M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL
ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 )
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED Basis)| 1000 1 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12. BRAND: LAMOTTE b
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
CA HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS,
TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX| 1000 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13. BRAND: LAMCTTE TAaL;g: PER
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
CYA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS ,
1000 TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: 1000 | 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 4 LAMOTIE TABLETS PER
* BOX
QPL BRAND:
~ STOCK #
~ INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, .
TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX| 1000 4 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15, BRAND: LAMOTTE raaLers pen
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation s for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Qm&
DATE: 3‘%&}@22’:;

2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION
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El Paso

) | CITY OF EL PASO Earae
D BID TABULATION FORM MK

= . 2L
OL CHEMICALS . Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

Project Name: PO

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015
’ THIRD GEN, LLC dba TRIPLE 8.
SPECT%‘E“’&QEE%?O“ INC JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
” EL PASO, TX
) ESTIMATED ANNUAL N ANNUAL 3-YR ANNUAL YR
DESCRIPTION UNIT OF QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ESTIMATED ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
' MEASURE 8 TOTAL TOTAL (8) TOTAL TOTAL
{AxB=C(C) {Cx 3 YRS) {AxB=¢C) {Cx 3IYRS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, PH, TEST
TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16. BRAND: LAMOTTE i
QPL BRAND: 5
STOCK # ;
INSTRUMENTAL. DPD #3, TOTAL
CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.99 $70.98 $239.94
» ] BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
17. | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE | Teters per e N
QPL BRAND: LA MOTTE
STOCK # DPD#3
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 | 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.99 $119.97 $359.91
: : v ¥ 3 BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
18. | TABLETS PER BOX BRAND: LAMOTTE | TAeLers rer potingly ;
QPL BRAND: LA MOTTE
STOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL CA HARDNESS,
AL : : . , .
¢ 1 G%*;’%%?fé?;‘iﬁ% ggirs';ie&?s 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19, LAMOTTE e
QPL BRAND:
~ BTOCK #
INSTRUMENTAL CYA, CYANURIC ACID, _
TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX| 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20, BRAND: LAMOTTE TABLETS PER |
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #

NOTE: The information cogtained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecution of contract,

APPROVED BY: ;g }giiﬁ
pate: L & A

2016-261 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

16




Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
N
20310
Solicitation #: 2016-261
Department: PARKS AND RECRFATION

= ¢ . . ) o~
. . I THIRD GEN, LLC dba TRIPLE 8.
. e gy e O ING JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
. - é o EL PASO, TX
— ESTIMATED ANNUAL ANNUAL 3YR ANNUAL 3R
DESORIPTION UNITOF | QUANTITY UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED | UNITPRICE | ESTIMATED | ESTIMATED
NO. MEASURE| ~ "~ WIN MAX (8) TOTAL TOTAL B TOTAL TOTAL
) (AxB=C) | (Cx3YRS) (axB=¢) | (Cx3YRS)
CO2CANISTERS, 5(? LB GANISTERS 50 70 100 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
BRAND: N/A &b
21. CANISTERS
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
PHOSPHATE REMOVER BRAND: N/A 1 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.00 $105.00 $315.00
22. QUBOTILE]
"QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW RELEASE |
CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE TABLETS FOR 50 80 125 NO BID NO BID NO BID $124.00 $15,500.00 | $46,500.00
23.| EROSION FEEDER) BRAND: PRO GHLOR | Lespaus
« _BUCKET.
QPL BRAND: ~ ACCUTAB
STOCK # ATT 55#
ENZYME CLEANER AND PHOSPHATE
REMOVER BRAND: NATURAL POOL 55 8 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
24, PRODUCTS DRUM
QPL BRAND:
STOCK #
ACCU-TABS BRAND: ACCU@TAB 55 400 415 NO BID NO BID. NO BID $124.00 $51,460.00 | $154,380.00
25, Sy,
QPL BRAND: ACCUTAB
STOCK #

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation s for information only and does not constifute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _ @g}‘\s

PO ... 4 SO

DATE: WWio s

2016-261 PODL CHEMICALS ~ PARKS REGREATION
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Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS
‘Eizd Opening ate' OCTOBER 28, 2015

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED -
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS, THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE {[
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

EEX B men

l\l mrwﬂnu t'm

20&0

Solicitation #: 2016-264
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

THIRD GEN, LLC dba TRIPLE S.
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., INC
EL PASO, TX

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

X

Ivo oprion oFFereD , [] L]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET -30 DAYS
IBIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 1.8 5

Within ___ consecutive calendar days '

Within ___hours or overnight after receipt of NONE STATED 24

verbal order in cases of emergency.

{IF'BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID,

BIiDS SOLICITED: 20 N
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: é Zg}ﬁ

DATE: e ‘{s :

LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 16

BIDS RECEIVED: 6 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5
information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecution of contract.

NO BID: 0

18
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MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY
1516 E. SAN ANTONIO AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901

UNIVAR USA
6980 MARKET AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79915

D. GILMORE DISTRIBUTING
10017 CARNEGIE
EL PASO, TX 79937

DISCOUNT POOLS SPAS & SUPPLIES
111 SOUTH ROADRUNNER PARKWAY
LAS CRUCES, NM 88011-8281

Emerald Pool Supply
34406 N. 27th Drive, suite 192
Phoenix, AZ 85085

Progressive Pool Systems
11233 Red Hawk Lane
El Paso, Texas 79936

ALPHA ENVIRONMENTAL AND ENERGY
SYSTEMS, INC.

6090 BANDOLERO DR

EL PASO,TX 79912-1948

UNIVERSAL SUPPLIES
11233 REDHAWK LANE
EL PASO, TX 79936

BEST BUY DISTRIBUTING
ATTN: MARTHA RAMIREZ
1690 DONNA CAPONI LANE
EL PASO, TX 79936

U-DO-IT POOL SUPPLY
8927 DYER STREET
EL PASO, TX 79904-1403

L & R SUPPLY & CHEMICAL
11355 ROJAS DRIVE #10
EL PASO, TX 79936

NATURAL POOL PRODUCTS
PO BOX 3265
MCKINNEY, TEXAS 75070

SUN CITY POOL SUPPLY
10017 CARNEGIE
EL PASO, TEXAS 79925

DALE BOREN'S SERVICE SUPPLY, INC.

809 TONY LAMA ST.
EL PASO,TX 79915

BARON’S CHEMICAL CO.
817 TEXAS AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79901

ARSA INDUSTRIES
3900 ROSA
EL PASO, TX 79905

FM POOL CENTER, INC
9925 MONTANA AVENUE
EL PASO, TX 79925

D&D INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
ATTN: JAVIER COSME
6825 MARBLE CANYON
EL PASO, TX 79912

Triple-S Janitorial Supplies
10015 Carnegie Ave.
El Paso, Texas 79925

Leslie’s Poolmart Inc.
3925 E. Broadway Road #100
Phoenix, Arizona 85040



