CITY OF EL PASO, TEXAS
AGENDA ITEM
DEPARTMENT HEAD'S SUMMARY FORM
DEPARTMENT: Capital Improvement
AGENDA DATE: December 11, 2018

CONTACT PERSON/PHONE: Sam Rodriguez, City Engineer, 212-1843
Bruce D. Collins, Purchasing Director, 212-1181

DISTRICT(S) AFFECTED: 1

STRATEGIC GOAL: NO. 4 Enhance El Paso’s Quality of Life though Recreational, Cultural and Educational
Environments

SUBJECT:

Discussion and action or the award of Solicitation 2019-068 Bartlett Park Landscape Improvements to BLACK STALLION
CONTRACTORS INC. for and estimated total amount of $634,857.90.

BACKGROUND / DISCUSSEON:

The project will provide significant landscape and recreational improvements to the existing amenities on Bartlett Park. The
improvements include site grading and placing new fill material to accommodate new sod; the landscape improvements will
consist of modifying and improving the existing irrigation system, placing trees and shrubs, placing decorative native rock
caver, and placing landscape boulders; new park amenities will include placing a full size basketball court, basketball court
lighting, park lighting, placing playground wood fibers, benches, concrete curb, concrete sidewalk, ADA ramps, concrete
walking paths, stabilized chat path, rock seat walls, fenced dog area, wrought iron fence, park signing, and miscellapeous
construction.

SELECTION SUMMARY:

Solicitation was advertised on September 18, 2018 and September 25, 2018, The solicitation was posted on City website on
September 18, 2018. The email (Purmail) notification was seat out on September 20, 2018, There were a total of ninety-
three (93) viewers. Nine (%) bids were received. Eight (8) from local vendors.

PROTEST

No protest received for this requirement.

[ Protest received.

COUNCIL REPRESENTATIVE BRIEFING:

Was a briefing provided? [ | Yes or [_] No
If yes, select the applicable districts.

[ ] Distriet 1
] District 2
] District 3
(] District 4
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D District 5
[ IDistrict 6
[ District 7
(I pistrict 8
[ An Districts

PRIOR COUNCIL ACTION:

/A

AMOUNT AND SOURCE OF FUNDING:

Amount: $634,857.900
Source: 2012 Quality of Life
580270 ~ 25010 ~ 4800 - 190 - PCP13PRKAQ3

BOARD / COMMISSION ACTION:

N/A
R R R R () D AUTHORIZATYONH## S dehrdedetese e e e
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COUNCIL PROJECT FORM
(Low Bid)

********************-k*****-k*****POSTING LANGUAGE BELOW**'k**w*************'k*******************

Please place the following item on the REGULAR AGENDA for the Council Meeting of DECEMBER
11, 2018.

STRATEGIC GOAL 4: Enhance El Paso’s Quality of Life through Recreational, Cultural and
Educational Environments

Discussion and action on the award of Solicitation 2019-068 Bartlett Park Landscape Improvements
to BLACK STALLION CONTRACTORS INC. for an estimated total award of $634,857.90. The
project will provide significant landscape and recreational improvements to the existing amenities
on Bartlett Park. The improvements include site grading and placing new fill material to
accommodate new sod; the landscape improvements will consist of modifying and improving the
existing irrigation system, placing trees and shrubs, placing decorative native rock cover, and
placing landscape boulders; new park amenities will include placing a full size basketball court,
basketball court lighting, park lighting, placing playground wood fibers, benches, concrete curb,
concrete sidewalk, ADA ramps, concrete walking paths, stabilized chat path, rock seat walls,
fenced dog area, wrought iron fence, park signing, and miscellaneous construction.

Department: Capital Improvement

Award to: BLACK STALLION CONTRACTORS INC.
El Paso, TX

ltem(s): Base Bid, Additive Alternate 1, Addilive Altemate 2, Additive
Alternate 3, Additive Altemate 4, Additive Alternate 5 and Additive
Alternate 6

Initial Term: 210 Consecutive Calendar Days

Base Bid: $563,229.05

Additive Alternate 1: $ 1,444.40

Additive Aliernate 2: $ 15,525.00

Additive Alternate 3: $ 6,844.00

Additive Alternate 4: $ 9,016.07

Additive Alternate 5: $ 13,599.38

Additive Alternate 6: $ 25,200.00

Total Estimated Award: $634,857.90

Account No.: 190-4800-29010-580270-PCP13PRKAQ3

Funding Source: 2012 Quality of Life Bond

District(s): 1

This is a Low bid, unit price contract.

The Purchasing & Strategic Sourcing and Capital Improvement Departments recommend award
as indicated to BLACK STALLION CONTRACTORS INC, the lowest responsive, responsible
bidder.

It is requested that the City Manager be authorized to establish the funding sources and make
any necessary budget transfers and execute any and all documents necessary for execution of
this award.



Work under this unit price contract is only an estimated value and will be ordered, performed,
invoiced, and paid by measured quantity. The actual cost of this contract may be higher or lower
than the total estimated value and will be the sum total of unit prices at the end of the contract
term.

As a part of this award, upon the review of the City Attorney, the City Engineer may without further
authorization from City Council approve contract changes which are necessary for proper
execution of the work and carrying out the intent of the project, which are in accordance with
applicable law, do not make changes to the prices and are within the appropriate budget.



Bid Tab Summary
2019-068 Bartlett Park Landscape Improvements

Addititive Additive Additive Additive Additive Additive
Contractor Base Bid Alternate 1 Alternate 2 |Alternate 3 |Alternate 4 |Alternate 5§ |Alternate 6 Total
Black Stallion
Contractors Inc. $563,229.05 $1,444.40 $15,525.00 $6,844.00 $9,016.07] $13,599.38| $25,200.00| $634,857.90
Del Mar Contracting,
Inc. $772,712.85 $1,408.25 $20,000.00 NO BID $8,367.00f $16,156.20( $31,000.00f $849,644.30
Globe Builders, LLC. $843,450.59 $1,206.46 $24,400.00] $14,640.00 $57,869.64| $12,116.89| $31,518.74; $935,202.32
Karlsruher, Inc. dba
CSA Constructors $609,087.33 $1,075.62 $42,900.00 $6,500.00 $7,699.99| $11,758.38| $32,500.00| $711,531.32
Keystone GC, LLC $688,790.18 $1,493.61 $46,832.37 $8,054.84 $9,650.68] $11,022.10f $31,882.51] $797,726.29
Mirador Enterprises,
Inc. $826,190.01 $3,410.84 $51,586.86 $3,546.03] $10,655.05| $16,392.11| $32,5623.15] $944,304.05
Pride General
Contractors, LLC $643,816.47 $1,968.46 $28,080.00 $7,097.51 $7,709.50| $11,264.70f| $39,400.00{ $739,336.64
Synergy Project
Consultants, Inc. $643,704.46 $821.88 $9,931.00 $1,500.00 $6,663.60| $12,046.96| $27,830.00| $702,497.90
TAO Industries, Inc.
dba HAWK
Conststruction $718,020.59 $952.21 $34,500.00 $7,092.05 $6,822.28| $12,331.39| $29,710.30] $809,428.82




CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2015.068
BID DATE: Octobor 24, 2048 DEPARTMENT: CABRITAL IMPROVEMENT
BLACK STAL'“'?'?CGONTRACTORS' DEL MAR CONTRACTING, INC GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 9 BIDDER 2 OF 8 BIDDER 3 OF 9
TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMDUNT
PRX unireimerice] o anae T pnrenerice | O e T lunrempriceay] - pmea T
AP PRICE) PRICE) PRICE)
ITEM# " ary unrr BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM (INFIGURES) | Dpokovmouno || (N FIGURES) DO NOT ROUND FIGURES) 0O NOT ROUND
DMLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
A S >ONSTRUCTION SIGN
ool $12,021.15
1. 5 MONTH|  Fumish, Install and Maintain SWPPP $2,127.50 $10,637.5 $3,500.00 $17.500. $2,404.23) G\ TRACTOR'S
PRICE: LEFT BLANK
2. 1 EA Furnish and Install Construction Sign $805.00 $805.0 $1,000.00 $1,ooo.ouu $1,693.12 $1,693.12
B. DEMOLITION AND EARTHWORK
3, 2 AC Clsaring and Grubbing $2,875.00 55,750.00ﬂ $7,500.00 $15,ooo.ooﬂ $2,505.81 $6,011.62
4 1,064 cY Grading $12.65 $13,459.60] $56.00 $59,584.00} $20.79 $31,696.56
5. 620 cY Top Soll - 12" For Sod Area (New Fill) $26.75 $17.825.00 $52.00 $32.240.00“ 532,50 $20,150.00}
C. HARDSCAPE
6. 60 LF Concrate Curb and Gutter $17.25 $1,035.00 $15.00 ssao.ooﬂ $31.15 $1,869.00]
7. 1,490 SE Goncrete Sidewalk - 4" Thick $4.03 $6,004.70 $5.50 $8,195.001 $7.38 $10,996.20}
8. 4 EA ADA Ramp $862.50 $3,450.00 $900.00 $3,600.00] $1,603.12 $6,772.48)
9. 2,070 LF Goncrete Header Curb (Edaing) $10.35 $21 ,424.50n $13.25 527.427,50}1 $23.70 $49,059.00)
Approved By.Cf.Cf 2019.068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Page 1 of 24

Dater | ,!(q“g



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM
Ialn TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS 61D NO: 2019-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
BLACK STALL'?SG?O"TMCTORS' DEL MAR CONTRACTING, INC GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 9 BIDDER Z OF 9 BIDDER 3 OF 9
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | TGTAL AMOUNT |[UNIT BID PRICE (IN]  TOTAL AMOUNT
(IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
APPRX PRICE) FRICE) PRICE)
ITEM # aTY UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM DO NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND O NOT ROUND
CHLY TWO LECIMAL ORLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
C. HARDSCAPE
10. 175 Lp | Concreta GurbatEngincored Wood Fiber $17.25 53.018.75“ $20.00 $3,500.0 ’ $20.79 $5.213.25
11, 1 EA Playground Maintenance Qpening $862.50] $862.50 $500.00 $500.00] $1,625.38 $1,625.39¢
12. 40 gy | Concrete sm”""‘g ﬁ}::: Path - Complete $115.00 $4,600.00 $125.00 $5,000.00] $189.62 $7.584.80}
13. 820 sy Concrete Walk Path - 4" Thick (Stamped) $51.75 $42,435.00 $55.00 $45,100.00 $685.33 $69,970.60}
1. | sgss | gp [P/°"Stabilized Chat Franklin Red - 3" Depth $1.73 $15,544.05 $4.20 $37,737.00] $1.69 $15,184.65
{Complete In Place)
Rock Seat Wall with Footing and Cap J
15, 780 LF (Complete In Place) $46.00 $35,880.00 $35.00 $27,300.001 $47.40 $36,972.00
16. 450 sg | AsphaltConcrete Pavement - 2°ACIE"ABC §11.50 $5,175.00 $10.00 $4,500.00] $52.82 $23,769.00)
{wiB" Subgrade Prep}
12" Half Pipe Class 4 RCP {Inctudes
17. 13 LF Backfill, Subgrade Prap & Pond Rock) $143.75 $1,868.75 $190.00 $2,470.00] $312.88 $4,067.44
Park Area Lighting Improvements
18, 1 LS (Complete In Place) $103,800.00 $103,800.00 $168,000.00 $168.000.qu $151,459.81 $151,459.81
Approved By: - 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: 1[4 ity Page 2 of 24



CITY OF EL. PASO

BID TABULATION FORM sl
2017 Award Winner =
BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2015-068
BID DATE: Cctober 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
BHACK STALL'?:CGONTRACTORS' DEL MAR CONTRACTING, INC GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX ELPASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER1OF 8 BIDDER 20F 9 BIDDER3OF 9
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BED PRICE TOFAL AMOUNT JUNIT BID PRICE (INI TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE) PRICE) PRICE}
ITEM # ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM DO NOT ROUND 1O NOT ROUND DO KGT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
C. HARDSCAPE
Wrought Iron Fence For Electrical OH
19. 1 LS Enclosure (Including Gate) $8,050.00 $8,050.00 $7.300.00 $7,300.0 $7,914.32 $7,914.32
20. 1 EA Concrete Flume With Steel Plate Cover $2,875.00 $2,875.00H $1,200.00 $1 ,EDG.OEIﬂ $B8,126.97 $8,126.97
D. IRRIGATION
trrigation Modifications (Inciuding Heated
21, 1 LS Enclosure & Satellite Controlles} $10,620.00 $10,620.0 $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $23,159.18 $23,159.18§
22, 1 LS Irrigation System - Complets In Place $70,800.00 $70,800.0 $69,0DD.ODI 569,000.0(% $86,987.12 $86,987.12
E. SITE IMPROVEMENTS
Engineered Woaod Fibers - 12" Dapth I DH
23. 125 CY (Complets In Place) $51.75 $6,468.75 $95.00 $11,875.0 $101.58 $12,697.50)
24. 1 Ls | FullSize Basketball Court- Complate In $51.750.00 $51,750.00| $55,000.00 $55,00000]  $108,350.72 $108,359.72
25, 1 EA Park Monument Sign - Complete In Place $8,970.00 $8,970.00; $5,000.00 $5,000.00¢ $10,835.97 $10,835.97|
28, 1 EA Park Rules Sign - Complete In Place $1,265.00 $1,265.00 $500.00 $£500.00 $1,462.85 $1,462.85
27. a EA Accessible Sign - Complete In Place $345.00 $1,035.DD" $500.00 51 .500.00! $2,038.37 $6,1158.11
Approved By: G- 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Page 3 of 24

Date: }i fjq (i¥



CITY OF EL. PASO

BID TABULATION FORM 017 Avard iy
BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS 81D NO: 2048-088
BID DATE: Qctober 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: GAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
BLACK STALL;?SGCDNTRACTORS' DEL MAR CONTRACTING, INC GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 9 BIDDER 20F 9 BIDDER 30QF 9
UNIT BID PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT  HUNIT BID PRICE (IN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX (N FIGURES) | (QUANTITY XUNIT || (N FIGURES) | {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE) PRICE) PRICE)
ITEM # aTy UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM 156 KOT HOUND DO NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES FLACES PLACES
F. LANDSCAPING
28, 4 EA Tree « 1" Caliper $184.00 $736.00 $150.00 $600.00 $203.17 $812.68
29. 45 EA Tree - 2" CGaliper $396.75 $17,853.75¢ $370.00 $16,650.004 $365.71 £16,456.955
30. 10 EA Tree - 3" Calipes $690.00 $6.9{JD.UOJ $550.00 $5,500.00 $809.63 $B,096.30}
3. 18 EA Shrub {1 Gallon) $11.50 $207.00] $20.00 $360.001 $22.95 $413.10
3z 183 EA Shrub (56 Gallon) $28.75 $5,261.25 $32.00 $5,856.00 $31.99 §5,854.17]
33. 7 EA Shrub {15 Gallon} $184.00 $1,288.000 $170.00 $1,190.00¢ $257.35 $1,801 .45F
34, b4 EA Transplant Tree - 2 Caliper $345.00 $690.00 $225.00 $450.001 $121.90 $243.80%
35. B0 EA Transplant Shrub $23.00 $1,380.00; $30.00 $1,800.004 $18.96 $1,137.60
36. 18 EA Plant Donated Shrub $14.95 $269.10 $20.00 5360.004 $9.48 $170.644
37. 16,7414 SF Sod 30.81 $13,560.21 $2.50 $41 .852.50[ $1.09 s18.247.59I
Approved By, 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
fage 4 of 24

Dale: U/[c‘l 1%



CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

ks
D17 A

ward Winnef

BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO:; 2019-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
BLACK ST"“"L'?:CCO"T“‘“’“’RS' DEL MAR CONTRACTING, ING GLOBE BUILDERS, LLG
El PASO, TX EL PASO, TA EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 9 BIDDER 2 0F 9 BIDDER 3 OF 8
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT JUNIT BID PRIGE (iN]  TOTAL AMOUNT
{IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES) (QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
APPRX PRICE} PRICE) PRICE)
ITEM # ary URIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM B0 NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND DO HOT ROUND
CNLY TWD DECIMAL QNLY TWD DECIMAYL OMLY TWO GECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
F. LANDSCAPING
38, 730 LF Stasl Edging $3.45 52,515.50H $4.00 $2,926.00 $9.82 $7,168.60}
3. 7,230 s¢ |¥/4" Rock Mulch Desert Tan - 3" Depth with $1.27 $9,182.10) $1.25 $9,037.50) $1.12 58,097.60}
Weed Barrier
40. | 5221 sF | 34" Mulch Frankiin Red - 3" Depth with $1.04 $5,429.84 $1.25 $6.526.25 $0.94 $4,907.74
Weed Barrier
1 942" - 3" Native Screen Rack 3" Depth, Fill
41, 6,178 56 wi3/4" Native Rock (Install Only) $1.156 $7,104.70 $1.25 $7,722.50] $0.56 53,459 66]
3" - 6" Mative Screen Rock 6" Depth, Fill
42. 5,375 SF with 314" Native Rock (Install Only) $1.15 $6,181.25 $1.25 $6,718.75 50.74 $3,977.50]
43. 2 EA Boulder Desert Tan - 2'x2'x2' $264.50 $529.00 $250.00 %500.00§ $162.53] $325.06
44, 4 EA Boulder Dazert Tan « 3'x3'x¥ $345.00 $1,380.004 $330.00 $1,320.00 $182.85 $731.404
45, 3 £A Boulder Desart Tan - 4"x4"'x4" $517.50 $1,552.50} $375.00 $1,125.00] $203.17 $609.51
$537.432.30
SUM TOTAL - BASE BID ITEMS 1 thru 45 $7356,917.00 $803,286.28
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE $557,432.30
MOBILIZATION $36,795.85
{NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM TOTAL BASE BID) 325,796.75 BIDDER'S PRICE: $39,000.00 $40,164.31
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID AND MOBILIZATION) $563,229.05 $772,712.85 $843,450.59
BIDDER'S PRICE: $772,712.85
Approved By, CO— 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Page 5 of 24

Dale: |f [{g.i [ty



CITY QF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2013.068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
BLACK STALLIOH CONTRACTORS, DEL MAR CONTRACTING, INC GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF § BIDDER 2 OF 9 BIDDER 3 OF 8
UN‘f BID PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID PRICE (fNi TOTAL AMOQUNT
APPRX (NFIGURES) | (QUANTITYXUNIT | (N FIGURES) :quamm;)c UNIT FIGURES) (QUANTITY X.UNIT
PRICE) PRICE PRICE])
iema|  APTR UNIT BRIEF DESGRIPTION OF ITEM ponRIcE) obCE) o porHice)
ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1 - WATER HARVESTING AREA
46. 2 EA Tree - 2" Catiper $414.00 $828.00 $350.00 s‘!oo‘oo! $329.40 $658.80]
47, 4 EA Shrub {1 Gallon) $11.50 $46.00] $20.00 $80.00 $20.67 $82.68)
48, 11 EA Shrub {5 Gallon) $26.75 $316.25 $32.00 $352.00 $26.81 $316.94
3" - §" Native Screen Rock 6" Depth, Fill
49, 221 SF w114 Native Rock (mstall Only) $1.15 $254.15 $1.25 $276.25¢ $0.67 $148.07
SUM TOTAL ~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1 {ITEMS 46-49) $1,444.40 $1,408.25 $1,206.46
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO, 2 - PARKING AREA
50. 1 Lg | Parking Area ""’Sg;':.::f;d Chatand Steel $15,525.00 $15,525.oo§ $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $24,400.00 $24,400.00
SUM TOTAL ~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 2 {ITEM 50) $15,526.00 $20,000.00 $24,400.00
TSTST
51. 1 EA Cantata Chimes $6,844.00 $6,844.00 NO BID NO BID| $14,640.00 $14.640.00
SUM TOTAL — ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 3 (ITEM §1) $6,844.00 NO BID $14,640.00
Approved By: C‘é' 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date:uf!ct{l'( Page 6 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

i
2017 A

Wam TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 204%-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
BLACK STA""‘?,:‘C‘_’C’“TR“CTORS' DEL MAR CONTRACTING, INC GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
ELPASQ, TX EL PASD, TX EL. PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 8 BIDDER 2 OF 9 BIDDER 30F 9
UNIT BID pmc‘ﬂ“""‘“"""""“"’“‘"‘wm AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | JTOTAL AMOUNT _{UNIT BID PRICE (iIN| _ TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) EQUA!:“W XUNIT (IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT
RICE} PRICE) PRICE)
meM# Cory UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM 06 NOT ROUND 50 NOT ROUND DO NOT REUND
QMLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 4 - IMPROVEMENTS 10 AREA BETWEEN TRAIN AND ARROYO
52, 9 EA Tree - 2" Catiper $396.75 $3,570.75 $350.00 sa,qsamu $329.40 $2,964.60
53. 6 EA Shrub {1 Gallon) $11.50 $69.00\H $20.00 $120.00| $2067 $124.02
54, 6 EA Shrub {5 Gallon) $28.75 5172_50L\ $32.00 s192.uoﬁg $28.81 $172.86
55. 3,556 SF 3/14" Rock Mutch - 3" Depth $1.27 $4,516.12 $1.25 $4 445,005 $1.01 $3 591,561
56. 115 LF Steel Edging $5.98 $687.70 $4.00 $460.00 $8.84 $1,016.60]
SUM TOTAL — ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 4 {ITEMS 52-56) $9,016.07 $6,367.00 $7,869.64
Approved By: (- 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Page 7 of 24

Date: 4 ffecfry’



CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

-
2017 Awa

BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019-068
s8I0 DATE: Octobar 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
BLACK ST“""'?;‘C‘_:O"TRACTORS' DEL MAR CONTRACTING, INC GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASQ, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
HIDDER 1 OF 9 BIDDER 2 OF 9 BIDDER 3 OF 9
UNIT BID PRIGE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT [JUNIT BID PRICE (IN]  TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE) : BRICE) rRICE)
fmem#| "oy UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM 00 O D 50 HOT RaND 5O NOY AUND
ONLY TWO OECIMAL ONLY TWO DEGCIMAL ONLY TWD DECIKAL
FLACES PLACES PLAGES
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 5 - DOG AREA
57. 188 LF Ghain Link Fenca - 4" High $30.50 £5,750.92 $33.00 ss.zm.aoﬂ $32.45 £6,100.60
58. 1 EA Chain Link Gate - 4' Wide 5661.25 $6861.25 $700.00 $700.00 $701.50 $701.50
58, 891 SF Sod $1.73 $1,541.43 $6.20 $5,524.20] $1.01 $899.91
60. 914 SE 318" Screaning - 3" Depth 51.27 $1.160.78 $2.00 $1,828.00| $1.52 $1,389.28|
B1. 2 EA Trea - 2" Caliper $402.50 $805.00] $350.00 $700.00| $329.40 $656.80
62. 2 EA Bench 51,840.00 $3,680.00} $600.00 $1,200.00] $1,183.40 $2,366.80
SUM TOTAL ~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 5 (ITEMS 57-62) $13,559.38 $16,156.20 $12,116.89
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 6 - WIRE WELDED FENCE
83, 1 Ls | Wire-Welded Fance for Baskethall Court $25.200.00 $25,200.00 $31,000.00 531,000.00" $31,518.74 $31,518.74
(including Single Swing Gate)
SUM TOTAL - ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 6 {ITEM 63) $25,200,00 £31,000.00 $31,518.74
AMENDMENTS NO. 1 & NO. 2 ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES YES
|pip BOND SUBMITTED YES YES YES
Approved By: (G~ 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: tfjql 1y Page B of 24




CITY OF EL. PASO

BID TABULATION FORM 2015 A e e
ialo TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019-068
BID BATE: October 24, 2618 DEPARTMENT: GAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER INC. dba CSA
CONSTRUCTORS KEYSTONE GC, LLC MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 9 BIDDER 5 OF 9 BIDDER 6 OF 9
TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX UNIT BID PRICE (QUANTTY S UNIT UNIT BID PRICE fQuaRI X UNIT UNIT BID PRICE (iN A e
PRICE) PRICE) B PRICE)
FTEM# oty UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM {IN FIGURES}) 00 NOT ROUND (IN FIGURES) DO NOT ROUND FIGURES) £O NOT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAYL OHNLY TWD DECIMAL CQNLY TWO DECHAAL
PLACES PLACES PLAGES
A SWFPP AND CONSTRUCTION SIGN
1. 5 MONTH|  Furnish, Instalt and Maintain SWPPP $1,105.00 ss,szs.ooﬂ $1,861.16 $9,305.80 $2,348,00 $11,740.00
2. 1 EA Furniah and Install Conatruction Sign 3877.00 3877.0 $933.25 $933.25 £661.43 $661.433
B. DEMOLITION AND EARTHWORK
3. 2 AC Clearing and Grubbing £1,105.00 $2,210.00H £2,433.20 $4,866.40 $1.322.86 $2,645.72
4, 1,064 cyY Grading $19.05 $20.269.20J $71.24 $75,799.36) $105.68 $112,443.52
5. 620 cy Top Soil - 12" For Sod Area (New Fili) $39.00 524,180.00H $33.27 $20,627.40 $46.95 $25,109.00)
C. HARDSCAPE
6. 60 LF Conerete Curb and Gutter $15.60 3936.00“ $139.42 $8,365.20 $15.87 5952.201
7. 1,490 SF Conerete Sidewalk - 4" Thick $4.24 $6,317.60] $3.87 $5,766.30 $6.20 $9,357.20/
8. 4 EA ADA Ramp $1,078.00 $4,316.00] $769.66 $3,078.64 $992.14 $3.988.561
g. 2,070 LF Concrate Header Curb (Edging) $11.05 $22,873.50ﬂ $11.10 $22.977.00” $19.84 541.068.80I
Approved, By: CG’ 2018-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDOSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: Lt/ lty Page 9 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

1017

e Time: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER INC. dha CSA
CONETRUCTORE KEYSTONE GC, LLC MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASQ, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 9 BIDDER 5 OF 9 BIDDER & OF 9
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT [JUNIT BID PRIGE (IN] _ TOTAL AMOUNT |
APPRX {IN FIGURES) {QUANTETYEX UNIT {IN FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) (QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE} PRICE) PRICE)
ITEM # Qary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM 00 NDT ROUND PO HOT ROLUND 00 MNOT ROUND
QHNLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TW( DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
C. HARDSCAPE
10, 175 g | Concrete Curb at i“i:“’md Wood Fibar $39.00 $6,825.00 $38.26 $6,605.50 $15.87 $2,777.25]
1. 1 EA Playground Raintenance Opening $1,430.00 $1,430.00} $449.44 3440 44t $859.86 $859,86]
12, 40 gy | Concrete s""’"":g f,:::: Path - Complete $97.50 $3,900.00) $168.17 $6,766.80) $99.21 $3,968.40
13, 820 sY | Concrete Walk Path - 4" Thick (Stamped) $54.00 $44,280.00) $40.99 $33,611.80 $83.34 $68,338.80}
4. | sgss | sp |38 Stabilized Chat Franklin Rad - 3" Gapth $4.36 $35,174.60 $4.05 $36,380.26 $1.94 $17,430.90]
{Complete In Place) T
15, 780 LF Rock Seat Wall with Footing and Cap $28.60 $22,308. $46.81 $36,511.80) $66.14 $51,569.20
{Complete In Place}
Asphalt Concrate Pavament - 2*ACI6"ABC u
16. 450 $G (w6 Subgrade Prop) $10.40 $4,680.00 $8.11 $3,649.50; $8.73 $3.928.50]
12" Half Pipe Class 4 RCP (Includes
17. 13 LF BackHil, Subsgrade Prap & Pond Rack) $162.00 $2,106.00) $97.21 $1,263.73 $274.76 $3,571.88
1B. 1 LS Park Area Lighting Improvements $136,516.00 $139,516.00 $120.433.16 $129,433.16 $128,178.20 $128,178.20
(Compilate in Place)
Approved By: (3G 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAFE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: {¢f{ct [{Y Page 10 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM
IBID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BiD NO: 2019-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER INC. dha CSA
CONSTRUCTORS KEYSTONE GG, LLC MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASQ, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 8 BIDDERSOF 9 BIDDER 6 OF &
UNIT BiD PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BiD PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID PRICE {IN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) {QUAP;QT:EX UNIT {IN FIGURES) [QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNITY
1CE) PRICE} PRICE)
ITEM # aTy UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM DO NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND D6 HOT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLAGES PLACES PLACES

C. HARDSCAPE

19, 1 Ls Wrought Iron Fence For Electrical $7,505.00 $7,595.00 $8.444.81 $8,444.81 $7,729.45 $7.729.45
Enclosure {including Gate}

20 4 EA Concrete Flume With Steel Plate Cover §2,600.00 $2.600.00ﬁ %2,142.04 $2,142.04 $B59.86 $859.86

D. IRRIGATION

frrigation Modifications {Including Heated
21, 1 LS Enclosure & Satollite Gontroliar) $7,109.00 $7,108.00 $11,106.72 $11,106.72 $11,905.71 $11,905.71
22. 1 LS Irrigation System - Complete In Place $71,500.00 $71,500.00 3$74,044.82 $74,044.82 $79,371.40 $79,371.40]
E. SITE IMPROVEMENTS
Engineered Wood Fibers - 12" Depth DH
508

23. 125 cYy (Complete In Plage) $32.50 $4,062.5 $61.70 %7,712.50 $64.34 $8,042.50
24. 1 g | FullSize B"”"““’;:'af:"“ - Complete In $62,400.00 $62.40000]  $57.433.41 $57,433.41 $93,922.83 $03,922.83]
25, 1 EA Park Monument Sign - Complete In Place $6,500.00] $6,500.00) $10,453.94 $10,453.44j $12,170.28 $12,170.28
26. 1 EA Park Rules Sign - Compleate In Place $650.00] $650.00 $675.03 $675.03 $1,058.29 $1,058.29]
27. 3 EA Accessible Sign - Complete In Place $195.00 $585.00 $311.11 5933.331 $562.21 $1,686.63

Appmve? By: (¢ [

Date: { /{ {1 ¥

2018-08B BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS

Page 11 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

u l‘mv
2017 Award Wi

|aio nivLe: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019-088
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER INC. dba CSA
CONSTRUCTORS KEVSTONE GG, LLG MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 9 BIDDER 5 OF 9 EIDDER 6 OF 9
UNIT BID PRIGE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT [IUNIT BID PRICE (IN]  TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) 'Quaﬁggsx UNIT || {IN FIGURES) toum;g[rga? uNiY FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT
} PRICE)}
mEM# Ty UNIT BRIEF DESGRIPTION OF ITEM DO NOT ROUND b0 NOT RBUND DG NOT ROUND
OHLY TWO BECIMAL GNLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
- PLACES PLACES PLACES
F. LANDSCAPING
28. 4 EA Tree - 1* Caliper $143.00 $572.00) $197.45 s7ag.aoﬂ $211.66 $846 64}
29, 45 EA Tree - 2" Galiper $266.00 $12,870.00 $425.76 $19,159.20| $456.39 $20,537.55§
30. 10 EA Tree - 3" Caliper $604.00 $6,040.00 $739.21 $7.392.10 $792.39 $7,923.90
31. 18 EA Shrub {1 Gallon) $11.05 $198.90, 511.11 $199.98 $11.91 $214.38
32, 183 EA Shrub (5 Gallen) $27.30 $4,995.90} $20.62 $5,420.46| $31.76 $5,810.25
33. 4 EA Shrub (15 Gallon} $162.50 $1,137.50§ $196.22 $1,373.54 $210.33 $1,472.31
34. 2 EA Transplant Tree - 2" Caliper $136.50 $273.00] $370.22 $740.44 $396.86 $793.72
35. 80 EA Transplant Shrub $13.00 $780.00} $22.21 $1,332.604 $23.81 $1,428.60¢
36. 18 EA Plant Donated Shrub $13.00 $234.00 $14.81 $266.58 $15.87 5285.66}
a7. | 16,141 SF Sod $1.24 $20,758.84) $1.85 $30,970.85) $1.98 $33,147.1al
Approved By: (*(~ 2019-066 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Dale: u![ailf( Page 12 of 24



CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

_ 2047 Award WinneT

lam TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019068
BID BATE: Octobar 24, 2018 DEFARTRIENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER [NC. dha CSA
CONSTRUCTORS KEYSTONE GC, LLC MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASD, TX EL. PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER4 OF & BIDDER 5 0F 9 BIDDER G QF &
UNIT BID PRIGE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRIGE | TOTAL AMOUNT [{UNIT BID PRICE {INl  TOTAL AMOUNT
(N FIGURES) [QUANTITY X UNIT {{H FIGURES) (QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) (QUANTITY X UNIT
APPRX PRICE) PRICE) PRICE)
ITEM # ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITERA BO NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL QNLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLAGES PLACES PLACES
F. LANDSCAPING
a8, 7i0 LE Steel Edging $4.23 $3,087.9 $6.42 $4,686.8 $6.88 $5,022.490
314" Rock Mutch Desert Tan - 3" Depth withj
30, 7.230 SF Weed Barrier 1.1 $8,025.30 $1.36 $9,832.80 $1.46 $10,555.80}
34" Mulch Franklin Red - 3" Depth with
40, 5,221 SF Weed Barrier $1.17 $6,108.57 $1.07 $5,586.47 $1.15 $6,004.15
1 1/2" - 3" Native Screen Rock 3" Depth, Fill
a1, 6,178 86 wi3/4* Native Rock (Instati Onty) $0.59 $3,645.02 $1.23 $7,598.94; %$1.32 $8,154.96§
3" - 6" Native Screen Rock 6" Repth, Fill
42, 5,375 SF with 3/4” Native Rock {Instal! Only) $0.72 $3,870.0 $1.23 £6,611.25 $1.32 $7,085.00%
43, 2 EA Boulder Desert Tan - 2'x2'x2’ $234.00 MSB.GDF $271.50 $543.00 $281.03 $582.08E
0 |
44, 4 EA Boulder Desert Tan - 3'x3'x3" $247.00 $988.00 $370.22 $1,480.88( $306.86 $1,587.44
45, 3 EA Boulder Desert Tan - 4'x4'x4" $273.00 $819.00] $555.34 $1,666.0£ $505.29 $1,785.87
589,687.33
SUM TOTAL - BASE BID {TEMS 1 thru 45 ¥ 597 $685,087.94 $822,584.24
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE: § 589,594.33
MOBILIZATION
{NOT TO EXGEED 5% OF SUM TOTAL BASE BID) $19,500.00 $3,702.24 $3,805.77
£609,097.33
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID AND MOBILIZATION} $688,7590.18 $826,120.01
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE: § 668,094.33

Approved By:
Date: 1t {1

R

2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS

Page 13 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2t Pracorenent
2017 Award Wi

BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019.068
BID DATE: Qctobar 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER INC. dba CSA
CONSTRUCTORS KEYSTONE GG, LLC MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASOQ, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 9 BIDDER 5 QF 9 BIDDER 6 OF 9
UNvﬁ BID PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT [{UNIT BID PRICE {IN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE) PRICE} PRICE}
hITEHl # aTy UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM 50 NOT ROUND BO NOT ROUND 0 NOT ROUND
OHLY TWO DECIMAL QNLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1 - WATER HARVESTING AREA
46. 2 EA Traa - 2" Caliper $286.00 8572.00 $425.76 $851.52 $971.44 $1,942 88}
47, 4 EA Shrub (1 Gallon} $11.05 $44 204 1111 $44.44 $25.34 $101.38
48, 14 EA Shrub (5§ Gallon} $27.30 $300.30{ $29.62 $325.824 $67.58 $743.38
3" - 6" Native S Rock 6" Dapth, Fill sez3.22
- ative Screen Roc s
449, 221 SF wi1i4* Native Rock (Instali Oniy) $0.72 $159.12 $1.23 $271.83, §2.82 CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE: §622.22
$3,410.04
SUM TOTAL — ADDITWE ALTERNATE NO. 1 {ITEMS 46-45) $1.075.62 $1,493.61
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE $3,409.84
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 2 - PARKING AREA
50. 1 Ls | Parking Area “’s;';;:fg‘“’ Chat and Stael $42,900.00 MZ,SO0.00I $46,832.37 $46,832.37 $51,506.86 $51,586.86]
SUM TOTAL -~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 2 {ITEM 50) $42,900.00 $46,832.37 $51,586.86
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 3 - CGANTATA CHIMES
51. 1 EA Cantata Chimes $6,500.00 58.500.00H $8,054.84 $8,054.84 $3,546.03 $3,546.03)
SUM TOTAL - ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 3 {{TEM 51} $6,500.00 $8,054.84 $3,546.03
Approved By: C("’ 2019-058 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Page 14 of 24

Date: {1 ffcyf
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2017 Avard Winne? g,

BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NQ: 2019.068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER INC. dha CSA
CONSTRUCTORS KEYSTONE GC, LLC MIRADOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASD, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 9 BIDDER5OF 9 BIDDER 6 OF &
UNIT BID PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID PRIGE TOTAL AMOUNT {UNIT BID PRICE {!N’ TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT r FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE} PRICE) PRICE)
ITEM # aTY UNIT BRIEF BDESCRIPTION OF ITEM DO NOT ROUND [0 HOT ROUND 00 ROT ROUND
QNLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWD DECIMAL OHLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES BLACES
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 4 - IMPROVEMENTS TO AREA BETWEEN TRAIN AND ARROYO
52, 9 EA Tree - 2" Caliper $286.00 52‘574.00‘ $425.76 $3.831.84ﬂ $470.62 $4,235.58]
53. 6 EA Shrub {1 Gallon) $11.05 Sﬁﬁ(alﬂ 51111 $66.66 $12.28 $73.688
£163.80
54, [ EA Shrub {5 Gallon) $27.30 CONTRACTOR'S $29.62 $177.72 £32.74 $195.44
PRICE: §745.29
55. 3,556 SF 34" Rock Mulch - 3" Bepth $1.24 $4.409.44!1 $1.36 $4,836.16 $1.50 $5,334.00
$815.35
56. 115 LF Stesl Edging $4.23 $486.45, $6.42 $738.30]J $7.08%coNTRACTOR'S
PRICE $815.34
$7,698.99 $10,655.05
SUM TOTAL - ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 4 ITEMS 52-56} $9,660.68
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE: $8,281.48 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE 510,655.04

Approved By: (M-

Date: |}

flaliy

2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS

Page 15 0f 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

w AT

65 1 Precorecent
2017 Award Wi

ner ﬁ“
BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS B\D NO; 2019-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEFPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
KARLSRUHER INC. dba CSA
CONSTRUCTORS KEYSTONE GC, LLC MIRADDOR ENTERPRISES, INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 8 BIDDER S OF 9 BIDDER 6 OF 9
UNIT 8ID PRtC'E' TOTAL AMDUNT UNIT BID PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT  |lUNIT BID PRICE {IN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) {QUAN?T'CVE? UNIT [IN FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
P PRICE}) PRICE)
ITEM # QTy UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTIOM OF ITEM 0 NOT ROUND 00 NOT ROUND BE HOT ROUND
OMLY TWO DEGIMAL ONLY TWD DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 5 - DOG AREA
57. 188 LF Chain Link Fence - 4' High $32.50 $6,1 10.00H $22.21 $4,175.48 $39.14 $7,358.32
BB. 4 EA Chain Link Gate - 4° Wide $747.00 $747.004 $610.87 $610.87 $846.06 $B846.06
$1,869.11
59, 891 SF Sod $1.24 $1.104.84 $1.85 $1,648.35 $2.21 CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $1.966 54
$1,480.68}
60, 944 SF 38" Screening - 3" Depth 1.1 $1,.014.54 $1.36 $1,243.04 F1.62|CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $1,479.35
$1.015.288
61. 2 EA Trae - 2" Caliper $286.00 $572.00 342576 §B51.52 3507 8AlconTRACTOR'S
PRICE 51 015,27
62, 2 EA Bench $1,105.00 $2,210.00; $1,246.42 $2‘492.84L $1,851.33 $3,722.66
$11,758.38 $16,392.11
- . 2 ,022,
SUM TOTAL — ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 5 (ITEMS 57-6 ) CONTRACTOR'S PRICE; $6,259.38 $11,022.10 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE 516,388,118
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NOQ. 6 - WIRE WELDED FENCE
Wire-Welded Fence for Baskethall Court
63, 1 LS (Including Singis Swing Gate) $32,500.00 $32,500.00 $31,882.51 $31,882.51 $32,523.15 $32,523.154
SUM TOTAL — ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 6 (ITEM 63) $32,500.00 $31,882.51 $32,523.15
AMENDMENTS NO. 1 & NO. 2 ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES YES
jBID BOND SUBMITTED YES YES YES

. o
porove B i

2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS

Page 16 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM i
!BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS 81D NO: 2019.068
BiD DATE: QOctobar 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVERENT
PRIDE GENERAL CONTRACTORS, SYNERGY PROJECT CONSULTANTS, TAD INDUSTRIES, INC. dba HAWK
LLC INC, CONSTRUCTION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER7 OF 9 BIDDER 8OF 9 BIDDER 9 OF 9
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTALAMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMDUNT || UNIT BID PRICE iN | TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN EIGURES) (QUANTITYEX UNIT {IN FIGURES) {Qumg:’g ); UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X LINIT
PRICE) PRICE PRICE)
ITEM # ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM O NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND BO NOT AOUND
ONLY TWO BECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
A ON SIGN
1 -] MONTH Fumish, Install and Maintain SWPPP $819.00 $4.095.Uﬂq $2,855.80 $14,279.00 $2,715.74 $13,578.70)
2. 1 EA Furnish and Install Construction Sign $819.00 $819.00 $1.784.00 $1,784.00§ $696.32 $696.32
B. DEMOLITION AND EARTHWORK
3 2 AC Clearing and Grubbing $2,340.00 $4,680.00ﬂ £1,000.00 $2,000.00u $3,408.88 $6,81 9.76E
4. 1,064 Y Grading $17.55 $18,673.20{ $79.89 $85,002.96 $16.43 $17.481.52
b, 620 cYy Top Soil - 12” For Sod Area {New Fili} $41.52 525,742.40" $115.08 EYA] ,349.60] $62.67 $38,855.40
C. HARDSCAPE
& 60 LF Concrete Curb and Gutter $17.55 $1,053.00 345.90 $2,754.00 $33.81 $2,028.607
7. 1,490 SF Concrete Sidewalk - 4" Thick $4.10 $6,109.00¥ $5.56 $8.2_84.40L $8.52] $12,694.80
8 4 EA ADA Ramp $1,111.50 $4,446.00 $1,298.50 $5,194.004 $1,129.39 $4,517.56%
3 2,070 LF Concrete Header Curh {Edging) $10.53 LY .797.10E $5.01 $10,370.70 $11.30 $23,391.00
Approve? By: fa<s 2018-088 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
pate: ¢t/{qlcy Page 17 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM B o Pracusenest:
2017 Awaed Winnier
BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019.068
B0 DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
PRIDE GENERAL CONTRAGTORS, || SYNERGY PROJECT CONSULTANTS, TAO INDUSTRIES, INC. dba HAWK
LLe INC. CONSTRUCTION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER 7 OF 8 BIDDER 8 OF BIDDER 9 OF 9
TOTAL AMOEINT TOTAL AMDUNT TOTAL AMIOUNT
APPRX unTBID PRICE | e | unireip price | Y XN BiD PRICE | QU X UNIT
PRICE) PRICE]) PRICE}
ITEM # QaTyY UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM {IN FIGURES) DO NOT ROUND {IN FIGURES) DO NOT ROUND FIGURES) DO NOT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL OHLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
C. HARDSCAPE

10. 175 g | Conerete Curb at 'i'i:‘”’ed Wood Fiber $46.80 $8,190.00 $19.47 $3.407.25 $26.54 $4,644.500

11. 1 EA Playground Maintenantce Opening $2,340.00 $2,340.00( $814.00 $814.00 $3,565.21 $3,585.29

12, 40 gy | Concrete S“’P"""g §:::: Path - Complata $73.71 $2,948.40 $192.50 $7,700.00] $322.60 $12,904.00]

13, 820 SY | Concrete Walk Path - 4 Thick (Stamped) $55.28 $46,329.60 $44.93 $36,842,60) $54.83 $44,950,60}

3/8" Stabilized Chat Franklin Red - 3" Depth
14. | 8988 SF (Gomplots I Placer $1.72 $15.454 201 $0.37 $3,324 43 $4.91 $44.116.35
15, 780 LF Rock Seat Wall with Footing and Cap $46.80 $36,504.00 $32.86 $25,630.80] 533,77 $26,340.60
(Complete In Place}
Asphalt Goncrets Pavement - 2*AC/E"ABC oL
16. 450 SG (wit" Subgrads Prop) $35.10 $15,795.001 $5.60 $2,520.0 $27.04 $12,168.00
412" Half Pipe Class 4 RCP (Includes
17, 13 LF Backfil, Sabarade Pran & Pond Fom) $304.20 $3,954.60] $207.70 $2,700.10} $150.98 $1,962.74]
18. 1 LS Park Area Lighting Improvements $111,150,00 $111,150.00 $113,482.00 $113 462.0 $147,834.49 $147,834.49
{Complste In Place) g }
Approved By: /v (- 2019.068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: {( {{‘ﬂ%{ Page 18 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Th ta
2007 A

ward Winnet =
. .

BID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2049-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
' PRIDE GENERAL CONTRACTORS, | SYNERGY PROJECT CONSULTANTS, TAO INDUSTRIES, INC, dba HAWK
LLe INC. CONSTRUCTION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER 7 OF 9 BIDDER 8 OF 8 BIDDER 8 OF §
UNITBID PRICE | TOTALAMOUNT I UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE {IN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) taum;'g:’g; UNIT {IN FIGURES) (OUAlmlTY XUNT FIGURES) (QUANTITY X UNIY
cE) PRICE}
ITEM# "y UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM 00 NOT AGUND 60 HOT RAUND 50 NOT RBUND
OLY TWO BECIMAL ONLY TWO DECHIAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
FLACES PLACES PLACES
C. HARDSCAPE
Wrought Iron Fence For Electrical ! Oﬂ
19. 1 LS Enclosure {Including Gats} $8,130.00 $8,190.0 $12,626.00 $12,626.00 $8,137.18 $B,137.18])
20. 1 EA Concrate Flume With Steel Plate Cover $5,265.00 $5,265.00 $6,354.00 $8.354.00’ $2,830.77 $2,830.77;
D. IRRIGATICN
Irrigation Modifications (Including Heated “

21, 1 LS Enclosure & Satellite Gontrolier} $10,530.00 $10,530.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.0 $7.616.33 $7.616.33§
22, 1 LS Irrigation System - Complete In Place $70,200.00 570,200.001 $43,500.00 $43,500.00ﬂ $78,983.41 $78,.983.41
E. SITE IMPROVEMENTS
23, 125 oy Engineered Woad Fibers - 12" Depth $61.59 $7,698.75 $100.00 $12,sco.aog $110.76 $13,845.00

{Complete In Place)
24, 1 Ls | Full SireBasketall Court - Complete In $70,200.00 $70,200.00) $34,773.00 $34,773.00] $59,423.42 $59,423.42
25, 1 EA Park Monument Sign - Complets In Place $14,040.00 $14,040.00{ $16,439.00 $19,439.00] $12,365.64 512,365.641
26. i EA Park Rules Sign - Complete In Place $2,106.00 52.105.0011 $2,353.00 $2,353.00] $954.24 595424
27. 3 EA Accessible Sign - Complete In Place $468.00 Y .404.00' $564.67 $1,684.01 $578.23 S1,?34.69i
Approved By: /oc; 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: ![/{‘;! 314 Page 19 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

i

5 e

2017 A

Iam TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2019-068
BID DATE: October 34, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
PRIDE GENERAL CONTRACTORS, || SYNERGY PROJEGT CONSULTANTS, TAO INDUSTRIES, INC. dba HAWK
LLe INC. CONSTRUCTION
EL PASO, TX EL PASD, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER 7 OF 8 BIDDER & OF 9 BIDDER 9 OF 9
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRIGE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE (iN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX (IN FIGURES) (QUANﬂTg X UNIT {IN FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) [QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE) PRICE} PRICE)
mem¥ Coy UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF [TEM DO NOT ROUND 0O NOT RCUND 00 HOT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWD DECIMAL
— puu_:_es BLACES PLACES
F. LANDSCAPING
28. 4 EA Tres - 1" Caliper $187.20 $748.80 $200.00 $800.00 $153.19 $612.76
$11,250.00
29, 45 EA Trae - 2" Calipar $403.65 $16,164.25] $250.00|oNTRACTOR'S $306.38 $13,787.10]
PRICE $11,750.00
30, 10 EA Tree - 3" Caliper $700.83 $7,008.30) $450.00 $4,500.00] $647.58 $6,475.80
31 18 EA Shrub {1 Gallon} $10.53 $1689.54 $18.00 $324.00 $11.684 $213.12
32, 183 EA Shrub (5 Gallon) $28.08 $5,138.64 $25.00 $4,575,00) $29,25 $5,352.75
33 7 EA Shrub (15 Gallon) $186.03 $1,302.21 $125.00 $875.00 $174.08 $1,218.56)
34, 2 EA Transpiant Troe - 2* Caliper $351.00] $702.00 $200.00 $400.00) $146.23 $202.46
as. 60 EA Transplant Shrub $21.08 $1,263.60 $15.00 $900.00; $13.93 $835.80]
36. 18 EA Plant Donated Shrub $14.04 $252.72 $5.00 $80.00 $13.93 $250.74
37, 16,744 SF Sod $1.76 $29,454.16ﬂ 51.00 $1s.741.0a% $1.32 $22.098.12
Approved By: IC A 2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
pate: ([ [{alfE Page 20 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

"lwi

20 Avward Winnel g
181D TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BI} NO: 2019-058
BID DATE: Octobar 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
PRIDE GENERAL CONTRACTORS, || SYNERGY PROJECT GONSULTANTS, TAC INDUSTRIES, INC. dba HAWK
LLE INC. CONSTRUGTION
EL PASD, TX EL PASO, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER 7 OF 9 BIDDER & OF 9 BIDDER 9 OF 9
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT || UNIT BID PRICE (IN TOTAL AMDUNT
{IN FIGURES) | (QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES) (QUANTIFY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
APPRX PRICE) PRICE} PRICE}
ITEM # ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM DO HOY ROUND DO HOT ROUND D0 NOT ROUKD
QNLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL QNLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
F. LANDSCAPING
38. 730 LF Steel Edging $6.08 54,433.401 $18.00 $13,140.00 $4.53 $3,306.90]
39, | 7,230 gr |4 Rock Mulch Desert Tan - 3" Depth with $1.29 $9,326.70] 50.60 $4,338.00 $1.18 $8,531.40
Wead Barrier
3/4* Mulch Franklin Red - 3° Depth with $2.610.50)
40. [ 5221 SF Wead Barrier $1.02 $5,325.42 $0.50)c aNTRAGTOR'S $1.25 $6,526.25
PRICE: 52,60.50
1 4/2" - 3* Native Screen Rock 3" Depth, Fill *
41, 6,178 sG wi3/4" Native Rock (Install Only) $1.17 $7.228.26 $0.25 $1,544.50] $0.63 $3,802.14
3* - 6" Natlve Scresn Rock 8" Dapth, Fill
42. 5,375 EA with 3/4" Native Rock (Install Only} $1.17 $6,268.75} $0.28 $1,505.00 $0.77 $4.128,751
43. b4 EA Bouldar Desert Tan - 2'x2'x2’ $257.40 $514.80 $200.00 $400.00u $250.68 $501.36}
$1,200.00]
44, 4 EA Boulder Desert Tan - 3'x3'x3’ $351.00 $1,404.00 $300.00icoNTRACTOR'S $264.60 $1,058.40
FRICE: §7,700,00
45, 3 EA Boulder Desert Tan - 4'x4'x4" $526.50 $1,578.50 $400.00 $1,200.00] $292.45 3877.35
$613,061.87
SUM TOTAL - BASE BID ITEMS 1 thru 45 $619,054,30 $684,420.59
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE $784,520.91
MOBILIZATION $30,652.59
(NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM TOTAL BASE BID) $24,762.17 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE: $39,076.00 $33,600.00
$643,704.46
SUM TOTAL {BASE BID AND MOBILIZATION) $643,816.47 $718,020.59
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE $820,596,91

Appioved By, Q{}
it

Date: it /{4t

2019-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAFE IMPROVEMENTS

Page 21 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

2017 Award Winne?

IBID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS B8ID NO: 2019-068
BID DATE: October 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
PRIDE GENERAL CONTRACTORS, SYNERGY PROJECT CONSULTANTS, TAO INDUSTRIES, INC, dba HAWK
LLe INC. CONSTRUCTION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER7OF 3 BIDDERBOF 9 BIDDER 9 OF 8
UNITBID PRICE | TOTAL AMQUNT UNIT BID PRICE TOTAL AMQUNT UNIT BID PRICE (IN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) (Qum;g;fg’x UNIT {IN FIGURES}) {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) (QUANTITY X UNIT
E) PRICE) PRICE)
memal APPRX | gy BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM norHice) roncE) L FRE)
ONLY TWO DECIMAYL ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES PLACES
ADDITIVE ALT EE ARVESTING AREA
46, 2 EA Tree - 2" Caliper $348.66 $697.32 $250.00 $500.00 $253.00 $506.00
a7, 4 €A Shrub {1 Gallon) $17.55 $70.20) $10.00 $40.00)| $9.78 $39.12
$220.00
48, 11 EA Shrub (5 Gallon) 530.42 $334.62 $20.00|cONTRACTOR'S 524.15 5265.65
PRICE $120.00
$61.88
3" . §" Native Screen Rock 6" Depth, Fill
a9. | 2z SF wHit" Netive Rock (otull Oy $3.92 $866.32 $0.28]conrracToR'S 50.64 $141.44]
PRICE $61.00
$821.88
SUM TOTAL ~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1 (ITEMS 45.49) $1,968.45 $952.21
CONTRACTOR'S PRICE 5721.00
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 2 - PARKING AREA
50, 1 Ls | Parking Area “’5;‘;:::‘1 Chatand Steel $28,080.00 528,080.00] $9,931.00 $9,931.00§ $34,500.00 $34,500.00]
SUM TOTAL ~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 2 (ITEM 50) $26,080.00 $9,931.00 $34,500.00
51, 1 EA Cantata Chimes §7,097.51 $7,097.51 $1,500.00 $1.500.00] $7,092.05 $7,082.05
SUM TOTAL ~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 3 (ITEM 54) $7,097.51 $1,500.00 $7,092.05

Approved By: £~
Date: ({ /f[1¢

2015-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS

Page 22 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

{sln TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: 2012.068
BID DATE: Gctohor 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
PRIDE GENERAL CONTRACTORS, || SYNERGY PROJECT CONSULTANTS, TAD INDUSTRIES, INC. dha HAWK
LLe INC. CONSTRUCTION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER 7 OF 9 BIDDER B OF 9 BIDDER 9 OF 9
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT | UNIT BID PRICE | TOTALAMOUNT E UNIT BID PRICE (IN | TOTAL AMGUNT
APPRX {IN FIGURES) (aum::grv X UNIY {IN FIGURES) (Qumn:;vﬁx UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
CE} PRICE) PRICE)
ITEM# ooy UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM 00 NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND DOt RaUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECHAAL CMLY TWO DECIMAL
PLACES PLACES
RAIN AND ARRGYO
52, 9 EA Tree - 2" Caliper $348.66 $3,137.94 $250.00 sz.zso.onﬂ $253.00 $2,277.00
53. 6 EA Shrub (1 Gallon) $17.55 $105.30 $15.00 %90.00 $9.78 sss,esﬁ
54, I £a Shrub (§ Gallon) $29.25 $175.50 $20.00 $120.00L; £24.15 $144.90]
55. 3,556 SF 3/4" Rock Mulch - 3" Depth $1.01 $3,591.56 $0.60 $2.133.ﬁ@l§ $1.10 33,911 .601
56. 115 LF Steel Edging $6.08 $699.20| $18.00 $2,070.00) 53.74 $430.10
SUM TOTAL ~ ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 4 (ITEMS 52-56) $7,708.50 $6,663.60 $6,822.28
Approved By: (OC— 2619-068 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: [iffci/{¥ Page 23 of 24



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

IBID TITLE: BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS 8D NO: 2019-068
BID DATE: QOctober 24, 2018 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
FPRIDE GENERAL CONTRACTORS, || SYNERGY PROJECT CONSULTANTS, TAQ INDUSTRIES, INC. dba HAWK
LLe INC. CONSTRUCTION
ELPASO, TX El. PASO, TX HORIZON, TX
BIDDER 7 OF 9 BIDDER 8 OF 8 BIDDER 2 OF &
UNIT BID PRICE | TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID PRICE TOTAL AMODUNT UNIT BID PRICE {IN TOTAL AMOUNT
APPRX (IN FIGURES) (QUANTITY X UNIT {IN FIGURES} {QUANTITY X UNIT FIGURES) {QUANTITY X UNIT
PRICE) PRICE} PRICE}
ITEM # ary UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM DO NOT ROUND 3O NOT ROUND DO NOT ROUND
ONLY TWO DECIMAL ONLY TWO DECIMAL OHLY TWO OECIMAL
PLAGES PLACES PLACES
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 5 - DOG AREA
57, 188 LF Chain Link Fence - 4' High $23.40 $4,399.20) $38.52 $7,241.76 $30.59 $5,750.92
§8. 1 EA Chain Link Gats - 4' Wide $234.00 $234.00; $1,840.00 $1,840.00 $661.25 £661.25
89. 891 SF Sod $2.28 $2,031.48 $1.00 $891.00 $1.10 $5880.10§
60, 914 SF 3/8" Screening - 3" Depth $1.03 $941.42 $0.30 $274.200 $0.98 5895.72
61. 2 EA Tren - 2" Caliper $348.66 $697.32 $250.00 $500.004 $253.00 $506.008
62. 2 EA Bench $1,480.64 $2,961.28) $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,7668.70 $3,537.40¢
SUM TOTAL - ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 5 (ITEMS §7-62 } $11,264.70 §12,046,96 $12,331.39
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 6 - WIRE WELDED FENCE
Wire-Welded Fence for Basketball Court Dl
63, 1 LS (Including Single Swing Gate) $39,400.00 $39,400.0 $27.830.00 527,BSO.GDH $29,710.30 $29,710.30
SUM TOTAL — ADDITIVE ALTERNATE NO. 6 {ITEM 63) $39,400.00 $27,830.00 $29,710.30
AMENDMENTS NO. 1 & NQ, 2 ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES YES
181D BOND SUBMITTED YES YES YES
Approved 8y, & 2019-0688 BARTLETT PARK LANDSCAPE IMPROVEMENTS
Date: /[ HicT Page 24 of 24



2019-068 Bartiett Park Landscape Improvements

Name

1 koehn, peggy

2 Bustillos, Luis

3 Counts, Tim

4 Pena, Lorenzo

5 herrera, cesar

6 Leanos, Nancy

7 Rick, Barraza

8 Simms, Barry

9 Luna, Larry
10 Luna, Hector
11 Ayala, Luz
12 Duify, Brian
13 Concha, David
14 Paoli, Marcos
15 Bluett, Claire
16 Murillo, Marco
17 Wilbanks, Ben
18 Kyle, Bellomy
19 Gibson, Patty
20 Wood, Jayne
21 Deg, Maria
22 Oney, Hilary
23 Price, Jerry
24 HARRISON, MIKE
25 Hudson, Brad
26 Dodge, Montana
27 koehn, peggy
28 Soto, Daniel
29 Erick, Osorio
30 Escobedo, Mario
31 Kew, Jerrod
32 Estrada, Jose
33 Archie, Banks
34 Gonzalez, Ruben
35 Gorham, Rita
36 Jorge, Ojeda
37 Erwin, Matthew
38 Armando, Armando
39 Wilson, Yvonne
40 Mejia, Saul
41 morgan, terry
42 Hernandez, Juan
43 Carlos, Garcia

View List

Company

Dodge Reports (aka D
AAA General Contract
Accent Landscape Con
Alpine Electric

asphalt pavers inc.
Aztec Contractors, |
Barraza Code Electri
Barry Simms Inc.
Bella Luna Engineeri
Black Stallion Contr
Bradley's Hardware
Brian Duffy And Asso
CEA Group
ChemStation

Cobb, Fendley And As
Compa Contractors
Compound Design, LLC
ConstructConnect
construction Bid Sou
Construction Reporte
Contractors Register
CSA Constructors
Data Grid

DEL MAR CONTRACTING,

Direx Construction,
Dodge data and analy
Dodge Reporis (aka D
DRS Rock Materials,
ecoReach, Inc.

EGL Construction Inc
Facility Solutions G
Forterra Pipe And Pr
Globe Builders, LLC
GLZ General Contract
Gorham Electric, Inc
HAWK Construction
Heartland Park and R
Hellas Construction,
Hendee Enterprises |
Horizone Constructio
hunter knepshield of
Hydrozone Landscape
Integrated Earthwork



2019-068 Bartlett Park Landscape Improvements
View List

44 Avila, Michael

45 Leos, Joaquin A
46 Robles, Jesse |
47 Paredes, Raul

48 Campos, Jesus
49 Andrea, Klinefelter
50 Wormley, Randy
51 Gutierrez, Victor
52 galindo, jose alberto
53 Borja, Javier

54 martinez, avelardo
55 Mata Jr., Alberio
56 matyear, william
57 Matyear, William
58 Fraire, Julio

859 Hernandez, Michael
60 Medina, Mercedes
61 Molina, Cesar

62 Soileau, Carmen
63 onvia, onvia

64 sanchez, virjinia
65 Felix, Lupe

66 Powers, Jerry

67 Verdecchia, Miguel
68 Jurado, Ana

69 Bjornsson, Ron

70 Workman, Nigel

71 Soriano Artiaga, Jose Luis

72 Acosta, Arami

73 Pare, Jerry

74 Locascio, Megan
75 Hermandez, Cecilia
76 Olguin, Jeannette
77 Zaragoza, Cynthia
78 Austin, Fork

79 Johnson, Kesha
80 Salinas, Adrian

81 vaquera, Margaret
82 Acosta, German
83 Tarin, Manue!

84 tanzy, russell

85 Bid Docs, SW

86 Wolff, James

J. Carrizal General
J.A.R Construction
JMR Demolition, Lid.
Jobe Materials
Keystone Contractors
Kimley-Horn

Majesty Maint And ClI
MANNY'S LANDSCAPE AN
maril enterprise
Martinez Bros Contra
martinez irrigation
Mata's Garage Doors
matco

Matyear Construction
MFH Environmental Co
Mirador Enterprises
MIRADOR Enterprises,
Nine-Degrees Archite
No Fault Sport Group
onvia

PAndS JANITORIAL SER
Prime lrrigation And
Pro-Tech Pest and La
Rinker Materials

sites southwest
Smartprocure
SofSurfaces Inc

Sun city brick pavin
Synergy Project Cons
Synscapes of el Paso
The Blue Book

The Planlt Room
Vitual Builders Exch
VonanZa Construction
Wayne Enterprises
WTAGC
YARDBYRDS

yuceca construction
Zayza lrrigation And
Ztex Construction



2019-068 Bartlett Park Landscape Improvements
View List

87 Melvin, Craig

88 Bangquil, Lovely

89 James, Hardison
90 Reyes, Yesenia

91 Martinez, Alonso
92 Watson, Frank

93 Hernandez, Alberto





